

















ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008 IBC-E77



Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction.

PART | - IBC MEANS OF EGRESS

Public Hearing: Committee: AS AM D
Assembly: ASF AMF DF

PART Il - IRC BUILDING AND ENERGY

Public Hearing: Committee: AS AM D
Assembly: ASF AMF DF

E58-07/08
1009.3, 1009.3.2 (IFC [B] 1009.3, 1009.3.2); IRC R311.5.2.3 (New), R311.5.3.2

Proponent: David W. Cooper, Stairway Manufacturers’ Association

THESE PROPOSALS ARE ON THE AGENDA OF THE IBC MEANS OF EGRESS AND THE IRC
BUILDING/ENERGY CODE DEVELOPMENT COMMITTEES AS 2 SEPARATE CODE CHANGES. SEE THE
TENTATIVE HEARING ORDERS FOR THESE COMMITTEES.

PART | - IBC MEANS OF EGRESS

Add new text as follows:

1009.3 (IFC [B] 1009.3) Walk line. The walk line is the line of travel used to provide for uniform layout of the tread
depths in the design and requlation of flights with winder treads. The walk line shall be parallel to the side of the flight

where the treads are narrowest and located 12 inches (305 mm) from the point of minimum tread depth used for
placement of the foot on the flight in ascent or descent.

Revise as follows:

1009-3-(IFC[B] 1009-3) 1009.4 (IFC [B] 1009.4) Stair treads and risers. Stair riser heights shall be 7 inches (178
mm) maximum and 4 inches (102 mm) minimum. Stairtread-depths-shallbe-11inches(279-mm)-minimum- The riser
height shall be measured vertically between the leading edges of adjacent treads. Rectangular tread depths shall be
11 inches (279 mm) minimum Fhe-tread-depth-shall-be measured horizontally between the vertical planes of the
foremost projection of adjacent treads and at a right angle to the tread’s leading edge. Winder treads shall have a
minimum tread depth of 11 inches (279 mm) measured between the vertical planes of the foremost prolect|on of
adjacent treads at the intersections with the walk line :

and a minimum tread depth used for placement of the foot

ascent or descent of 10 inches (254 mm).

Exceptions:

1. Alternating tread devices in accordance with Section 1009.9.

2. Spiral stairways in accordance with Section 1009.8.

3. Aisle stairs in assembly seating areas where the stair pitch or slope is set, for sightline reasons, by the
slope of the adjacent seating area in accordance with Section 1025.11.2.

4. In Group R-3 occupancies; within dwelling units in Group R-2 occupancies; and in Group U occupancies
that are accessory to a Group R-3 occupancy or accessory to individual dwelling units in Group R-2
occupancies; the maximum riser height shall be 7.75 inches (197 mm); the minimum tread depth shall be
10 inches (254 mm); the minimum winder tread depth at the walk line shall be 10 inches (254 mm); and
the minimum winder tread depth shall be 6 inches (152 mm). A nosing not less than 0.75 inch (19.1 mm)
but not more than 1.25 inches (32 mm) shall be provided on stairways with solid risers where the tread
depth is less than 11 inches (279 mm).

5. See the Section 3403.4 for the replacement of existing stairways.

4009-34{IFC{B]-1009-3-1)-1009.4.1 (IFC [B] 1009.4.1) Winder treads. (No change to text)

IBC-E78 ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008



400932 (IFC[B]-1009-3.2)-1009.4.2 (IFC [B] 1009.4.2) Dimensional uniformity. Stair treads and risers shall be of
uniform size and shape. The tolerance between the largest and smallest riser height or between the largest and
smallest tread depth shall not exceed 0.375 inch (9.5 mm) in any flight of stairs. The greatest winder tread depth at the
12-inch-(305-mm)-walk line within any flight of stairs shall not exceed the smallest by more than 0.375 inch (9.5 mm)

measured-at-a-rightangle to-the- tread’s-leading-edge.

Exceptions:

1. Nonuniform riser dimensions of aisle stairs complying with Section 1025.11.2.
2. Consistently shaped winders, complying with Section 1009.3, differing from rectangular treads in the same
stairway flight.

Where the bottom or top riser adjoins a sloping publicway, walkway or driveway having an established grade and
serving as a landing, the bottom or top riser is permitted to be reduced along the slope to less than 4 inches (102 mm)
in height, with the variation in height of the bottom or top riser not to exceed one unit vertical in 12 units horizontal (8-
percent slope) of stairway width. The nosings or leading edges of treads at such nonuniform height risers shall have a
distinctive marking stripe, different from any other nosing marking provided on the stair flight. The distinctive marking
stripe shall be visible in descent of the stair and shall have a slip-resistant surface. Marking stripes shall have a width
of at least 1 inch (25 mm) but not more than 2 inches (51 mm).

4009:33(IFC{B]-1009-3-3}-1009.4.3 (IFC [B] 1009.4.3) Profile. (No change to text)
PART Il - IRC BUILDING AND ENERGY

Revise as follows:

R311.5.2.3 Walk line. The walk line is the line of travel used to provide for uniform layout of the tread depths in the
design and reqgulation of flights with winder treads. The walk line shall be parallel to the side of the flight where the
treads are narrowest and located 12 inches (305 mm) from the point of minimum tread depth used for placement of the
foot on the flight in ascent or descent.

R311.5.3.2 Tread depth. The minimum tread depth shall be 10 inches (254 mm). The tread depth shall be measured
horizontally between the vertical planes of the foremost projection of adjacent treads and at a right angle to the tread’s
leading edge. The greatest tread depth within any flight of stairs shall not exceed the smallest by more than 3/8 inch
(9.5 mm). Winder treads shall have a minimum tread depth of 10 inches (254 mm) measured between the vertical
planes of the foremost projection of adjacent treads at the intersections with the walk line-as-abeve-ata-peint-12-inches
305-mm)-rom-the-side-where-the-treads-are-narrower. Winder treads shall have a minimum tread depth used for
placement of the foot in ascent or descent of 6 inches (152 mm) at any point. Within any flight of stairs, the largest
winder tread depth at the 42-ireh(305-mm)-walk line shall not exceed the smallest winder tread by more than 3/8 inch
(9.5 mm).

Reason: PART | -IBC

Need for Improvement:
Current regulation of the placement of the walk line varies for lack of a specific point from which to measure. The tread depth measured at the walk
line therefore varies from one enforcement jurisdiction to another sometimes even within a jurisdiction. The complications of varying interpretations
of this part of the code have lead to costly hearings and appeals for variances. The industry needs a standard as do code officials but more
importantly the people walking these stairs need a standard as well that will provide consistency in the built environment. In this effort the Stairway
Manufacturers’ Association has offered several proposals over the years that have met with an agreement by the committees involved that a
standard is needed but with certain objections. Each proposal in succession has improved utilizing the critical direction obtained from the
committees in the code development process and in meetings with code officials around the country.

Separate Section on Walk Line is Needed:
The walk line is a critical element of stair design just as are width, headroom, rise and run. The separation of this element draws attention to the
need to meet this requirement in the planning stage rather than being buried within the code. This allows for further specifics for location and
simplification of the subsequent sections relative to tread depth. Finally although the term walk line has been used for years with in the code text on
tread depth, this section offers a clear understanding.

What is the “Walk Line”:
The walk line is related to the person’s position when walking on the stair and is that line which the inside foot follows when walking on a stair and
therefore this proposal states that the walk line shall be established based only on that portion of the treads in a flight that can be walked on. Any
portion of a tread that cannot be walked on does not require regulation by this section. The extension of the tread or its size beyond the “walk-able”
area, whether for structural attachment or decorative purpose, is not necessary to the regulation of tread depth for the safety of the user.

Ease of enforcement:
In this proposal the location of the walk line is simply determined by measuring onto the tread at the front of each tread from the point of minimum
tread depth because the walk line is defined as being parallel to the side of the flight. This represents no change in the common practice to measure
at the leading edge or nosing of the tread and no longer will require a square across the tread depth to accurately determine the winder tread depth
at the walk line.

ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008 IBC-E79



Simplification of the IBC Tread Related Sections:
No changes in any of the specified dimensions are being made. The first change is to only move the tread depth requirement to allow the riser
requirements to appear together. The word “rectangular” used in exception 2 of the dimensional uniformity exception has been added to clarify. The
way in which the winder treads will be measured is changed to match the way they are laid out to be uniform. This does not affect typical two or
three winder layouts that are typically much deeper than the rectangular treads they are paired with in a flight and more closely reflects the foot
positions in both ascent and descent as a person turns while walking on the stair. At the same time this allows for an easier method of accurately
measuring the tread depth without the use of a square across the depth of the winder tread. The minimum winder tread depth is now clarified by
reflecting the most common enforcement convention and is to be measured on that portion of the stair-walking surface that is actually used for
walking as is in the new walk line section.

The Dimensional uniformity section has been edited for simplification because these terms are now clearly stated in the new walk line section.

PART II-IRC
Need for Improvement:
Current regulation of the placement of the walk line varies for lack of a specific point from which to measure. The tread depth measured at the walk
line therefore varies from one enforcement jurisdiction to another sometimes even within a jurisdiction. The complications of varying interpretations
of this part of the code have lead to costly hearings and appeals for variances. The industry needs a standard as do code officials but more
importantly the people walking these stairs need a standard as well that will provide consistency in the built environment. In this effort the Stairway
Manufacturers’ Association has offered several proposals over the years that have met with an agreement by the committees involved that a
standard is needed but with certain objections. Each proposal in succession has improved utilizing the critical direction obtained from the
committees in the code development process and in meetings with code officials around the country.

Separate Section on Walk Line is Needed:
The walk line is a critical element of stair design just as are width, headroom, rise and run. The separation of this element draws attention to the
need to meet this requirement in the planning stage rather than being buried within the code. This allows for further specifics for location and
simplification of the subsequent sections relative to tread depth. Finally although the term walk line has been used for years with in the code text on
tread depth, this section offers a clear understanding.

What is the “Walk Line”:
The walk line is related to the person’s position when walking on the stair and is that line which the inside foot follows when walking on a stair and
therefore this proposal states that the walk line shall be established based only on that portion of the treads in a flight that can be walked on. Any
portion of a tread that cannot be walked on does not require regulation by this section. The extension of the tread or its size beyond the “walk-able”
area, whether for structural attachment or decorative purpose, is not necessary to the regulation of tread depth for the safety of the user.

Ease of enforcement:
In this proposal the location of the walk line is simply determined by measuring onto the tread at the front of each tread from the point of minimum
tread depth because the walk line is defined as being parallel to the side of the flight. This represents no change in the common practice to measure
at the leading edge or nosing of the tread and no longer will require a square across the tread depth to accurately determine the winder tread depth
at the walk line.

Simplifications of the IRC Tread Related Sections:
No changes in any of the specified dimensions are being made. The way in which the winder treads will be measured is changed to match the way
they are laid out to be uniform. This does not affect typical two or three winder layouts that are typically much deeper than the rectangular treads
they are paired with in a flight and more closely reflects the foot positions in both ascent and descent as a person turns while walking on the stair. At
the same time this allows for an easier method of accurately measuring the tread depth without the use of a square across the depth of the tread
winder. The minimum winder tread depth is now clarified by reflecting the most common enforcement convention and is to be measured on that
portion of the stair-walking surface that is actually used for walking as is in the new walk line section.

Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction.

PART | - IBC MEANS OF EGRESS

Public Hearing: Committee: AS AM D
Assembly: ASF AMF DF

PART Il - IRC BUILDING AND ENERGY

Public Hearing: Committee: AS AM D
Assembly: ASF AMF DF

E59-07/08
1009.3, 1009.3.2 (IFC [B] 1009.3, [B] 1009.3.2); IRC R311.5.2.3 (New), R311.5.3.2

Proponent: David W. Cooper, Stairway Manufacturers’ Association

THESE PROPOSALS ARE ON THE AGENDA OF THE IBC MEANS OF EGRESS AND THE IRC
BUILDING/ENERGY CODE DEVELOPMENT COMMITTEES AS 2 SEPARATE CODE CHANGES. SEE THE
TENTATIVE HEARING ORDERS FOR THESE COMMITTEES.

PART | - IBC MEANS OF EGRESS

Revise as follows:

1009.3 (IFC [B] 1009.3) Walk line. The walk line is the line of travel used to provide for uniform layout of the tread
depths in the design and requlation of flights with winder treads. The walk line shall be parallel to the side of the flight

where the treads are narrowest and located 12 inches (305 mm) from the point of minimum tread depth used for
placement of the foot on the flight in ascent or descent.

IBC-E80 ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008



Exception: Separate walk lines shall be established to measure winder sections that reverse direction of the stair
within the same flight where winder treads are permitted. The change in direction shall be separated by at least 2
rectanqular treads. The largest winder tread depth at the walk lines within the flight shall not exceed the smallest
by more than 3/8 inch (9.5 mm).

1009-3-(IFC[B]-1009-3) 1009.4 (IFC [B] 1009.4) Stair treads and risers. Stair riser heights shall be 7 inches (178
mm) maximum and 4 inches (102 mm) minimum. Stairtread-depths-shallbe-1H-inches{(279-mm)-minimum-—The riser
height shall be measured vertically between the leading edges of adjacent treads. Rectangular tread depths shall be
11 inches (279 mm) minimum Fhe-tread-depth-shall-be-measured horizontally between the vertical planes of the
foremost projection of adjacent treads and at a right angle to the tread’s leading edge. Winder treads shall have a
minimum tread depth of 11 inches (279 mm) measured between the vertical planes of the foremost projection of
adjacent treads at the intersections with the walk line-at-a-right-angle-to-the-tread’sleading-edge-at-apeint12-inches

305-mm)-from-the-side-where-the-treads-are-narrower and a minimum tread depth used for placement of the foot in
ascent or descent of 10 inches (254 mm).

Exceptions:

1. Alternating tread devices in accordance with Section 1009.9.

2. Spiral stairways in accordance with Section 1009.8.

3. Aisle stairs in assembly seating areas where the stair pitch or slope is set, for sightline reasons, by the
slope of the adjacent seating area in accordance with Section 1025.11.2.

4. In Group R-3 occupancies; within dwelling units in Group R-2 occupancies; and in Group U occupancies
that are accessory to a Group R-3 occupancy or accessory to individual dwelling units in Group R-2
occupancies; the maximum riser height shall be 7.75 inches (197 mm); the minimum tread depth shall be
10 inches (254 mm); the minimum winder tread depth at the walk line shall be 10 inches (254 mm); and
the minimum winder tread depth shall be 6 inches (152 mm). A nosing not less than 0.75 inch (19.1 mm)
but not more than 1.25 inches (32 mm) shall be provided on stairways with solid risers where the tread
depth is less than 11 inches (279 mm).

5. See the Section 3403.4 for the replacement of existing stairways.

4009-3-4{IFC{B]-1009-3-1)-1009.4.1 (IFC [B] 1009.4.1) Winder treads. (No change to text)

400932 (IFC[B]1-1009-3.2 1009.4.2 (IFC [B] 1009.4.2) Dimensional uniformity. Stair treads and risers shall be of
uniform size and shape. The tolerance between the largest and smallest riser height or between the largest and
smallest tread depth shall not exceed 0.375 inch (9.5 mm) in any flight of stairs. The greatest winder tread depth at the
12-inch-(305-mm)-walk line within any flight of stairs shall not exceed the smallest by more than 0.375 inch (9.5 mm)
measured-atarightangle-to-the-tread'sleading-edge.

Exceptions:

1. Nonuniform riser dimensions of aisle stairs complying with Section 1025.11.2.
2. Consistently shaped winders, complying with Section 1009.3, differing from rectangular treads in the same
stairway flight.

Where the bottom or top riser adjoins a sloping public way, walkway or driveway having an established grade and
serving as a landing, the bottom or top riser is permitted to be reduced along the slope to less than 4 inches (102 mm)
in height, with the variation in height of the bottom or top riser not to exceed one unit vertical in 12 units horizontal (8-
percent slope) of stairway width. The nosings or leading edges of treads at such nonuniform height risers shall have a
distinctive marking stripe, different from any other nosing marking provided on the stair flight. The distinctive marking
stripe shall be visible in descent of the stair and shall have a slip-resistant surface. Marking stripes shall have a width
of at least 1 inch (25 mm) but not more than 2 inches (51 mm).

4009:33(IFC{B]-1009-3-3)-1009.4.3 (IFC [B] 1009.4.3) Profile. (No change to text)
PART Il - IRC BUILDING AND ENERGY

Revise as follows:

R311.5.2.3 Walk line. The walk line is the line of travel used to provide for uniform layout of the tread depths in the
design and reqgulation of flights with winder treads. The walk line shall be parallel to the side of the flight where the

ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008 IBC-E81



treads are narrowest and located 12 inches (305 mm) from the point of minimum tread depth used for placement of the
foot on the flight in ascent or descent.

Exception: Separate walk lines shall be established to measure winder sections that reverse direction of the stair
within the same flight. The change in direction shall be separated by at least 2 rectanqular treads. The largest
winder tread depth at the walk lines within the flight shall not exceed the smallest by more than 3/8 inch (9.5 mm).

R311.5.3.2 Tread depth. The minimum tread depth shall be 10 inches (254 mm). The tread depth shall be measured
horizontally between the vertical planes of the foremost projection of adjacent treads and at a right angle to the tread’s
leading edge. The greatest tread depth within any flight of stairs shall not exceed the smallest by more than 3/8 inch
(9.5 mm). Winder treads shall have a minimum tread depth of 10 inches (254 mm) measured between the vertical
planes of the foremost projection of adjacent treads at the intersections with the walk line-as-abeve-atapoint42-inches

i . Winder treads shall have a minimum tread depth used for
placement of the foot in ascent or descent of 6 inches (152 mm) at any point. Within any flight of stairs, the largest
winder tread depth at the 42-ireh(305-mm)-walk line shall not exceed the smallest winder tread by more than 3/8 inch
(9.5 mm).

Reason: PART | -IBC

Need for Improvement:
Current regulation of the placement of the walk line varies for lack of a specific point from which to measure. The tread depth measured at the walk
line therefore varies from one enforcement jurisdiction to another sometimes even within a jurisdiction. The complications of varying interpretations
of this part of the code have lead to costly hearings and appeals for variances. The industry needs a standard as do code officials but more
importantly the people walking these stairs need a standard as well that will provide consistency in the built environment. In this effort the Stairway
Manufacturers’ Association has offered several proposals over the years that have met with an agreement by the committees involved that a
standard is needed but with certain objections. Each proposal in succession has improved utilizing the critical direction obtained from the
committees in the code development process and in meetings with code officials around the country. In this proposal we feel we have provided a
complete solution to the concerns in the regulation of winder tread depth.

Separate Section on Walk Line is Needed:
The walk line is a critical element of stair design just as are width, headroom, rise and run. The separation of this element draws attention to the
need to meet this requirement in the planning stage rather than being buried within the code. This allows for further specifics for location and
simplification of the subsequent sections relative to tread depth. Finally although the term walk line has been used for years with in the code text on
tread depth, this section offers a clear understanding.

What is the “Walk Line”:
The walk line is related to the person’s position when walking on the stair and is that line which the inside foot follows when walking on a stair and
therefore this proposal states that the walk line shall be established based only on that portion of the treads in a flight that can be walked on. Any
portion of a tread that cannot be walked on does not require regulation by this section. The extension of the tread or its size beyond the “walk-able”
area, whether for structural attachment or decorative purpose, is not necessary to the regulation of tread depth for the safety of the user.

Ease of enforcement:
In this proposal the location of the walk line is simply determined by measuring onto the tread at the front of each tread from the point of minimum
tread depth because the walk line is defined as being parallel to the side of the flight. This represents no change in the common practice to measure
at the leading edge or nosing of the tread and no longer will require a square across the tread depth to accurately determine the winder tread depth
at the walk line.

Reason for the Exception:
Reversing winders are rare but can often offer the only egress solution and should be provided with some level of safety regulated by the code.
They are allowed in the code but lacking any regulation at all. This issue has been addressed because of input from ICC staff and many questions
from concerned building officials around the country. Reversing winders often cause the user seeking the shortest path to cross the stair. Providing
a transition of two rectangular treads allows for a more gradual change in the users gait to be achieved whether or not they change sides. This
section also provides clarity for how reversing winder treads are measured for tread depth by providing for two walk lines and clarifying the
regulation of uniform tread depth at the walk line of the reversing winders throughout the flight.

Simplification of the IBC Tread Related Sections:
No changes in any of the specified dimensions are being made. The first change is to only move the tread depth requirement to allow the riser
requirements to appear together. The word “rectangular” used in exception 2 of the dimensional uniformity exception has been added to clarify. The
way in which the winder treads will be measured is changed to match the way they are laid out to be uniform. This does not affect typical two or
three winder layouts that are typically much deeper than the rectangular treads they are paired with in a flight and more closely reflects the foot
positions in both ascent and descent as a person turns while walking on the stair. At the same time this allows for an easier method of accurately
measuring the tread depth without the use of a square across the depth of the winder tread. The minimum winder tread depth is now clarified by
reflecting the most common enforcement convention and is to be measured on that portion of the stair-walking surface that is actually used for
walking as is in the new walk line section.

The Dimensional uniformity section has been edited for simplification because these terms are now clearly stated in the new walk line section.

PART lI- IRC

Need for Improvement:
Current regulation of the placement of the walk line varies for lack of a specific point from which to measure. The tread depth measured at the walk
line therefore varies from one enforcement jurisdiction to another sometimes even within a jurisdiction. The complications of varying interpretations
of this part of the code have lead to costly hearings and appeals for variances. The industry needs a standard as do code officials but more
importantly the people walking these stairs need a standard as well that will provide consistency in the built environment. In this effort the Stairway
Manufacturers’ Association has offered several proposals over the years that have met with an agreement by the committees involved that a
standard is needed but with certain objections. Each proposal in succession has improved utilizing the critical direction obtained from the
committees in the code development process and in meetings with code officials around the country. In this proposal we feel we have provided a
complete solution to the concerns in the regulation of winder tread depth.

IBC-E82 ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008



Separate Section on Walk Line is Needed:
The walk line is a critical element of stair design just as are width, headroom, rise and run. The separation of this element draws attention to the
need to meet this requirement in the planning stage rather than being buried within the code. This allows for further specifics for location and
simplification of the subsequent sections relative to tread depth. Finally although the term walk line has been used for years with in the code text on
tread depth, this section offers a clear understanding.

What is the “Walk Line”:
The walk line is related to the person’s position when walking on the stair and is that line which the inside foot follows when walking on a stair and
therefore this proposal states that the walk line shall be established based only on that portion of the treads in a flight that can be walked on. Any
portion of a tread that cannot be walked on does not require regulation by this section. The extension of the tread or its size beyond the “walk-able”
area, whether for structural attachment or decorative purpose, is not necessary to the regulation of tread depth for the safety of the user.

Ease of enforcement:
In this proposal the location of the walk line is simply determined by measuring onto the tread at the front of each tread from the point of minimum
tread depth because the walk line is defined as being parallel to the side of the flight. This represents no change in the common practice to measure
at the leading edge or nosing of the tread and no longer will require a square across the tread depth to accurately determine the winder tread depth
at the walk line.

Reason for The Exception:
Reversing winders are rare but can often offer the only egress solution and should be provided with some level of safety regulated by the code.
They are allowed in the code but lacking any regulation at all. This issue has been addressed because of input from ICC staff and many questions
from concerned building officials around the country. Reversing winders often cause the user seeking the shortest path to cross the stair. Providing
a transition of two rectangular treads allows for a more gradual change in the users gait to be achieved whether or not they change sides. This
section also provides clarity for how reversing winder treads are measured for tread depth by providing for two walk lines and clarifying the
regulation of uniform tread depth at the walk line of the reversing winders throughout the flight.

Simplifications of the IRC Tread Related Sections:
No changes in any of the specified dimensions are being made. The way in which the winder treads will be measured is changed to match the way
they are laid out to be uniform. This does not affect typical two or three winder layouts that are typically much deeper than the rectangular treads
they are paired with in a flight and more closely reflects the foot positions in both ascent and descent as a person turns while walking on the stair. At
the same time this allows for an easier method of accurately measuring the tread depth without the use of a square across the depth of the winder
tread. The minimum winder tread depth is now clarified by reflecting the most common enforcement convention and is to be measured on that
portion of the stair-walking surface that is actually used for walking as is in the new walk line section.

Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction.

PART | - IBC MEANS OF EGRESS

Public Hearing: Committee: AS AM D
Assembly: ASF AMF DF

PART Il - IRC BUILDING AND ENERGY

Public Hearing: Committee: AS AM D
Assembly: ASF AMF DF

E60-07/08
1009.3, 1009.3.1 (IFC [B] 1009.3, [B] 1009.3.1); IRC R311.5.3

Proponent: David W. Cooper, Stairway Manufacturers’ Association

THESE PROPOSALS ARE ON THE AGENDA OF THE IBC MEANS OF EGRESS AND THE IRC
BUILDING/ENERGY CODE DEVELOPMENT COMMITTEES AS 2 SEPARATE CODE CHANGES. SEE THE
TENTATIVE HEARING ORDERS FOR THESE COMMITTEES.

PART | - IBC MEANS OF EGRESS

1. Add new text as follows:

1009.3 (IFC [B] 1009.3) Stair treads and risers. Stair treads and risers shall comply with Sections 1009.3.1 through
1009.3.5.

1009.3.1 (IFC [B]1 1009.3.1) Dimension reference surfaces. For the purpose of the section, all dimensions are
exclusive of carpets, rugs, or runners.

2. Revise as follows:

1009.3.2 (IFC [B] 1009.3.2) Riser height and tread depth. Stair
riser he|ghts shall be 7 inches (178 mm) maximum and 4 inches (102 mm) minimum. Stair tread depths shall be 11
inches (279 mm) minimum. The riser height shall be measured vertically between the leading edges of adjacent
treads. The tread depth shall be measured horizontally between the vertical planes of the foremost projection of
adjacent treads and at a right angle to the tread’s leading edge. Winder treads shall have a minimum tread depth of 11
inches (279 mm) measured at a right angle to the tread’s leading edge at a point 12 inches (305 mm) from the side
where the treads are narrower and a minimum tread depth of 10 inches (254 mm).

ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008 IBC-E83



Exceptions:

1. Alternating tread devices in accordance with Section 1009.9.

2. Spiral stairways in accordance with Section 1009.8.

3. Aisle stairs in assembly seating areas where the stair pitch or slope is set, for sightline reasons, by the
slope of the adjacent seating area in accordance with Section 1025.11.2.

4. In Group R-3 occupancies; within dwelling units in Group R-2 occupancies; and in Group U occupancies
that are accessory to a Group R-3 occupancy or accessory to individual dwelling units in Group R-2
occupancies; the maximum riser height shall be 7.75 inches (197 mm); the minimum tread depth shall be
10 inches (254 mm); the minimum winder tread depth at the walk line shall be 10 inches (254 mm); and
the minimum winder tread depth shall be 6 inches (152 mm). A nosing not less than 0.75 inch (19.1 mm)
but not more than 1.25 inches (32 mm) shall be provided on stairways with solid risers where the tread
depth is less than 11 inches (279 mm).

5. See the Section 3403.4 for the replacement of existing stairways.

1009.3.1-(IFC B} 4009.3.1)-1009.3.3 (IFC [B] 1009.3.3) Winder treads. (No change to text)

400932 (IFC{B]-1009-3-2) 1009.3.4 (IFC [B] 1009.3.4) Dimensional uniformity. (No change to text)

4009.3-3-(IFC{B]-11009.3-3) 1009.3.5 (IFC [B] 1009.3.5) (Supp) Profile. (No change to text)
PART Il - IRC BUILDING AND ENERGY

Revise text as follows:

R311.5.3 Stair treads and risers. Stair treads and risers shall meet the requirements of this section. For the
purposes of this section all dimensions and dimensioned surfaces shall be exclusive of carpets, rugs, or runners.

Reason: PART I-IBC- This new section provides for accurate measurements consistent with the intent of the code by standardizing the surfaces to
be measured from the dimensions currently described under 1009.3 Treads and risers. It further makes sense out of the nosing radius and bevel
dimensions in 1009.3.3 Profile as these are not intended to be measured at a carpeted surface.

This clarification would result in more consistent interpretation and enforcement eliminating confusion. In our code seminars around the
country | ask how officials determine the riser height if the stair is carpeted. Some have a standard thickness they calculate for the carpet without
knowing the thickness that will be used. Others measure in consideration of the compressed thickness and still others wait to pass or fail the
stairway based on measuring to the uncompressed surface of a carpet that might change after just a few months use or when it is replaced. We
can’t have our cake and eat it too. Court battles ensue over such widely interpreted issues that become law upon adoption and in this case should
become the sole responsibility of the occupant as they change carpets, rugs, and runners.

Surfaces can easily vary 1 inch or more in thickness when uncompressed carpet and pad is inserted in the calculation of the riser height. The
code requires accuracy within 3/8 of an inch and yet it provides for inconsistent measurements and enforcement. The fact is that carpeting is not
regulated by the code and cannot be indiscriminately inserted based on widely varying individual interpretation.

Whether the stair is site built or prefabricated the rise of the stair is determined during the rough stage long prior to the selection of carpet for
thickness. Prior to layout of the stringer you must know what thickness treads will be used and what materials will be used on the floors. The
decision is made to allow the landing tread that meets the floor surface (or also called landing nosing) to be held up to accept floor coverings to abut
its back edge or place it flush for carpet to wrap it such that the top riser should always be the same height as the other stair risers within normal
construction tolerances prior to the addition of carpets. The top and bottom steps should not be controlled based on carpet because the
uncontrollable addition of rugs and/or runners at the floors and landings will change at the option of the owners/occupants/residents.

Since carpeting is not controlled by the code then the dimensions of the stair should not be controlled by carpet. The code must provide a
product that the end user can rely on regardless of the jurisdiction they decide to live or walk. We mislead ourselves if we think that the variants now
allowed in measuring the rise on stairs provide for safety. We need to provide a standard the consumer can count on and walk safely on. This

change provides the needed standard the code now lacks.

PART II-IRC-This new section provides for accurate measurements consistent with the intent of the code by standardizing the surfaces to be
measured from the dimensions described under R311.5.3 Treads and risers. It further makes sense out of the nosing radius and bevel dimensions
in R311.5.3.3 Profile as these are not intended to be measured at a carpeted surface.

This clarification would result in more consistent interpretation and enforcement eliminating confusion. In our code seminars around the
country | ask how officials determine the riser height if the stair is carpeted. Some have a standard thickness they calculate for the carpet without
knowing the thickness that will be used. Others measure in consideration of the compressed thickness and still others wait to pass or fail the
stairway based on measuring to the uncompressed surface of a carpet that might change after just a few months use or when it is replaced. We
can’t have our cake and eat it too. Court battles ensue over such widely interpreted issues that become law upon adoption and in this case should
become the sole responsibility of the occupant as they change carpets, rugs, and runners.

Surfaces can easily vary 1 inch or more in thickness when uncompressed carpet and pad is inserted in the calculation of the riser height. The
code requires accuracy within 3/8 of an inch and yet it provides for inconsistent measurements and enforcement. The fact is that carpeting is not
regulated by the code and cannot be indiscriminately inserted based on widely varying individual interpretation.

Whether the stair is site built or prefabricated the rise of the stair is determined during the rough stage long prior to the selection of carpet for
thickness. Prior to layout of the stringer you must know what thickness treads will be used and what materials will be used on the floors. The
decision is made to allow the landing tread that meets the floor surface (or also called landing nosing) to be held up to accept floor coverings to abut
its back edge or place it flush for carpet to wrap it such that the top riser should always be the same height as the other stair risers within normal
construction tolerances prior to the addition of carpets. The top and bottom steps should not be controlled based on carpet because the
uncontrollable addition of rugs and/or runners at the floors and landings will change at the option of the residents.

IBC-E84 ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008



Since carpeting is not controlled by the code then the dimensions of the stair should not be controlled by carpet. The code must provide a
product that the end user can rely on regardless of the jurisdiction they decide to live or walk. We mislead ourselves if we think that the variants now
allowed in measuring the rise on stairs provide for safety. We need to provide a standard the consumer can count on and walk safely on. This

change provides the needed standard the code now lacks.
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction.

PART | - IBC MEANS OF EGRESS

Public Hearing: Committee: AS AM D
Assembly: ASF AMF DF

PART Il — IRC BUILDING AND ENERGY

Public Hearing: Committee: AS AM D
Assembly: ASF AMF DF

E61-07/08
1009.3 (IFC [B] 1009.3)

Proponent: Scott Crossfield, Theatre Projects Consultants, Inc., representing himself
Revise as follows:

1009.3 (IFC [B] 1009.3) Stair treads and risers. Stair riser heights shall be 7 inches (178 mm) maximum and 4
inches (102 mm) minimum. Stair tread depths shall be 11 inches (279 mm) minimum. The riser height shall be
measured vertically between the leading edges of adjacent treads. The tread depth shall be measured horizontally
between the vertical planes of the foremost projection of adjacent treads and at a right angle to the tread’s leading
edge. Winder treads shall have a minimum tread depth of 11 inches (279 mm) measured at a right angle to the tread’s
leading edge at a point 12 inches (305 mm) from the side where the treads are narrower and a minimum tread depth of
10 inches (254 mm).

Exceptions:

1. Alternating tread devices in accordance with Section 1009.9.

2. Spiral stairways in accordance with Section 1009.8.

3. Aisle stairs in assembly seating areas where the stair pitch or slope is set, for sightline reasons, by the slope
of the adjacent seating area in accordance with Section 1025.11.2.

4. Other than in Accessible units and Type A units required in Section 1107; in Group R-3 occupancies; within
dwelling units in Group R-2 occupancies; and in Group U occupancies that are accessory to a Group R-3
occupancy or accessory to individual dwelling units in Group R-2 occupancies; the maximum riser height
shall be 7.75 inches (197 mm); the minimum tread depth shall be 10 inches (254 mm); the minimum winder
tread depth at the walk line shall be 10 inches (254 mm); and the minimum winder tread depth shall be 6
inches (152 mm). A nosing not less than 0.75 inch (19.1 mm) but not more than 1.25 inches (32 mm) shall
be provided on stairways with solid risers where the tread depth is less than 11 inches (279 mm).

5. See the Section 3403.4 for the replacement of existing stairways.

Reason: The intent of this proposal is to clarify the residential exception for the reduction in tread riser ratios are not permitted for stairways that may
be in Accessible or Type A units

It was indicated during testimony for a similar change, E57-06/07, that the Fair Housing Act does not specify requirements for stairways within
units, therefore, Type B units could use the 7.75/10 rise/run exception. The 7/11 rise/run would be required in Accessible units and Type A units that
included stairways in the floor plan. While stairs are not an accessible route, the configurations of stairways is important for person with other
mobility impairments.

Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction.

Public Hearing: Committee: AS AM D
Assembly: ASF AMF DF

ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008 IBC-E85



E62-07/08
1009.3 (IFC [B] 1009.3)

Proponent: A. Brooks Ballard, Virginia Department of Corrections
Revise as follows:

1009.3 (IFC [B] 1009.3) Stair treads and risers. Stair riser heights shall be 7 inches (178 mm) maximum and 4
inches (102 mm) minimum. Stair tread depths shall be 11 inches (279 mm) minimum. The riser height shall be
measured vertically between the leading edges of adjacent treads. The tread depth shall be measured horizontally
between the vertical planes of the foremost projection of adjacent treads and at a right angle to the tread’s leading
edge. Winder treads shall have a minimum tread depth of 11 inches (279 mm) measured at a right angle to the tread’s
leading edge at a point 12 inches (305 mm) from the side where the treads are narrower and a minimum tread depth of
10 inches (254 mm).

Exceptions:

1. Alternating tread devices in accordance with Section 1009.9.

2. Spiral stairways in accordance with Section 1009.8.

3. Aisle stairs in assembly seating areas where the stair pitch or slope is set, for sightline reasons, by the
slope of the adjacent seating area in accordance with Section 1025.11.2.

4. In Group R-3 occupancies; within dwelling units in Group R-2 occupancies; and in Group U occupancies

that are accessory to a Group R-3 occupancy or accessory to individual dwelling units in Group R-2

occupancies; the maximum riser height shall be 7.75 inches (197 mm); the minimum tread depth shall be

10 inches (254 mm); the minimum winder tread depth at the walk line shall be 10 inches (254 mm); and

the minimum winder tread depth shall be 6 inches (152 mm). A nosing not less than 0.75 inch (19.1 mm)

but not more than 1.25 inches (32 mm) shall be provided on stairways with solid risers where the tread

depth is less than 11 inches (279 mm).

See the Section 3403.4 for the replacement of existing stairways.

In Group 1-3 facilities, stairways providing access to guard towers, observations stations and control

rooms, not more than 250 square feet (23 m°) in area, shall be permitted to have a maximum riser height

of 8 inches (203 mm) and a minimum tread depth of 9 inches (229 mm).

o> &

Reason: The proposed new Exception 6, applicable to Use Group |-3, allows spaces that are normally occupied by a small number of staff persons
to have stairways with greater riser height and narrower tread depth than the standard 7-11 risers/tread requirements. In order to provide the 360-
degree visibility and maximum mobility necessary for guard observation stations, the size of the base of such elevated stations must be kept to a
minimum. Security is increased without risk to either the general public or the inmates, since access to these spaces is restricted to prison staff
personnel.

This incorporates an allowance found in 1996 BOCA Building Code Section 1014.6

Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction.

Public Hearing: Committee: AS AM D
Assembly: ASF AMF DF

E63-07/08
1009.3.1 (IFC [B] 1009.3.1)

Proponent: John Berry, Cole + Russell Architects, Inc.
Revise as follows:

1009.3.1 (IFC [B] 1009.3.1) Winder treads. Winder treads are not permitted in means of egress stairways except
within a dwelling unit and sleeping unit.

Exceptions:

1. Curved stairways in accordance with Section 1009.7.
2. Spiral stairways in accordance with Section 1009.8.

IBC-E86 ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008



Reason: | have recently experienced multi-level sleeping units in hotels that do not qualify as dwelling units since they do not include provisions for
cooking. Considering that the typical occupant load in a sleeping unit will typically be less than dwelling units, | see no reason why stair winders
should not be allowed in sleeping units.

Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not change the cost of construction.

Public Hearing: Committee: AS AM D
Assembly: ASF AMF DF

E64-07/08
1009.3.3 (IFC [B] 1009.3.3)

Proponent: David W. Cooper, Stairway Manufacturers’ Association
Revise as follows:

1009.3.3 (IFC [B] 1009.3.3) (Supp) Profile. The radius of curvature at the leading edge of the tread shall be not
greater than 8-54neh-(42-7mm) 9/16 inch (14.3 mm) Beveling of nosings shall not exceed 0.5 inch (12.7 mm). Risers
shall be solid and vertical or sloped under the tread above from the underside of the leading-edge-ofthe-tread nosing
above at an angle not more than 30 degrees (0.52 rad) from the vertical. The leading edge (nosings) of treads shall
project not more than 1.25 inches (32 mm) beyond the tread below and all projections of the leading edges shall be of
uniform size, including the leading edge of the floor at the top of a flight.

Exceptions:

1. Solid risers are not required for stairways that are not required to comply with Section 1007.3, provided
that the opening between treads does not permit the passage of a sphere with a diameter of 4 inches (102
mm).

2. Solid risers are not required for occupancies in Group I-3 or in F, H and S occupancies other than areas
accessible to the public.

Reason: Risers are allowed to slope to provide for nosing projection and necessary heel clearance in descent. The present language does not
control the direction in which the riser is allowed to slope. The insertion of the words “under the tread above” provides the clarification needed.

The substitution of the word nosing provides a sentence that is easier to read and understand. The term nosing is a defined term in the code
and is further clarified by its use in parenthesis within the text of this section.

Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction.

Public Hearing: Committee: AS AM D
Assembly: ASF AMF DF

E65-07/08
1009.3.3 (IFC [B] 1009.3.3)

Proponent: Scott Crossfield, Theatre Projects Consultants, Inc., representing himself
Revise as follows:

1009.3.3 (IFC [B] 1009.3.3) (Supp) Profile. The radius of curvature at the leading edge of the tread shall be not
greater than 0.5 inch (12.7 mm). Beveling of nosings shall not exceed 0.5 inch (12.7 mm). Risers shall be solid and
vertical or sloped from the underside of the leading edge of the tread above at an angle not more than 30 degrees
(0.52 rad) from the vertical. The leading edge (nosings) of treads shall project not more than 1.25 inches (32 mm)
beyond the tread below and all projections of the leading edges shall be of uniform size, including the leading edge of
the floor at the top of a flight.

Exceptions:

1. Solid risers are not required for stairways that are not part of a required means of egress to-comply-with
Section10073, provided that the opening between treads does not permit the passage of a sphere with a
diameter of 4 inches (102 mm).

2. Solid risers are not required for occupancies in Group I-3 orin F, H and S occupancies other than areas
accessible to the public.

ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008 IBC-E87



Reason: The intent of the proposal is to make solid risers applicable to all means of egress stairways, not just those that serve as part of an
accessible means of egress.

Section 1007.1 states that when 2 or more means of egress are required, at least two means of egress are required to be accessible. Two
examples can illustrate the concern with tieing the open rises to just the stairways that are part of the accessible means of egress and not all means
of egress stairways. Example 1) A two story office building with 4 required exit stairways - two would have solid risers and two would be permitted
to have openings between treads (per Section 1009.3.3, Exp. 1). Example 2) A high rise office building with two required exit stairways. The
elevator is required to serve as one of the accessible means of egress. Therefore, one stairway will have solid risers and one stairway can have
opening between treads (per Section 1009.3.3 Exp. 1).

If the true purpose for solid risers is to make stairways safer for either the general population or persons with mobility impairments who will be
walking up the stairway, there is no justification to tie this requirement to only those stairways uses as part of the accessible means of egress.

In addition, this would be consistent with 2004 ADA/ABA Accessibility Guidelines Section 210.1.

Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction.

Public Hearing: Committee: AS AM D
Assembly: ASF AMF DF

E66—-07/08
1009.3.3 (IFC [B] 1009.3.3)

Proponent: A. Brooks Ballard, Virginia Department of Corrections
Revise as follows:

1009.3.3 (IFC [B] 1009.3.3) (Supp) Profile. The radius of curvature at the leading edge of the tread shall be not
greater than 0.5 inch (12.7 mm). Beveling of nosings shall not exceed 0.5 inch (12.7 mm). Risers shall be solid and
vertical or sloped from the underside of the leading edge of the tread above at an angle not more than 30 degrees
(0.52 rad) from the vertical. The leading edge (nosings) of treads shall project not more than 1.25 inches (32 mm)
beyond the tread below and all projections of the leading edges shall be of uniform size, including the leading edge of
the floor at the top of a flight.

Exceptions:

1. Solid risers are not required for stairways that are not required to comply with Section 1007.3, provided
that the opening between treads does not permit the passage of a sphere with a diameter of 4 inches (102
mm).

2. Solid risers are not required for occupancies in Group I-3 or in F, H and S occupancies other than areas
accessible to the public. There are no restrictions on the size of the opening in the riser.

Reason: The additional language is needed for clarification that there are no limits on openings in risers in these unique situations. Exception 2
recognizes that open risers are commonly used for stairs in occupancies such as detention facilities for practical reasons. Open risers provide a
greater degree of security and supervision due to the fact that people cannot effectively conceal themselves behind the stair. There is no opening
size limitation. These risers can be completely open with no restrictions.

Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction.

Public Hearing: Committee: AS AM D
Assembly: ASF AMF DF

E67-07/08
1009.3.3 (IFC [B] 1009.3.3)

Proponent: Scott Crossfield, Theatre Projects Consultants, Inc., representing himself
Revise as follows:

1009.3.3 (IFC [B] 1009.3.3) (Supp) Profile. The radius of curvature at the leading edge of the tread shall be not
greater than 0.5 inch (12.7 mm). Beveling of nosings shall not exceed 0.5 inch (12.7 mm). Risers shall be solid and
vertical or sloped from the underside of the leading edge of the tread above at an angle not more than 30 degrees
(0.52 rad) from the vertical. The leading edge (nosings) of treads shall project not more than 1.25 inches (32 mm)
beyond the tread below and all projections of the leading edges shall be of uniform size, including the leading edge of
the floor at the top of a flight.

IBC-E88 ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008



Exceptions:

1. Solid risers are not required for stairways that are not required to comply with Section 1007.3,
provided that the opening between treads does not permit the passage of a sphere with a diameter of
4 inches (102 mm).

2. Solid risers are not required for occupancies in Group I-3 or in F, H and S occupancies other than
areas accessible to the public.

3. Solid risers are not required for spiral stairways constructed in accordance with Section 1009.8.

4. Solid risers are not required for alternating tread devices constructed in accordance with Section

1009.9.

Reason: The general requirements for solid risers, as currently stated, are applicable to all stairways. Spiral stairways and alternating tread devices
are only used for limited access areas, such as catwalks in theaters, or roof access for maintenance and service personnel. Open risers are
necessary for these types of stairways to be constructed safely and efficiently. Sections 1009.8 for spiral stairways and Section 1009.9.2 for
alternating tread device do provide specifics for tread and riser dimensions, but do not state if open risers are permitted.

Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction.

Public Hearing: Committee: AS AM D
Assembly: ASF AMF DF

E68-07/08
1009.6 (IFC [B] 1009.6)

Proponent: Robert Bagnetto, Lapeyre Stair Inc.
Revise as follows:

1009.6 (IFC [B] 1009.6) Vertical rise. A flight of stairs shall not have a vertical rise greater than 12 feet (3658 mm)
between floor levels or landings.

Exceptions:
1. Aisle stairs complying with Section 1025.

2. Alternating tread devices used as a means of egress shall not have a rise greater than 20 feet (6096mm)
between floor levels or landings.

Reason: The purpose of this proposed change to IBC-2006 is to allow a maximum allowable vertical height of 20 feet for alternating tread devices
used as a means of egress, without requiring an intermediate landing or platform.

The proposed change is superior to the current provisions of the code in that alternating tread devices may be used in heights up to 20 ft,
without the use of an intermediate landing platform. In some instances this eliminates the need for unnecessary components; and potentially
improves safety by allowing alternating tread devices to be used in areas with limited horizontal space, where otherwise the only alternative would
be to use a vertical ladder.

Alternating tread devices are allowed by the code only as a means of egress to locations that are for use by maintenance/industrial workers
(see listing below). Such workers are typically able to climb higher vertical distances than the general public without an intermediate landing.
Sections 502 and 505 allow the use of a ladder to access equipment platforms which are also typically used by maintenance/industrial workers.
Allowable heights for ladders are not addressed in IBC. OHSA regulations in 29CFR1910.27 allow ladders with cages, wells or safety devices up to
30 feet in height before a landing is required; Ladders without cages, wells or safety devices are allowed up to 20 feet in height before a landing is
required. IMC section 306.5 allows ladders up to 30 feet in height without a landing. Alternating tread devices are typically not equipped with cages,
wells or safety devices; however they are typically safer than a ladder as they have a larger landing area for the users’ feet, side rails that act as a
guard and a handrail and a shallower angle. Additionally, alternating tread devices have been shown by approximately 25 years of successful use
and by the scientific study, “Performance, perceived safety and comfort of the alternating tread stair” to be an acceptable vertical access component
and preferred over ships’ ladders. Therefore, allowing alternating tread devices with vertical heights of 20 feet (the same vertical distance as ladders
without cages, wells or safety devices) without requiring a landing is reasonable.

Allowed Alternating Tread Devices usage as a Means of Egress

410.5.3 Gridirons of Stage Exits to scuttle in roof

1009.9 Mezzanines < 250 e & < 5 occupants in F,H & S occupancies
1009.9 -3 guard towers observation stations or control rooms < 250 i
1009.9,11 to Unoccupied roofs

1015.3 Secondary means of egress to Boiler, Incinerator and Furnace rooms
1015.4 Secondary means of egress to Refrigeration machinery rooms
1015.6.1 Stage galleries, gridirons and catwalks

1019.1.2 Second means of egress for helistops < 60 ft long or 2,000 f® in area

ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008 IBC-E89



Bibliography:
Performance, perceived safety and comfort of the alternating tread stair by Jorna, Mohageg & Synder, Virginina Polytechnic Institute and State
University, published Applied Ergonomics 1989.20.1,26-32

29CFR1910.27(d)(2) Fixed ladders — landing platforms

Cost Impact: The code change proposal could minimally reduce the cost of construction in some cases by eliminating the need for landings for
alternating tread devices.

Analysis: There is a similar code change by Mr. Bagnetto to Section 505.5.

Public Hearing: Committee: AS AM D
Assembly: ASF AMF DF

E69-07/08
1009.6 (IFC [B] 1009.6)

Proponent: Scott Crossfield, Theatre Projects Consultants, Inc., representing himself
Revise as follows:

1009.6 (IFC [B] 1009.6) Vertical rise. A flight of stairs shall not have a vertical rise greater than 12 feet (3658 mm)
between floor levels or landings.

Exceptions:
1. Aisle stairs complying with Section 1025.

2. Spiral stairs complying with Section 1009.8.
3. Alternating tread devices complying with Section 1009.9.

Reason: The general requirements for landing at 12 feet intervals, as currently stated in Section 1009.6, are applicable to all stairways. Spiral
stairways and alternating tread devices are only used for limited access areas, such as catwalks in theaters, or roof access for maintenance and
service personnel. Landings only at the top and bottom are necessary for these types of stairways to be constructed safely and efficiently.

Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction.

Public Hearing: Committee: AS AM D
Assembly: ASF AMF DF

E70-07/08
1009.7 (IFC [B] 1009.7)

Proponent: John Berry, Cole + Russell Architects, Inc.
Revise as follows:

1009.7 (IFC [B] 1009.7) Curved stairways. Curved stairways with winder treads shall have treads and risers in
accordance with Section 1009.3 and the smallest radius shall not be less than twice the required width of the stairway.

Exception: The radius restriction shall not apply to curved stairways for occupancies in Group R-3, and within
individual dwelling units and sleeping units in occupancies in Groups R-1 and R-2.

Reason: | have recently experienced multi-level sleeping units in hotels that do not qualify as dwelling units since they do not include provisions for
cooking. Considering that the typical occupant load in a sleeping unit will be less than dwelling units, | see no reason why curved stairways should
not be allowed in sleeping units.

Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction.

Public Hearing: Committee: AS AM D
Assembly: ASF AMF DF

IBC-E90 ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008



E71-07/08
1009.8 (IFC [B] 1009.8)

Proponent: John Berry, Cole + Russell Architects, Inc.
Revise as follows:

1009.8 (IFC [B] 1009.8) (Supp) Spiral stairways. Spiral stairways are permitted to be used as a component in the
means of egress only within dwelling units and sleeping units or from a space not more than 250 square feet (23 m2)
in area and serving not more than five occupants, or from galleries, catwalks and gridirons in accordance with Section
1015.6.

A spiral stairway shall have a 7.5 inch (191 mm) minimum clear tread depth at a point 12 inches (305 mm) from
the narrow edge. The risers shall be sufficient to provide a headroom of 78 inches (1981 mm) minimum, but riser
height shall not be more than 9.5 inches (241 mm). The minimum stairway clear width at and below the handrail shall
be 26 inches (660 mm).

Reason: | have recently experienced multi-level sleeping units in hotels that do not qualify as dwelling units since they do not include provisions for
cooking. Considering that the typical occupant load in a sleeping unit will be less than dwelling units, | see no reason why spiral stairways should
not be allowed in sleeping units.

Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction.

Public Hearing: Committee: AS AM D
Assembly: ASF AMF DF

E72-07/08
1009.9.2 (IFC [B] 1009.9.2)

Proponent: Robert Bagnetto, Lapeyre Stairs Inc.
Revise as follows:

1009.9.2 (IFC [B] 1009.9.2) Treads of alternating tread devices. Alternating tread devices shall have a minimum
projected tread of 5 inches (127 mm), a minimum tread depth of 8.5 inches (216 mm), a minimum tread width of 7
inches (178 mm) and a maximum riser height of 9.5 inches (241 mm)._The projected tread depth shall be measured
horizontally between the vertical planes of the foremost projections of adjacent treads. The riser height shall be
measured vertically between the leading edges of adjacent treads. The combination of riser height and projected tread
depth provided shall result in an alternating tread device angle that complies with Section 1002. The initial tread of the
device shall begin at the same elevation as the platform, landing or floor surface.

Exception: Alternating tread devices used as an element of a means of egress in buildings from a mezzanine area
not more than 250 square feet (23 m2) in area which serves not more than five occupants shall have a minimum
projected tread of 8.5 inches (216 mm) with a minimum tread depth of 10.5 inches (267 mm). The rise to the next
alternating tread surface should not be more than 8 inches (203 mm).

Reason: The purpose of this proposed change is to clarify the code. The code is ambiguous in that it does not specify how to measure riser height
and projected tread depth of alternating tread devices.

This proposal is superior to the current provisions in the code in that it rectifies shortcomings in the code by clarifying the manner is which
alternating tread device projected tread depth and riser height are measured.

IBC Section 1009.3 provides details on how to measure riser height and projected tread depth of traditional stairs. However, exception 1 of this
section exempts alternating tread devices from measuring riser height and projected tread depth using the same method as for traditional stairs.

IBC section 1009.9.2 provides the values for minimum projected tread depth and maximum riser height but does not provide the details on how
to measure these features.

IBC section 1002 defines alternating tread devices as having a series of steps between 50 and 70 degrees.

By definition, the left and right treads of alternating tread devices are each about %2 the width of the device and therefore do not overlap one
another. The most reasonable method of measuring projected tread depth of alternating tread devices is using treads that are directly above and
below each other (not adjacent treads which are to the side of each other and do not overlap one another.), as these are the treads that the left and
right feet of the user each separately use.

Also, measuring both projected tread depth and riser height from adjacent treads would give maximum angles of 43.26 degrees for alternating
tread devices accessing mezzanines and 62.24 degrees for alternating tread devices accessing any other area. This would conflict with section
1002 as the maximum angle of 43.26 degrees would be below the minimum 50 degree allowed by definition in section 1002; and the maximum
angle of 62.24 degrees would be significantly more restrictive than the 70 degree angle allowed by section 1002. Measuring projected tread depth
and riser height in accordance with this proposal would result in maximum angles of 62.02 degrees for alternating tread devices accessing

ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008 IBC-E91



mezzanines and 75.26 degrees for alternating tread devices accessing other areas. These angles are in the range of 50 to 70 degrees as required
by the definition of alternating tread devices in section 1002 (with the exception that either the actual projected tread depth used must be larger than
the minimum or the actual riser height used must be below the maximum to ensure a maximum angle of 70 degrees).

Note: The current wording in section 1009.9.2 is almost exactly the same as in section 1014.6.6 of the 1996 and 1999 editions the BOCA

National Building Code. The history behind how the wording was incorporated into BOCA could not be ascertained.

Bibliography:
Standard Building Code; Section 1007.8.4
The BOCA National Building Code/1999 Sections 1014.6.6

Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not affect the cost of construction.

Public Hearing: Committee: AS AM D
Assembly: ASF AMF DF

E73-07/08
1009.9.2 (IFC [B] 1009.9.2)

Proponent: Robert Bagnetto, Lapeyre Stair Inc.
Revise as follows:

1009.9.2 (IFC [B] 1009.9.2) Treads of alternating tread devices. Alternating tread devices shall have a minimum
projected tread of 5 inches (127 mm), a minimum tread depth of 8.5 inches (216mm), a minimum tread width of 7
inches (178 mm) and a maximum riser height of 9.5 inches (241 mm). _The minimum tread width at the edge opposite
of the nosing shall be 5 inches (127 mm) when the tread has a minimum area of 60 square inches. The initial tread of
the device shall begin at the same elevation as the platform, landing or floor surface.

Exception: Alternating tread devices used as an element of a means of egress in buildings from a mezzanine area
not more than 250 square feet (23 m2) in area which serves not more than five occupants shall have a minimum
projected tread of 8.5 inches (216 mm) with a minimum tread depth of 10.5 inches (267 mm). The minimum tread
width at the edge opposite of the nosing shall be 5 inches (127 mm) when the tread has a minimum area of 75
square inches. The rise to the next alternating tread surface should not be more than 8 inches (203 mm).

Reason: The purpose of this proposed change is to clarify the code. The code is ambiguous in that it does not specify how to measure tread depth
and width of alternating tread devices.

This proposal is superior to the current provisions in the code in that it rectifies shortcomings in the code by clarifying the manner is which
alternating tread device tread depth and width are measured.

IBC section 1009.9.2 provides the values for minimum tread depth and width of alternating tread devices, but does not provide the details on
how to measure these features.

The treads of traditional stairs are by their nature rectangular in plan. Therefore, other than specifying depth and width, they do not require
additional dimensional requirements to have their plan dimensions adequately specified. Winders, spiral stairs and alternating tread devices are
types of specialty climbing components that are addressed by the code. The code provides additional requirements besides depth and width to
ensure that the plan of treads of winders and spiral stairs are adequately specified, but no such additional requirements or tread shape are specified
for alternating tread devices.

The current requirements for tread dimensions of alternating tread devices were originally incorporated into BOCA via Code Change B98-85,
section 816.12.2 (at the same time alternating tread devices were first added to the code). The required dimensions for alternating tread devices
have not changed since the original proposal (The current wording in IBC-2006 is nearly identical to the wording in B98-85). Mark Rollman
representing Lapeyre Stair was the submitter of code change proposal B98-85. Lapeyre Stair is the original patent holder (1980) of the alternating
tread device and for many years was the sole manufacturer of alternating tread devices (non-residential). A reasonable assumption is that the
original proposed dimensions for the treads of alternating tread devices were based on the Lapeyre Stair tread design (which has not changed since
Lapeyre Stair began manufacturing alternating tread devices). However, as explained below, there are possible interpretations of the code, such
that this tread design does not meet the code requirements.

The code requires a minimum tread depth of 8.5 inches (10.5 inches for mezzanines) and a minimum tread width of 7 inches. These are
shown in illustrations 1 and 2 which assume a rectangular tread. The model tread upon which the code is based has a tread depth of 10.5 inches
and a tread width of 9 inches at the nosing side and 5 inches at the opposite side of the nosing. This is shown in illustration 3. Although
approximately 37% larger in area, this model tread does not meet an interpretation which assumes a rectangular tread shape; as the 5 inch tread
width at the side opposite of the nosing is less than 7 inches. The proposed change allows tread shapes other than rectangular, which the model
tread meets, while ensuring adequate foot landing area by specifying a required area of the tread.

IBC-E92 ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008



8.50 - e »
“—59.5s5qin

—73.5s3gin

7.00 |—= - 1

lustration 1 - - 7.00

Nustration 2

.“-. [+ e L0
\
- by
10.50 '
e N
<—81.55qin i |
‘ IBC-2004 Section 1009.9.2
Code Proposal
Alternating Tread Device
] ) Tread Dimensions
[ 4.00
r—| .00 |—==
lustration 3
Bibliography:

The 1999 BOCA National Building Code, section 1014.6.6
BOCA code change no. B98-85, section 816.12

Cost Impact: This code change proposal will not change the cost of construction.

Public Hearing: Committee: AS AM D
Assembly: ASF AMF DF

E74-07/08
408.3.4 (New), 1009.10 (New), 1009.3, 1012.2, 1012.5, 1013.2, 1013.5 (IFC [B] 1009.10 (New),
[B] 1009.3, [B] 1012.2, [B] 1012.5, [B] 1013.2, [B] 1013.5)

Proponent: A. Brooks Ballard, Virginia Department of Corrections
1. Add new text as follows:

1009.10 (IFC [B11009.10) Ships Ladders. Ships ladders are permitted to be used as a component of a means of
egress to and from control rooms or elevated facility observation stations not more than 250 SF (23sq m) with not
more than 3 occupants and for access to unoccupied roofs.
Ships ladders shall have a minimum projected tread of 5 inches (127 mm), a minimum tread depth of 8.5 inches
(216 mm), a minimum tread width of 15 inches (612 mm) and a maximum riser height of 9.5 inches (241 mm).
Handrails shall be provided on both sides of ships ladders.

(Renumber subsequent sections)

ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008 IBC-E93



408.3.4 Ship ladders. Ship ladders shall be permitted for egress from control rooms or elevated facility observation
rooms in accordance with Section 1009.10.

(Renumber subsequent sections)
2. Revise text as follows:

1009.3 (IFC [B] 1009.3) Stair treads and risers. Stair riser heights shall be 7 inches (178 mm) maximum and 4
inches (102 mm) minimum. Stair tread depths shall be 11 inches (279 mm) minimum. The riser height shall be
measured vertically between the leading edges of adjacent treads. The tread depth shall be measured horizontally
between the vertical planes of the foremost projection of adjacent treads and at a right angle to the tread’s leading
edge. Winder treads shall have a minimum tread depth of 11 inches (279 mm) measured at a right angle to the tread’s
leading edge at a point 12 inches (305 mm) from the side where the treads are narrower and a minimum tread depth of
10 inches (254 mm).

Exceptions:
1. Alternating tread devices in accordance with Section 1009.9.
2. Ships ladders in accordance with Section 1009.10.
2. 3. Spiral stairways in accordance with Section 1009.8.
3. 4. Aisle stairs in assembly seating areas where the stair pitch or slope is set, for sightline reasons, by the
slope of the adjacent seating area in accordance with Section 1025.11.2.
4. 5. In Group R-3 occupancies; within dwelling units in Group R-2 occupancies; and in Group U occupancies

that are accessory to a Group R-3 occupancy or accessory to individual dwelling units in Group R-2
occupancies; the maximum riser height shall be 7.75 inches (197 mm); the minimum tread depth shall be
10 inches (254 mm); the minimum winder tread depth at the walk line shall be 10 inches (254 mm); and
the minimum winder tread depth shall be 6 inches (152 mm). A nosing not less than 0.75 inch (19.1 mm)
but not more than 1.25 inches (32 mm) shall be provided on stairways with solid risers where the tread
depth is less than 11 inches (279 mm).

5. 6. See the Section 3403.4 for the replacement of existing stairways.

1012.2 (IFC [B] 1012.2) Height. Handrail height, measured above stair tread nosings, or finish surface of ramp slope,
shall be uniform, not less than 34 inches (864 mm) and not more than 38 inches (965 mm). Handrail height of
alternating tread devices and ship ladders, measured above tread nosings shall be uniform, not less than 30 inches
(762 mm) and not more than 34 inches (864 mm).

1012.5 (IFC [B] 1012.5) Handrail extensions. Handrails shall return to a wall, guard or the walking surface or shall be
continuous to the handrail of an adjacent stair flight. Where handrails are not continuous between flights the handrails
shall extend horizontally at least 12 inches (305 mm) beyond the top riser and continue to slope for the depth of one
tread beyond the bottom riser. At ramps where handrails are not continuous between runs, the handrail shall extend
horizontally above the landing 12 inches (305 mm) minimum beyond the top and bottom of ramp runs.

Exceptions:

1. Handrails within a dwelling unit that is not required to be accessible need extend only from the top riser to the
bottom riser.

2. Aisle handrails in Group A and E occupancies in accordance with Section 1025.13.

3. Handrails for alternating tread devices and ship ladders are permitted to terminate at a location vertically
above the top and bottom risers. Handrails for alternating tread devices and ship ladders are not required to
be continuous between flights or to extend beyond the top or bottom risers.

1013.2 (IFC [B] 1013.2) Height. Guards shall form a protective barrier not less than 42 inches (1067 mm) high,
measured vertically above the leading edge of the tread, adjacent walking surface or adjacent seatboard.

Exceptions:
1. For occupancies in Group R-3, and within individual dwelling units in occupancies in Group R-2, guards
whose top rail also serves as a handrail shall have a height not less than 34 inches (864 mm) and not more

than 38 inches (1067 mm) measured vertically from the leading edge of the stair tread nosing.
2. The height in assembly seating areas shall be in accordance with section 1024.14.

IBC-E94 ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008



3. Along alternating tread device_and ship ladders, guards whose top rail also serves as a handrail, shall have
height not less than 30 inches (762 mm) and not more than 34 inches (864 mm), measured vertically from
the leading edge of the device tread nosing.

1013.3 (IFC [B] 1013.3) Opening limitations. Open guards shall have balusters or ornamental patterns such that a 4-
inch-diameter (102 mm) sphere cannot pass through any opening up to a height of 34 inches (864 mm). From a height
of 34 inches (864 mm) to 42 inches (1067 mm) above the adjacent walking surfaces, a sphere 8 inches (203 mm) in
diameter shall not pass.

Exceptions:

1. The triangular openings formed by the riser, tread and bottom rail at the open side of a stairway shall be of a
maximum size such that a sphere of 6 inches (152 mm) in diameter cannot pass through the opening.

2. At elevated walking surfaces for access to and use of electrical, mechanical or plumbing systems or
equipment, guards shall have balusters or be of solid materials such that a sphere with a diameter of 21
inches (533 mm) cannot pass through any opening.

3. In areas that are not open to the public within occupancies in Group I-3, F, H or S, and for alternating tread
devices_and ship ladders, balusters, horizontal intermediate rails or other construction shall not permit a
sphere with a diameter of 21 inches (533 mm) to pass through any opening.

4. In assembly seating areas, guards at the end of aisles where they terminate at a fascia of boxes, balconies
and galleries shall have balusters or ornamental patterns such that a 4-inch-diameter (102 mm) sphere
cannot pass through any opening up to a height of 26 inches (660 mm). From a height of 26 inches (660
mm) to 42 inches (1067 mm) above the adjacent walking surfaces, a sphere 8 inches (203 mm) in diameter
shall not pass.

5. Within individual dwelling units and sleeping units in Group R-2 and R-3 occupancies, openings for required
guards on the sides of stair treads shall not allow a sphere of 4.375 inches (111 mm) to pass through.

Reason: Applicable to Use Group I-3, allows spaces that are normally occupied by a small number of staff persons to have stairways with greater
riser height and narrower tread depth than the standard 7-11 riser/tread requirements. In order to provide the 360-degree visibility and maximum
mobility necessary for guard observation stations, the size of the base of such elevated stations must be kept to a minimum. Security is increased
without risk to either the general public or the inmates, since access to these spaces is restricted to prison staff personnel.

Ships ladders are easier and safer to maneuver than are alternating tread stairs in conditions related to I-3 functions which require carrying
items necessary for occupation.

The proposals to Sections 1009.3, 1012.2, 1012.5, 1013.2 and 1013.3 are for correlation. During the 2006/07 cycle the committee approved
the revisions in code changes E86, E93, E99 and E100 that added provisions for alternating tread devices to 1012.2, 1012.5, 1013.2 and 1013.3.
The same exceptions for handrails and guards should apply to ship ladders.

Cost Impact: The code change will not increase the cost of construction.

Public Hearing: Committee: AS AM D
Assembly: ASF AMF DF

E75-07/08
1009.10 (IFC [B] 1009.10)

Proponent: Lawrence Suggars, South Salt Lake City, UT, representing Utah Chapter of ICC
Revise as follows:

1009.10 (IFC [B] 1009.10) (Supp) Handrails. Stairways shall have handrails on each side and shall comply with
Section 1012. Where glass is used to provide the handrail, the handrail shall also comply with Section 2407.

Exceptions:

1. Handrails for aisle stairs are not required where permitted by Section 1025.13.

2. Stairways within dwelling units, spiral stairways and aisle stairs serving seating only on one side are
permitted to have a handrail on one side only.

3. Decks, patios and walkways that have a single change in elevation where the landing depth on each side
of the change of elevation is greater than what is required for a landing do not require handrails.

4. In Group R-3 occupancies, a change in elevation consisting of a single riser at an entrance or egress door
does not require handrails.

ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008 IBC-E95



5. Changes in room elevations of three or fewer risers within dwelling units and sleeping units in Group R-2
and R-3 do not require handrails.

6. Stairways that serve a occupant load of 10 or less and are less then 44 inches wide are permitted to have
one handrail.

Reason: In truth two handrails to small spaces may present their own problems. For example when moving furniture up or down the flight of stairs.
Some athletic type persons may confuse them as parallel bars or simple as a quick means of egress. For many years in many areas of the country
all that was ever required was one handrail in small and limited application. | ask you, was there a problem with the old application? If so lets look at
the statistics to determine where the problems occurred. One handrail worked for many years without a problem in limited applications. Please
consider this revision to section 1009.10 in an attempt to not over regulate buildings.

Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction.

Public Hearing: Committee: AS AM D
Assembly: ASF AMF DF

E76-07/08
1009.12 (New), 1009.12.1 (New) (IFC [B] 1009.12 (New), [B] 1009.12.1 (New))

Proponent: Ed Donoghue, Edward Donoghue Associates Inc., representing National Elevator Industry, Inc.
Add new text as follows:

1009.12 (IFC [B] 1009.12) Stairway to elevator equipment. Roofs and penthouses containing elevator equipment
that must be accessed for maintenance are required to be accessed by a stairway.

1009.12.1 (IFC [B] 1009.12.1) Penthouse or roof access. \Where the stairway provides access to the penthouse or
roof, access shall be provided through a penthouse complying with Section 1509.2.

Reason: The requirement for a stair to the roof for maintaining elevator equipment will correlate the IBC with ASME A17.1/CSA B44. ASME
A17.1/CSA B44 has required stairs and a door to access elevator equipment since 1955. More specifically Section 2.27.3.2.1 of A17.1 states the
following “a stairway with a swinging door and platform at the top level, conforming to 2.7.3.3 shall be provided from the top floor of the building to
the roof level. Hatch covers as a means of access to roofs shall not be permitted.” Alternating tread devices or ladders are not permitted as
alternatives to the starway.

A similar code change was submitted in the last cycle (E71-06/07) to Section 1009.11, which was disapproved as it was felt that the definition
of occupiable space already addressed this concern. The definition for occupiable space does not necessarily cover maintenance of elevator
equipment as the intent of “engaged in labor” is talking more about the intended occupancy classification of the space such as an office space. The
commentary for the definition of occupiable space states “Some spaces are neither habitable nor occupiable, such as closets, toilet rooms and
mechanical equipment rooms.” Without clarification this section conflicts with the elevator code.

Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction.

Public Hearing: Committee: AS AM D
Assembly: ASF AMF DF

E77-07/08
1010.7.2 (IFC [B] 1010.7.2)

Proponent: Scott Crossfield, Theatre Projects Consultants, Inc., representing himself

Delete and substitute as follows:

1010.7.2 (IFC [B] 1010.7.2) Wet conditions. Landings subject to wet conditions shall be designed to prevent the

accumulation of water.

Exception: Submerged landings of ramps into swimming pools.

IBC-E96 ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008



Reason: The intent of this proposal is two fold — to address conditions inside where there may be water, such as at a pool, or a ramp immediately
inside an entrance; and to provide consistent language between IBC and 2003 ICC/ANSI A117.1 and ADA/ABA Guidelines.

Interior and exterior ramps can be subject to wet conditions. If the landings are wet, this could make moving onto or off a the ramp a slipping
hazard.

The current language for “approach” can be interpreted to be any area around the ramp or the route to the ramp. Limiting the language to the
landing will provide a more precise requirement.

Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction.

Public Hearing: Committee: AS AM D
Assembly: ASF AMF DF

E78-07/08
1011.1 (IFC [B] 1011.1)

Proponent: Keith Wen, RA, New York City Department of Buildings, representing New York City
Revise as follows:

1011.1 (IFC [B] 1011.1) Where required. Exits and exit access doors shall be marked by an approved exit sign
readily visible from any direction of egress travel. The path of egress travel Aceess to exits and within exits shall be
marked by readily visible exit signs _to clearly indicate the direction of egress travel in cases where the exit or the path
of egress travel is not immediately visible to the occupants. Intervening means of egress doors within exits shall be
marked by exit signs. Exit sign placement shall be such that no point in an exit access corridor_or exit passageway is
more than 100 feet (30 480 mm) or the listed viewing distance for the sign, whichever is less, from the nearest visible
exit sign.

Exceptions:

1. Exit signs are not required in rooms or areas that require only one exit or exit access.

2. Main exterior exit doors or gates that are obviously and clearly identifiable as exits need not have exit
signs where approved by the building official.

3. Exit signs are not required in occupancies in Group U and individual sleeping units or dwelling units in
Group R-1, R-2 or R-3.

4. Exit signs are not required in sleeping areas in occupancies in Group I-3.

5. In occupancies in Groups A-4 and A-5, exit signs are not required on the seating side of vomitories or
openings into seating areas where exit signs are provided in the concourse that are readily apparent from
the vomitories. Egress lighting is provided to identify each vomitory or opening within the seating area in
an emergency.

Reason: Section 1011.1 requires exit signs along the exit access to help occupants to reach the exits. Typically, once the occupants reach the
exits, exit signs are not required within the exits. However, in buildings with more complicated egress layout, it is possible that the direction of
egress travel within the exits may not be immediately apparent to the occupants. For example, a vertical exit enclosure on the north side of a
building may transition into a horizontal extension in the form of either an extended landing/corridor or an exit passageway with intervening means of
egress doors on the 15" floor before continuing down into the staircase on the south side. The path of egress might involve turns with extended
distances. In such cases, it is important to provide clear egress direction for the occupants within the exits.

The report from the 2003 World Trade Center Building Code Task Force identified the problem of clarity or “readability” of travel within exit
enclosures, and in response to the 1993 and 2001 World Trade Center incidents, recommended additional exit signs within the exit enclosures.

Evacuees may be hesitant or even confused when traveling within an exit that involves transition from a vertical to a horizontal direction and
horizontal extension that includes turns and intervening doors within the path of egress. When travel direction is not clear within an exit, it creates
uncertainty in decision making and causes delays in evacuations in threatening conditions.

The proposed changes clarify that exit signs shall be installed if the path of egress travel within an exit is not obvious to the occupants. This
may already be the practice of many jurisdictions to ensure life safety of the occupants; this proposal simply codifies such practice.

Additionally, similar to the requirement for exit access corridor, exit signs in exit passageways should also be visible from within a 100 feet or
the listed viewing distance for the sign, whichever is less.

ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008 IBC-E97



NTERVENING
MEANS OF EGRESS IRECTION OF

POOR WITHIN AN EXIT EGRESS TRAVEL IN
THIS TRANSITION BETWEEN

VERTICAL EXIT ENCLOSURE
7 AND EXIT PASSAGEWAY
/ 5 NOT IMMEDIATELY
APPARENT

d\/
[

NTERVENING
MEANS OF EGRESS
POOR WITHIN AN EXIT

T\

EXAMPLE OF AN EXIT PASSAGEWAY
THAT REQUIRES EXIT SIGNS ALONG
THE EGRESS PATH AND ON THE
INTERVENING EXT POORS

Bibliography:

City of New York, Department of Buildings. World Trade Center Building Code Task Force: Findings and Recommendations (available at
http://home2.nyc.gov/html/dob/downloads/pdf/wtcbctf.pdf). February, 2003.

LL26/2004 Section 27-383.1 (a).

Cost Impact: This proposal establishes requirements for exit signs in exits where egress direction is not immediately apparent, which may increase
costs in buildings that have more complicated egress paths, but the decrease in egress and full building evacuation time outweighs the moderate
cost of the exit signs.

Public Hearing: Committee: AS AM D
Assembly: ASF AMF DF

E79-07/08
1011.1 (IFC [B] 1011.1)

Proponent: A. Brooks Ballard, Virginia Department of Corrections

Revise as follows:

1011.1 (IFC [B] 1011.1) Where required. Exits and exit access doors shall be marked by an approved exit sign
readily visible from any direction of egress travel. Access to exits shall be marked by readily visible exit signs in cases
where the exit or the path of egress travel is not immediately visible to the occupants. Exit sign placement shall be

such that no point in a corridor is more than 100 feet (30 480 mm) or the listed viewing distance for the sign, whichever
is less, from the nearest visible exit sign.

IBC-E98 ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008



Exceptions:

—_

Exit signs are not required in rooms or areas that require only one exit or exit access.

2. Main exterior exit doors or gates that are obviously and clearly identifiable as exits need not have exit
signs where approved by the building official.

3. Exit signs are not required in occupancies in Group U and individual sleeping units or dwelling units in
Group R-1, R-2 or R-3.

4. Exit signs are not required in dayrooms, sleeping areas rooms, or dormitories in occupancies in Group I-3.

5. In occupancies in Groups A-4 and A-5, exit signs are not required on the seating side of vomitories or

openings into seating areas where exit signs are provided in the concourse that are readily apparent from

the vomitories. Egress lighting is provided to identify each vomitory or opening within the seating area in

an emergency.

Reason: This change clarifies the intent of this section that exit signs are not required in cells or contiguous housing dayrooms or sleeping
dormitories in Group I-3 occupancies as those areas are within the same smoke compartment and therefore fall under the Group I-3 classification.
Most occupants in such buildings are long-time residents who become familiar with the locations of all exits outside their sleeping areas, whether
they are marked or unmarked. In cases of emergency, occupants in Use Group I-3 are escorted by staff to the exits and to safety. The exit signs
also represent potential for vandalism and use as weapons when they are accessible to the residents.

Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction.

Public Hearing: Committee: AS AM D
Assembly: ASF AMF DF

E80-07/08
1011.6 (New), 1011.7 (New), [IFC [B] 1011.6 (New), [B] 1011.7 (New)]

Proponent: Manny Muniz, Manny Muniz Associates, LLC, representing himself
Add new text as follows:
1011.6 (IFC [B] 1011.6) Floor-level exit signs. Where exit signs are required by Section 1011.1, additional approved

floor-level exit signs which are internally or externally illuminated, photoluminescent or self-luminous shall be provided
in all interior corridors of Groups A, E, I, R-1, R-2 and R-4 Occupancies.

Exceptions:

1. Where path marking complying with Section 1011.7 is provided.
2. Group I-3 occupancies.

The bottom of the sign shall not be less than 6 inches (152 mm) or more than 8 inches (203 mm) above the floor
level and shall indicate the path of exit travel. For exit and exit-access doors, the sign shall be on the door or adjacent
to the door with the closest edge of the sign or marker within 4 inches (102 mm) of the door frame.

1011.7 (IFC [B] 1011.7) Path marking. When exit signs are required by Section 1011.1, approved path marking shall
be installed at floor level or no higher that 8 inches (203 mm) above the floor level in all interior corridors of Groups A,
E, I, R-1, R-2 and R-4 occupancies.

Such marking shall be continuous except as interrupted by door-ways, corridors or other such architectural features in
order to provide a visible delineation along the path of travel and shall comply with Section 1011.5.3.

Exceptions:

1. Where floor level exit sighs complying with Section 1011.6 are provided.
2. Group I-3 occupancies.

Reason: Corridor smoke from a fire stratifies from the ceiling downward. This often renders the exit signs located above the exit doors difficult, if
not impossible, to see. From the time a fire begins, the clock for successful evacuation begins to count down. There must never be confusion about
where the exits are.

UL 924, the UL standard for exit signs, does not nor has it ever tested or listed exit signs for visibility through smoke, only for clear air. UL 924
does test and list exit signs for use at the floor proximity where the air is typically clear during the early stages of a fire.

ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008 IBC-E99



California has had requirements in their building code for floor-level exit signs or path markings in interior corridors of Groups A, E, |, and R
since 1989. The State of Connecticut recently enacted a similar law to require floor proximity path markings in all new Group A occupancies with an
occupant load of more than three hundred persons, Group B medical occupancies, Group E, Group I-1, Group I-2, Group R-1 hotels and motels,
and Group R-2 dormitories.

The Federal Aviation Administration, the International Maritime Organization and the American Public Transit Association all require floor-
proximity exit path markings on passenger planes, passenger ships and passenger trains.

The discussion should not be about whether or not buildings should have floor proximity egress path marking but rather which buildings should
have it

Cost Impact: The code change proposal will increase the cost of construction.

Public Hearing: Committee: AS AM D
Assembly: ASF AMF DF

E81-07/08
1012.5 (IFC [B] 1012.5)

Proponent: Scott Crossfield, Theatre Projects Consultants, Inc., representing himself
Revise as follows:

1012.5 (IFC [B] 1012.5) (Supp) Handrail extensions. Handrails shall return to a wall, guard or the walking surface or
shall be continuous to the handrail of an adjacent stair flight. Where handrails are not continuous between flights the
handrails shall extend horizontally at least 12 inches (305 mm) beyond the top riser and continue to slope for the depth
of one tread beyond the bottom riser. At ramps where handrails are not continuous between runs, the handrail shall
extend horizontally above the landing 12 inches (305 mm) minimum beyond the top and bottom of ramp runs. At
stairways and ramps the handrail extensions shall extend in the same direction of the stair flight and ramp run.

Exceptions:

1. Handrails within a dwelling or sleeping unit that is not required to be aceessible Accessible units or Type A
units in accordance with Section 1107, need extend only from the top riser to the bottom riser.

2. Aisle handrails in Group A and E occupancies in accordance with Section 1025.13.

3. Handrails for alternating tread devices may terminate at a location vertically above the top and bottom
risers. Handrails for alternating tread devices are not required to be continuous between flights or to
extend beyond the top or bottom risers.

Reason: The change adds a new sentence for clarification of the direction of the handrail extensions. The current provisions do not indicate if the
handrails extensions must go straight or could bend. If they bend, they no longer assist the stairway user that needs the handrail for support. The
change is also for coordination with 2004 ADA/ABA Accessibility Guidelines and ICC A117.1 Section 505.10.
G208 Part | put a change into Section 3409.8 to address an exception for handrail extension on stairways being altered in existing buildings.
The intent of the additional language in Exception 1 is so that it is clear that the exception may not be used in Accessible units or Type A units
when the individual units have a stairway within the unit. It is our understanding that Fair Housing does not address requirements for stairways
within an individual unit, therefore, Type B units could use this exception.

Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction.

Public Hearing: Committee: AS AM D
Assembly: ASF AMF DF

E82-07/08
1012.5 (IFC [B] 1012.5)

Proponent: Philip Brazil, Reid Middleton, Inc., representing himself
Revise as follows:

1012.5 (IFC [B] 1012.5) (Supp) Handrail extensions. Handrails shall return to a wall, guard or the walking surface or
shall be continuous to the handrail of an adjacent stair flight. Where handrails are not continuous between flights the
handrails shall extend horizontally at least 12 inches (305 mm) beyond the top riser and continue to slope for the depth
of one tread beyond the bottom riser. At ramps where handrails are not continuous between runs, the handrail shall
extend horizontally above the landing 12 inches (305 mm) minimum beyond the top and bottom of ramp runs. The
extensions of handrails shall be in the same direction of the stair flights at stairways and the ramp runs at ramps.

IBC-E100 ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008



Exceptions:

1. Handrails within a dwelling unit or sleeping unit that is not required to be aecessible an Accessible unit or a
Type A unit, need extend only from the top riser to the bottom riser.

2. Aisle handrails in Group A and E occupancies in accordance with Section 1025.13.

3. Handrails for alternating tread devices may terminate at a location vertically above the top and bottom risers.
Handrails for alternating tread devices are not required to be continuous between flights or to extend beyond
the top or bottom risers.

Reason: The question of what direction handrails should extend at the top and bottom of stair flights and ramp runs has existed for many years. |
believe public safety is better served when the extensions are in the same direction as the stair flights and ramp runs they serve. The purpose for
this proposal is to add language making it clear that the extensions are required to be in the same direction. It will also better align IBC Section
1012.5 with Section 505.10 of ICC A117.1-03, which requires handrails to extend beyond and in the same direction of stair flights and ramp runs.

Exception #1 is revised for consistency with the terminology in IBC Chapter 11 for dwelling units, sleeping units, Accessible units and Type A
units. Note that the first two terms are defined in Section 202 and the last two terms are defined in Section 1102.1. Type B units are not also
excluded from qualifying for Exception #1 because multistory dwelling units and sleeping units not provided with elevator service are not required to
be Type B units. Refer to IBC Section 1107.7.2 for further information.

This proposal began as a public comment to Proposal E92-06/07-D. One of the reasons cited by the Means of Egress Committee for
disapproving Proposal E92-06/07 was that there should be an exception where handrails are continuous. The proposed language in this proposal
requiring handrail extensions to be in the same direction as stair flights and ramp runs, however, does not apply to continuous handrails because
there is no extension at a continuous handrail, only at the ends of handrails. Refer to the 2006 Report of the Public Hearing on the 2006 ICC
construction codes for further information.

A second reason cited by the Means of Egress Committee for disapproval was that there should be an exception for Group A aisle situations.
Exception #2 to Section 1012.5, however, exempts aisle handrails in Group A and E occupancies in accordance with Section 1025.13. Section
1025.13 on handrails in assembly occupancies, in turn, provides exemptions for ramped aisles and aisle stairs. Handrails are not required at (1)
ramped aisles with seating on both sides where the slope of the aisle is no greater than1:8 and, (2) at the sides of ramped aisles regardless of the
seating arrangement where a guard with graspability at least equivalent to that required for a handrail is provided.

A third reason cited by the Means of Egress Committee for disapproval was that the straight extension of the handrail into the landing at the top
and bottom of the stairway could be an egress hazard. Section 1012.5, however, currently requires handrails to return to a wall, guard or the
walking surface, except for handrails that are continuous to an adjacent stair flight or ramp run. An extension of a handrail is a portion of the
handrail and is subject to this same requirement.

Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction.

Public Hearing: Committee: AS AM D
Assembly: ASF AMF DF

E83-07/08
1013.1, 1002.1, (IFC [B] 1013.1, [B] 1002.1)

Proponent: Thomas Kinsman, T.A. Kinsman Consulting Company, representing himself
1. Revise as follows:

1013.1 (IFC [B] 1013.1) (Supp) Where required. Guards shall be located along open-sided walking surfaces,
mezzanines, equipment platforms, seatboards, stairways, ramps and landings that are located more than 30 inches
(762 mm) above the floor or grade below. Guards shall be adequate in strength and attachment in accordance with
Section 1607.7. Where glass is used to provide a guard or as a portion of the guard system, the guard shall also
comply with Section 2407. Guards shall also be located along glazed sides of stairways, ramps and landings that are
located more than 30 inches (762 mm) above the floor or grade below where the glazing provided does not meet the
strength and attachment requirements in Section 1607.7.

Exception: Guards are not required for the following locations:

1. On the loading side of loading docks or piers.

2. On the audience side of stages and raised platforms, including steps leading up to the stage and raised
platforms.

3. On raised stage and platform floor areas, such as runways, ramps and side stages used for entertainment
or presentations.

4. At vertical openings in the performance area of stages and platforms.

5. At elevated walking surfaces appurtenant to stages and platforms for access to and utilization of special

lighting or equipment.

Along vehicle service pits not accessible to the public.

In assembly seating where guards in accordance with Section 1025.14 are permitted and provided.

No

ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008 IBC-E101



2. Add new definition as follows:

1002.1 (IFC [B] 1002.1) Definitions. The following words and terms shall, for the purposes of this chapter and as
used elsewhere in this code, have the meanings shown herein.

SEATBOARD. Any furniture intended for sitting that is fixed in place or other building features greater than 4 inches in
width that could be used for sitting such as parapet wall tops at roof decks.

Reason: This proposal should be considered with a companion code change that seeks to strike the term “seatboard” from Section 1013.2. If the
companion code change is rejected, this proposal is set forth to better clarify the code with respect to seatboards. The underlying concern is the
liability for design professionals due to the lack of understanding of what a seatboard is.

This proposal accomplishes two goals: (1) it locates the term “seatboard” in the charging language in Section 1013.1 that otherwise sets forth a
long list of locations of where guards are required; and (2) it sets forth a definition of the term seatboards.

The reference to seatboards in Section 1013.1 is needed because it is currently missing from the list of locations where guards are currently
required and it is unique from all current locations. One shouldn’t have to go to a section titled “Height” to determine if guards are required on
seatboards.....rather it should be found in a section titled “Where required”.

Based on informal comment from ICC staff, the term seatboard came from the legacy codes and was related to bleachers and grandstands.
There was discussion in the last cycle when E98-06/07 was debated that indicated “seatboards” meant fixed furniture. The reference to ICC 300
standard in E98-06/07 for guards for bleachers was rejected. If the code committee desires to keep the term seatboard, a definition is necessary.
Seats are defined as a chair, bench, or pew and designed to support persons in the sitting position. Boards are defined as a piece of wood sawn thin
and with considerable length in comparison with its thickness.

If the intent in the code is to address the possibility of someone standing on a surface that could be used for sitting, this is a very necessary
code change.

Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction.

Public Hearing: Committee: AS AM D
Assembly: ASF AMF DF

E84-07/08
1013.1 (IFC [B] 1013.1)

Proponent: Thomas B. Zuzik Jr., Artistic Railings Inc., representing himself
Revise as follows:

1013.1 (IFC [B] 1013.1) (Supp) Where required. Guards shall be located along open-sided walking surfaces,
mezzanines, equipment platforms, stairways, ramps and landings that are located more than 30 inches (762 mm)

measured vertically to the floor or grade below at any point within 36 inches (914 mm)
horizontal to the edge of the open side. Guards shall be adequate in strength and attachment in accordance with
Section 1607.7. Where glass is used to provide a guard or as a portion of the guard system, the guard shall also
comply with Section 2407. Guards shall also be located along glazed sides of stairways, ramps and landings that are
located more than 30 inches (762 mm) above the floor or grade below where the glazing provided does not meet the
strength and attachment requirements in Section 1607.7.

Exception: Guards are not required for the following locations:

On the loading side of loading docks or piers.

On the audience side of stages and raised platforms, including steps leading up to the stage and raised
platforms.

3 On raised stage and platform floor areas, such as runways, ramps and side stages used for entertainment
or presentations.

4. At vertical openings in the performance area of stages and platforms.

5. At elevated walking surfaces appurtenant to stages and platforms for access to and utilization of special

6

7

N —

lighting or equipment.
Along vehicle service pits not accessible to the public.
In assembly seating where guards in accordance with Section 1025.14 are permitted and provided.

Reason: To provide fixed points for measuring the 30 inch vertical riser height of elevated surfaces to determine if guards are required.

1. The existing R312.1 states that guards are required when the walking surface is 30 inches or more above the walking surface below,
however it does not define clearly were to measure that vertical measurement. This proposed code change also sets a set of parameters as to
where to take the measurements.

2. | the author, previously submitted this proposal in the prior code cycle and used the 24 inch offset measurement that is published in the
BOCA 1996 building code, section 1825.0 retaining walls, section 1825.5 guards, as the determining distance or point of reference for when
retaining walls where required to have guards. Upon request from multiple supporters of the previous proposal a change from 24 inches to 36
inches was made to allow for an area the size of a minimum landing as required in the IRC for inside and outside exterior doors.

IBC-E102 ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008



The diagram below was drawn by the author and is shown as a visual guide or technical drawing. The drawing shows a 3 riser front entry
stoop with 7-3/4” risers from a front elevation. The ground is detailed in outlined dots. The 36” horizontal with 30” vertical box on the right shows the
area in which the code change submits the measurements should be taken. The 32-3/4” vertical point shows the deepest point within the 36”
horizontal edge measurement. The left side of the stoop is shown not over 30” in height and thus no guard required.

26+ i 26+

Thus if this stoop was on a facility it would require a guard be installed on the right side only as the left side is not 30 inches or more deep.

Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction.

Public Hearing: Committee: AS AM D
Assembly: ASF AMF DF

E85-07/08
1013.1, 1013.1.1 (New), 1013.2, 1013.3, 1013.5, 1013.6 (IFC [B] 1013.1, [B] 1013.1.1 (New), [B]
1013.2, [B] 1013.3, [B] 1013.5, [B] 1013.6); IRC R312.1, R312.2

Proponent: Paul K. Heilstedt, P.E., Chair, representing ICC Code Technology Committee (CTC)

THESE PROPOSALS ARE ON THE AGENDA OF THE IBC MEANS OF EGRESS AND THE IRC
BUILDING/ENERGY CODE DEVELOPMENT COMMITTEE AS 2 SEPARATE CODE CHANGES. SEE THE
TENTATIVE HEARING ORDERS FOR THESE COMMITTEES.

PART | - IBC MEANS OF EGRESS
1. Revise as follows:

SECTION 1013.0
GUARDS

1013.1 (IFC [B] 1013.1) (Supp) Where required. Guards shall be located along open-sided walking surfaces,
including mezzanines, equipment platforms, stairways, stairs, ramps and landings, that are located more than 30
inches measured vertically to the floor or grade below at any point within 36 inches ( 914 mm) horizontally to the edge

of the open side abevetheileer—er—grade%etew Guards shaII be adequate in strength and attachment in accordance
wrth Sectron 1607 7. WA . .

Exception: Guards are not required for the following locations:

1. On the loading side of loading docks or piers.
On the audience side of stages and raised platforms, including steps leading up to the stage and raised
platforms.

3. On raised stage and platform floor areas such as runways, ramps and side stages used for entertainment
or presentations.

ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008 IBC-E103



