


 

F32                                                                      ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008 

F42–07/08 
304.3.4 (New) 
 
Proponent: James E. Everitt, Everitt and Associates, representing himself 
 
Add new text as follows:  
 
304.3.4 Plastic dumpsters exceeding one cubic yard. Plastic dumpsters having a peak rate of heat release 
exceeding 300 kW/m2 at an incident  flux of 50 kW/m2 in the horizontal orientation when tested in accordance with  
ASTM E 1354 shall not be stored within buildings or placed within 15 feet of combustible walls, openings, or 
combustible roof lines. 
 

Exceptions:  
 

1. Dumpsters or containers in areas protected by an approved automatic sprinkler system complying with 
Chapter 9. 

2. Storage in a structure shall not be prohibited where the structure is of Type I or Type IIA construction, 
located not less than 10 feet (3048mm) from other buildings and used exclusively for dumpster or 
container storage 

 
Reason: 03 Commentary Although waste containers of this size (1.5 yards) are nearly always constructed of welded steel because of the weight of 
the waste load, the very fact that the waste load is large makes the containers a large fire hazard. 

Medium density polyethylene dumpsters up to nine cubic yards are now being distributed which have a fuel content of 20,020btu per pound 
(municipal solid waste averages 4,500btu lb). Medium density polyethylene is essentially equal to the fuel value for gasoline!  This material becomes 
a burning liquid spreading and flowing, it is an unnecessary risk to place them five feet away from a nearby structure.    

“FIRE LOSS IN THE UNITED STATES DURING 2005” States: Fires in rubbish outside of structures including dumpsters have increased 
10.8% nationally from 2004.  
 

 
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction. The use of these containers is not wide spread. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 



 

ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008                                                                                                                                   F33 

F43–07/08  
307.1.1 
 
Proponent: A. Keith Brown, North Metro Fire Rescue District, representing Fire Marshal’s Association of Colorado 
 
Revise as follows:  
 
307.1.1 Prohibited open burning. Open burning that is offensive or objectionable because of smoke or odor 
emissions or when atmospheric conditions or local circumstances make such fires hazardous shall be prohibited. 
 
Reason: The purpose of the proposed code change is to delete a prohibition imposed by the code; namely, a prohibition against offensive or 
objectionable smoke or odors resulting from open burning.  Enforcement of said prohibition is inherently arbitrary and capricious because the current 
code language compels the Fire Code Official to render an unreasonably subjective and irreproducible judgment in the absence of quantitative 
guidelines provided in Section 307 or referenced standards. The proposed language preserves those historic prohibitions, such as high winds 
(atmospheric conditions) and/or drought (local circumstances), that are demonstrably linked to fire behavior. 
 
Cost Impact: The code change will not increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 

F44–07/08  
307.4.3 (New), 307.5, 302.1, 307 
 
Proponent: Tom Lariviere, Fire Department, Madison, MS, representing Joint Fire Service Review Committee 
 
1. Add new text as follows:  
 
307.4.3 Portable outdoor fireplaces. Portable outdoor fireplaces shall not be operated within 15 feet (3048 mm) of a 
structure or combustible material.    
 

Exception:  Portable outdoor fireplaces used in accordance with manufacturer’s instructions at one- and two-
family dwellings.   

 
2. Revise as follows: 
 
307.5 Attendance. Open burning, bonfires, or recreational fires and use of portable outdoor fireplaces shall be 
constantly attended until the fire is extinguished. A minimum of one portable fire extinguisher complying with Section 
906 with a minimum 4-A rating or other approved on-site fire-extinguishing equipment, such as dirt, sand, water barrel, 
garden hose or water truck, shall be available for immediate utilization. 
 
3. Revise definitions as follows: 
 
302.1 Definitions. The following words and terms shall, for the purposes of this chapter and as used elsewhere in this 
code, have the meanings shown herein. 
 
OPEN BURNING. The burning of materials wherein products of combustion are emitted directly into the ambient air 
without passing through a stack or chimney from an enclosed chamber. Open burning does not include road flares, 
smudgepots and similar devices associated with safety or occupational uses typically considered open flames, or 
recreational fires or use of portable outdoor fireplaces. For the purpose of this definition, a chamber shall be regarded 
as enclosed when, during the time combustion occurs, only apertures, ducts, stacks, flues or chimneys necessary to 
provide combustion air and permit the escape of exhaust gas are open. 
 
PORTABLE OUTDOOR FIREPLACE.  A portable, outdoor, solid-fuel-burning fireplace that may be constructed of 
steel, concrete, clay or other noncombustible material. A portable outdoor fireplace may be open in design, or may be 
equipped with a small hearth opening and a short chimney or chimney opening in the top.    
 
RECREATIONAL FIRE. An outdoor fire burning materials other than rubbish where the fuel being burned is not 
contained in an incinerator, outdoor fireplace, portable outdoor fireplace, barbeque grill or barbeque pit and has a total 
fuel area of 3 feet (914 mm) or less in diameter and 2 feet (610 mm) or less in height for pleasure, religious, ceremonial, 
cooking, warmth or similar purposes. 



 

F34                                                                      ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008 

4. Revise section title as follows: 
 

SECTION 307 
OPEN BURNING, AND RECREATIONAL FIRES AND PORTABLE OUTDOOR FIREPLACES 

 
Reason: This proposal adds a definition for portable outdoor fireplace and makes minor revision to definitions of open burning and recreational fire 
for clarification. The proposed addition of subsection 307.4.3 Portable Outdoor Fireplaces makes clear that the use of these devices is specifically 
regulated.  
 Portable outdoor fireplaces designed to burn solid fuel are available at retailers ranging from the local grocery to hardware store to big box 
retailers. Their widespread availability and use has created considerable confusion for citizens and the fire service as to how or if they are regulated 
by the IFC.  
 Fires in portable outdoor fireplaces cannot be considered a “recreational fire” because critical to that definition is the concept that the fire is not 
contained in an incinerator, outdoor fireplace, barbeque grill or barbeque pit.  Some may then suggest that a portable outdoor fireplace is merely a 
type of “outdoor fireplace”, but the IFC doesn’t contain any references pertaining to where an outdoor fireplace can be located or operated.  
 Under the definition of open burning, the IFC commentary refers to patio fireplaces and states “These devices neither meet the literal definition 
of “open burning” nor is their use the type of burning intended to be regulated by Section 307, ...” However, the use and any hazard associated from 
operating a patio fireplace is closer to the type of activities regulated in Section 307 than use of other specific types of open flame addressed in 
Section 308.  The current IFC Sections 307 and 308 are essentially silent on use of this specific type of device.  
 The proposal prohibiting use of portable outdoor fireplaces within 15 feet from any structure replicates the first exception under 307.4 Location. 
However, the proposal allows an exception for use of patio fireplaces at one- and two-family dwellings.   
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 

F45–07/08  
308.3, 308.3.1, 308.3.2 
 
Proponent: Michael E. Dell’Orfano, South Metro Fire Rescue, representing Fire Marshal’s Association of Colorado 
 
Revise as follows:  
 
308.3 Open flame decorative devices.  Open flame decorative devices shall be used in accordance with this 
section.A person shall not utilize or allow to be utilized, an open flame in connection with a public meeting or gathering 
for purposes of deliberation, worship, entertainment, amusement, instruction, education, recreation, awaiting 
transportation or similar purpose in Group A or E occupancies without first obtaining a permit in accordance with 
Section 105.6. 
 
308.3.1 308.7 (Supp) Open-flame cooking devices. Charcoal burners and other open-flame cooking devices shall 
not be operated on combustible balconies or within 10 feet (3048 mm) of combustible construction. 
 

Exceptions: 
 

1. One- and two-family dwellings. 
2. Where buildings, balconies and decks are protected by an automatic sprinkler system. 
3. LP-gas cooking devices having LP gas container with a water capacity not greater than 2.5 pounds 

[nominal 1 pound (0.454 kg) LP-gas capacity]. 
 
308.3.2 308.3.1 Open-flame decorative devices General requirements. Open-flame decorative devices shall comply 
with all of the following restrictions: 
 
 1. through 10. (No change to current text) 
 
Reason: The purpose of this code change proposal is to clarify the scope of IFC Section 308.3.  The way 308.3 is currently written can lead 
someone to believe that this section only applies to Group A and E occupancies.  However, that charging paragraph only says that those uses need 
a permit per 105.6.  This is further supported by the fact that Section 308.3.8 addresses Group R-2 Dormitories.  Also, with the exception of the 
cooking device subsection, all other components of 308.3 appear to only address open-flame decorative devices.  Therefore, the title of 308.3 was 
changed to reflect this scope, open-flame cooking devices were moved to a stand-alone section (similar to food preparation, torches, portable-fueled 
devices, etc.), and the title of 308.3.2 was changed to “general requirements” to reflect its intended use.  General permit requirements are already 
addressed in 301.2. 
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 



 

ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008                                                                                                                                   F35 

F46–07/08 
308.3.1 
 
Proponent: Michael E. Dell’Orfano, South Metro Fire Rescue, representing Fire Marshal’s Association of Colorado 
 
Revise as follows:  
 
308.3.1 (Supp) Open-flame cooking devices. Charcoal burners, LP-gas burners having an LP-gas container with a 
water capacity greater than 2.5 pounds [nominal 1 pound (0.454 kg) LP-gas capacity], and other open-flame cooking 
devices shall not be operated on combustible balconies or within 10 ft (3048 mm) of any combustible construction. 

 
Exceptions: 
 

1. One- and two-family dwellings. 
2. Where buildings, balconies and decks are protected by an automatic sprinkler system, and any LP-gas 

containers are not greater than 2.5 pounds [nominal 1 pound (0.454 kg) LP-gas capacity]. 
3. LP gas cooking devices having an LP-gas container with a water capacity not greater than 2.5 pounds 

[nominal 1 pound (0.454 kg) LP-gas capacity]. 
 
Reason: F28-06/07 was approved as submitted during the code hearings in Orlando, which combined Sections 308.3.1 and 308.3.1.1 of the 2006 
IFC. This was intended to be only an editorial change to make the sections easier to use, without attempting to change the intent of those sections.  
However, the end result did change the original intent of the code.  In order to be consistent with the original intent of the 2006 IFC, it is necessary to 
add the words in Exception #2 proposed by this code change.  While there was an exception for one- and two-family dwellings in both 2006 IFC 
Sections 308.3.1 and 308.3.1.1, the sprinkler exception was only found in Section 308.3.1. Therefore, the original intent of the 2006 IFC was to 
prohibit cooking devices utilizing LP-gas cylinders greater than 2.5 pounds, even with sprinkler protection. This logic is supported by the 2003 IFC 
Commentary which states “Section 308.3.1.1… contains a very specific regulation for only LP-gas-fired cooking devices in the described locations 
and would, therefore, take precedence over the general provisions of this [308.3.1] section.” 
 This proposal also re-locates Exception #3 to the charging paragraph in order to help the whole section work better.  The end result is the same 
with LP-gas cylinders up to 2.5 pounds allowed, regardless of sprinkler protection. 
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 

F47–07/08 
308.3.1 
 
Proponent: Joseph T. Holland, III, Hoover Treated Wood Products 
 
Revise as follows:  
 
308.3.1 (Supp) Open-flame cooking devices. Charcoal burners and other open-flame cooking devices shall not be 
operated on combustible balconies or within 10 feet (3048 mm) of combustible construction. 
 

Exceptions: 
 

1. One- and two-family dwellings. 
2. Where buildings, balconies and decks are protected by an automatic sprinkler system, or 1-hr or greater  

  fire-resistance rated construction, or Type IV construction in accordance with Section 602.4 of the   
  International Building Code, or fire-retardant-treated wood in accordance with Section 2303.2 of the   
  International Building Code.. 

3. LP-gas cooking devices having LP gas container with a water capacity not greater than 2.5 pounds 
[nominal 1 pound (0.454 kg) LP-gas capacity]. 

 
Reason: Allow other means to achieve protection of the balcony. A fire rated assembly, heavy timber and fire-retardant-treated wood are recognized 
as providing fire protection; heavy timber because of its dimensions and FRTW because of the treatment. All three are already recognized in the 
building code (Section 1406.3) for protecting balconies in addition to sprinklers. 
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 



 

F36                                                                      ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008 

F48–07/08 
308.3.1 
 
Proponent: Michael E. Dell’Orfano, South Metro Fire District, representing Fire Marshal’s Association of Colorado 
 
Revise as follows:  
 
308.3.1 308.7 (Supp) Open-flame cooking devices. Charcoal burners and other open-flame cooking devices shall 
not be operated on combustible balconies or within 10 ft (3048 mm) of any combustible construction. 

 
Exceptions: 
 

1. One- and two-family dwellings. 
2. Where buildings, balconies and decks are protected by an automatic sprinkler system. 
3. LP-gas cooking devices having an LP-gas container with a water capacity not greater than 2.5 pounds 

[nominal 1 pound (0.454 kg) LP-gas capacity]. 
 
Reason: The focus of IFC Section 308.3 appears to be on open-flame decorative devices and their related uses.  The flow and intent of Section 
308.3 gets confused when a stand-alone topic such as “open-flame cooking devices” is inserted.  Therefore, the purpose of this code change 
proposal is to remove open-flame cooking device regulations from Section 308.3 and create a new section (308.7) to address this issue.  Section 
308.7, then, would be similar to Sections 308.5 and 308.6 which address other stand-alone, specific topics. 
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 

F49–07/08 
308.3.2, 308.3.3 (New) 
 
Proponent: A. Keith Brown, North Metro Fire Rescue District, representing Fire Marshal’s Association of Colorado 
 
1. Revise as follows:  
 
308.3.2 Liquid-fueled Oopen flame decorative devices.  Liquid-fueled oOpen-flame decorative devices shall comply 
with all of the following restrictions: 
 

1. Class I and Class II liquids and LP-gas shall not be used. 
2. Liquid- or solid-fueled lighting devices containing more than 8 ounces (237 ml) of fuel must self-extinguish and 

not leak fuel at a rate of more than 0.25 teaspoon per minute (1.26 ml per minute) if tipped over. 
3. The device or holder shall be constructed to prevent the spillage of liquid fuel or wax at the rate of more than 

0.25 teaspoon per minute (1.26 ml per minute) when the device or holder is not in an upright position. 
4. The device or holder shall be designed so that it will return to the upright position after being tilted to an angle 

of 45 degrees from vertical. 
 

Exception:  Devices that self-extinguish if tipped over and do not spill fuel or wax at the rate of more than 
0.25 teaspoon per minute (1.26 ml per minute) if tipped over. 
 

5. The flame shall be enclosed except where openings on the side are not more than 0.375 inch (9.5 mm) 
diameter or where openings are on the top and the distance to the top is such that a piece of tissue paper 
placed on the top will not ignite in 10 seconds. 

5. Chimneys shall be made of noncombustible materials and securely attached to the open-flame device. 
 

Exception: A chimney is not required to be attached to any open-flame device that will self-extinguish if 
the device is tipped over. 

7. Fuel canisters shall be safely sealed for storage. 
8. Storage and handling of combustible liquids shall be in accordance with Chapter 34. 
9. Shades, where used, shall be made of noncombustible materials and securely attached to the open-flame 

device holder or chimney. 
10. Candelabras with flame-lighted candles shall be securely fastened in place to prevent overturning, and shall 



 

ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008                                                                                                                                   F37 

be located away from occupants using the area and away from possible contact with drapes, curtains or other 
combustibles. 

 
2. Add new text as follows: 
 
308.3.3 Solid-fueled open-flame decorative devices.  Solid-fueled open-flame decorative devices shall comply with 
all of the following: 
 

1. The device shall be securely supported on a substantial noncombustible base. 
2. Solid fueled lighting devices containing more than 8 ounces (226.8 g) of fuel must self-extinguish if tipped 

over. 
3. The device or holder shall be constructed to prevent the spillage of wax when the device or holder is not in an 

upright position. 
4. The device or holder shall be designed so that it will return to the upright position after being tilted to an angle 

of 45 degrees from vertical. 
5. Chimneys shall be made of noncombustible materials and securely attached to the open-flame device. 
6. Shades, where used, shall be made of noncombustible materials and securely attached to the open-flame 

decorative device holder or chimney. 
7. Candelabras shall be securely fastened in place to prevent overturning, and shall be located away from 

occupants using the area and away from possible contact with drapes, curtains or other combustibles. 
 
(Renumber subsequent sections) 
 
Reason: The purpose of the proposed code change is to clarify which of the enumerated restrictions apply only to liquid-fueled devices, which apply 
only to solid-fueled devices, and which apply to both types of devices.  For example, leak rates (currently Items 2, 3, and 4) apply to liquid-fueled 
devices but do not apply to solid-fueled devices such as paraffin candles.  The restructuring of 308.3.2 into two subsections (liquid-fueled and solid-
fueled) facilitates that clarification.  Overall, this proposed code reorganization neither adds nor omits any restrictions pertaining to open-flame 
decorative devices. 
 
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 

F50–07/08 
308.3.7 
 
Proponent: A. Keith Brown, North Metro Fire Rescue District, representing Fire Marshal’s Association of Colorado 
 
Revise as follows:  
 
308.3.7 Group A occupancies. Open-flame devices shall not be used in a Group A occupancy. 
 

Exceptions: 
 

1. Open-flame devices are allowed to be used in the following situations, provided approved precautions 
are taken to prevent ignition of a combustible material or injury to occupants: 
1.1.  Where necessary For ceremonial or religious purposes in accordance with Section 308.3.5. 
1.2. On stages and platforms as a necessary part of a performance in accordance with Section 

308.3.6. 
1.3. Where candles on tables are securely supported on substantial noncombustible bases and the 

candle flames are protected open-flame decorative devices are used in accordance with Sections 
308.3.2, 308.3.3 and 308.3.4. 

2. Heat-producing equipment complying with Chapter 6 and the International Mechanical Code. 
3. Gas lights are allowed to be used provided adequate precautions satisfactory to the fire code official are 

taken to prevent ignition of combustible materials. 
 
Reason: The purpose of the proposed code change is to provide parallel wording among the three items listed under Exception 1 and to make the 
use of open-flame decorative devices in Group A occupancies at least as stringent as the IFC requires in other occupancies.  As currently written, 
Exception 1 Item 1.3 imposes less restrictive safety requirements for candles used in Group A occupancies than Sections 308.3.2, 308.3.3, and 
308.3.4 impose for candles and other open-flame decorative devices generally.  Such less restrictive use of open-flame devices in Group A 



 

F38                                                                      ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008 

occupancies is the antithesis of the intent of the general requirement of Section 308.3.7 that open-flame devices shall not be used at all in a Group A 
occupancy due to the inherent need for enhanced life safety appropriate for that occupancy group.  Additionally, the current wording of Item 1.3 is 
specific only to “candles on tables” while the language in the principal part of Exception 1 is clearly intended to apply to all open-flame devices; the 
proposed revision eliminates the undue specificity of the current Item 1.3. 
 Striking the word “necessary” in both Items 1.1 and 1.2 of Exception 1 eliminates extraneous language.  The apparent intent of these items is to 
allow the use of open-flame devices during religious ceremonies or theatrical performances in Group A occupancies rather than to give the fire code 
official the opportunity to deny the use of open-flame devices on the grounds that said use is not “necessary.”  The proposed changes will prevent 
arguments over what is or is not “necessary,” thus allowing the application of Exception 1 to focus on the safety procedures employed. 
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 

F51–07/08  
308 
 
Proponent: Ian MacDonald, Fire Department, City of Orange, CA, representing California Fire Chiefs Association 
 
1. Revise as follows:  
 
308.1 General. Open flame, fire and burning on all premises shall be in accordance with Sections 308.1 through 
308.4, and with other applicable sections of this code. This section shall control open flames, fire and burning on all 
premises. 
 
308.2 308.1.1 Where prohibited. A person shall not take or utilize an open flame or light in a structure, vessel, boat or 
other place where highly flammable, combustible or explosive material is utilized or stored. Lighting appliances shall be 
well-secured in a glass globe and wire mesh cage or a similar approved device. 
 
308.2.1 308.1.2 Throwing or placing sources of ignition. No person shall throw or place, or cause to be thrown or 
placed, a lighted match, cigar, cigarette, matches, or other flaming or glowing substance or object on any surface or 
article where it can cause an unwanted fire. 
 
308.4 308.1.3 Torches for removing paint. Persons utilizing a torch or other flame-producing device for removing 
paint from a structure shall provide a minimum of one portable fire extinguisher complying with Section 906 and with a 
minimum 4-A rating, two portable fire extinguishers, each with a minimum 2-A rating, or a water hose connected to the 
water supply on the premises where such burning is done. The person doing the burning shall remain on the premises 
1 hour after the torch or flame-producing device is utilized. 
 
308.3.1 (Supp) 308.1.4 Open-flame cooking devices. Charcoal burners and other open-flame cooking devices shall 
not be operated on combustible balconies or within 10 feet (3048 mm) of combustible construction. 
 

Exceptions: 
 

1. One- and two-family dwellings. 
2. Where buildings, balconies and decks are protected by an automatic sprinkler system. 

 
 3.  308.1.4.1 Liquefied-petroleum-gas-fueled cooking devices. LP-gas cooking devices having LP gas containers 
with a water capacity not greater than 2.5 pounds (nominal 1 pound (0.454 kg) LP-gas capacity) shall not be located 
on combustible balconies or within 10 feet (3048 mm) of combustible construction. 
 

Exception: One- and two-family dwellings. 
 
308.3.3 308.1.5 Location near combustibles. Open flames such as from candles, lanterns, kerosene heaters, and 
gas-fired heaters shall not be located on or near decorative material or similar combustible materials. 
 
308.5 (Supp) 308.1.6 Open-flame devices. Torches and other devices, machines or processes liable to start or cause 
fire shall not be operated or used in or upon wildfire risk areas, except by a permit in accordance with Section 105.6 
secured from the fire code official. 
 

Exception: Use within inhabited premises or designated campsites which are a minimum of 30 feet (9144 mm) 
from grass-, grain-, brush- or forest-covered areas. 



 

ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008                                                                                                                                   F39 

308.5.1 (Supp) 308.1.6.1 Signals and markers. Flame-employing devices, such as lanterns or kerosene road flares, 
shall not be operated or used as a signal or marker in or upon wildfire risk areas. 
 

Exception: The proper use of fuses at the scenes of emergencies or as required by standard railroad operating  
procedures. 

 
308.5.2 308.1.6.2 Portable fueled open-flame devices. Portable open-flame devices fueled by flammable or 
combustible gases or liquids shall be enclosed or installed in such a manner as to prevent the flame from contacting 
combustible material. 
 

Exceptions: 
 

1. LP-gas-fueled devices used for sweating pipe joints or removing paint in accordance with Chapter 38. 
2. Cutting and welding operations in accordance with Chapter 26. 
3. Torches or flame-producing devices in accordance with Section 308.4. 
4. Candles and open-flame decorative devices in accordance with Section 308.3. 

 
2. Add new text as follows: 
 
308.2 Permits required. Permits shall be obtained from the fire code official in accordance with Section 105.6 prior to 
engaging in the following activities involving open flame, fire and burning: 
 

1. Use of a torch or flame-producing device to remove paint from a structure. 
2. Use of open flame, fire or burning in connection with Group A or E occupancies. 
3. Use or operation of torches and other devices, machines or processes liable to start or cause fire in or upon 

hazardous fire areas. 
 
3. Revise as follows: 
 
308.3.7 308.3  Group A occupancies. Open-flame,  devices fire and burning shall not be used allowed in a Group A 
occupancy occupancies unless specifically permitted by the fire code official, and used in accordance with the 
requirements of Sections 308.1 and 308.3. 
 

Exceptions: 
 

1. Open-flame devices are allowed to be used in the following situations, provided approved precautions are 
taken to prevent ignition of a combustible material or injury to occupants: 
1.1.  Where necessary for ceremonial or religious purposes in accordance with Section 308.3.5. 
1.2. On stages and platforms as a necessary part of a performance in accordance with Section 

308.3.6. 
1.3. Where candles on tables are securely supported on substantial noncombustible bases and the 

candle flames are protected. 
2. Heat-producing equipment complying with Chapter 6 and the International Mechanical Code. 
3. Gas lights are allowed to be used provided adequate precautions satisfactory to the fire code official are 

taken to prevent ignition of combustible materials. 
 
308.3.2 308.3.1 Candles and other open-flame decorative devices. Candles and other open-flame decorative 
devices in drinking and dining establishments shall comply with all of the following restrictions: 
 

1. Class I and Class II liquids and LP-gas shall not be used. 
2. Liquid- or solid-fueled lighting devices containing more than 8 ounces (237 ml) of fuel must self-extinguish and 

not leak fuel at a rate of more than 0.25 teaspoon per minute (1.26 ml per minute) if tipped over. 
3. The device or holder shall be constructed to prevent the spillage of liquid fuel or wax at the rate of more than 

0.25 teaspoon per minute (1.26 ml per minute) when the device or holder is not in an upright position. 
4. The device or holder shall be designed so that it will return to the upright position after being tilted to an angle 

of 45 degrees from vertical. 
 

Exception: Devices that self-extinguish if tipped over and do not spill fuel or wax at the rate of more than 
0.25 teaspoon per minute (1.26 ml per minute) if tipped over. 

 
5. The flame shall be enclosed except where openings on the side are not more than 0.375 inch (9.5 mm) 

diameter or where openings are on the top and the distance to the top is such that a piece of tissue paper 
placed on the top will not ignite in 10 seconds. 



 

F40                                                                      ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008 

6. Chimneys shall be made of noncombustible materials and securely attached to the open-flame device. 
 

Exception: A chimney is not required to be attached to any open-flame device that will self-extinguish if 
the device is tipped over. 

 
7. Fuel canisters shall be safely sealed for storage. 
8. Storage and handling of combustible liquids shall be in accordance with Chapter 34. 
9. Shades, where used, shall be made of noncombustible materials and securely attached to the open-flame  

  device holder or chimney. 
10. Candelabras with flame-lighted candles shall be securely fastened in place to prevent overturning, and shall 

be located away from occupants using the area and away from possible contact with drapes, curtains or other 
combustibles. 

 
308.3.5 308.3.1.1  Religious ceremonies. When, in the opinion of the fire code official, adequate safeguards have 
been taken, participants in religious ceremonies are allowed to carry hand-held candles. Hand-held candles shall not 
be passed from one person to another while lighted. 
 
308.3.4 308.3.1.2 Aisles and exits. Candles shall be prohibited in areas where occupants stand, or in an aisle or exit. 
 
308.6 308.3.2  Flaming food and beverage preparation. The preparation of flaming foods or beverages in places of 
assembly and drinking or dining establishments areas, dining areas of restaurants and drinking establishments shall 
be in accordance with Sections 308.6.1 308.3.2.1 through 308.6.5 308.3.2.5. 
 
308.6.1 308.3.2.1 Dispensing. Flammable or combustible liquids used in the preparation of flaming foods or 
beverages shall be dispensed from one of the following: 
 

1. A 1-ounce (29.6 ml) container; or 
2. A container not exceeding 1-quart (946.5 ml) capacity with a controlled pouring device that will limit the flow to 

a 1-ounce (29.6 ml) serving. 
 
308.6.2 308.3.2.2 Containers not in use. Containers shall be secured to prevent spillage when not in use. 
 
308.6.3 308.3.2.3 Serving of flaming food. The serving of flaming foods or beverages shall be done in a safe manner 
and shall not create high flames. The pouring, ladling or spooning of liquids is restricted to a maximum height of 8 
inches (203 mm) above the receiving receptacle. 
 
308.6.4 308.3.2.4 Location. Flaming foods or beverages shall be prepared only in the immediate vicinity of the table 
being serviced. They shall not be transported or carried while burning. 
 
308.6.5 308.3.2.5 Fire protection. The person preparing the flaming foods or beverages shall have a wet cloth towel 
immediately available for use in smothering the flames in the event of an emergency. 
 
308.3.6 308.3.3 Theatrical performances. Where approved permitted, open-flame devices used in conjunction with 
theatrical performances are allowed to be used when adequate safety precautions have been taken in accordance with 
NFPA 160. 
 
4. Add new text as follows: 
 
308.4 Group R Occupancies.  Open flame, fire and burning in Group R occupancies shall comply with the 
requirements of Sections 308.1 through 308.1.6.2 and 308.4.1. 
 
5. Revise as follows: 
 
308.3.8 308.4.1 Group R-2 dormitories. Candles, incense and similar open-flame-producing items shall not be 
allowed in sleeping units in Group R-2 dormitory occupancies. 
 
Reason: This proposal creates consistency within Section 308, consistency with the language in Sections 105.6.30, 105.6.31, and 105.6.32 
(permits), and with the rest of the fire code.  Specifically, it cleans up inconsistent code language, reformats the section to provide more consistency 
with the rest of the code as well as improving the logical flow of the section, moves open-flame cooking devices out from underneath Group A and E 
occupancy requirements, and allows for sections related to open flame, fire and burning in other areas of the code (e.g. Sections 1503.2.2. and 
1103.1). 

Justification for revisions and new text is as follows: 
Section 308.1  This language specifies all of the subsections in section 308, as is consistent with other IFC code language.  Provisions are 

added for required compliance with the remainder of the code. 



 

ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008                                                                                                                                   F41 

Sections 308.1.1 through 308.1.6.2  All of the general code sections have been moved to 308.1, which is appropriately named “General.”  
Sections containing special requirements according to occupancies groups contain language requiring compliance with the specific and general 
requirements.  This language is consistent with the remainder of the fire code (e.g. Section 2704.1). 

Section 308.1.4 has been moved from 308.3.1.  It was originally a subsection of 308.3, which contained requirements for obtaining a permit for 
open flame in Group A and E occupancies.  Section 308.3.1 and 308.3.1.1 should not only apply to open-flame cooking devices within Group A and 
E occupancies, especially with exceptions for one- and two-family dwellings. 

Section 308.2  New text was added for permits.  The “.2” subsection is consistent within the code for permit information. 
Section 308.3  The language was modified for consistency with Section 308.1.  The revised language also ensures compliance with both the 

general and specific requirements. 
Section 308.3.1  The addition of candles in the language provides clarity to the requirements without diminishing them.  The more general 

reference to drinking and dining establishments is appropriate, as there should not be the differentiation between the kitchen and dining areas of the 
restaurant in this case.  The differentiation is appropriate when addressing flaming food and beverage preparation, which is appropriately conducted 
in the kitchen.  

Section 308.3.2  The differentiation between assembly, drinking and dining areas of restaurants and drinking establishments, and the kitchen 
or preparation areas. 

Section 308.4   The added language ensures compliance with both the general and specific requirements of Section 308, and is also 
consistent with the rest of the fire code language. 
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 

F52–07/08 
310 
 
Proponent: Tom Lariviere, Fire Department, Madison, MS, representing Joint Fire Service Review Committee 
 
Revise as follows:  
 

SECTION 310 
SMOKING 

 
310.1 General. The smoking or carrying of a lighted pipe, cigar, cigarette or any other type of smoking paraphernalia 
or material is prohibited in the areas indicated in this section.  Where required by the fire code official, a written 
smoking policy shall be developed. The smoking policy shall include, but not be limited to, the requirements in 310.2 
through 310.7. 
 
310.2 Prohibited areas. Smoking shall be prohibited where conditions are such as to make smoking a fire hazard and 
in spaces where flammable or combustible materials are stored or handled.  
 
310.2.1 Medical oxygen.  Smoking shall be prohibited in rooms or areas where medical oxygen is in use. 
 
310.3 “No Smoking” signs. The fire code official is authorized to order the posting of “No Smoking” signs in a 
conspicuous location in each structure or location in which smoking is prohibited. The content, lettering, size, color and 
location of required “No Smoking” signs shall be approved. 
 
310.4 Removal of signs prohibited. A posted “No Smoking” sign shall not be obscured, removed, defaced, mutilated 
or destroyed. 
 
310.5 Compliance with “No Smoking” signs. Smoking shall not be permitted nor shall a person smoke, throw or 
deposit any lighted or smoldering substance in any place where “No Smoking” signs are posted. 
 
310.6 Ash trays. Where smoking is permitted, suitable noncombustible ash trays or match receivers shall be provided 
on each table and at other appropriate locations. Metal trash containers with self-closing lids shall be available for 
emptying ashtrays in areas where smoking is permitted. 
 
310.7 Burning objects. Lighted matches, cigarettes, cigars or other burning object shall not be discarded in such a 
manner that could cause ignition of other combustible material. 
 
310.8 Hazardous environmental conditions. When the fire code official determines that hazardous environmental 
conditions necessitate controlled use of smoking materials, the ignition or use of such materials in mountainous, brush-
covered or forest-covered areas or other designated areas is prohibited except in approved designated smoking areas. 



 

F42                                                                      ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008 

 
Reason: Smoking can be an extremely hazardous situation.  There are specific times when smoking must be prohibited based on the hazard and 
the location. This proposal enhances the smoking requirements in the IFC and clarifies the requirements.   

In 310.1 the fire code official can require a written smoking policy when necessary. This typically would occur in a facility where smoking is 
allowed in some areas and not in others, and there is a higher fire hazard or life hazard present. 

310.2 is revised to simplify the requirement and states that if smoking is a fire hazard, for whatever reason, then smoking is not allowed. 
310.1 is added to address the use of medical oxygen.  This would be applicable to either patients in a health care facility or elsewhere. 
310.6 is revised to clarify that not only are the ashtrays to be noncombustible, but also the trash container that the ashtrays are dumped into 

needs to be noncombustible. 
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 

F53–07/08  
311.2.2 
 
Proponent: Tom Lariviere, Fire Department, Madison, MS, representing Joint Fire Service Review Committee 
 
Revise as follows:  
 
311.2.2 Fire protection. Fire alarm, sprinkler and standpipe systems shall be maintained in an operable condition at 
all times. 
 

Exceptions:  
 

1. When the premises have been cleared of all combustible materials and debris and, in the opinion of the 
fire code official, the type of construction, fire separation distance and security of the premises do not 
create a fire hazard. 

2. Where approved, buildings that will not be heated and where fire protection systems will be exposed to 
freezing temperatures, fire alarm and sprinkler systems are permitted to be placed out of service and 
standpipes are permitted to be maintained as dry systems (without an automatic water supply) provided 
the building has no contents or storage, and windows, doors and other openings are secured to prohibit 
entry by unauthorized persons. 

 
Reason: This proposal will require that the allowance to place either a fire sprinkler system or a fire alarm system out of service must be approved.  
It will not be an automatic allowance and acceptable practice. This proposal only indicates “approval” which will require that the use of this exception 
is approved by what ever process the local jurisdiction determines to be appropriate. It may need to include the fire code official, building code 
official, and fire chief, or any combination of these positions. 
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 

F54–07/08  
311.5.4 
 
Proponent: Sean DeCrane, Fire Department, Cleveland, OH, representing International Association of Fire Fighters, 
Local 93 
 
Revise as follows:  
 
311.5.4 Placard symbols. The design of the placards shall use the following symbols: 
 

1. [ ]   This symbol shall mean that the structure had normal structural conditions at the time of marking. 
2. [\] This symbol shall mean that structural or interior hazards exist and interior fire-fighting or rescue  
  operations should be conducted with extreme caution. 
3. [X] This symbol shall mean that structural or interior hazards exist to a degree that consideration should be  
  given to limit fire fighting to exterior operations only, with entry only occurring for known life hazards. 



 

ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008                                                                                                                                   F43 

4. Vacant Marker Hazard Identification Symbols: The following symbols shall used to designate known hazards 
on the Vacant Building Marker. They shall be painted directly above the symbol. 
4.1.  R/O - Roof Open 
4.2.  S/M - Stairs, Steps and Landing Missing 
4.3.  F/E – Avoid Fire Escapes 
4.4.  H/F – Holes in Floor 

 
Reason: There are a number of cities that are now requiring their fire departments to identify, and label, vacant buildings and the hazards they 
present to fire fighters. A vacant building can contain many hazards and unknowns to a responding fire fighter. During normal fire company 
operations, or after a response to a fire in a vacant structure, the fire department can simply paint, or use a placard, to designate the hazards 
encountered in the structure. By labeling the various degrees of hazards, the incident commanders can restrict operations to strictly defensive or 
cautious offensive operations. Simply identifying the known hazards allows the Incident Commander to have a clearer picture of the hazards 
contained in the building. 
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 

F55–07/08  
313.1 
 
Proponent: Tom Lariviere, Fire Department, Madison, MS, representing Joint Fire Service Review Committee 
 
Revise as follows:  
 
313.1 General. Fueled equipment, including but not limited to motorcycles, mopeds, lawn-care equipment, portable 
generators and portable cooking equipment, shall not be stored, operated or repaired within a building. 
 

Exceptions:  
 

1. Buildings or rooms constructed for such use in accordance with the International Building Code. 
2. Where allowed by Section 314. 
3. Storage of equipment utilized for maintenance purposes is allowed in approved locations when the 

aggregate fuel capacity of the stored equipment does not exceed 10 gallons (38 L) and the building is 
equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1. 

 
Reason: This revision is needed to clarify that portable generators are not allowed for use inside buildings based on the current code text.  The only 
exception to this is when utilized in accordance with one of the exceptions. This provision clarifies the current intent of the code.  As the result of 
recent tragic hurricanes it was documented that multiple fatalities occurred as the result of the improper use and location of portable generators. 
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 

F56– 07/08  
315.3.1 
 
Proponent: Ernest Little, Captain-Code Compliance, Prince William County, VA Fire Marshals Office 
 
Revise as follows:  
 
315.3.1 Storage beneath overhead projections from buildings. Combustible materials stored or displayed outside 
of buildings that are protected by automatic sprinklers shall not be stored or displayed under nonsprinklered eaves, 
canopies or other projections or overhangs. Where buildings are required to be protected by automatic sprinklers, the 
outdoor storage, display, and handling of combustible materials under eaves, canopies or other projections or 
overhangs is prohibited except where automatic sprinklers are installed under such eaves, canopies or other 
projections or overhangs, 
 



 

F44                                                                      ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008 

Reason: The purpose of this code language change is to clarify the requirement for automatic sprinklers, where automatic sprinklers are “required” 
to be installed to protect the building, to protect the space under eaves, canopies, or other projections or overhangs when combustibles are stored, 
displayed, or handled there. When a building is “required” to have an automatic sprinkler system installed throughout, NFPA 13, the standard for 
installation of sprinkler systems, has clear intention to have this space protected by automatic sprinklers. This NFPA standard has been the adopted 
reference in the past by the BOCA Basic Building Code and IBC for installation of automatic sprinklers. NFPA 13- 02 section 8-14.7.4 states 
“Sprinklers shall be installed under roofs or canopies over areas where combustibles are stored and handled.” The intent of this requirement is to 
prevent a fire involving the combustible materials stored or handled under a roof or canopy, from entering the overhead area and getting above the 
sprinkler system protecting the structure, thus overwhelming the fire protection system preventing control and extinguishment of the fire. The NFPA 
13 standard requires automatic sprinklers “in” the canopy or an overhead structure when it contains combustible construction and under the canopy 
or overhead structure when combustibles are stored, displayed, or handled under it. The current language contained in the IFC is not clear as to the 
need for automatic sprinklers “under” the overhead structure. When challenged, the current code section, as written, could be interpreted as only 
requiring automatic sprinklers “in” the canopy. The code change provides the necessary clarification of the code requirement. 
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 

F57–07/08  
316 (New), 302.1 (New), 202 (New) 
 
Proponent: Anthony C. Apfelbeck, City of Altamonte Springs, FL 
 
Add new text as follows:  
 

SECTION 316 
WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE AREAS 

 
316.1 General.  Buildings, structures or premises within wildland-urban interface areas shall comply with the 
International Wildland-Urban Interface Code.  
 

SECTION 302 
DEFINITIONS 

 
302.1 Definitions. The following words and terms shall, for the purposes of this chapter and as used elsewhere in this 
code, have the meanings shown herein. 
 
WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE AREA. That geographical area where structures and other human development 
meets or intermingles with wildland or vegetative fuels. 
 

SECTION 202 DEFINITIONS 
GENERAL DEFINITIONS 

 
WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE AREA.  See Section 302.1.  
 
 
Reason: This code change: 

1. Provides a definition for a “Wildland-Urban Interface Area” in the IFC Section 302 extracted from the definition in the IWUIC. 
2. Provides a referral to the “Wildland-Urban Interface Area” definition in Section 302 from the General Definitions Section 202. 
3. Provides a direct referral to the “Wildland-Urban Interface Code” in a new Section 316 within the IFC. 
This code change will integrate the designation of a “Wildland-Urban Interface Area” and the reference International Wildland-Urban Interface 

Code as an integral part of the IFC. Rather than forcing a local jurisdiction to adopt the IWUIC separately, the IWUIC will be adopted as a reference 
when the IFC is adopted. The reason for this is two fold: 

1. The base IFC should contain Wildland-Urban Interface requirements as an integral part of the document due to the expanding prevalence 
of these types of hazards that are confronted by the fire official. Users should not be forced to adopt a second document to be able to 
utilize the IWUIC. Wildland-urban interface fire prevention is no different from the other base fire prevention requirements of the IFC. 

2. Adding the direct reference to the IWUIC into the IFC will not burden any jurisdiction with the requirement of the document unless there is 
an actual “Wildland-Urban Interface Area” within the jurisdiction. If there is a “Wildland-Urban Interface Area” within the jurisdiction, then 
the code should be specifying that the WUIA needs to be protected appropriately and set the standard of  protection.  

 
Cost Impact: The code change will increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 



 

ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008                                                                                                                                   F45 

 

F58–07/08 
316 (New) 
 
Proponent: James Everitt, Everitt and Associates, representing McClure Industries 
 
Add new section as follows:  
 

SECTION 316 
LAUNDRY CARTS 

 
316.1 Laundry carts in commercial laundries.  Laundry carts used for commercial laundries shall be constructed of 
noncombustible materials or materials having a peak rate of heat release not exceeding 300 kW/m2 at a flux of 50 
kW/m2 when tested in a horizontal orientation in accordance with ASTM E 1354. Such laundry carts shall be 
permanently labeled indicating capacity and peak rate of heat release. 
 

Exceptions: 
 

1. Laundry carts in buildings protected with an approved automatic sprinkler system in accordance with 
Sections 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2. 

2. Laundry carts in coin-operated laundries. 
 
Reason: The change from cooking with animal fat to vegetable oil has increased the amount of spontaneous ignition fires.  These fires occur 
outside due to external heating form the sun or by insufficient cool down time in the laundry process and have been known to ignite in freshly folded 
linen. 

Polyethylene laundry carts have a fuel value equal to gasoline and the continued use of these carts is inappropriate. The City of Portland has 
experienced three recent fires two of which were $400k+ each with extensions $100k+ each, due to spontaneous ignition. Last year the Oregon 
State Coffey Creek Correction Facility had a commercial dryer fire with no loss using the ASTME 1354 container. The commercial dryer fire was 
emptied in to the container and taken outside and overhauled without evacuation, loss to the structure or damage the container.   

These laundry carts are currently available. This revision is supported by the Oregon Laundry Association and is now part of the Oregon 
amended IFC. 
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 

F59–07/08  
403.3 (New) 
 
Proponent: Tom Lariviere, Fire Department, Madison, MS, representing Joint Fire Service Review Committee 
 
Add new text as follows:  
 
403.3 Crowd manager. Trained crowd managers shall be provided for facilities or events where more than 1000 
persons congregate. The minimum number of crowd managers shall be established at a ratio of one crowd manager to 
every 250 persons. Where approved by the fire code official, the ratio of crowd managers shall be permitted to be 
reduced where the facility is equipped throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler system or based upon the 
nature of the event. 
 
Reason: The only requirement for crowd managers is in Section 2404.20 for tents.  Large assemblies of people create the need for crowd 
management due to panic and fear in emergency situations in numerous other locations than just tents.  It is the intent of this proposal for crowd 
managers to be personnel already assigned and employed by the facility. Current employees can be trained as crowd managers to fulfill this 
requirement. At the time of an emergency, the trained crowd managers would take on these additional responsibilities to control and direct the 
audience or attendees in a safe manner. 
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 



 

F46                                                                      ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008 

 

F60–07/08 
404.2, Table 405.2 
 
Proponent: Tom Lariviere, Fire Department, Madison, MS, representing Joint Fire Service Review Committee 
 
Revise as follows:  
 
404.2 Where required. An approved fire safety and evacuation plan shall be prepared and maintained for the 
following occupancies and buildings. 
 

1. Group A, other than Group A occupancies used exclusively for purposes of religious worship that have an 
occupant load less than 2,000. 

2. Group B buildings having an occupant load of 500 or more persons or more than 100 persons above or below 
the lowest level of exit discharge. 

3. Group E. 
4. Group F. 

  4. 5. Group H. 
  5. 6. Group I. 
  6. 7. Group R-1. 
  7. 8. Group R-2 college and university buildings. 
  8. 9. Group R-4. 
 9. 10. High-rise buildings. 
10.11. Group M buildings having an occupant load of 500 or more persons or more than 100 persons above or below 

the lowest level of exit discharge. 
11.12. Covered malls exceeding 50,000 square feet (4645 m2) in aggregate floor area. 
12.13.  Underground buildings. 
13.14.  Buildings with an atrium and having an occupancy in Group A, E or M. 
 

TABLE 405.2 
FIRE AND EVACUATION DRILL FREQUENCY AND PARTICIPATION 

GROUP OR OCCUPANCY FREQUENCY PARTICIPATION 
Group A Quarterly Employees 
Group Bc Annually Employees 
Group E Monthlya All occupants 
Group F Annually Employees 
Group I Quarterly on each shift Employeesb 
Group R-1 Quarterly on each shift Employees 
Group R-2d Four annually All occupants 
Group R-4 Quarterly on each shift Employeesb 
High-rise buildings Annually Employees 

(Footnotes remain unchanged) 
 
Reason: The IFC currently requires fire-safety plans in practically every occupancy group with the exception of Group F occupancies. Under the 
Code, the only “manufacturing” occupancy that requires a fire-safety plan is Group H occupancies. The only difference between a Group F and a 
Group H occupancy is the aggregate amount of hazardous materials present in the facility and some of the manufacturing processes. In many 
Group F occupancies, there can be processes and hazards that theoretically make them just as hazardous as a Group H occupancy. But because 
these facilities fall short of the aggregate amount of chemicals, they are not classified as Group H.  

Group F manufacturing facilities should have written fire safety and evacuation plans to protect the workers.  Under 29 CFR 1910.39(b), OSHA 
requires that any workplace with more than ten (10) employees shall have a written fire prevention plan. The code should at least parallel the OSHA 
Standard. 

Manufacturing facilities should be required to have at least annual emergency evacuation drills due to the size and complexity 
of some of these facilities. It will increase the life safety of the occupants to practice evacuation procedures.  
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 



 

ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008                                                                                                                                   F47 

F61–07/08  
404.1, 404.3.3 through 404.3.3.3 (New), 406.3.3 (New), 402.1 (New) 
 
Proponent: Tom Lariviere, Fire Department, Madison, MS, representing Joint Fire Service Review Committee 
 
1. Revise as follows:  
 
404.1 General. Fire safety, evacuation and lockdown plans and associated drills shall comply with the requirements of 
this section. The plans shall not conflict with other sections of this code. 
 
2. Add new text as follows: 
 
404.3.3 Lockdown plans. Where facilities develop a lockdown plan, the lockdown plan shall be in accordance with 
Sections 404.3.3.1 through 404.3.3.3. 
 
404.3.3.1 Lockdown plan contents. Lockdown plans shall be approved by the fire code official and shall include the 
following: 
 

1. Initiation. The plan shall include instructions for reporting an emergency that requires a lockdown. 
2. Accountability. The plan shall include accountability procedures for staff to report the presence or absence of 

occupants. 
3. Recall. The plan shall include pre-arranged signal for returning to normal activity. 
4. Communication and coordination. The plan shall include an approved means of two-way communication 

between a central location and each secured area. 
5. The plan shall be in accordance with the National Incident Management System and applicable state and 

federal laws or regulations. 
 
404.3.3.2 Training frequency. The training frequency shall be included in the lockdown plan. The lockdown drills shall 
not substitute for any of the fire and evacuation drills required in Section 405.2. 
 
404.3.3.3 Lockdown notification. The method of notifying building occupants of a lockdown shall be included in the 
plan. The method of notification shall be separate and distinct from the fire alarm signal. 
 
406.3.3 Emergency lockdown training. Where a facility has a lockdown plan, employees shall be trained on their 
assigned duties and procedures in the event of an emergency lockdown. 
 
(Renumber remaining sections) 
 
3. Add new definition as follows: 
 
402.1 Definition. The following word and term shall, for the purposes of this chapter and as used elsewhere in this 
code, have the meaning shown herein. 
 
LOCKDOWN. An emergency situation requiring that the occupants be sheltered and secured in place within a building 
when normal evacuation would put occupants at risk. 
 
Reason: Buildings are developing “lockdown” plans in response to security threats. This proposal will add requirements to the IFC on lockdown 
plans, lockdown drills and lockdown operations, not only in schools, but in all buildings where a lockdown plan is desired.   
 The code does not require a lockdown plan, however if a plan is to be developed, the plan must maintain the integrity of the egress system to 
an acceptable level.  These lockdown plans include procedures for locking occupants into individual rooms within the building, and typically do not 
consider the impact of lockdowns on fire safety. This proposal is intended to establish the conditions for lockdown plans so that they will not 
decrease the level of life safety in the event of fires. 
 Many facilities are adopting procedures that can significantly affect fire safety, such as using the fire alarm system to signal a security 
emergency, locking doors with devices that prevent egress, and chaining exit discharge doors from the inside to prevent occupants from leaving the 
building. It is important that plans for security threats do not include procedures that result in violations of life safety and actually increase the hazard 
to the occupants. 
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 



 

F48                                                                      ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008 

 

F62–07/08 
407.2 
 
Proponent: Jeffrey M. Shapiro, PE, International Code Consultants, representing The Chlorine Institute 
 
Revise as follows:  
 
407.2 Material safety data sheets. Material Safety Data Sheets (MSDS) for all hazardous materials shall be either 
readily available on the premises as a paper copy, or where approved, shall be permitted to be readily retrievable by 
electronic access. 
 
Reason: Use of electronic databases as a means to make MSDSs available is common all along the hazardous materials supply chain.  This 
proposal seeks only to update the code to recognize this longstanding common practice. 
 The use of electronic means to handle MSDSs is a far more efficient method of keeping this material up to date, organized and readily 
accessible from many locations.  It also makes the information electronically searchable and avoids the enormous administrative effort required to 
maintain paper copies MSDSs in binders or file cabinets duplicated at many sites. 
 To address concerns expressed by some individuals when a similar proposal was considered last cycle, such as power interruptions that might 
make MSDSs inaccessible at times, a condition of local approval has been added to limit the permissible use of electronic systems.  With this 
addition, jurisdictions desiring hard copies on site will still have these, while jurisdictions desiring to permit electronic databases will have a means of 
encouraging such systems without requiring the owner to submit an alternate method proposal. 
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 

F63–07/08 
408.3 
 
Proponent: Tom Lariviere, Fire Department, Madison, MS, representing Joint Fire Service Review Committee 
 
Revise as follows:  
 
408.3 Group E occupancies and Group R-2 college and university buildings. Group E occupancies and Group R-
2 college and university buildings shall comply with the requirements of Sections 408.3.1 through 408.3.4 and Sections 
401 through 406. Group R-2 college and university buildings shall comply with the requirements of Sections 408.3.1 
and 408.3.3 and Sections 401 through 406. 
 
Reason: The revision addresses the fact that the current IFC does not require assembly points for R-2 college and university buildings. With the 
increased emphasis on accountability during campus emergencies, assembly points are necessary for colleges and universities as well as schools.  
It makes sense to require assemble points for college and university level occupants just the same as high school occupants. 
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 

F64–07/08  
408.4 (New), Chapter 45 (New) 
 
Proponent: William Winslow, representing Washington State Association of Fire Marshals 
 
1. Add new text as follows:  
 
408.4 Group H-1, H-2, H-3, and H-4 occupancies and facilities with outdoor storage or use.  Group H-1, H-2, H-3, 
and H-4 occupancies and facilities with outdoor storage or use that exceeds the maximum allowable quantity per 
control area indicated in Section 2703 shall comply with Sections 401 through 407 and Sections 408.4.1 through 
408.4.3.   
 



 

ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008                                                                                                                                   F49 

408.4.1 Plan.  An approved hazardous materials emergency plan shall be maintained on-site.  
 
408.4.2 Training.  Where required by the fire code official, a minimum of two facility employees or other approved 
personnel shall be available on-site or by call-in.  Such personnel shall be trained to the hazardous materials 
technician level in accordance with DOL 29 CFR 1910.120(q)(6)iii and be knowledgeable with the hazardous materials 
emergency plan, the locations of hazardous installations, and the operation of safety systems, and shall assist the fire 
department when requested.  
 
408.4.3 Emergency drill.  An annual emergency drill shall be conducted to test the hazardous materials emergency 
plan. Where required by the fire code official, the emergency drill shall include facility personnel and the fire 
department. 
 

Exception:  Where approved by the fire code official, an actual incident that included fire department involvement 
shall satisfy the requirement for the annual drill.    

 
(Renumber subsequent sections.) 
 
2. Add standard to Chapter 45 as follows: 
 
DOL 
 29 CFR 1910.120(q)(6)iii-2007 Hazardous Materials Technician  
 
Reason: Facilities with hazardous materials above maximum allowable quantities should have an approved hazardous materials emergency plan 
and should test the plan with a drill at least once a year.  In addition, where the fire code official determines it is necessary, personnel trained to the 
technician level should be available to accompany fire department hazmat emergency responders while they attempt to stop leaks or mitigate other 
hazardous conditions.  After all, plant personnel know their facilities better than the fire department, and their hands-on assistance is critical to 
ensure the safety of everyone involved with the emergency response.  Section 408.4.2 allows non-employee personnel to be used if they are 
adequately trained.  Examples might be environmental contractors with specific training on the site.    
 
Cost Impact: The approximate cost to train and equip 2 hazmat technicians is $10,000.  The cost of contract services with site specific training 
would be in the same range.   
 
Analysis: A review of the standard proposed for inclusion in the code, DOL 29 CFR 1910.120(q)(6)iii-2007, for compliance with ICC criteria for 
referenced standards given in Section 3.6 of Council Policy #CP 28 will be posted on the ICC website on or before January 15, 2008. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 

F65–07/08 
501.3 
 
Proponent: Steven L. Schoon, Golder Ranch Fire District, Arizona Fire Marshals Association 
 
Revise as follows:  
 
501.3 Construction documents. Construction documents for proposed fire apparatus access, location of fire lanes, 
security gates across fire apparatus access and construction documents and hydraulic calculations for fire hydrant 
systems shall be submitted to the fire department for review and approval prior to construction. 
 
Reason: Section 501.3 requires fire apparatus access to have construction documents submitted to the fire department for review and approval 
prior to construction.  Section 503.6 requires the installation of security gates across a fire apparatus access road be approved by the fire chief.   
Adding the proposed language ties these two sections together and requires the security gate to have a construction document for the fire 
department to review.   Furthermore, if a security gate was not on the original construction plans for the fire apparatus access, this new text 
reinforces that a security gate installed at a later time does require a construction plan to be submitted and approved prior to construction. 
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 



 

F50                                                                      ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008 

F66–07/08  
503.1, 503.1.4 (New), 503.1.4.1 (New), 503.1.4.2 (New), 503.1.5 (New), 503.2.8(New), Appendix 
D104.3, D106, D107 
 
Proponent: Steven Orlowski, National Association of Home Builders 
 
Revise as follows:  
 
503.1 Where required. Fire apparatus access roads shall be provided and maintained in accordance with Sections 
503.1.1 through 503.1.3 503.1.5. 
 
503.1.4 Multiple-family residential developments.  Fire apparatus access roads for multiple-family residential 
developments shall be in accordance with Section 503.1.4.1 and 503.1.4.2. 

  
D106.1 503.1.4.1 Projects having more than 100 dwelling units. Multiple-family residential projects having no more 
than 100 dwellings units shall be equipped throughout with two separate and approved fire apparatus access roads. 

 
Exception: Projects up to 200 dwelling units may have a single approved fire apparatus access road when all 
buildings, including non residential occupancies, are equipped throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler 
system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1, 903.3.1.2, or 903.3.1.3. 

 
D106.2 503.1.4.2 Projects having more than 200 dwelling units. Multiple-family residential projects having more 
than 200 dwelling units shall be provided with two separate and approved fire apparatus access roads regardless of 
whether they are equipped with an approved automatic sprinkler system. 

  
D107.1 503.1.5 One- or two-family dwelling residential developments. Developments of one- or two-family 
dwellings where the number of dwelling units exceeds 30 shall be provided with separate and approved fire apparatus 
access roads and shall meet the requirements of Section D104.3 503.2.8. 

 
Exceptions:  
 

1. Where there are more than 30 dwelling units on a single public or private fire apparatus access road and 
all dwelling units are equipped throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler system in accordance with 
Section 903.3.1.1, 903.3.1.2 or 903.3.1.3, access from two directions will not be required. 

2. The number of dwelling units on a single fire apparatus access road shall not be increased unless the fire 
apparatus access roads will connect with future development, as determined by the fire code official.   

 
D104.3 503.2.8 Remoteness. Where two access roads are required, they shall be placed a distance apart equal to not 
less than one half of the length of the maximum overall diagonal dimension of the property or area to be served, 
measured in a straight line between accesses. 
 
Reason: The purpose of this proposal is to address the concerns of when fire apparatus access is required. As the IFC is currently written the 
number of fire apparatus accesses is determined by the local fire official. In jurisdictions which require the installation of an approved automatic 
sprinkler system, these exceptions should be implemented without requiring jurisdictions to adopt the complete appendix. 
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will decrease the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 

F67–07/08  
503.2.1, Appendix D103.1, D105.2 
 
Proponent: Edwin M. Berkel, CFI, Mehlville Fire Protection District, representing himself 
 
Revise as follows:  
 
503.2.1 Dimensions. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed width of not less than 20 feet (6096 
mm), exclusive of shoulders, except for approved security gates in accordance with Section 503.6, and an 
unobstructed vertical clearance of not less than 13 feet 6 inches (4115 mm). 



 

ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008                                                                                                                                   F51 

D103.1 Access road width with a hydrant. Where a fire hydrant is located on a fire apparatus access road, the 
minimum road width shall be 26 feet (7925 mm), exclusive of shoulders. See Figure D103.1. 
 
D105.2 Width. Fire apparatus access roads shall have a minimum unobstructed width of 26 feet (7925 mm), exclusive 
of shoulders, in the immediate vicinity of any building or portion of building more than 30 feet (9144 mm) in height. 
 
Reason: The intent of the width requirements for fire apparatus access roads is that the all-weather surface capable of supporting the expected 
imposed loads of apparatus be applicable to the full 20 foot width of the road to provide space for fire apparatus to pass one another during 
fireground operations. The need to pass may occur when engines are parked for hydrant hookup or laying hose or when trucks are performing aerial 
ladder operations. Including adjacent road shoulders in the 20 foot width measurement could yield sub-standard and inadequate driving surfaces for 
apparatus.  This proposal will make it clear that the shoulders are not to be included in the minimum fire apparatus access road width. 
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 

F68–07/08  
503.2.8 (New) 
 
Proponent: Tom Lariviere, Fire Department, Madison, MS, representing Joint Fire Service Review Committee 
 
Add new text as follows:  
 
503.2.8 Angles of approach and departure. The angles of approach and departure for fire apparatus access roads 
shall be within the limits established by the fire code official based on the fire department’s apparatus. 
 
Reason: The Angle of Approach is the angle between the ground and a line running from the bottom of the front tire to the lowest-hanging point 
directly in front of it, which is usually the front bumper. This angle gives an indication of how steep an incline the vehicle can clear when approaching 
that angle. 

The Angle of Departure is the angle between the ground and a line running from the bottom of the rear tire to the lowest-hanging point directly 
behind it, which is usually the rear step. Similar to the approach angle, this angle indicates how steep an incline the vehicle can clear when departing 
from that angle. 
 Currently, no language exists in the IFC regarding angles of approach and departure.  This design aspect of a fire apparatus access road is 
crucial to successful navigation by apparatus. 
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 

F69–07/08 
503.3 
 
Proponent: Daniel Najera, University of California, Davis Fire Department, representing California Fire Chief’s 
Association (CFCA) 
 
Revise as follows:  
 
503.3 Marking. Where required by the fire code official, approved signs or other approved notices markings that 
include the words NO PARKING - FIRE LANE shall be provided for fire apparatus access roads to identify such roads 
or prohibit the obstruction thereof.  Signs or notices The means by which fire lanes are designated shall be maintained 
in a clean and legible condition at all times and be replaced or repaired when necessary to provide adequate visibility.  
 
Reason: This code revision replaces the word “notices” with “marking” and adds the words “NO PARKING FIRE LANE”.  Marking is more consistent 
code language and is reflected in the title of this section.  Notices is an ambiguous term that does not reflect permanency but allows for floating fire 
lanes and handed out paper notices.  The existing language leaves too much room for interpretation that may not reflect the original intent of this 
section. 
 The addition of the words NO PARKING FIRE LANE assists the fire department, local law enforcement authority’s and the judicial system in 
upholding fire lane enforcement.  It is common code language that is easily understood and is commonly used in vehicle codes around the country. 
 This proposal does not mention size, color or material to be used for fire lane markings.  It is understood by the word approved that fire lane 
markings have to be approved by the local authority having jurisdiction.  
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 



 

F52                                                                      ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008 

F70–07/08 
503.5, 503.6, Appendix D103.5, Chapter 45 (New) 
 
Proponent: Joseph R. Hetzel, PE, Thomas Associates, Inc., representing Door & Access Systems Manufacturers 
Association 
 
1. Revise as follows:  
 
503.5 Required gates or barricades.  The fire code official is authorized to require the installation and maintenance 
of gates or other approved barricades across fire apparatus access roads, trails or other accessways, not including 
public streets, alleys or highways.  Electric gate openers, where provided, shall be listed in accordance with UL 325.  
Gates intended for automatic operation shall be designed, constructed and installed to comply with the requirements of 
ASTM F 2200.  
 
503.6 Security gates.  The installation of security gates across a fire apparatus access road shall be approved by the 
fire chief.  Where security gates are installed, they shall have an approved means of emergency operation.  The 
security gates and the emergency operation shall be maintained operational at all times.  Electric gate openers, where 
provided, shall be listed in accordance with UL 325.  Gates intended for automatic operation shall be designed, 
constructed and installed to comply with the requirements of ASTM F 2200.  
 
Appendix D103.5 Fire apparatus access road gates.   Gates securing the fire apparatus access roads shall comply 
with all of the following criteria: 
 

1. The minimum gate width shall be 20 feet (6096 mm). 
2. Gates shall be of the swinging or the sliding type. 
3. Construction of gates shall be of materials that allow manual operation by one person. 
4. Gate components shall be maintained in an operative condition at all times and replaced or repaired when 

defective. 
5. Electric gates shall be equipped with a means of opening the gate by fire department personnel for emergency 

access.  Emergency opening devices shall be approved by the fire code official. 
6. Manual opening gates shall not be locked with a padlock or chain and padlock unless they are capable of 

being opened by means of forcible entry tools or when a key box containing the key(s) to the lock is installed 
at the gate location. 

7. Locking device specifications shall be submitted for approval by the code official. 
8. Electric gate openers, where provided, shall be listed in accordance with UL 325. 
9. Gates intended for automatic operation shall be designed, constructed and installed to comply with the 

requirements of ASTM F 2200.  
 
2. Add standards to Chapter 45 as follows: 
 
ASTM 
 ASTM F 2200-05 Standard Specification for Automated Vehicular Gate Construction 
UL 

UL 325-02 Door, Drapery, Gate, Louver, and Window Operators and Systems, with revisions through 
February, 2006 

 
Reason: The purpose of the proposed code change is to provide requirements for automatic vehicular gates, which are not currently addressed in 
the Code.   
 The current Code provisions are inadequate because public safety needs are not addressed regarding automatic operation of vehicular gates.    
Protection is needed from potential entrapment of individuals between an automatically moving gate and a stationary object, or surface, in close 
proximity to such gate.  Gates intended for automation require specific design, construction and installation to accommodate entrapment protection 
to minimize or eliminate certain excessive gate gaps, openings and protrusions identified as contributing to the hazard of entrapments that have 
historically caused numerous serious injuries and deaths.   
 The Code will be improved by including provisions referencing UL 325 and ASTM F 2200.  UL 325 is an ANSI recognized safety standard 
containing provisions governing gate openers.  Gate openers listed to the requirements of UL 325 provide the public with assurance that safety 
requirements have been met for such openers.  ASTM F 2200 is a consensus document containing provisions governing the construction of 
vehicular gates intended for automation, and has been harmonized with the applicable provisions of UL 325. 
 Death and injury data does exist associated with automated vehicular gates.  A previous related proposal on the topic, submitted in 2002 by the 
Consumer Product Safety Commission and designated as E34-02, pointed out the following information compiled by the CPSC from 1985 to that 
time: 

1. Reports of 32 deaths relating to automatically operated vehicular gates were received, many as a result of entrapment between a moving 
gate and a stationary object. 

2. Data from the National Electronic Injury Surveillance System estimated that approximately 2,000 people are treated annually in hospital 
emergency rooms due to injuries in such gates.  Many of these injuries have been identified as serious, involving amputation, broken arms 
and broken legs. 

With regard to security, both UL 325 and ASTM F 2200 make consideration for restricted access gates by recognizing gate openers and 
operators for such applications as a particular Class (IV) out of four different classifications. 



 

ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008                                                                                                                                   F53 

Cost Impact: The code change proposal will increase the cost of construction.  However, the resulting safety benefits will outweigh the increased 
cost. 
 
Analysis: A review of the standards proposed for inclusion in the code, ASTM F 2200-05 and UL 325-02, for compliance with ICC criteria for 
referenced standards given in Section 3.6 of Council Policy #CP 28 will be posted on the ICC website on or before January 15, 2008. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 

F71–07/08  
503.6, Appendix D103.5 
 
Proponent: Anthony C. Apfelbeck, City of Altamonte Springs, FL 
 
Delete and substitute as follows:  
 
503.6 Security gates The installation of security gates across a fire apparatus access road shall be approved by the 
fire chief. Where security gates are installed, they shall have an approved means of emergency operation. The security 
gates and the emergency operation shall be maintained operational at all times.  D103.5  Fire apparatus access road 
gates. Gates securing the fire apparatus access roads shall comply with all of the following criteria: 
 

1. The minimum gate width shall be 20 feet (6096 mm). 
2. Gates shall be of the swinging or sliding type. 
3. Construction of gates shall be of materials that allow manual operation by one person. 
4. Gate components shall be maintained in an operative condition at all times and replaced or repaired when 

defective. 
5. Electric gates shall be equipped with a means of opening the gate by fire department personnel for emergency 

access. Emergency opening devices shall be approved by the fire code official. 
6. Manual opening gates shall not be locked with a padlock or chain and padlock unless they are capable of 

being opened by means of forcible entry tools or when a key box containing the key(s) to the lock is installed 
at the gate location. 

7. Locking device specifications shall be submitted for approval by the fire code official. 
 
Reason: The current language in Appendix D103.5 is more specific and appropriate to be included in the core code text of Section 503. The 
language in D103.5 should be imported into the core code as it is not onerous and contains basic gate requirements for every fire apparatus access 
road. The language to be replaced in the current 503.6 is very generic and leaves very little guidance to the designer, owner and fire code official. 
The language in D103.5 covers all of the issues currently covered the existing Section 503.6.  
 
Cost Impact: The code change will increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 

F72–07/08  
504.1 
 
Proponent: Steven Orlowski, National Association of Home Builders 
 
Revise as follows:  
 
504.1 Required access. Exterior doors and openings required by this code or the International Building Code shall be 
maintained readily accessible for emergency access by the fire department. An approved access walkway leading 
from fire apparatus access roads to exterior openings shall be provided when required by the fire code official. 
 

Exception: Required access shall not be applicable to structures built to the requirements of the International 
Residential Code. 

 
Reason: The purpose of the added exception is to clarify that readily accessible routes to a structure from the fire apparatus road are only 
applicable to commercial and residential occupancies that are governed by the IBC and does not apply to one- and two-family dwellings. 
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will decrease the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 



 

F54                                                                      ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008 

F73–07/08  
504.3, 2703.8.3.4 
 
Proponent: Philip Brazil, PE, Reid Middleton, Inc., representing himself 
 
Revise as follows:  
 
504.3 Stairway access to roof. New buildings four or more stories in height above grade plane, except those with a 
roof slope greater than four units vertical in 12 units horizontal (33.3 percent slope), shall be provided with a stairway 
to the roof. Stairway access to the roof shall be in accordance with Section 1009.12. Such stairway shall be marked at 
street and floor levels with a sign indicating that the stairway continues to the roof. Where roofs are used for roof 
gardens or for other purposes, stairways shall be provided as required for such occupancy classification. 
 
2703.8.3.4 Fire-resistance rating requirements. The required fire-resistance rating for fire barriers shall be in 
accordance with Table 2703.8.3.2. The floor construction of the control area and the construction supporting the floor 
of the control area shall have a minimum 2-hour fire-resistance rating. 
 

Exception: The floor construction of the control area and the construction supporting the floor of the control area 
is allowed to be 1-hour fire-resistance rated in buildings of Type IIA, IIIA and VA construction, provided that both of 
the following conditions exist: 
 

1. The building is equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 
903.3.1.1; and 

2.  The building is three stories or less in height above grade plane. 
 
Reason: The changes are proposed for consistency with the actions taken by the membership on Proposals G6-06/07-AS and G8-06/07-AMPC1.  
Refer to IBC (and IFC) Section 1009.11 in Proposal G8-06/07-AMPC1 for Section 504.3 on stairway access to the roof.  Refer to IBC Section 
414.2.4 in Proposal G6-06/07-AS for Section 2703.8.3.4 on control areas. 
  
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 

F74–07/08 
505.1.1 (New), 505.1.1.1 (New), 505.1.2 (New) 
 
Proponent: Daniel Najera, University of California, Davis Fire Department, representing California Fire Chiefs’ 
Association (CFCA) 
 
Add new text as follows:  
 
505.1.1 Multi-tenant buildings. Numbers or letters as specified in Section 505.1 shall be designated for all tenant 
spaces within a building.  Directional address numbers or letters shall be provided.   Numbers or letters required by 
this section shall be internally or externally illuminated. 
 
505.1.1.1 Multi-tenant directory signs.  An illuminated directory sign displaying travel paths to all tenant spaces shall 
be located at all driveway entrances to the property.   
 
505.1.2 Additional addressing. Where required by the fire code official, additional numbers or addresses sized in 
accordance with Section 505.1, shall be placed on the rear or sides of all buildings in such a position as to be plainly 
legible and visible.  
 
Reason: The added code sections provide the code official authority to require additional addressing in facilities, campuses, or strip malls where 
identification of multi-tenant buildings is essential to first responders. 

The additional addressing proposed by these sections will assist emergency responders in identifying specific addresses in larger multi-tenant 
buildings when the response must be approached from access roads other than the street-side of the building. 

Addressing features for tenants are relied upon by emergency responders (fire, police, EMS) for purposes other than fire.  Responders cannot 
always rely on smoke/fire showing or that responsible persons will be waiting at the curb to escort personnel to the scene of the incident.  
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 



 

ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008                                                                                                                                   F55 

F75–07/08  
505.3 (New); IBC 501.3 (New) 
 
Proponents: Sean DeCrane, Cleveland, OH Fire Department representing International Association of Fire Fighters 
Local #93, Cleveland, OH; Kirk Grundahl, WTCA Representing the Structural Building Component Industry 
 
THESE PROPOSALS ARE ON THE AGENDA OF THE IFC AND THE IBC GENERAL CODE DEVELOPMENT 
COMMITTEES AS 2 SEPARATE CODE CHANGES. SEE THE TENTATIVE HEARING ORDERS FOR THESE 
COMMITTEES. 
 
PART I – IFC 
 
Add new text as follows:  
 
505.3 Building information sign. Building information signs shall comply with Sections 505.3.1 through 505.3.7. 
 
505.3.1 Sign location. The Building information sign shall be placed on a minimum of two exterior walls containing a 
means of access to a building or facility, no lower than 42” or no higher than 60” inches, and no further than six (6) feet 
from main entry point’s unhinged side, or right side if non-hinged opening. Local jurisdictions shall have the authority to 
require additional locations. 
 
505.3.1.2 Sign features. The building information sign shall consist of: 
 

1. White reflective background with red letters; 
2. Durable material; 
3. Numerals shall be Roman or Latin numerals, as required, and/or alphabet letters; 
4. Permanently affixed to the building or structure in an approved manner. 

 
505.3.1.3 Sign shape. The building information sign shall be a Maltese Cross as shown in Figure 505.3.1.3 

 
 

 
 

FIGURE 505.3.1.3 
BUILDING INFORMATION SIGN 
 

505.3.1.4 Sign size and lettering. The minimum size of the building information sign and lettering shall be in 
accordance with the following: 
 

1. The width and height shall be 6 inches by 6 inches 
2, The height or width of each Maltese cross wing area shall be 1 1/8 inches and have a stroke width of ½ inch; 

IIA 

2 PS3 

E 

TC 



 

F56                                                                      ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008 

3. The center of the Maltese cross a circle of oval 3 ⅛ inches in diameter and has a stroke width of ½ inch; 
4. All roman numerals and/or alphabetic designations, shall  be 1 ¼ inch height and have a stroke width of ¼ 

inch.  
 

505.3.2 Sign Designations. Designations shall be made based upon the construction type, content, hazard, fire 
protection systems, life safety and occupancy. Where multiple designations occur within a classification Category, the 
designation used shall be based on the greatest potential risk. 
 
505.3.3 Construction type (top wing). The construction types shall be designated by assigning the appropriate 
Roman numeral, and letter, placed inside the top wing of the Maltese cross. The hourly rating provided is for the 
structural framing in accordance with Table 601 of the International Building Code, 

                 
Construction Type      Hourly Rating 
Fire Resistive Construction -    3 Hour Rating 
IB – Fire Resistive Construction -   2 Hour Rating 
IIA – Non-Combustible Construction -  1 Hour Rating 
IIB – Non-Combustible Construction -  0 Hour Rating 
IIIA – Ordinary Construction -   1 Hour Rating 
IIIB – Ordinary Construction -   0 Hour Rating 
IV – Heavy Timber Construction 
V – Combustible Construction –    0 Hour Rating 

 
505.3.4 Hazards of content (left wing). The hazards of building contents shall be designated by one of the following 
classifications as defined in NFPA 13 and the appropriate designation shall be placed inside the left wing of the 
Maltese cross: 
 

1 – Light Hazard 
2 – Moderate Hazard 
3 – High Hazard 

 
505.3.5 Fire protection systems (right wing). The fire protection systems shall be designated by determining its level 
of protection and assigning the appropriate designation to the right wing of the Maltese cross. Where multiple systems 
are provided, all shall be listed: 
 

AS – Automated Fire Sprinkler System installed throughout; 
PS – Partial Automatic Fire Sprinkler System, and designate floor; 
CS – Combination Sprinkler and Standpipe System; 
S – Standpipe System; 
NS – No system installed 
 

505.3.6  Occupancy type (bottom wing). The occupancy of a structure can accompany particular hazards related to 
the stated occupancy. Identifying the occupancy of a structure will allow fire fighters to make informed tactical 
assumptions and decisions. Occupancies shall be designated in accordance with the occupancy classification found in 
Section 302.1 of the International Building Code and the corresponding designation shall be placed in the bottom wing 
of the Maltese cross. 
 

A – Assembly 
B – Business 
E – Educational 
F – Factory or Industrial 
H – High Hazard 
I – Institutional 
M – Mercantile 
R – Residential 
S – Storage 
U – Utility or Miscellaneous 
 

505.3.7 Tactical considerations (center circle). The building identification marker is designed to provide key 
information in the initial stages of a fire ground incident. The information contained on this sign will allow the initial 
response fire fighters on the initial response group to make more well informed and quicker tactical decisions.  

 



 

ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008                                                                                                                                   F57 

505.3.7.1 Additional Information. Where fire fighters conduct pre-plan operations, unique situations shall be 
identified and placed under within the center section of the sign to allow the initial response fire fighters to identify that 
there are special considerations for this occupancy. Special consideration designations include, but are not limited to: 
 

1. Protect in place 
2. Limited mobility 
3. Handicapped occupants 
4. Impact resistant drywall 
5. Impact resistant windows; 
6. All types of roof and floor structural members including but not limited to post tension concrete, bar joists, 

joists, rafters, trusses, I-joists and I-beams); 
7. Chemicals; 
8. Plastics; 
9. Explosives 

 
Inspectors are authorized to use NFPA 1620 as a guide.   

 
505.3.8 Sign classification maintenance. Sign classification maintenance shall comply with all of the following: 

 
1. Fire departments in the jurisdiction shall define the designations to be placed within the sign. 
2. Fire departments in the jurisdiction shall conduct annual inspections to verify compliance with this section of 

the code. 
3. The owner of a building shall be responsible for the maintenance and updates to the sign in accordance to fire 

department designations. 
4. The owner of a building shall notify the fire department of any changes that possibly effect the classifications, 

of the system, within thirty (30) days of the changes and the Fire Department shall conduct an inspection. 
5. The owner of a building shall change the effected classification posted on the sign within thirty (30) days of the 

changes.          
 

505.3.9 Training. Jurisdictions shall train all fire department personnel on the building identification marker.    
 
(Renumber subsequent sections.) 
 
2.  Add standard to Chapter 45 as follows:  
 
NFPA 

1620-03 Recommended Practice for Pre-Incident Planning 
  
PART II – IBC GENERAL 
 
1.  Add new text as follows:  
 
501.3 Building information sign. Building information signs shall comply with Sections 501.3.1 through 501.3.7. 
 
501.3.1 Sign location. The Building information sign shall be placed on a minimum of two exterior walls containing a 
means of access to a building or facility, no lower than 42” or no higher than 60” inches, and no further than six (6) feet 
from main entry point’s unhinged side, or right side if non-hinged opening. Local jurisdictions shall have the authority to 
require additional locations. 
 
501.3.1.2 Sign features. The building information sign shall consist of: 
 

1. White reflective background with red letters; 
2. Durable material; 
3. Numerals shall be Roman or Latin numerals, as required, and/or alphabet letters; 
4. Permanently affixed to the building or structure in an approved manner. 

 
501.3.1.3 Sign shape. The building information sign shall be a Maltese Cross as shown in Figure 501.3.1.3 

 
 



 

F58                                                                      ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008 

 
 

FIGURE 501.3.1.3 
BUILDING INFORMATION SIGN 

 
501.3.1.4 Sign size and lettering. The minimum size of the building information sign and lettering shall be in 
accordance with the following: 
 

1. The width and height shall be 6 inches by 6 inches 
2, The height or width of each Maltese cross wing area shall be 1 1/8 inches and have a stroke width of ½ inch; 
3. The center of the Maltese cross a circle of oval 3 ⅛ inches in diameter and has a stroke width of ½ inch; 
4. All roman numerals and/or alphabetic designations, shall  be 1 ¼ inch height and have a stroke width of ¼ 

inch.  
 

501.3.2 Sign Designations. Designations shall be made based upon the construction type, content, hazard, fire 
protection systems, life safety and occupancy. Where multiple designations occur within a classification Category, the 
designation used shall be based on the greatest potential risk. 
 
501.3.3 Construction type (top wing). The construction types shall be designated by assigning the appropriate 
Roman numeral, and letter, placed inside the top wing of the Maltese cross. The hourly rating provided is for the 
structural framing in accordance with Table 601 of the International Building Code, 
 

                 
Construction Type      Hourly Rating 
Fire Resistive Construction -    3 Hour Rating 
IB – Fire Resistive Construction -   2 Hour Rating 
IIA – Non-Combustible Construction -  1 Hour Rating 
IIB – Non-Combustible Construction -  0 Hour Rating 
IIIA – Ordinary Construction -   1 Hour Rating 
IIIB – Ordinary Construction -   0 Hour Rating 
IV – Heavy Timber Construction 
V – Combustible Construction –    0 Hour Rating 

 
501.3.4 Hazards of content (left wing). The hazards of building contents shall be designated by one of the following 
classifications as defined in NFPA 13 and the appropriate designation shall be placed inside the left wing of the 
Maltese cross: 
 

1 – Light Hazard 
2 – Moderate Hazard 
3 – High Hazard 

 
501.3.5 Fire protection systems (right wing). The fire protection systems shall be designated by determining its level 
of protection and assigning the appropriate designation to the right wing of the Maltese cross. Where multiple systems 
are provided, all shall be listed: 

IIA 

2 PS3 

E 

TC 



 

ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008                                                                                                                                   F59 

AS – Automated Fire Sprinkler System installed throughout; 
PS – Partial Automatic Fire Sprinkler System, and designate floor; 
CS – Combination Sprinkler and Standpipe System; 
S – Standpipe System; 
NS – No system installed 
 

501.3.6  Occupancy type (bottom wing). The occupancy of a structure can accompany particular hazards related to 
the stated occupancy. Identifying the occupancy of a structure will allow fire fighters to make informed tactical 
assumptions and decisions. Occupancies shall be designated in accordance with the occupancy classification found in 
Section 302.1 of the International Building Code and the corresponding designation shall be placed in the bottom wing 
of the Maltese cross. 
 

A – Assembly 
B – Business 
E – Educational 
F – Factory or Industrial 
H – High Hazard 
I – Institutional 
M – Mercantile 
R – Residential 
S – Storage 
U – Utility or Miscellaneous 
 

501.3.7 Tactical considerations (center circle). The building identification marker is designed to provide key 
information in the initial stages of a fire ground incident. The information contained on this sign will allow the initial 
response fire fighters on the initial response group to make more well informed and quicker tactical decisions.  

 
501.3.7.1 Additional Information. Where fire fighters conduct pre-plan operations, unique situations shall be 
identified and placed under within the center section of the sign to allow the initial response fire fighters to identify that 
there are special considerations for this occupancy. Special consideration designations include, but are not limited to: 
 

1. Protect in place 
2. Limited mobility 
3. Handicapped occupants 
4. Impact resistant drywall 
5. Impact resistant windows; 
6. All types of roof and floor structural members including but not limited to post tension concrete, bar joists, 

joists, rafters, trusses, I-joists and I-beams); 
7. Chemicals; 
8. Plastics; 
9. Explosives 

 
Inspectors are authorized to use NFPA 1620 as a guide.   

 
501.3.8 Sign classification maintenance. Sign classification maintenance shall comply with all of the following: 

 
1. Fire departments in the jurisdiction shall define the designations to be placed within the sign. 
2. Fire departments in the jurisdiction shall conduct annual inspections to verify compliance with this section of 

the code. 
3. The owner of a building shall be responsible for the maintenance and updates to the sign in accordance to fire 

department designations. 
4. The owner of a building shall notify the fire department of any changes that possibly effect the classifications, 

of the system, within thirty (30) days of the changes and the Fire Department shall conduct an inspection. 
5. The owner of a building shall change the effected classification posted on the sign within thirty (30) days of the 

changes.          
 

501.3.9 Training. Jurisdictions shall train all fire department personnel on the building identification marker.  
 
(Renumber subsequent sections.) 
 
2.  Add standard to Chapter 35 as follows:  
 
NFPA 

1620-03 Recommended Practice for Pre-Incident Planning 



 

F60                                                                      ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008 

Reason: This Building Information Sign (BIS) is designed to be utilized in the crucial initial response of fire fighters to a structure fire. Similar to the 
Emergency Response Guidebook, published by the Department of Transportation, the BIS is designed to be utilized in the initial fifteen (15) to thirty 
(30) minutes of an incident. Fire fighters are trained to size up a situation as early as notification, sometimes appearances can be deceiving, a type 
of construction may not appear to be what it really is. This is becoming an occurrence with urban renewal. As communities try to design 
neighborhoods and maintain structural consistency, what may appear to be a traditional form of construction is now a designed lightweight system. 
In the dark, or to mutual aid crews, this is not always apparent. Having the BIS will allow responding companies to make an informed tactical 
decision. The responding company will be able to identify the type of construction, hazard level of the contents, occupancy of the building and 
whether the building is protected with automatic suppression and the extent of the protection. 
 In Tactical Considerations, we will allow fire fighters to identify additional considerations and prepare for them. Just by seeing that there are 
additional considerations would give fire fighters pause to consider additional aspects of the situation. Are there Protect in Place, Handicap or 
Limited Mobility concerns of the occupants. Is the interior constructed using impact resistant dry wall which will make wall breeching very difficult, is 
there lexan glazing? These are a sample of concerns that would cause a fire fighter to consider options at an incident. Does the building contain 
lightweight construction in the roof or floors. This can be identified and placed in the Tactical Considerations. The National Institute for Occupational 
Safety and Health released a report, 'Preventing Injuries and Deaths of Fire Fighters Due to Truss System Failures1 recommends identifying 
structures by suggesting that building owners and managers “Consider placing building construction information outside the building. Include 
information about roof and floor type (presence of trusses, materials used), roof loads (heating, ventilation, and air conditioning (HVAC) units, 
displays), sprinkler systems, utilities, chemicals on site and contact numbers. Use and follow the proper building codes."  Tactical Considerations, 
allows fire fighters to identify the type of construction that puts them at risk. The author also recommends the use of NFPA 1620 as a guide for Pre-
Plan operations. 
 
Bibliography: 
1. NIOSH Alert – “Preventing Injuries and Deaths of Fire Fighters due to Truss System Failures” April 2005 
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will have a minimal increase to the cost of construction. 
 
Analysis: A review of the standard proposed for inclusion in the code, NFPA 1620-03, for compliance with ICC criteria for referenced standards 
given in Section 3.6 of Council Policy #CP 28 will be posted on the ICC website on or before January 15, 2008. 
 
PART I – IFC 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
PART II – IBC GENERAL 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 

F76–07/08 
506.1, 2701.5 
 
Proponent: Daniel Najera, University of California, Davis Fire Department, representing California Fire Chief’s 
Association (CFCA) 
 
Revise as follows: 
 
506.1 Where required.  Where access to or within a structure or an area is restricted because of secured openings or 
where immediate access is necessary or life-saving for fire-fighting purposes, or where reports are required by Section 
2701.5.1 or 2701.5.2  the fire code official is authorized to require a key box  to be installed in an approved location.  
The key box shall be of an approved type and shall contain keys to gain necessary access as required by the fire code 
official or hazardous materials reports necessary to emergency response personnel.   
 When required by the fire code official, permittees shall apply for approval to permanently close a storage, use or 
handling facility.  Such application shall be submitted at least 30 days prior to the termination of the storage, use or 
handling of hazardous materials.  The fire code official is authorized to require that the application be accompanied by 
an approved facility closure plan in accordance with Section 2701.6.3 
  
2701.5 Permits. Permits shall be required as set forth in Sections 105.6 and 105.7. 
 Where required by the fire code official, reports required by Section 2701.5.1 or 2701.5.2, shall be maintained in a 
key box in accordance with Section 506.1 so as to be available to emergency response personnel. 

When required by the fire code official, permittees shall apply for approval to permanently close a storage, use or 
handling facility. Such application shall be submitted at least 30 days prior to the termination of the storage, use or 
handling of hazardous materials. The fire code official is authorized to require that the application be accompanied by 
an approved facility closure plan in accordance with Section 2701.6.3. 
 



 

ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008                                                                                                                                   F61 

Reason: Section 2701.5.2 contains the requirement for an HMIS report.  There is no provision that indicates where the HMIS report must be 
maintained.  Under normal operations, there may not be a need to keep this information readily available, however, in an emergency, this 
information is necessary in order to determine the safest course of action for firefighting/rescue personnel.   
 Responses to a hazardous material incident ideally include three sources of information for determining the type and quantity of material 
involved.  Many times, HMIS are unavailable or are located inside the “hot zone” of the buildings to which emergency personnel are responding.   
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 

F77–07/08 
507.4 (New); IBC 604 (New) 
 
Proponent: Sean DeCrane, Cleveland Fire Fighters Association, IAFF Local #93, Cleveland, OH 
  
THESE PROPOSALS ARE ON THE AGENDA OF THE IFC AND THE IBC GENERAL CODE DEVELOPMENT 
COMMITTEES AS 2 SEPARATE CODE CHANGES. SEE THE TENTATIVE HEARING ORDERS FOR THESE 
COMMITTEES. 
 
PART I – IFC 
 
Add new text as follows: 
 
507.4 Lightweight truss identification.  Lightweight truss construction shall be identified in accordance with Sections 
507.4.1 through 507.4.3.4. 
 

Exception. Detached one and two family dwellings unless otherwise required by other laws or ordinance. 
 
507.4.1 Lightweight steel trusses. Where the roof or any floor of a building does not have a fire-resistance rating, 
and the non-rated assembly is constructed of a pre-fabricated steel truss system consisting of cold-formed steel chord 
and web sections using 10 gauge or thinner elements, identifying emblems complying with Section 507.4.3 shall be 
permanently affixed to the building.  
 
507.4.2 Lightweight wood trusses. Where the roof or any floor of a building does not have a fire-resistance rating, 
and the non-rated assembly is constructed of a pre-fabricated wood truss with members connected using light gauge 
(16, 18 or 20 gauge) metal truss plates, identifying emblems complying with Section 507.4.3 shall be permanently 
affixed to the building.  
 
507.4.3 Identifying emblems. Identifying emblems shall comply with Sections 507.4.3.1 through 507.4.3.4.  
 
507.4.3.1 Color. The emblem shall be of a bright and reflective color, or made of reflective material.  
 
507.4.3.2 Dimensions. The dimensions of the emblem shall be a minimum of 12 inches (305 mm) horizontally by 6  
inches (152 mm) vertically.  
 
507.4.3.3 Identification Letters. Letters of an approved size and color shall be printed on the emblem as follows: 
 

1. “F” to signify a floor with truss construction; 
2. “R” to signify a roof with truss construction; 
3. “F/R” to signify both a floor and roof with truss construction. 

 
507.4.3.4 Location. The emblem shall be permanently affixed on or to the left of the main entrance door on the side of 
the building from which responding firefighters are most likely to enter, as approved and shall be located at a height 
between 4 feet (1219 mm) and 6 feet (1829 mm) above the ground.  
 



 

F62                                                                      ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008 

PART II – IBC 
 
Add new text as follows: 
 

SECTION 604 
IDENTIFICATION OF UNPROTECTED LIGHTWEIGHT TRUSS CONSTRUCTION 

 
604.1 Lightweight steel trusses. If the roof or any floor of a building does not have a fire-resistance rating, and the 
non-rated assembly is constructed of a pre-fabricated steel truss system consisting of cold-formed steel chord and web 
sections using 10 gauge or thinner elements, identifying emblems complying with Section 604.3 shall be permanently 
affixed to the building.  
 

Exception. Detached one and two family dwellings unless otherwise required by other laws or ordinance. 
 
604.2 Lightweight wood trusses. If the roof or any floor of a building does not have a fire-resistance rating, and the 
non-rated assembly is constructed of a pre-fabricated wood truss with members connected using light gauge (16, 18 or 
20 gauge) metal truss plates, identifying emblems complying with Section 604.3 shall be permanently affixed to the 
building.  
 

Exception. Detached one and two family dwellings unless otherwise required by other laws or ordinance 
 
604.3 Identifying emblems. Identifying emblems shall comply with Sections 604.3.1 through 604.3.4.  
 
604.3.1 Color. The emblem shall be of a bright and reflective color, or made of reflective material.  
 
604.3.2 Dimensions. The dimensions of the emblem shall be a minimum of 12 inches (305 mm) horizontally by 6  
inches (152 mm) vertically.  
 
604.3.3 Identification Letters. Letters of an approved size and color shall be printed on the emblem as follows: 
 

1. “F” to signify a floor with truss construction; 
2. “R” to signify a roof with truss construction; 
3. “F/R” to signify both a floor and roof with truss construction. 

 
604.3.4 Location. The emblem shall be permanently affixed on or to the left of the main entrance door on the side of 
the building from which responding firefighters are most likely to enter, as approved and shall be located at a height 
between 4 feet (1219 mm) and 6 feet (1829 mm) above the ground.  
 
Reason: One significant threat facing fire fighters today is the wide use of lightweight non-fire rated construction, specifically lightweight truss 
construction. We have witnessed numerous occasions where fire fighters have been injured and killed in structures using lightweight truss 
construction. Many of the collapses have occurred in the first few minutes of the incident.  
 It is acknowledged the use of truss construction, due to its great load bearing ability, has allowed for buildings to be constructed  cheaper and 
with many benefiting features. The issue needing to be addressed is when that building is compromised by fire. Due to the lightweight material these 
buildings fail far quicker putting the fire fighters at greater risk. 
 The Intent of the code indicates the intention to provide safety to fire fighters and emergency responders during emergency operations. Simply 
identifying the structures where truss construction is used will actually allow all the IBC to comply with that specific intent. 
This proposal deals with specifically Lightweight Steel non-rated assembly and Lightweight Wood Trusses. It does not require every building with 
truss construction to be labeled. With the ever widening use of lightweight truss construction, we are endangering the lives of fire fighters who enter 
the structure to extinguish the fire. The intent of this proposal is to notify responding fire fighters of the use of non-rated truss construction and to 
identify the risks involved. This knowledge will indicate the need for extreme caution, and if no lives are at risk, a defensive attack. While opponents 
discuss the need for pre-planning, there are times where it would not be of use. In times of Mutual Aid response, a responding company from an 
outside jurisdiction may be one of the first arriving companies. This company would not necessarily have been informed of the known risk. In larger 
Departments, city neighborhoods can have drastically different types of construction inherent to the particular populace. Non-rated truss construction 
identification placards would notify these responding companies of the building construction hazard they are facing. 
 Lightweight truss construction is economically attractive. The proponent’s intent is not to eliminate lightweight construction but rather force the 
industry to protect the structural members from the effects of fire for a defined time period or notify the responding fire fighters of the risk they face 
when responding to the respective structure.  

This requirement is already required statewide in the States of New Jersey and New York. 
 
Bibliography 
Special Data Package, Fire Fighter Casualties as a Result of Roof or Floor Collapses in Wood-Frame Buildings, Fire Analysis and Research 
Division, National Fire Protection Association, 1 Batterymarch Park, PO Box 9101, Quincy, MA 02269-9101, March 1998 
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will have a minimal (low) effect on the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 



 

ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008                                                                                                                                   F63 

F78–07/08 
507.4 (New), 502.1 (New) 
 
Proponent: Scott Poster, Fire Department, Los Angeles County, CA 
 
Add new text as follows:  
 
507.4. Structures and outdoor storage underneath high-voltage transmission lines. Structures and outdoor 
storage underneath high-voltage transmission lines shall comply with Section 507.4.1 and 507.4.2. 
 
507.4.1 Structures. Structures shall not be constructed within the utility easement underneath high-voltage 
transmission lines. 
 

Exception: Restrooms and unoccupied telecommunication structures of non-combustible construction less than 
15 feet in height. 

 
507.4.2 Outdoor storage. Outdoor storage within the utility easement underneath high-voltage transmission lines 
shall be limited to noncombustible material. Storage of hazardous materials including, but not limited to, flammable and 
combustible liquids is prohibited. 
 

Exception: Combustible storage, including vehicles, is allowed provided that a plan indicating the storage 
configuration is submitted and approved.  

 
502.1 Definitions. The following words and terms shall, for the purposes of this chapter and as used elsewhere in this 
code, have the meanings shown herein. 
 
HIGH-VOLTAGE TRANSMISSION LINE. An electrical power transmission line operating at or above 66 kilovolts 
 
Reason: Structure fires underneath high-voltage transmission lines could cause arcing and shock hazard. Firefighting operations involve the use of 
elevated aerial apparatus and other emergency equipment, personnel aboveground and hose streams that may come in close proximity to high-
voltage transmission lines. According to nationally recognized utility companies, manual de-energization of lines may take 20 minutes or longer to 
accomplish. A history of problems with structure fires underneath high voltage lines does not exist, due to the fact that the utility companies have set 
internal policies that until recently allowed only low-intensity use of the property underneath high-voltage transmission lines. 
 From NIOSH Hazard ID #15, January 2002, Firefighters Exposed to Electrical Hazards During Wildland Fire Operations 
“Dense smoke can obscure energized electrical lines or equipment and can become charged and conduct electrical current.”   
 From Bonneville Power Administration, Living and Working Safely Around High Voltage Power Lines 
p.7, 2001, DOE/BP-1821, “Smoke and hot gases from a large fire can create a conductive path for electricity. When a fire is burning under a 
transmission line, electricity could arc from the conductor to the ground, endangering people and objects near the arc” 
 From SP-Ausnet, Corporate Communications Team, Melbourne, Victoria. “Excessive exposure to “electric fields” and “magnetic fields” is 
deemed harmful to humans or animals. Powerlines are designed such that the electric and magnetic fields at ground level and at the boundaries of 
easements are kept within these standards. If one was to change the conditions on the ground under a high voltage line, such as building a structure 
or raise the ground level, etc. then the persons in the vicinity of these higher levels are exposed to higher than accepted electric and magnetic fields. 
It should be noted that the effect of these fields are proportional to the field strength as well as the duration of exposure.” 
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 

F79–07/08  
508.2 
 
Proponent: Anthony C. Apfelbeck, City of Altamonte Springs, FL 
 
Revise as follows:  
 
508.2 Type of water supply. A water supply shall consist of approved reservoirs, pressure tanks, elevated tanks, 
water mains, fire department mobile water supply resources or other fixed systems capable of providing the required 
fire flow. 
 



 

F64                                                                      ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008 

Reason: The current code language in 508.2 does not allow the fire code official to consider fire department rural water supply operations involving 
tanker shuttles as a means of meeting the required fire flow. For a vast majority of rural areas, the only means of providing a water supply is via a 
tanker shuttle type operation. This code change will recognize this capability as a reasonable alternative to providing the required water supply. The 
term “approved” is also added to provide an oversight by the fire code official /Fire Chief in determining if a water supply is appropriate for utilization 
in providing the needed fire flow.   
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 

F80–07/08  
508.3.1 (New), Appendix B105.1 
 
Proponent: Steven Orlowski, National Association of Home Builders 
 
Revise as follows: 
 
B105.1 (Supp) 508.3.1 One- and two-family dwellings. The minimum fire-flow and flow duration requirements for 
one- and two family dwellings having a fire-flow calculation area which does not exceed 5,000 3,600 square feet 
(344.5 464.5 m2) shall be 1,000 gallons per minute (3785 L/min) for 1 hour. Fire flow and flow duration for one- and 
two- family dwellings having a fire-flow calculation area in excess of 5,000 3,600 square feet (344.5 464.5 m2) shall not 
exceed 1,500 gallons per minute (5678 L/min) be less than that specified in Table B105.1. 
 

Exception: A reduction in required fire flow of 50 percent, as approved, is allowed when the building is provided 
with an approved automatic sprinkler system. 

 
Reason:  During the recent Uniform Fire Code revision cycle, the allowable fire-flow calculated area was increased from 3,600 square feet to 5,000 
square feet. This proposal will keep the requirements consistent for one- and two- family dwellings constructed in jurisdictions where there is an 
overlap in authority by the Building Official and the Fire Marshal.  By increasing the square footage from 3,600 to 5,000 it will relieve the designer 
and reviewer from having to perform burdensome calculations for each individual dwelling.  Allowing for a 50 % reduction in fire flow for dwellings 
should be permitted where the dwelling is equipped with an automatic sprinkler system and rated exterior walls in accordance with IRC Table 
R302.1. 
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will decrease the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 

F81–07/08  
508.5, 508.5.1 through 508.5.1.4 (New); Appendix C 
 
Proponent: Anthony C. Apfelbeck, City of Altamonte Springs, FL 
 
Revise as follows:  
 
508.5 Fire hydrant systems. Where the fire code official has determined that fire hydrant systems are available, fire 
hydrant systems shall comply with Sections 508.5.1 through 508.5.6. 
 
508.5.1 Where required. Where a portion of the facility or building hereafter constructed or moved into or within the 
jurisdiction is more than 400 feet (122 m) from a hydrant on a fire apparatus access road, as measured by an 
approved route around the exterior of the facility or building, on-site fire hydrants and mains shall be provided where 
required by the fire code official. 
 

Exceptions: 
 

1. For Group R-3 and Group U occupancies, the distance requirement shall be 600 feet (183 m). 
2. For buildings equipped throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance 

with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2, the distance requirement shall be 600 feet (183 m). 
 
C102.1 508.5.1  Fire hydrant locations. Where a facility, building or portion of a building is hereafter constructed or 
moved into the jurisdiction, fire hydrants shall be provided along required fire apparatus access roads, and adjacent 
public streets and on the proposed site in accordance with Sections 508.5.1.1 through 508.5.1.4.  



 

ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008                                                                                                                                   F65 

C103.1 Fire hydrants available.  508.5.1.1 Number of fire hydrants. The minimum number of fire hydrants available 
to a building shall not be less than that listed in Table C105.1 508.5.1.1. The number of fire hydrants available to a 
complex or subdivision shall not be less than that determined by spacing requirements listed in Table C105.1 
508.5.1.1 when applied to fire apparatus access road and perimeter public streets from which fire operations could be 
conducted.  
 
C104.1 508.5.1.2 Existing fire hydrants. Existing fire hydrants on public streets are allowed to be considered as 
available. Existing fire hydrants on adjacent properties shall not be considered available unless fire apparatus access 
roads extend between properties and easements are established to prevent obstruction of such roads. 
 
C105.1  508.5.1.3 Hydrant spacing. The average spacing between fire hydrants shall not exceed that listed in Table 
C105.1 508.5.1.1. 
 

Exception: The fire chief code official is authorized to accept a deficiency of up to 10 percent where existing fire 
hydrants provide all or a portion of the required fire hydrant service.  

 
Regardless of the average spacing, fire hydrants shall be located such that all points on streets and access roads 

adjacent to a building are within the distances listed in Table C105.1 508.5.1.1. 
 

TABLE C105.1 [Supp] 508.5.1.1 
NUMBER AND DISTRIBUTION OF FIRE HYDRANTS 

 
 

FIRE-FLOW 
REQUIREMENT (gpm) 

 
MINIMUM 

NUMBER OF 
HYDRANTS 

AVERAGE SPACING 
BETWEEN 

HYDRANTSa,b,c 

(feet) 

 
MAXIMUM DISTANCE FROM ANY 

POINT ON STREET OR ROAD 
FRONTAGE TO A HYDRANTd 

1,750 or less 1 500 250 
2,000-2,250 2 450 225 

2,500 3 450 225 
3,000 3 400 225 

3,500-4,000 4 350 210 
4,500-5,000 5 300 180 

5,500 6 300 180 
6,000 6 260 150 

6,500-7,000 7 250 150 
7,500 or more 8 or moree 200 120 

For SI: 1 foot = 304.8 mm, 1 gallon per minute = 3.785 L/m. 
a. Reduce by 100 feet for dead-end streets or roads. 
b. Where streets are provided with median dividers which cannot be crossed by fire fighters pulling hose lines, or 

where arterial streets are provided with four or more traffic lanes and have a traffic count of more than 30,000 
vehicles per day, hydrant spacing shall average 500 feet on each side of the street and be arranged on an 
alternating basis up to a fire-flow requirement of 7,000 gallons per minute and 400 feet for higher fire-flow 
requirements. 

c. Where new water mains are extended along streets where hydrants are not needed for protection of structures or 
similar fire problems, fire hydrants shall be provided at spacing not to exceed 1,000 feet to provide for 
transportation hazards. 

d. Reduce by 50 feet for dead-end streets or roads. 
e. One hydrant for each 1,000 gallons per minute or fraction thereof. 
 
508.5.1.4 On-site fire hydrants. On-site fire hydrants shall be provided so that no portion of a facility or building is 
more than 400 feet (122m) from a fire hydrant. 
 

Exceptions: 
 

1. For Group R-3 and Group U occupancies, the distance requirement shall be 600 feet (183 m). 
2. For buildings equipped throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance 

with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2, the distance requirement shall be 600 feet (183 m). 
 
2. Delete without substitution: 
 
C101.1 Scope. Fire hydrants shall be provided in accordance with this appendix for the protection of buildings, or 
portions of buildings, hereafter constructed. 



 

F66                                                                      ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008 

Reason: The current Appendix C, Fire Hydrant Locations and Distribution, is inserted into Section 508.5.1. The current Section 508.5.1 is relocated 
to a new Section 508.5.1.4. The current hydrants spacing language has a number of faults that are corrected by this action: 

1. The current language in Section 508.5.1 conflicts with optional adoptable language in appendix C. While 508.5.1 states that, “on-site 
hydrants shall be provided where required by the fire code official” when a building is more than 400 feet from a fire hydrant, Appendix C 
would require additional hydrants over and above the 508.5.1 language. To correct this, the current 508.5.1 language is now moved under 
a new 508.5.1 where the hydrant spacing language is in better context with the overall “fire hydrant system” criteria. 

2. Appendix C is designed as a performance standard rather than a prescriptive approach. As the hazard (and required fire flow) increases, 
the number of fire hydrants necessary to protect the property also increases. This approach for hydrant spacing design is more 
appropriate to the protected property.   

3. A straight reading of the 508.5.1 requires fire hydrants only when a building is more than 400 feet from a hydrant on a fire apparatus 
access road. Since there is no reference to public hydrants or a requirement that hydrants be provided in a general manner, it is unclear 
as to the intended application. 

4. It is important to note that the inclusion of the new Appendix C text into 508.5.1 does not change the original scope language of “508.5 
Fire hydrant systems. Fire hydrant systems shall comply with Sections 508.5.1 through 508.5.6.” The imported language from Appendix 
C just provides additional design criteria for fire hydrant systems. 

5. The language “Where the fire code official has determined that fire hydrant systems are available” has been added to the first line in 508.5 
as a scoping clarification. It does not appear to be the intent of the original language to required hydrants when no water distribution 
system is available to supply the hydrants. This is more of a function of Section 508.1. The authority to determine if availability is 
reasonable is vested with the fire code official.  

6. The term “fire chief” in Section 508.5.1.3 is revised to “fire code official” in order to match the existing text contained in Section 508. 
7. Lastly, this proposed change will bring needed nationwide clarity to design professionals, contractors, owners and enforcement officials 

via a common fire hydrant location and spacing approach via this performance design.   
 
Cost Impact: The code change will increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 

F82–07/08 
509.1 (IBC [F] 911.1) 
 
Proponent: Phillip Brazil, PE, Reid Middleton, Inc., representing himself 
 
Revise as follows:  
 
509.1 (IBC [F] 911.1) (Supp) Features. Where required by other sections of this code and in all buildings classified as 
high-rise buildings by the International Building Code, a fire command center for fire department operations shall be 
provided. The location and accessibility of the fire command center shall be approved by the fire department. The fire 
command center shall be separated from the remainder of the building by not less than a 1-hour 2-hour fire barrier 
constructed in accordance with Section 706 of the International Building Code or horizontal assembly constructed in 
accordance with Section 711 of the International Building Code, or both. The room shall be a minimum of 96 square 
feet (9 m2) with a minimum dimension of 8 feet (2438 mm). A layout of the fire command center and all features 
required by this section to be contained therein shall be submitted for approval prior to installation. The fire command 
center shall comply with NFPA 72 and shall contain the following features: 
 

1. The emergency voice/alarm communication system unit. 
2. The fire department communications system. 
3. Fire-detection and alarm system annunciator system. 
4. Annunciator unit visually indicating the location of the elevators and whether they are operational. 
5. Status indicators and controls for air-handling systems. 
6. The fire-fighters control panel required by Section 909.16 for smoke control systems installed in the building. 
7. Controls for unlocking stairway doors simultaneously. 
8. Sprinkler valve and water-flow detector display panels. 
9. Emergency and standby power status indicators. 

    10. A telephone for fire department use with controlled access to the public telephone system. 
    11. Fire pump status indicators. 
    12. Schematic building plans indicating the typical floor plan and detailing the building core, means of egress, fire 

protection systems, fire-fighting equipment and fire department access. 
    13. Work table. 
    14. Generator supervision devices, manual start and transfer features. 
    15. Public address system, where specifically required by other sections of this code. 
    16. Elevator fire recall switch in accordance with ASME A17.1. 
    17. Elevator emergency or standby power selector switch(es), where emergency or standby power is provided. 
 



 

ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008                                                                                                                                   F67 

Reason: The features contained in a fire command center are typically served by electrical systems that are required to be protected by shaft 
enclosures or to be self-protecting, for example, by the installation of listed electrical circuit protective systems or equivalent systems.  Fire command 
centers are typically required in buildings where shaft enclosures and electrical circuit protective systems are required to be 2-hour fire-resistance-
rated (i.e., high-rise buildings).  The fire-resistance rating of the fire barrier protecting the fire command center, however, is required to be 1-hour.  
The level of protection typically required of the electrical systems that serve the fire command center is diminished by the lack of an equivalent level 
of protection.  The purpose of the proposal is to establish equivalent protection for the fire command center. 
 The other proposed changes are editorial.  For examples of listed electrical circuit protective systems, refer to UL Category FHIT, Electrical 
Circuit Protective Systems, which covers systems incorporating cable protected with electrical circuit protective materials (Category FHIY) and 
systems constructed with fire-resistive cable (Category FHJR). 
  
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 

F83–07/08  
508.5.1 
 
Proponent: Steven Orlowski, National Association of Home Builders 
 
Revise as follows:  
 
508.5.1 Where required. Where a portion of the facility or building hereafter constructed or moved into or within the 
jurisdiction is more than 400 feet (122 m) from a hydrant or a fire apparatus access road, as measured by an  
approved route around the exterior of the facility or building, on-site fire hydrants and mains shall be provided where 
required by the fire code official. 
 

Exceptions: 
 

1. For Group R-3 and Group U occupancies, the distance requirement shall be 600 feet (183 m). 
2. For Group R-3 occupancies that are equipped throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler system, 

the distance requirement shall be 1000 (304.8 m) feet. 
3.2. For buildings equipped throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance 

with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2, the distance requirement shall be 600 feet (183 m). 
 
Reason: The purpose of the following modification is to allow greater distances between hydrant spacing in residential developments where all the 
dwelling units are equipped with an automatic sprinkler system. The justification for allowing the 1000 foot spacing is based on the allowance of 
1000 feet from the water source as required in the WUIC Section 404 and the NFPA 1 requirement for when hydrants are not required to protect 
structures, a hydrant shall be spaced no more than 1000 feet apart for assisting vehicular or transportation hazards.  
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will decrease the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 

F84–07/08 
509.1 (IBC [F] 911.1) 
 
Proponent: Ken Kraus, Fire Department, Los Angeles, CA 
 
Revise as follows:  
 
509.1 (IBC [F] 911.1) (Supp) Features. Where required by other sections of this code and in all buildings classified as 
high-rise buildings by the International Building Code, a fire command center for fire department operations shall be 
provided. The location and accessibility of the fire command center shall be approved by the fire department. The fire 
command center shall be separated from the remainder of the building by not less than a 1-hour fire barrier 
constructed in accordance with Section 706 of the International Building Code or horizontal assembly constructed in 
accordance with Section 711 of the International Building Code, or both. The room shall be a minimum of 96 250 
square feet (9 23 m2) with a minimum dimension of 8 10 feet (2438 3048 mm). A layout of the fire command center 
and all features required by this section to be contained therein shall be submitted for approval prior to installation. The 
fire command center shall comply with NFPA 72 and shall contain the following features: 



 

F68                                                                      ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008 

1. The emergency voice/alarm communication system unit. 
2. The fire department communications system. 
3. Fire-detection and alarm system annunciator system. 
4. Annunciator unit visually indicating the location of the elevators and whether they are operational. 
5. Status indicators and controls for air-handling systems. 
6. The fire-fighters control panel required by Section 909.16 for smoke control systems installed in the building. 
7. Controls for unlocking stairway doors simultaneously. 
8. Sprinkler valve and water-flow detector display panels. 
9. Emergency and standby power status indicators. 

    10. A telephone for fire department use with controlled access to the public telephone system. 
    11. Fire pump status indicators. 
    12. Schematic building plans indicating the typical floor plan and detailing the building core, means of egress, fire 

protection systems, fire-fighting equipment and fire department access. 
    13. Work table. 
    14. Generator supervision devices, manual start and transfer features. 
    15. Public address system, where specifically required by other sections of this code. 
    16. Elevator fire recall switch in accordance with ASME A17.1. 
    17. Elevator emergency or standby power selector switch(es), where emergency or standby power is provided. 
 
Reason: This proposal is intended to increase the minimum size of the Fire Command Center to a size and configuration that is conducive to 
effective use of the facility by emergency responders. 
 The current minimum requirement for the size of a Fire Command Center is impractical.    Fire Command Centers (FCC) not only need to be 
designed to accommodate a significant number of emergency responders wearing full personel protective equipment.  FCC’s are also used to 
review building emergency plans during incidents, co-locate decision makers within the Incident Command System (ICS) and interpret fire protection 
system information.  Given the multiple uses of the FCC, it is extremely likely that the limitations of a 10’by 10’ room would serve to compromise the 
effectiveness of Incident management.  

The current minimum size has proven in both exercise and emergency incident scenarios to be too small and confining. 
A minimum size of 250 square feet allows for the necessary personnel to effectively perform the required tasks associated with a Fire 

Command Center.  
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 

F85–07/08  
509.1 (IBC [F] 911.1) 
 
Proponent: Lawrence G. Perry, AIA, representing Building Owners and Managers Association International (BOMA) 
 
Revise as follows:  
 
509.1 (IBC [F] 911.1) (Supp) Features. Where required by other sections of this code and in all buildings classified as 
high-rise buildings by the International Building Code, a fire command center for fire department operations shall be 
provided. The location and accessibility of the fire command center shall be approved by the fire department. The fire 
command center shall be separated from the remainder of the building by not less than a 1-hour fire barrier 
constructed in accordance with Section 706 of the International Building Code or horizontal assembly constructed in 
accordance with Section 711 of the International Building Code, or both. The room shall be a minimum of 96 square 
feet (9 m2) with a minimum dimension of 8 feet (2438 mm). A layout of the fire command center and all features 
required by this section to be contained therein shall be submitted for approval prior to installation. The fire command 
center shall comply with NFPA72 and shall contain the following features: 
 

1. The emergency voice/alarm communication system unit. 
2. The fire department communications system. 
3. Fire-detection and alarm system annunciator system. 
4. Annunciator visually indicating the location of the elevators and whether they are operational. 
5. Status indicators and controls for air-handling systems. 
6. The fire-fighter=s control panel required by Section 909.16 for smoke control systems installed in the building. 
7. Controls for unlocking stairway doors simultaneously. 
8. Sprinkler valve and water-flow detector display panels. 
9.  Emergency and standby power status indicators. 

    10.  A telephone for fire department use with controlled access to the public telephone system. 



 

ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008                                                                                                                                   F69 

    11.  Fire pump status indicators. 
    12.  Schematic building plans indicating the typical floor plan and detailing the building core, means of egress, fire 

protection systems, fire-fighting equipment and fire department access, and the location of fire walls, fire 
barriers, fire partitions, smoke barriers and smoke partitions. 

    13.  Work table. 
    14.  Generator supervision devices, manual start and transfer features. 
    15.  Public address system, where specifically required by other sections of this code. 
    16.  Elevator fire recall switch in accordance with ASME A17.1. 
    17.  Elevator emergency or standby power selector switch(es), where emergency or standby power is provided. 
 
Reason: This proposal will add additional information to first responders in buildings having fire command centers. It will require that the schematic 
building plans, which are already required, include the location of fire walls, fire barriers, fire partitions, smoke barriers, and smoke partitions.  BOMA 
believes this is a far better method of providing this information to fire inspectors and responding fire fighters than providing stencils or stickers on 
walls throughout the building. BOMA has submitted a separate proposal to delete the requirement for marking of rated walls (newly added to Section 
703.6 of the IBC). 
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 
F86–07/08  
509.1, 509.2 (New) [IBC [F] 911.1, [F] 911.2 (New)] 
 
Proponent: Gary Lewis, Chair, representing ICC Ad Hoc Committee on Terrorism Resistant Buildings  
 
1. Revise as follows:  
 
509.1 (IBC [F] 911.1) (Supp) Features. Where required by other sections of this code and in all buildings classified as 
high-rise buildings by the International Building Code, a fire an emergency command center for fire department 
emergency operations shall be provided. The location and accessibility of the fire emergency command center shall be 
approved by the fire department. The fire emergency command center shall be separated from the remainder of the 
building by not less than a 1-hour fire barrier constructed in accordance with Section 706 of the International Building 
Code or horizontal assembly constructed in accordance with Section 711 of the International Building Code, or both. In 
buildings that are more than 420 feet (128 m) in height, the emergency command center shall be separated from the 
remainder of the building by not less than a 2-hour fire-resistance-rated fire barrier constructed in accordance with 
Section 706 of the International Building Code or 2-hour horizontal assembly constructed in accordance with Section 
711 of the International Building Code, or both. The room shall be a minimum of 96 square feet (9 m2) with a minimum 
dimension of 8 feet (2438 mm). A layout of the fire emergency command center and all features required by this 
section to be contained therein shall be submitted for approval prior to installation. The fire emergency command 
center shall comply with NFPA 72 and shall contain the following features: 
 

1. The emergency voice/alarm communication system unit. 
2. The fire department communications system. 
3. Fire-detection and alarm system annunciator system. 
4. Annunciator visually indicating the location of the elevators and whether they are operational. 
5. Status indicators and controls for air-handling systems. 
6. The fire-fighter=s control panel required by Section 909.16 for smoke control systems installed in the building. 
7. Controls for unlocking stairway doors simultaneously. 
8. Sprinkler valve and water-flow detector display panels. 
9.  Emergency and standby power status indicators. 

    10.  A telephone for fire department use with controlled access to the public telephone system. 
    11.  Fire pump status indicators. 
    12.  Schematic Building Emergency resource manual approved by the fire department that includes emergency 

operation instructions and building plans indicating the typical floor plan and detailing the building core, means 
of egress, as well as the layout and operating instructions for the emergency aspects of fire protection 
systems, HVAC systems, elevator controls, communication systems, utilities, fire-fighting equipment and fire 
department access. 

    13.  Work table. 
    14.  Generator supervision devices, manual start and transfer features. 
    15.  Public address system, where specifically required by other sections of this code. 
    16.  Elevator fire recall switch in accordance with ASME A17.1. 
    17.  Elevator emergency or standby power selector switch(es), where emergency or standby power is provided. 



 

F70                                                                      ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008 

2. Add new text as follows: 
 
509.2 (IBC [F] 911.2) Location. The emergency command center shall be located at least 25 feet from uncontrolled 
building entrances and loading docks, shall not be visible from the street, and shall be at a location approved by the 
fire chief. 
 
Reason: The purpose of this change is to increase the ability of firefighters, and other emergency responders, to develop a clear picture of 
conditions throughout the building which will enable them to better manage evacuation, fire suppression and other emergency response activities.  It 
will also enhance the safety of emergency responders, in buildings greater than 420 feet in height, by requiring a two-hour fire resistance rated 
enclosure for the emergency command center, the same as is required for the exit stair enclosure.   
 The value of the fire control center already required by the Code is enhanced by a strengthened “Emergency Resource Manual” which will now 
include operating instructions for emergency systems as well as information on the emergency aspects of HVAC systems, elevator controls, 
communication systems and utilities.  The center is re-titled the emergency command center to reflect its role in managing emergencies other than 
fire emergencies. 
 New Section 509.2 will establish a minimum distance the command center must be located from any uncontrolled building entrance or loading 
dock, thus reducing the possibility of access or damage to the command center from outside influences.   
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 

F87–07/08  
511 (New), 907.2.12.2 (IBC [F] 907.2.12.2), Appendix I (New) 
 
Proponent: Tom Lariviere, Fire Department, Madison, MS, representing Joint Fire Service Review Committee 
 
1. Add new text as follows:  
 

SECTION 511 
EMERGENCY RESPONDER RADIO COVERAGE 

 
511.1 Emergency responder radio coverage in new buildings. All new buildings shall have approved radio 
coverage for emergency responders within the building.  
 
511.2 Emergency responder radio coverage in existing buildings. Existing buildings that do not have approved 
radio coverage for emergency responders within the building shall be equipped with such coverage within 18 months 
of receiving notice of such deficiency from the fire code official.   
 
2. Revise as follows: 
 
907.2.12.2 (IBC [F] 907.2.12.2) (Supp) Fire department communication system. An approved two-way, fire 
department communication emergency responder radio coverage system designed and installed in accordance with 
NFPA 72 shall be provided for fire department use. It shall operate between a fire command center complying with 
Section 509 and elevators, elevator lobbies, emergency and standby power rooms, fire pump rooms, areas of refuge 
and inside enclosed exit stairways. The fire department communication device shall be provided at each floor level 
within the enclosed exit stairway. 

 
Exception: Fire department radio systems where approved by the fire department. 

 
3. Add new appendix as follows: 
 

APPENDIX I 
EMERGENCY RESPONDER RADIO COVERAGE 

 
SECTION I101 

GENERAL 
 
I101 Scope. Systems, components, and equipment required to provide emergency responder radio coverage shall be 
in accordance with this appendix. 
 



 

ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008                                                                                                                                   F71 

I101.1 Permit. A construction permit is required for installation of or modification to emergency responder radio 
coverage systems and related equipment. Maintenance performed in accordance with this code is not considered a 
modification and does not require a permit. 
 

SECTION I102 
DEFINITIONS 

 
I102.1 Definitions. For the purpose of this appendix, certain terms are defined as follows: 
 
AGENCY. Any emergency responder department within the jurisdiction that utilizes radio frequencies for 
communication.  This could include, but not be limited to, various public safety agencies such as fire department, 
emergency medical services and law enforcement. 
 

SECTION I103 
TECHNICAL REQUIREMENTS 

 
I103.1 Radio signal strength.  The building shall be considered to have acceptable emergency responder radio 
coverage when signal strength measurements in 90 percent of all areas on each floor of the building meet the signal 
strength requirements in Sections I103.1.1 and I103.1.2. 
 
I103.1.1 Minimum signal strength into the building. A minimum signal strength of -95 dBm shall be receivable 
within the building.  
 
I103.1.2 Minimum signal strength out of the building. A minimum signal strength of -100 dBm shall be received by 
the agency's radio system when transmitted from within the building.  
 
I103.2 System design.  The emergency responder radio coverage system shall be designed in accordance with  
Sections I103.2.1 through I103.2.5. 
 
I103.2.1 Amplification Systems Allowed. Buildings and structures which cannot support the required level of radio 
coverage shall be equipped with a radiating cable system, a distributed antenna system with FCC certified signal 
boosters, or other system approved by the fire code official in order to achieve the required adequate radio coverage.  
 
I103.2.2 Technical criteria. The fire code official shall maintain a document providing the specific technical 
information and requirements for the emergency responder radio coverage system. This document shall contain, but 
not be limited to, the various frequencies required, the location of radio sites, effective radiated power of radio sites, 
and other supporting technical information.  
 
I103.2.3 Secondary power.  The emergency responder radio coverage system shall be equipped with a secondary 
source of power. The secondary source of power shall be either a battery system or an emergency generator.  The 
secondary power supply shall supply power automatically when the primary power source is lost. The secondary 
source of power shall be capable of operating the emergency responder radio coverage system for a period of at least 
twelve hours. 
 
I103.2.3.1 Battery Systems. The active components of the installed system or systems shall be capable of operating 
on an independent battery system for a period of at least twelve hours without external power input. The battery 
system shall automatically charge in the presence of external power input.  
 
I103.2.4 Signal Booster requirements. If used, signal boosters shall meet the following requirements: 
 

1. All signal booster components shall be contained in a NEMA4 type water proof cabinet.   
2. The battery system shall be contained in a NEMA4 type water proof cabinet.  
3. The system shall include automatic alarming of malfunctions of the signal booster and battery system. Any 

resulting trouble alarm shall be automatically transmitted to an approved central station or proprietary 
supervising station as defined in NFPA 72 or, when approved by the fire code official, shall sound an audible 
signal at a constantly attended location.  

4. Equipment shall have FCC Certification prior to installation.  
 

I103.2.5 Additional frequencies and change of frequencies. The emergency responder radio coverage system 
shall be capable of modification or expansion in the event frequency changes are required by the FCC or additional 
frequencies are made available by the FCC.   



 

F72                                                                      ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008 

I103.3 Installation requirements.  The installation of the public safety radio coverage system shall be in accordance 
with Sections I103.3.1 through I103.3.5. 
 
I103.3.1 Approval prior to installation. No amplification system capable of operating on frequencies licensed to any 
public safety agency by the FCC shall be installed without prior coordination and approval of the fire code official. 
 
I103.3.2 Permit required.  A construction permit as required by Section 105.7.11 shall be obtained prior to the 
installation of the emergency responder radio coverage system. 
 
I103.3.3 Minimum qualifications of personnel. The minimum qualifications of the system designer and lead 
installation personnel shall include:  
 

1. A Valid FCC issued General Radio Operators License, and  
2. Certification of in-building system training issued by a nationally recognized organization, school or a 

certificate issued by the manufacturer of the equipment being installed.  
 
The agency may waive these requirements upon successful demonstration of adequate skills and experience 

satisfactory to the fire code official.  
 

I103.3.4 Acceptance test procedure. When an emergency responder radio coverage system is required, and upon 
completion of installation, the building owner shall have the radio system tested to ensure that two-way coverage on 
each floor of the building is a minimum of 90 percent. The test procedure shall be conducted as follows: 
 

1. Each floor of the building shall be divided into a grid of 20 approximately equal areas. 
2. The test shall be conducted using a calibrated portable radio of the latest brand and model used by the agency 

talking through the agency's radio communications system.  
3. A maximum of two nonadjacent areas will be allowed to fail the test.  
4. In the event that three of the areas fail the test, in order to be more statistically accurate, the floor may be 

divided into 40 equal areas. A maximum of four nonadjacent areas will be allowed to fail the test. If the system 
fails the 40-area test, the system shall be altered to meet the 90 percent coverage requirement.  

5. A test location approximately in the center of each grid area will be selected for the test, then the radio will be 
enabled to verify two-way communications to and from the outside of the building through the public agency's 
radio communications system. Once the test location has been selected, that location shall represent the 
entire area.  If the test fails in the selected test location, that grid area shall fail, and prospecting for a better 
spot within the grid area will not be allowed.  

6. The gain values of all amplifiers shall be measured and the test measurement results shall be kept on file with 
the building owner so that the measurements can be verified during annual tests. In the event that the 
measurement results become lost, the building owner will be required to rerun the acceptance test to 
reestablish the gain values.  

7. As part of the installation a spectrum analyzer or other suitable test equipment shall be utilized to insure 
spurious oscillations are not being generated by the subject signal booster. This test will be conducted at time 
of installation and subsequent annual inspections.  

 
I103.3.5 FCC compliance. The emergency responder radio coverage system installation and components shall also 
comply with all applicable Federal regulations, including but not limited to, Federal Communications Rules (47 CFR 
90.219). 
 
I103.4 Maintenance. The emergency responder radio coverage system shall be maintained in accordance with 
Sections I103.4.1 through I103.4.5. 
 
I103.4.1 Maintenance.  The public radio coverage system shall be maintained operational at all times. 
 
I103.4.2 Permit required.  A permit as required by Section 105.7.4 shall be obtained prior to the modification or 
alteration of the emergency responder radio coverage system. 
 
I103.4.3 Testing and proof of compliance. The emergency responder radio coverage system shall be inspected and 
tested annually or whenever structural changes occur including additions or remodels that could materially change the 
original field performance tests. Testing shall consist of the following: 
 

1. In-building coverage test as described in Section I103.3.4.  
2. Signal boosters shall be tested to ensure that the gain is the same as it was upon initial installation and 

acceptance.  



 

ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008                                                                                                                                   F73 

3. Backup batteries and power supplies shall be tested under load of a period of one hour to verify that they will 
properly operate during an actual power outage. If within the one hour test period the battery exhibits 
symptoms of failure, the test shall be extended for additional one hour periods until the integrity of the battery 
can be determined.  

4. All other active components shall be checked to verify operation within the manufacturer’s specifications. 
5. At the conclusion of the testing a report shall be submitted to the fire code official which shall verify compliance 

with Section I103.3.4.  
 

I103.4.4 Additional frequencies. The building owner shall modify or expand the emergency responder radio coverage 
system at their expense in the event frequency changes are required by the FCC or additional frequencies are made 
available by the FCC. Prior approval of a public safety radio coverage system on previous frequencies does not 
exempt this section. 
 
I103.4.5 Field testing. Agency personnel shall have the right to enter onto the property at any reasonable time to 
conduct field-testing to verify the required level of radio coverage. 
 
Reason: Large buildings have historically provided barriers to radio communications within them.  This is the reason high rise buildings are required 
to install hard wired, two-way communications systems.  The typical system has phone jacks strategically located throughout the building (in 
stairways, elevator lobbies, and inside elevators), with hand sets available to emergency responders in the lobby or the fire control room.   
However, problems with this solution include: 

• Handset availability – even if they don’t get stolen or misplaced, the typical building will only have five handsets, far too few for the dozens 
to hundreds of firefighters required to successfully bring a high rise fire under control  

• Lack of training for responders – while some fire departments routinely train on these systems, each one is different, presenting problems 
remembering the special considerations necessary to operate successfully in each high rise building; other responders (law enforcement, 
EMS) don’t train on these systems at all, and many times don’t even know they exist  

• Buildings other than high-rise interfere with routine radio communications, but aren’t required to provide an alternative.  
When this requirement was implemented, it was the best alternative available.  Now, technology has progressed to a point where there are 

multiple solutions with multiple technologies to address virtually any situation.  These solutions support emergency responders’ radio systems so 
that no additional training is required by the responders; the same communication system that they use every day can be used in any building in a 
jurisdiction. 
 Emergency response agencies use radio communications routinely and lives depend on the adequacy of the radio communication system.  
Communications must be able to go both into and out of the buildings in times of emergency.  Whether it be someone inside the building requesting 
assistance, or even worse calling May Day, or the Incident Commander outside the building trying to obtain a status report to make a determination 
on deployment of additional resources, communications is critical. 
 Some will complain of the cost of these systems, which range from the relatively inexpensive to very expensive, depending upon the solution 
chosen by the building owner or developer (one estimate is from $.40/ft to $1.25/ft).  The fact is that tax payers have invested billions of dollars in 
their public safety communications systems.  It isn’t unusual for a mid-size jurisdiction to spend millions of dollars to equip emergency responders 
with communications systems, only to have a developer construct a building that defeats the entire system inside their facility.  Good public policy 
dictates that these owners/developers bear the cost of upgrading their facilities to allow emergency responders to utilize the tools that tax payers 
have provided.  This is in keeping with the philosophy inherent in the I-Codes that, when a facility grows too large or complex for effective fire 
response, that fire protection features be provided within the building at the owner’s expense.     
 This proposal provides that an adequate level of communication is available within the building.  Once a deficiency is noted in a building, the 
installation and technical criteria in Appendix I can be utilized to design and install a system to enhance the radio communications.  There are 
several types of systems that can be utilized to enhance radio traffic and under this proposal any of these systems can be used. 
 This proposal also includes existing buildings in Section 511.2.  While modeling and other techniques may provide a good prediction as to 
whether a building will interfere with radio communications, the reality is that it is unknown if a building will need to install any type of radio system 
enhancements until after the building is constructed.  These issues are dependent on the construction type, shadows of other buildings, size of 
structure, etc. This proposal includes existing structures so that once the building is built, the system can be installed at any time, when and if it 
becomes necessary; it also provides a reasonable amount of time for existing buildings to come into conformance (18 months after notification). 
 The proposed Appendix I includes design, construction, maintenance and testing criteria.  This provides guidance to the code official and 
ensures that the emergency responder radio coverage system will be operational throughout the life of the building.   
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 



 

F74                                                                      ICC PUBLIC HEARING ::: February 2008 

F88–07/08  
603.3.2; IRC M2201.2 
 
Proponent: John Levy, Oilheat Associates, Inc., representing National Oilheat Research Alliance 
 
THESE PROPOSALS ARE ON THE AGENDA OF THE IFC AND THE IRC MECHANICAL CODE DEVELOPMENT 
COMMITTEES AS 2 SEPARATE CODE CHANGES. SEE THE TENTATIVE HEARING ORDERS FOR THESE 
COMMITTEES. 
 
PART I  IFC 
 
Revise as follows:  
 
603.3.1 (Supp) Fuel oil storage in outside, aboveground tanks. Where connected to a fuel-oil piping system, the 
maximum amount of fuel oil storage allowed outside above ground without additional protection shall be 660 gallons 
(2498 L). The storage of fuel oil above ground in quantities exceeding 660 gallons (2498 L) shall comply with NFPA 
31. 
 
603.3.2 (Supp) Fuel oil storage inside buildings. Fuel oil storage inside buildings shall comply with Sections 
603.3.2.1 through 603.3.2.5 or Chapter 34. 
 

Exception:  The storage of fuel oil used for space or water heating inside buildings in quantities exceeding 660 
gallons (2498 L) shall comply with NFPA 31. 

 
PART II  IRC MECHANICAL 
 
Revise as follows: 
 
M2201.2 Above-ground tanks. The maximum amount of fuel oil stored above ground or inside of a building shall be 
660 gallons (2498 L). The supply tank shall be supported on rigid noncombustible supports to prevent settling or 
shifting. 
 

Exception: The storage of fuel oil, used for space or water heating, above ground or inside buildings in quantities 
exceeding 660 gallons (2498 L) shall comply with NFPA 31. 

 

Reason: In 603.3.1, the current code refers to NFPA-31 for storage exceeding 660 gallons. 
Our proposal is to use similar language in 603.3.2 for tanks that are used for space/water heating only.   
To reduce the possibility of environmental releases, the Oil heat industry encourages customers with large underground tanks to replace them 

with aboveground storage whenever possible. 
Limiting the inside storage to 660 gallons will leave a large numbers of building owners with significantly less on-site storage than is acceptable. 

While average annual consumption of fuel oil is just under 1,000 gallons, many larger homes consume well over 2,000 gallons per year. 
Of the approximately 10 million US households that currently use oil to heat their home, approximately 20% have underground tanks and in 

some states the number of buried tanks is over 50%. 
It is a common practice in many areas for two and three level homes to have a separate oil furnace and tank for each floor.    
The proposed change is intended to address the need for larger inside storage capacities than currently permitted, without the additional 

financial and logistical burdens involved with the installation of protected tanks. 
“Protected” tanks (double wall, insulated tanks) are not practical for inside fuel oil storage in most locations due to size and weight constraints. 

A 300 gallon “protected” tank weighs 1,874 pounds and is 52” in diameter.  A typical 330 gallon tank weighs 320 pounds and is 27” wide. Installers 
must lift and move these tanks as access to machinery and elevators to move them is unlikely. 

“Protected” tanks typically require an investment that is approximately ten times the investment for unprotected tanks.  We believe this will 
discourage the proactive replacement of aging tanks and lead to additional releases of product and the resulting environmental consequences.  

In jurisdictions that previously followed NFPA 31, four (4) 330 tanks have been allowed for a number of years.  The replacement of these tanks 
will require that the storage capacity be downsized, providing a disincentive to proactive replacement. 

Properly installed standard UL listed fuel oil storage tanks (UL 80 and UL 2258), installed in accordance with NFPA-31 have a well established 
safety record. There is no loss history to substantiate the current 660 gallon limit and merely changing the storage capacity for fuel oil should not 
cause additional fire hazards. 
 
Cost Impact: The code change proposal will not increase the cost of construction. 
 
Public Hearing: Committee:   AS   AM   D 
    Assembly:   ASF  AMF  DF 
 
 


