REVISION RECORD FOR THE
STATE OF CALIFORNIA

ERRATA

December 15, 2006

2001 Title 24, Part 2, California Building Code

PLEASE NOTE: The date of this Errata is for identification purposes only.
See the History Note Appendix for the adoption and effective dates of the provisions.

It is suggested that the section number as well as the page number be checked when inserting this material and removing the superseded
material. In case of doubt, rely on the section numbers rather than the page numbers because the section numbers must run consecutively.

It is further suggested that the superseded material be retained with this revision record sheet so that the prior wording of any section can
be easily ascertained.

Please keep the removed pages with this revision page for future reference.

NOTE

Due to the fact that the application date for a building permit estab-
lishes the California Building Standards code provisions that are
effective at the local level, which apply to the plans, specifications, and
construction for that permit, it is strongly recommended that the
removed pages be retained for historical reference.

VOLUME 1
Remove Existing Pages Insert New Pages
1-449 through 1-452 1-449 through 1-452

Item No. 5510A053






2001 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE

Section 470A.2.3 — In item 7, revise “water closet” to “toilet”.
Section 470A.2.6 — In item 4, revise “water closet” to “toilet”.
Section 470A.2.7 — In item 4, revise “water closet” to “toilet”.
Section 470A.2.8 — In item 3, revise “water closets” to “toilets”.

Section 470A.2.9 —In item 1, after the word “inmate” add ;” and
delete the words “exclusive of circulation corridors of 3 feet (914
mm) in width in front of cells/rooms;”; and in item 3 revise “water
closets” to “toilets™.

Section 470A.2.10 — Insert a new paragraph 3 to read “The exer-
cise area must contain or provide free access to a toilet, wash ba-
sin, and drinking fountain as provided in Section 470A.3.”

Section 470A.2.12 — revise the first sentence to read “There must
be a minimum of one suitably equipped medical examination
room in every facility which provides on-site health care.” ; add
items “4. Provide lockable storage for medical supplies.” and “S.
Any room where medical procedures are provided must be
equipped with hot and cold running water.”

Section 470A.2.15 — Delete heading and the entire section.
Section 470A.2.22 — Delete the last sentence.

Section 470A.2.25 — Revise to read “There must be a minimum of
one suitably furnished interview room for confidential interviews
in every facility which provides on-site health care. The interview
room shall be designed in consultation with responsible custody
staff and health care staff. Such an interview room shall:”

Section A3.1 — Revise the title to read ““Toilets/urinals.”; delete
the section language and its exception inserting 6 new items and a
Note.

Section 470A.3.2 — Revise the first “Wash Basins.” To a bold
title; omit the balance of the language and exception; insert 7 new
items.

Section 470A.3.3 — Revise the first sentence to read “... single-oc-
cupancy cell, double occupancy cell, dormitory, temporary hold-
ing cell, temporary staging cell, and sobering cell and be
accessible to the occupants of dayrooms and exercise areas.”; re-
vise item 1 to replace both locations of “water outlet” with “drink-
ing fountain bubbler”; delete item 2; renumber item 3 as item 2.

Section 470A.3.4 —add “NOTE: Shower areas shall provide mod-
esty for inmates with staff being able to visually supervise.”.

Section 470A.3.5—1In all locations revise “beds/bunks” to “beds”.

Section 470A.3.9 — in the title delete “/shelves/clothes hooks”;
and delete all but the first sentence.

Section 470A3.10 — Replace the first sentence with “In temporary
holding and temporary staging cells, seating must be securely
fixed to the floor and/or wall.”

9. January 2, 2003 Supplement approved by the California
Building Standards Commission on January 31, 2001, Filed with
the Secretary of State on February 2, 2001, published January 1,
2003, and effective 180 days after publication — July 1, 2003:

Section 460A.1.7 —In item 3, revise “... a maximum of 144 ...” to
read “... a minimum of 144 ...”.

Section 460A.1.8 —In item 3, revise “... a maximum of 144 ...” to
read “... a minimum of 144 ...”.

Section 460A.1.11 — Replace item 1. language.

Section 460A.1.11 —Initem 1.1, revise “... one half ...” to read ...
one quarter ...”.

Section 460A.1.11 — Revise item 1.2 to read “The required recre-
ation area shall contain no single dimension less than 40 feet.”

DECEMBER 15, 2006 ERRATA

HISTORY NOTE APPENDIX

Section 460A.1.12 — Revise to read “Academic Classrooms.
There shall be dedicated academic classroom space for every ju-
venile in every facility. The primary purpose for the academic
classroom shall be for education. Each academic classroom shall
contain ...”; and, add the NOTE words as the last sentence of this
section.

Section 460A.1.14 — delete the “and,” for the end of item 4; and,
delete the “.” and add «; and,” to the end of item 5; and, insert a new
item “6. Smooth, non porous, washable surfaces.”

Section 460A.2.1 — Revise the NOTE of item 3 to read “... provide
modesty for ...”.

Section 460A.2.3 — insert new items 1. and 2.

Section 460A.2.5 — Delete the last “.” And add new language “...
measured from any side of the bed. Beds placed ....”.

Section 470A.1 — Under Living Areas, revise “... as detoxifica-
tion safety ...” to read “... as sobering safety ...”.

Section 470A.2.1 — In item 3., revise “A detoxification cell ...” to
read “A sobering cell ...”; and, at the end, add “For those facilities
that accept male and female intoxicated inmates, two sobering
cells shall be provided.”

Section 470A.2.1 — Revise item 4. to read “Access to a shower
within the secure portion of the facility.”

Section 470A.2.1 — Add a new item “8. Unobstructed access to hot
and cold running water for staff use.”

Section 470A.2.4 — Revise it to read “Sobering cell. A sobering
cell shall:”; and, add a new item “8. Have accessible a shower in
the secure portion of the facility.”

Section 470A.2.5—1Initem 1 revise the second line to read “... with
no one floor dimension being less than 6 feet ...”; and, add a new
item “8. any wall or ceiling mounted devices must be inaccessible
to the inmate occupant.”

Section 470A.2.8 — In item 1 revise the second line to read “...
single-bed unit; a minimum of 70 square ...”; and, revise the third
line to read “... double-bed unit; and a minimum of 90 square feet
for a triple-bed unit and have a minimum ...”.

Section 470A.2.9 — At the end of item 2. delete the “.” And add the
words “allowed access at a given time;”

Section 470A.2.14 — Add a new second paragraph to read “If neg-
ative pressure isolation rooms are being planned, they shall be de-
signed to recognized industry standards.”

Section 470A.2.16 — Revise the language in the third to the end of
the section to read “... to purchase items. When commissary sup-
plies are kept within the security perimeter for a facility, an area
shall be provided for the secure storage of the stock for such in-
mate canteen items.”

Section 470A.2.20 — Revise the second line to read “... janitor’s
closet, with sufficient area ...””; and, revise the third line to read ...
cleaning implements and supplies, must be ...”; and revise the
fourth line to read “... of the facility. A mop sink shall also be avail-

able within the security area of the facility. In court holding, ...”

Section 470A.3.5 — Revise the first line to read “... must be ele-
vated off the floor, have a solid bottom, and a sleeping surface of at
least ...”; and in the second and third lines, end the sentence at
“long.” delete the words “and be of the pan-bottom type or
constructed of concrete.”

Section 470A.3.8 — Revise “In detoxification cells ...” to read “In
sobering cells ...”.

10. (OSHPD EF 01/02) Amend Chapters 4 and 10 of Part 2,
Title 24. Approved as emergency by the California Building Stan-

1-449



HISTORY NOTE APPENDIX

dards Commission on January 15, 2003 and filed with the Secre-
tary of State on January 16, 2003. Effective January 16, 2003.

11. Errata February 1, 2003:

Page 1-30: In Division 6 Occupancies, add reference to Appendix
Chapter 3A.

Page 1-116, In Section 1004.3.4.3, insert [For SFM] and revise
“...or more in Group E shall . ..” to “or more; and Group E
shall .. .”

Page 1-134.82: In Figure 11B-18A, revise both parking stall
widths to 9'-0" and the crosshatched divider to 5'-0".

Page 1-134.83: In both Figures 11B-18B and 11B-18C, revise
parking stall width to 9'-0".

12. (SFM 3/02) Swing of Patient Room Doors. Amend Section
1007.511. Approved by the Building Standards Commission on
May 14, 2003 and effective 180 days after publication.

13. (BOC 01/02) Design Criteria for Furnishings and Equip-
ment. Adopt Section 460A.2.10 Design Criteria for Required
Spaces. Amend Sections 460A.1.2; 460A.1.5-460A.1.9;
460A.1.13. Approved by the Building Standards Commission on
July 16, 2003 and effective 180 days after publication.

14. (SFM EF 06/03) Senate Bill 1896 Bedridden Clients in
Residential Care Facilities—Repealed emergency expired Janu-
ary 8, 2004.

15. (SFM EF 01/04) Senate Bill 1896 Bedridden Clients in
Residential Care Facilities. Amend various sections of the Cali-
fornia Building and Fire Codes. Approved on an emergency basis
by the California Building Standards Commission on November
18, 2004, effective November 22, 2004.

16. Errata April 8, 2005 to November 22, 2004 Emergency
Supplement:

Page 1-50.12A: Delete Table 8-B erroneously located in Chapter
4A.

Page 1-92: Insert requirements for R2 Occupancies into Table
8-B, renumber Footnote 7 to 8, and insert new Footnote 7.

17. (SFM EF 01/04) Senate Bill 1896 Bedridden Clients in
Residential Care Facilities. Amend Sections 107.17.14; 203-B;
310.1; add new Section 415A; amend Table 8-A; Sections
904.2.10 and 1003.3.1.8.1. Approved as permanent by the Build-
ing Standards Commission on March 16, 2005.

18. (CSLCEF 2/05) Amend Title 24, Part 2 with the addition of
Chapter 31F. Various sections. Approved by the California Build-
ing Standards Commission on January 19, 2005 and filed with the
Secretary of State on January 31, 2005. Effective 180 days after
publication.

19. (HCD EF 01/05) Senate Bill 1025 Disabled Access to Mul-
tistory Dwelling Units in Covered Multifamily Dwellings.
Amend Sections 1102A.3-C, 1105A and 1107A.5. Approved on
an emergency basis by the California Building Standards Com-
mission on May 18, 2005, effective July 1, 2005.

20. Editorial change, without regulatory effect, to Sections
1105A.2.1and 1107A.5: Revise EXCEPTION to delete the period
() and add the words “and regulated by the Department of Hous-
ing and Community Development as referenced in Section
101.17.9.1.”

21. (SFM EF 01/05) Assembly Bill 1216 Wildland-Urban In-
terface Fire Protection Areas. Add matrix table for Chapter 7A,
amend matrix table for Chapter 15, amend Section 101.17.14, add
note to Chapter 7, add new Chapter 7A, and insert Article 1503.4
[for SEFM]. Approved on an emergency basis by the California

1-450

2001 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE

Building Standards Commission on May 18, 2005, effective De-
cember 1, 2005.

22. (BOC 01/04) Part 2, Chapter 4A, Division VIII, Sections
470A.1; 470A.2.8; 470A.2.22. Amend Chapter 4A to add defini-
tion modifications to:

“BOARD OF CORRECTIONS” by adding the word “board”
between “which” and “acts.”

“RATED CAPACITY” change “medical” to “health care.”

Section 470A.2.8 remove the phrase “inmate for a” and replace
the words “for a” with the word “per.”

Section 470A.2.22 remove the words “and” between Type I and
Type Il and remove the word “facilities” after Type II, also remove
the phrase “housing inmate classified higher than mninimum se-
curity” and delete the word “must” and replace with new word
“shall.”

Approved by the Building Standards Commission on July 19,
2005. Filed with the Secretary of State on July 20,2005. Published
on November 23, 2005, effective 180 days after publication.

23. (HCD EF 01/05) Senate Bill 1025 Disabled Access to Mul-
tistory Dwelling Units in Covered Multifamily Dwellings.
Amend Sections 1102A.3-C, 1105A, and 1107A.5. Reapproved
onan emergency basis by the California Building Standards Com-
mission on September 21, 2005, effective October 29, 2005.

24. Errata December 19, 2005: (BOC 01/04) Correct date se-
quence of history notes.

25. Errata January 23, 2006:

Page 1-134.1: Section 1102A.3-C, Covered Multifamily Dwell-
ings, DSA/AC Note, revise “Section 1116B.5” to “1111B.5.”

Page 1-134.2: Section 1102A.9-1, International Symbol of Acces-
sibility, revise “Chapter 12B” to Chapter 11B.”

26. (HCD EF 01/05) Senate Bill 1025 Disabled Access to Mul-
tistory Dwelling Units in Covered Multifamily Dwellings.
Amend Sections 1102A.3-C, 1105A and 1107A.5. Approved as
permanent by the Building Standards Commission on January 25,
2006.

27. (SFM EF 01/05) Assembly Bill 1216 Wildland-Urban In-
terface Fire Protection Areas. Add matrix table for Chapter 7A,
amend matrix table for Chapter 15, amend Section 101.17.14, add
note to Chapter 7, add new Chapter 7A, and insert Article 1503.4
[for SFM]. Re-adopted/approved on an emergency basis by the
California Building Standards Commission on March 22, 2006,
effective March 30, 2006.

28. (SFM EF 02/05) Assemby Bill 1216 Wildland-Urban In-
terface Fire Protection Areas. Amend Chapter 7A—References,
Definitions and Standards of Quality. Adopted on an emergency
basis by the California Building Standards Commission on Sep-
tember 21, 2005 with an effective date of January 1, 2008.

29. (HCD 03/04) Amend Title 24, Part 2, Vol. 1, Chapters 1, 2,
11A with editorial corrections, updated accessibility provisions
for residential applications. Approved by the California Building
Standards Commission on May 17, 2006. Filed with Secretary of
State on May 23, 2006 with an effective date 180 days after publi-
cation on November 3, 2006.

30. (DSA/AC 02/04) Amend Title 24, Part 2, Vol. 1, Chapters
1,2,10, 11A, 11B, 11C and 30 with editorial corrections, updated
accessibility provisions for public buildings. Approved by the
California Building Standards Commission on May 17, 2006.
Filed with Secretary of State on May 23, 2006 with an effective
date 180 days after publication on November 3, 2006.

DECEMBER 15, 2006 ERRATA



2001 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE

31. (OSHPD 02/04) Amend Title 24, Part 2, Vol. 1, Chapters 1
and 4A with editorial corrections, updated provisions for medical
facilities. Approved by the California Building Standards Com-
mission on May 17,2006. Filed with Secretary of State on May 23,
2006 with an effective date 180 days after publication on Novem-
ber 3, 2006.

32.(SFM 05/04) Amend Title 24, Part 2, Vol. 1, Chapters 1, 2, 3,
9,10 and 35 with editorial corrections, updated provisions for fire
and panic safety applications. Approved by the California Build-
ing Standards Commission on May 17, 2006. Filed with Secretary
of State on May 23, 2006 with an effective date 180 days after pub-
lication on November 3, 2006.

33. (AGR 01/04) Amend Title 24, Part 2, Vol. 1, Chapter 4A
with editorial corrections, updated provisions for meat and poul-
try processing plants, collection centers and facilities, renders and
horsemeat and pet food establishments. Approved by the Califor-
nia Building Standards Commission on May 17, 2006. Filed with
Secretary of State on May 23,2006 with an effective date 180 days
after publication on November 3, 2006.

34. Editorial Corrections. Editorial corrections. Approved by
the California Building Standards Commission on May 17, 2006.
Filed with Secretary of State on May 23, 2006 with an effective
date 180 days after publication on November 3, 2006.

35. (SFM EF 01/05) Assembly Bill 1216 Wildland-Urban In-
terface Fire Protection Areas. Add matrix table for Chapter 7A,
amend matrix table for Chapter 15, amend Section 101.17.14, add
new Chapter 7A and insert Article 1503.4 [for SFM]. Re-adopted/
approved on an Emergency basis by the California Building Stan-
dards Commission on March 22, 2006 with an effective date of
March 30, 2006.

36. (SFM EF 01/05) Assembly Bill 1216 Wildland-Urban In-
terface Fire Protection Areas. Add matrix table for Chapter 7A,
amend matrix table for Chapter 15, amend Section 101.17.14, add
new Chapter 7A and insert Article 1503.4 [for SFM]. The lan-
guage for the permanent rule will remain effective and unchanged
from the adoption/approval of the Emergency Supplement dated
December 1, 2006. Approved as permanent by the California
Building Standards Commission on July 27, 2006 and filed with
the Secretary of State on July 28, 2006.

37. Erratum to correct the publication date from October 12,

2006 to November 3, 2006, for the code changes described in
items 29 through 34 above.

DECEMBER 15, 2006 ERRATA

HISTORY NOTE APPENDIX

1-451



2001 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE

(This page intentionally left blank.)

1-452 DECEMBER 15, 2006 ERRATA



