REVISION RECORD FOR THE
STATE OF CALIFORNIA

ERRATA
April 3, 2007
2001 Title 24, Part 2, California Building Code

PLEASE NOTE: The date of this Errata is for identification purposes only.
See the History Note Appendix for the adoption and effective dates of the provisions.

It is suggested that the section number as well as the page number be checked when inserting this material and removing the superseded
material. In case of doubt, rely on the section numbers rather than the page numbers because the section numbers must run consecutively.

It is further suggested that the superseded material be retained with this revision record sheet so that the prior wording of any section can
be easily ascertained. Please keep the removed pages with this revision page for future reference.

NOTE

Due to the fact that the application date for a building permit estab-
lishes the California Building Standards code provisions that are
effective at the local level, which apply to the plans, specifications, and
construction for that permit, it is strongly recommended that the
removed pages be retained for historical reference.

VOLUME 2
Remove Existing Pages Insert New Pages
2-xvi.3 through 2-xvi.8 2-xvi.3 through 2-xvi.8
2-xvi.13 through 2-xvi.18 2-xvi.13 thrugh 2-xvi.18
2-xvi.23 and 2-xvi.24 2-xvi.23 and 2-xvi.24
2-xvi.29 and 2-xvi.30 2-xvi.29 and 2-xvi.30
2-xvi.33 through 2-xvi.38 2-xvi.33 through 2-xvi.40
2-497 and 2-498 2-497 and 2-498

Item No. 5510A057






MATRIX ADOPTION TABLES—VOLUME 1

CHAPTER 1—ADMINISTRATION

LOCAL LOCAL
ENFORCING AUTHORITY LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL OFFFII%EAL (;iFEFI}(L:m STATE AGENCY
HCD OSHPD
ADOPTING AGENCY CEC [ CA | 1AC | 1 2 3\5(? SFM DHS DWR | AGR | BOC | BSC DsssA 1 2 | 3 | 4 | DOSH* | SL | sLC
Adopt entire UBC
chapter without
amendments
Adopt entire UBC X X | X | X]|X
chapter as amended
(amended sections listed
below)
Adopt only those X X | X | X X X X | X | X | X X
sections that are L IR 4
listed below
101.1 CA X[ X | X
101.2 UBC X X [ X | X X X X [ X[ X | X [ X [X[|X[X X
101.2 CA X
101.2.1.1.4 CA X
101.3.1 CA X X[ X | X X X X [ X[ X | X [ X [X[|X[X X
1014 -101.4.1 CA X X[ X | X X X X [ X[ X | X [ X [X[|X[X X
101.5 CA X X[ X | X X X X [ X[ X | X [ X [X[|X[X X
101.6 CA X X[ X | X X X X [ X[ X | X [ X [X[|X[X X
101.7 CA X X[ X | X X X X [ X[ X | X [ X [X[|X[X X
101.8 CA X X[ X | X X X X [ X[ X | X [ X [X[|X[X X
101.9 CA X X[ X | X X X X [ X[ X | X [ X [X[|X[X X
101.9.1 CA X[ X | X
101.9.2 CA X[ X | X
101.11 CA X | X X X
101.12 CA X | X X
101.13 CA X | X X
101.14 CA X | X X
101.15 CA L IR 4 X
101.16 CA X X[ X | X X X X [ X[ X | X [ X [X[|X[X X
101.17 CA X X [ X | X | X X X X [ X[ X | X [ X [X[|X[X X
101.17.9 CA X
101.17.9.1 CA X
101.17.10 CA X
101.17.11 CA X
101.17.12 CA X
101.17.13 CA X [ X|X|X
101.17.14 CA X
102.1 CA X
102.2 CA X
102.2.1 CA X
102.2.2 CA X
103.1 CA L IR 4 X
103.2 CA X
103.2.1 CA X
103.2.2 CA X
104 CA X
104.2.1.1 CA X
104.2.1.1.1 CA X
(Continued)

APRIL 3, 2007 ERRATA 2-xvi.3




CHAPTER 1—ADMINISTRATION—(Continued)

LOCAL | LOCAL

ENFORCING AUTHORITY LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL OFFICIAL | OFFICIAL STATE AGENCY
HCD oS oS 0SHPD

ADOPTING AGENCY CEC [ CA |W1AC | 1 | 2 | AC SFM DHS | DWR |AGR [BOC | BSC | S | 1 | 2 | 3 | 4 | DOSH | sL |sLC

104.2.1.1.2 CA X

104.2.1.1.3 CA X

104.2.3.1 CA X | X

104.2.8.1 CA X

104.2.8.1.1 CA X

104.2.8.1.2 CA X

104.2.8.2 CA X

105.1.1 CA L NI 4 X

106.2 CA X

106.3.3.1 -106.3.3.4 CA L NI 4 X

106.4.1 CA X

106.4.2.1 CA X

107.1.1 CA X

107.1.2 CA X

107.6.1 CA L NI 4 X

108 -108.5.1 UBC X

108.1.1 CA X

108.5.1 CA X

108.5.2 CA X

108.5.3 CA X

108.5.4 -108.8 UBC X

108.5.4 CA X

108.5.5 CA X

108.5.6 CA X

108.6 UBC X

109 UBC L NI 4 X

*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.
The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

2-xvi.4 APRIL 3, 2007 ERRATA



CHAPTER 2—DEFINITIONS AND ABBREVIATIONS
NOTE: Please refer to Chapter 2 for specific adoptions.

LOCAL LOCAL
ENFORCING AUTHORITY LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL OFFFII%EAL (;iFEFI}(L:m STATE AGENCY
HCD OSHPD
ADOPTING AGENCY CEC | CA | 1AC | 1 2 3\5(? SFM DHS DWR | AGR | BOC | BSC DsssA 1 2 3 4 DOSH* | SL
Adopt entire UBC X
chapter without
amendments
Adopt entire UBC X X [ X[ X | X |X
chapter as amended
(amended sections listed
below)
Adopt only those X X | X | X X X
sections that are
listed below
201.1 UBC X
202—A CA X X | X X X X
202—A UBC X | X X
203—B CA X X | X X X
203—B UBC X | X X
204—C CA X X | X X X X X
204—C UBC X | X X
205—D CA X X | X X X
205—D UBC X | X X
206—E CA X X | X X X X [ X | X | X |X
206—E UBC X | X X
207—F CA X X | X X X X
207—F UBC X | X
208—G CA X X | X X
208—G UBC X | X X
209—H CA X X X XX |[X|X
209—H UBC X | X X
210—I CA X X | X X X
212—K CA X X | X X
213—L CA X X | X X X
213—L UBC X | X
214—M CA X X | X X X
214—M UBC X | X X
215—N CA X | X X
215—N UBC X | X
216—0 UBC X | X
216—0 CA X | X X
217—P UBC X | X X
217—P CA X X | X X X
218—Q CA X
219—R CA X X | X X X
219—R UBC X | X X
220—S CA X X | X X X
220—S UBC X | X X
221—T CA X X | X X X
221—T UBC X | X
222—U CA X | X X X X
222—U UBC X | X X X
223—V CA X X | X X
223—V UBC X | X
224—W CA X | X X X
224—W UBC X | X
226—Y UBC X | X

*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.
The @ designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

APRIL 3, 2007 ERRATA 2-xvi.5




CHAPTER 3—USE OR OCCUPANCY

LOCAL LOCAL
ENFORCING AUTHORITY LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL OFFFII%EAL (;iFEFI}(L:m STATE AGENCY
HCD OSHPD
ADOPTING AGENCY CEC | CA | 1AC | 1 2 3\5(? SFM DHS DWR | AGR | BOC | BSC DsssA 1 2 3 4 DOSH* | SL
Adopt entire UBC
chapter without
amendments
Adopt entire UBC L JNIR 2 x! X X | X [X|X
chapter as amended
(amended sections listed
below)
Adopt only those X | X | X X X
sections that are
listed below
301 UBC X | X | X
301.1 CA X | X | X
302 UBC X | X
302.1 w/ Except.3 UBC X
302.2 -302.3 UBC X | X
302.4 CA X
302.4 w/ X | X
Excepts. 2 & 3 UBC
302.5 UBC X | X
302.6 UBC X | X +
303 UBC X | X
303.1.1 UBC X
303.1.1 CA X
303.1.2 UBC X | X
303.1.4 -303.1.5 CA X
303.2.1 -304.2.1 UBC X
303.2.2.1 CA X
303.2.2.2 CA X
303.5 UBC +
304.2.2.2 -305.2.3 UBC X
303.10 CA X
304.2.2.3 CA X
304.2.2.4 CA X
305.3 UBC X
305.5 -305.6 UBC X
305.1 CA X
305.2.3 CA X
305.2.4 CA X
305.5 UBC +
305.8 UBC X
305.9a CA X
305.9.1 CA X
305.9.2 CA X
305.9.3 CA X
305.10 CA X
305.11 CA X
306.1 CA X
306.2.2.1 CA X
306.2.2.2 -306.2.2.5 CA X
306.5 UBC +

*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.

1. This state agency adopts the entire chapter except for those sections indicated by the following symbol: 4.

The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

2-Xvi.6 APRIL 3, 2007 ERRATA



CHAPTER 3—USE OR OCCUPANCY—(Continued)

LOCAL LOCAL
ENFORCING AUTHORITY LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL OFFFII%EAL gfﬁéﬂ{l STATE AGENCY
HCD DSA DSA OSHPD
ADOPTING AGENCY CEC CA 1/AC 1 AC SFM DHS DWR | AGR | BOC | BSC SS 2 3 DOSH* SL
306.8 CA X
307.1 CA X
307.1.1 CA X
307.2.7 CA X
307.2.12 CA X
307.5.4 UBC +
307.5.5 CA X
307.8 CA X
307.13 -307.13.4 CA X
308.1 CA X
308.2.1 CA X
308.2.2.1 -308.2.22 CA X
308.2.2.3 CA X
308.2.24 CA X
308.5.2 UBC +
308.7.1 - 308.7.2 CA X
308.8 -308.8.1 CA X
308.9 CA X
308.10a CA X
308.11 CA X | X
308.12 CA X
309 -309.3 UBC
309.3 UBC +
309.5 -309.6 UBC
310-310.2.1 UBC X
310.1 CA X
310.1 -310.1.6 CA X
310.2.1 except. only CA X
310.2.2 w/except. CA X X
310.2.2 UBC X
310.2.3 CA X
3104 CA X
310.5 UBC X +
310.5.1 -310.5.2 CA X
310.6 - 310.6.3 CA X
310.6 -310.6.3 UBC X
310.6.3 CA X
310.7 UBC X
310.7 CA X
310.9.1.1 CA X
310.9.1.2 CA X
310.9.1.3 CA X
3109.14 CA X
310.9.1.5 CA X
310.9.1.6 CA X
310.10 - 310.10.3 CA X

*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.
1. This state agency adopts the entire chapter except for those sections indicated by the following symbol: 4.

The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

APRIL 3, 2007 ERRATA

2-xvi.7




CHAPTER 3—USE OR OCCUPANCY—(Continued)

LOCAL LOCAL
ENFORCING AUTHORITY LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL OFFFII%EAL gfﬁéﬂ{l STATE AGENCY
HCD DSA DSA OSHPD
ADOPTING AGENCY CEC CA 1/AC 1 2 AC SFM DHS DWR | AGR | BOC | BSC SS 1 2 3 4 DOSH* SL
310.11 w/except. CA X
310.12 CA X
310.13.1 CA X
310.14 w/excepts. & X
notes CA
310.14 w/o excepts. & X
notes CA
310.14.1 CA X
310.14.2 -310.16.3 CA X
311-311.2.2.1 UBC X
311.2.2.1 CA X
311.2.2.2 UBC X [ X
311.2.3-311.4 UBC X | X
311.2.3.6 CA X
311.2.3.7 CA X
311.5-311.5.2 UBC X
311.9 -311.9.7 UBC X
311.9.11 -311.9.12 UBC X
311.9.13 CA X
312 -312.5 UBC X | X
312.7 -312.7.6 CA X | X
312.8 CA X
Table 3-A CA X
Tables 3-A X | X
and 3-B UBC
Table 3-D-1 CA X
Table 3-G CA X
Table 3-H UBC X [ X
Table 3-1 CA X

*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.
1. This state agency adopts the entire chapter except for those sections indicated by the following symbol: 4.

The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

2-Xxvi.8 APRIL 3, 2007 ERRATA



CHAPTER 8—INTERIOR FINISHES

LOCAL LOCAL
FIRE HEALTH
ENFORCING AUTHORITY LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL OFFICIAL | OFFICIAL STATE AGENCY
HCD OSHPD
DSA DSA
ADOPTING AGENCY CEC | CA [ 1AC | 1 2 | AC SFM DHS DWR | AGR | BOC | BSC | SS 1 2 3 4 | DOSH* | SL
Adopt entire UBC L JNIR 2 x! X X | X |X|X
chapter without
amendments
Adopt entire UBC
chapter as amended
(amended sections listed
below)
Adopt only those X | X
sections that are
listed below
801 - 801.2 UBC X
801.3 UBC X | X
802 - 805 UBC X
806 UBC X | X
807 UBC X | X +
807.1 UBC X | X
807.1.1 - 807.1.2 UBC X
807.1.3 -807.2 UBC X | X
Table 8-A UBC X | X

*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.
1. This state agency adopts the entire chapter except for those sections indicated by the following symbol: 4.

The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

CHAPTER 9—FIRE-PROTECTION SYSTEMS

LOCAL LOCAL
FIRE HEALTH
ENFORCING AUTHORITY LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL OFFICIAL | OFFICIAL STATE AGENCY
HCD OSHPD
DSA DSA

ADOPTING AGENCY CEC | CA | 1AC | 1 2 | AC SFM DHS DWR | AGR | BOC | BSC | SS 1 2 3 4 DOSH* | SL
Adopt entire UBC X X
chapter without
amendments
Adopt entire UBC L IR 2 X X
chapter as amended
(amended sections listed
below)
Adopt only those X [ X
sections that are
listed below
901 CA X
903 CA X X
904.1.2 CA X
904.2.1 CA X
904.2.4.4 CA X
904.2.6.4 CA X
904.2.7 CA X
904.2.10 -904.2.10.1 CA X
904.2.11 -904.2.11.3 CA X
904.2.11.4 CA X
904.3.3 CA X
904.5.1 CA X
905.2.4 CA X
906.3 CA X | X

*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.
The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

APRIL 3, 2007 ERRATA 2-xvi.13



CHAPTER 10—MEANS OF EGRESS

LOCAL LOCAL
FIRE HEALTH
ENFORCING AUTHORITY LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL OFFICIAL OFFICIAL STATE AGENCY
HCD OSHPD
DSA DSA
ADOPTING AGENCY CEC | CA | 1AC 1 2 AC SFM DHS DWR | AGR | BOC | BSC | SS 1 2 3 4 | DOSH* | SL
Adopt entire UBC X
chapter without
amendments
Adopt entire UBC L NI 2 X
chapter as amended
(amended sections
listed below)
Adopt only those X X | X | X X | X
sections that are
listed below
1001.1 Note CA X
1001.2 CA X
1003.1 Note 1 CA X X
1003.1 Note 2 CA X
1003.1 Notes 3 & 4 CA X
1003.1.1 CA X | X
1003.1.1.1 CA X
1003.1.1.2 CA X
1003.2.2.2.2 CA X | X
1003.2.3 UBC X
1003.2.8.1 CA X X
1003.2.8.2 UBC X
1003.2.8.3 UBC X
1003.2.8.4 CA X
1003.2.8.5 CA X
1003.2.8.6 CA X X
1003.2.8.6.1 CA X X
1003.2.9.1 CA X
1003.2.9.2 CA X
1003.2.10 X X
w/Except. 1 CA
1003.2.10 X
w/Except. 2 CA
1003.3 UBC X
1003.3.1.1 CA X | X
1003.3.1.2 CA X
1003.3.1.2.1 CA X
1003.3.1.3 Note CA X
1003.3.1.6.1 Note CA X
1003.3.1.6.1.2 X
w/Excepts. 1,2 &
3 CA
1003.3.1.8 CA X | X X
1003.3.1.8 Note CA X
1003.3.1.9 CA X
1003.3.1.10 CA X
1003.3.1.10 Note = CA X
1003.3.3.6.1.1 Note CA X
1003.3.3.13.1 CA X X
1003.3.4.4 Note CA X
1003.3.4.6 Note CA X

*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.
The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

2-xvi.14 APRIL 3, 2007 ERRATA



CHAPTER 10—MEANS OF EGRESS—(Continued)

LOCAL LOCAL
ENFORCING AUTHORITY LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL OFFFII%EAL gfﬁéﬂ{l STATE AGENCY
HCD DSA DSA OSHPD
ADOPTING AGENCY CEC CA 1/AC 1 2 AC SFM DHS DWR | AGR | BOC BSC SS 1 2 3 DOSH* SL
1003.3.4.9 CA X
1004.2.2 CA X
1004.2.3.3 CA X
1004.2.5.2 CA X
1004.3.2.2 CA X
1004.3.2.3.2 CA X
1004.3.4.3 CA X
1004.3.4.5 X
Except. 4 CA
1005.1 UBC X X
1006.3.2.3 CA X
1006.3.4.1.1 CA X
1007.2.5 CA X
1007.2.6 CA X
1007.2.8 CA X
1007.2.9 CA X
1007.3.11 CA X
1007.3.12 CA X
1007.4.2 CA X
1007.4.3 CA X
1007.4.5 CA X
1007.4.7 CA X
1007.5.1 CA X
1007.5.3 CA X
1007.5.4 CA X
1007.5.10 CA X
1007.5.11 CA X
1007.5.12 CA X
1007.5.13 CA X
1007.6.1 CA X
1007.6.2.1 CA X
1007.6.2.1.1 CA X
1007.6.3 - X
1007.6.3.8 CA
1008.5.4.3 CA X
1008.5.5 CA X
1008.5.7 Note CA X
1010 CA X
Table 10-A CA X

*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.

The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

APRIL 3, 2007 ERRATA

2-xvi.15



VYV

CHAPTER 11A—HOUSING ACCESSIBILITY

ENFORCING AUTHORITY

LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL

OFFICIAL

LOCAL
HEALTH
OFFICIAL

STATE AGENCY

ADOPTING AGENCY

CEC

CA

HCD

1/AC

1

DSA
AC

SFM

DHS

DWR

AGR

BOC

BSC

OSHPD
DSA
SS 1 2 3

4 DOSH* SL

Adopt entire California
chapter

X

Adopt entire California
chapter as amended
(amended sections listed
below)

Adopt only those
sections that are
listed below

1102A w/o
except. CA

X

X

1104A w/o
except. CA

X

X

*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.
The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to DSA AS & HCI1/AC.

2-Xxvi.16

APRIL 3, 2007 ERRATA




Matrix tables continue on next page.

APRIL 3, 2007 ERRATA 2-xvi.17



CHAPTER 11B—ACCESSIBILITY TO PUBLIC BUILDINGS, PUBLIC ACCOMMODATIONS,
COMMERCIAL BUILDINGS AND PUBLICLY FUNDED HOUSING

LOCAL LOCAL
FIRE HEALTH
ENFORCING AUTHORITY LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL OFFICIAL | OFFICIAL STATE AGENCY
HCD OSHPD
DSA DSA
ADOPTING AGENCY CEC | CA | UAC | 1 2 | AC SFM DHS DWR | AGR | BOC | BSC | SS 1 2 3 4 | DOSH* | SL

Adopt entire California X
chapter
Adopt only those X
sections that are
listed below
1114B.2.2 - X
1114B.2.2.4.1 CA
1114B.2.2.5 - X
1114B.2.4 CA

*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.
The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

CHAPTER 11C—STANDARDS FOR CARD READERS AT GASOLINE FUEL DISPENSING FACILITIES

LOCAL LOCAL
FIRE HEALTH
ENFORCING AUTHORITY LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL OFFICIAL | OFFICIAL STATE AGENCY
HCD OSHPD
DSA DSA
ADOPTING AGENCY CEC | CA | UAC | 1 2 | AC SFM DHS DWR | AGR | BOC | BSC | SS 1 2 | 3 4 | DOSH* | SL
Adopt entire California X
chapter

*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.
The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

2-xvi.18 APRIL 3, 2007 ERRATA




CHAPTER 25A—GYPSUM BOARD AND PLASTER

LOCAL LOCAL

FIRE HEALTH
ENFORCING AUTHORITY LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL OFFICIAL | OFFICIAL STATE AGENCY
HCD OSHPD
DSA DSA
ADOPTING AGENCY CEC | CA | UAC | 1 2 | AC SFM DHS DWR | AGR | BOC | BSC | SS 1 2 | 3 4 | DOSH* | SL
Adopt entire California X | X X
chapter

*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.
The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

CHAPTER 26—PLASTIC
LOCAL LOCAL
FIRE HEALTH
ENFORCING AUTHORITY LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL OFFICIAL | OFFICIAL STATE AGENCY
HCD OSHPD
DSA DSA
ADOPTING AGENCY CEC | CA | UAC | 1 2 | AC SFM DHS DWR | AGR | BOC | BSC | sS 1 2 3 4 | DOSH* | sL
Adopt entire UBC xt | xt X X X[ X |xX|X
chapter without
amendments
Adopt entire UBC

chapter as amended
(amended sections listed
below)

Adopt only those
sections that are
listed below

2602 -2602.6 UBC + | +
*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.

1. This state agency adopts the entire chapter except for those sections indicated by the following symbol: 4.
The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

CHAPTER 27—ELECTRICAL SYSTEMS

LOCAL LOCAL
FIRE HEALTH
ENFORCING AUTHORITY LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL OFFICIAL | OFFICIAL STATE AGENCY
HCD OSHPD
DSA DSA
ADOPTING AGENCY CEC | CA | UAC | 1 2 | AC SFM DHS DWR | AGR | BOC | BSC | SS 1 2 3 4 | DOSH* | SL
Adopt entire UBC X X X[ X[ X |X
chapter without
amendments
Adopt entire UBC

chapter as amended
(amended sections listed
below)

Adopt only those
sections that are
listed below
*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.
The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

APRIL 3, 2007 ERRATA 2-Xvi.23



CHAPTER 28—MECHANICAL SYSTEMS

chapter as amended
(amended sections listed
below)

LOCAL LOCAL
FIRE HEALTH
ENFORCING AUTHORITY LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL OFFICIAL | OFFICIAL STATE AGENCY
HCD OSHPD
DSA DSA
ADOPTING AGENCY CEC | CA | UAC | 1 2 | AC SFM DHS DWR | AGR | BOC | BSC | SS 1 2 3 4 | DOSH* | SL
Adopt entire UBC X X XXX |X
chapter without
amendments
Adopt entire UBC

Adopt only those
sections that are
listed below

*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.
The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

CHAPTER 29—PLUMBING SYSTEMS

ENFORCING AUTHORITY

LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL

LOCAL
FIRE
OFFICIAL

LOCAL
HEALTH
OFFICIAL

STATE AGENCY

ADOPTING AGENCY

CEC

CA

HCD

1/AC

1

DSA
AC

SFM

DHS

DWR

AGR

BOC

BSC

DSA
SS

OSHPD

2

3

DOSH*

SL

Adopt entire UBC
chapter without
amendments

Adopt entire UBC
chapter as amended
(amended sections listed
below)

Adopt only those
sections that are
listed below

2901 UBC

2902.3 CA

2902.6 note CA

X

X

2904 UBC

X

X

X

X

*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.
The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

2-Xxvi.24

APRIL 3, 2007 ERRATA




CHAPTER 35—UNIFORM BUILDING CODE STANDARDS

LOCAL LOCAL
FIRE HEALTH
ENFORCING AUTHORITY LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL OFFICIAL OFFICIAL STATE AGENCY
HCD OSHPD
DSA DSA
ADOPTING AGENCY CEC | CA | VAC | 1 2 AC SFM DHS DWR | AGR | BOC | BSC | SS 2 3 DOSH* | SL

Adopt entire UBC X | X X
chapter without
amendments
Adopt entire UBC X X
chapter as amended
(amended sections
listed below)
Adopt only those X
sections that are
listed below
3504a CA X
3504.1 CA X
3504.1.1 CA X
3504.1.2 CA X
3504.1.3 CA X X
3504.2 CA X X
3504.2.1 CA X
3504.2.2 CA X
3505.1 CA X X
3505.2 CA X
3505.3 CA X
3505.4 CA X
3506 CA X
3506.1 CA X

*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.
The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

APPENDIX CHAPTER 3—USE OR OCCUPANCY

ENFORCING AUTHORI

ITY

LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL

LOCAL
FIRE
OFFICIAL

LOCAL
HEALTH
OFFICIAL

STATE AGENCY

ADOPTING AGENCY

CEC

HCD

CA 1/AC 1 2

DSA
AC

SFM

DHS

DWR

AGR

BOC

BSC

DSA
SS

OSHPD

2 3

DOSH*

SL

Adopt entire UBC
chapter without
amendments

Adopt entire UBC

listed below)

chapter as amended
(amended sections

Adopt only those
sections that are
listed below

Division II

UBC

X

*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.
The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

APRIL 3, 2007 ERRATA

2-Xvi.29



APPENDIX CHAPTER 3A—USE OR OCCUPANCY

LOCAL
LOCAL FIRE | HEALTH
ENFORCING AUTHORITY LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL OFFICIAL OFFICIAL STATE AGENCY
HCD OSHPD
DSA DSA
ADOPTING AGENCY CEC | CA 1 2 AC SFM DHS DWR | AGR | BOC | BSC | sS 1 2 3 4 DOSH* | SL
Adopt entire California X
chapter

*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.
The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

APPENDIX CHAPTER 4—SPECIAL USE AND OCCUPANCY

ENFORCING AUTHORITY

LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL

LOCAL
FIRE
OFFICIAL

LOCAL
HEALTH
OFFICIAL

STATE AGENCY

ADOPTING AGENCY

CEC

HCD
1/AC 1 2

CA

DSA

AC SFM

DHS

DWR

AGR

BOC

BSC

DSA

OSHPD

SS 1

2 3

4 DOSH* SL

Adopt entire UBC
chapter without
amendments

Adopt entire UBC
chapter as amended
(amended sections
listed below)

Adopt only those
sections that are
listed below

Division II UBC

X

The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

APPENDIX CHAPTER 9—BASEMENT PIPE INLETS

ENFORCING AUTHORITY

LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL

LOCAL
FIRE
OFFICIAL

LOCAL
HEALTH
OFFICIAL

STATE AGENCY

ADOPTING AGENCY

CEC

HCD
1/AC 1 2

CA

DSA

AC SFM

DHS

DWR

AGR

BOC

BSC

DSA

OSHPD

SS 1

2 3

4 DOSH* SL

Adopt entire UBC
chapter without
amendments

Adopt entire UBC
chapter as amended
(amended sections
listed below)

Adopt only those
sections that are
listed below

907 UBC

X

The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

2-xvi.30

APRIL 3, 2007 ERRATA




APPENDIX CHAPTER 33—EXCAVATION AND GRADING

LOCAL LOCAL
ENFORCING AUTHORITY LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL OFFFII%EAL gfﬁéﬂ{l STATE AGENCY
HCD OSHPD
ADOPTING AGENCY CEC | CA | 1AC | 1 2 3\5(? SFM DHS DWR | AGR | BOC | BSC l‘JsssA 1 2 3 4 DOSH | SL
Adopt entire UBC
chapter without
amendments
Adopt entire UBC X
chapter as amended
(amended sections
listed below)
Adopt only those X | X
sections that are
listed below
3304 CA X
3305A CA X X | X
3306 - 3308 UBC X | X
3306 CA X
3306.1 CA X
3306.2 CA X
3307 - 3309 CA X
3309.1 - 3309.9 CA X
3309.5-3309.6 UBC X | X
3310 CA X
3310.1 - 3310.3 CA X
3311 -3312 CA X
3312.1 CA X
3312.2 CA X
3312 - 3316 UBC X | X
3313 CA X
3313.1 -3313.5 CA X
3314 CA X
3314.1 -3314.4 CA X
3315 CA X
3315.1 -3315.5 CA X
3316 CA X
3316.1 CA X
3316.2 CA X
3317.1 -3317.8 UBC X | X
3317 CA X
3317.1 -3317.8 CA X
3318 UBC X | X
3318 CA X
3318.1 CA X
3318.2 CA X

*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.
The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

APRIL 3, 2007 ERRATA 2-Xxvi.33



MATRIX ADOPTION TABLES—VOLUME 2

CHAPTER 16—STRUCTURAL FORCES

LOCAL LOCAL
ENFORCING AUTHORITY LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL OFFFIE:::AL (?FEFI}(L:ITIPL STATE AGENCY
HCD OSHPD
ADOPTING AGENCY CEC | CA | 1AC | 1 2 e\s(? SFM DHS DWR | AGR | BOC | BSC l‘JsssA 1 2 3 4 | DOSH* | sL
Adopt entire UBC X
chapter without
amendments
II Adopt entire UBC X | X X X
chapter as amended
(amended sections
listed below)
Adopt only those X
sections that are
listed below
|| [1605222 CA X
1611.5 w/except. CA X
1611.7.2 CA X
1613.3.2.2 CA X | X X
1619 CA X
1629.4.2.2 CA X | X X
1629.6.1 CA X | X X
1629.6.7 CA X | X X
1629.7 CA X | X X
1629.8.3 CA X | X X
1630.2.3.3.1 CA X | X X
1630.2.3.3.2 CA X | X X
1630.2.3.4 CA X | X X
1630.3.1 CA X | X X
1630.3.2 CA X | X X
1630.4.2.2 CA X | X X
1630.8.2.1.2 CA X | X X
1630.8.2.2.1 CA X | X X
1630.8.2.2.2 CA X | X X
1632.1 CA X
1632.2 CA X
1633.2.1.1 CA X | X X
1633.2.6.2 CA X | X X
1634.2 CA X | X X
1636.3 CA X
Table 16-A CA X X
Table 16-B CA X
|| [Table 16-N1 CA X | X X
Table 16-O CA X

*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.
The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

CHAPTER 16A—STRUCTURAL FORCES

LOCAL LOCAL
FIRE HEALTH
ENFORCING AUTHORITY LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL OFFICIAL | OFFICIAL STATE AGENCY
HCD OSHPD
DSA DSA
ADOPTING AGENCY CEC | CA | 1AC | 1 2 | AC SFM DHS DWR | AGR | BOC | BSC | sS 1 2 3 4 | DOSH* | sL
Adopt entire X | X X
California chapter

*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.
The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

2-xvi.34 APRIL 3, 2007 ERRATA



CHAPTER 17—STRUCTURAL TESTS AND INSPECTIONS

LOCAL LOCAL
FIRE HEALTH
ENFORCING AUTHORITY LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL OFFICIAL | OFFICIAL STATE AGENCY
HCD OSHPD
DSA DSA
ADOPTING AGENCY CEC | CA | VAC | 1 2 | AC SFM DHS DWR | AGR | BOC | BSC | SS 1 2 3 4 | DOSH* | SL
Adopt entire UBC X
chapter without
amendments
Adopt entire UBC X
chapter as amended
(amended sections
listed below)
Adopt only those X | X X
sections that are
listed below
1701.2-1701.3 UBC X
1701.5, Item 1.1 CA X
1701.5, Item 16 CA X
1701.6-1701.7 UBC X
1703 UBC X
1704-1704.6.5 UBC X
1704.1.2.1 CA X

*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.
The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

CHAPTER 17A—STRUCTURAL TESTS AND INSPECTIONS

LOCAL LOCAL
FIRE HEALTH
ENFORCING AUTHORITY LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL OFFICIAL | OFFICIAL STATE AGENCY
HCD OSHPD
DSA DSA
ADOPTING AGENCY CEC | CA | 1AC | 1 2 | AC SFM DHS DWR | AGR | BOC | BSC | sS 1 2 3 4 | DOSH* | sL
Adopt entire X | X X
California chapter

*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.
The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

CHAPTER 18—FOUNDATIONS AND RETAINING WALLS

LOCAL LOCAL
FIRE HEALTH
ENFORCING AUTHORITY LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL OFFICIAL OFFICIAL STATE AGENCY

HCD OSHPD
DSA DSA
ADOPTING AGENCY CEC CA 1/AC 1 2 AC SFM DHS DWR | AGR | BOC | BSC SS 1 2 3 4 DOSH* SL

Adopt entire UBC
chapter without
amendments

Adopt entire UBC X | X X X
chapter as amended
(amended sections
listed below)

Adopt only those
sections that are
listed below

1802 CA X
1804.2 CA X
1804.8 CA X
1804.9 CA X
1809.5.1.2 CA X

*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.
The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

APRIL 3, 2007 ERRATA 2-Xxvi.35




CHAPTER 18A—FOUNDATIONS AND RETAINING WALLS

LOCAL LOCAL
FIRE HEALTH
ENFORCING AUTHORITY LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL OFFICIAL | OFFICIAL STATE AGENCY
HCD OSHPD
DSA DSA
ADOPTING AGENCY CEC | CA | 1AC | 1 2 | AC SFM DHS DWR | AGR | BOC | BSC | sS 1 2 3 4 | DOSH* | sL
Adopt entire X X X
California chapter

*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.
The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

CHAPTER 19—CONCRETE

ENFORCING AUTHORITY

LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL

LOCAL
FIRE
OFFICIAL

LOCAL
HEALTH
OFFICIAL

STATE AGENCY

ADOPTING AGENCY

CEC

HCD

CA 1/AC 1 2

AC

DSA

SFM

DHS

DWR

AGR

BOC

BSC

DSA
SS

OSHPD

2

3

4 DOSH* SL

Adopt entire UBC
chapter without
amendments

X | X

Adopt entire UBC
chapter as ammended
(amended sections
listed below)

Adopt only those
sections that are
listed below

1903.11.2 CA

1915.2.2.2 CA

1921.2.1.7 CA

X

1923.3.5 CA

X

1928 CA

X

*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.
The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

CHAPTER 19A—CONCRETE

LOCAL LOCAL
FIRE HEALTH
ENFORCING AUTHORITY LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL OFFICIAL | OFFICIAL STATE AGENCY
HCD OSHPD
DSA DSA
ADOPTING AGENCY CEC | CA | 1AC | 1 2 | AC SFM DHS DWR | AGR | BOC | BSC | sS 1 2 3 4 | DOSH* | sL
Adopt entire X | X X
California chapter

*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.
The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

CHAPTER 20—LIGHTWEIGHT METALS

chapter as amended
(amended sections
listed below)

LOCAL LOCAL
FIRE HEALTH
ENFORCING AUTHORITY LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL OFFICIAL | OFFICIAL STATE AGENCY
HCD OSHPD
DSA DSA
ADOPTING AGENCY CEC | CA | 1AC | 1 2 | AC SFM DHS DWR | AGR | BOC | BSC | sS 1 2 3 4 | DOSH* | sL

Adopt entire UBC X | X X
chapter without
amendments
Adopt entire UBC X X

Adopt only those
sections that are
listed below

*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.
The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

2-Xvi.36

APRIL 3, 2007 ERRATA




CHAPTER 20A—LIGHTWEIGHT METALS

LOCAL LOCAL
FIRE HEALTH
ENFORCING AUTHORITY LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL OFFICIAL | OFFICIAL STATE AGENCY
HCD OSHPD
DSA DSA
ADOPTING AGENCY CEC | CA | 1AC | 1 2 | AC SFM DHS DWR | AGR | BOC | BSC | sS 1 2 3 4 | DOSH* | sL
Adopt entire X X X
California chapter

*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.

The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

CHAPTER 21—MASONRY

ENFORCING AUTHORITY

LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL

LOCAL LOCAL
HEALTH

FIRE
OFFICIAL OFFICIAL

STATE AGENCY

ADOPTING AGENCY

CEC

HCD

CA 1/AC 1 2

DSA
AC

SFM DHS DWR

AGR

BOC

BSC

OSHPD
DSA
SS 1 2 3 4

DOSH* SL

Adopt entire UBC
chapter without
amendments

X | X

Adopt entire UBC
chapter as amended
(amended sections
listed below)

Adopt only those
sections that are
listed below

2108.2.6.2.6.2 CA

X

*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.

The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

CHAPTER 21A—MASONRY

LOCAL LOCAL
FIRE HEALTH
ENFORCING AUTHORITY LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL OFFICIAL | OFFICIAL STATE AGENCY
HCD OSHPD
DSA DSA
ADOPTING AGENCY CEC | CA | 1AC | 1 2 | AC SFM DHS DWR | AGR | BOC | BSC | sS 1 2 3 4 | DOSH* | sL
Adopt entire X | X X
California chapter

*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.

The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

CHAPTER 22—STEEL

ENFORCING AUTHORITY

LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL

LOCAL LOCAL
HEALTH

FIRE
OFFICIAL OFFICIAL

STATE AGENCY

ADOPTING AGENCY

CEC

HCD

CA 1/AC 1 2

DSA
AC

SFM DHS DWR

AGR

BOC

BSC

OSHPD
DSA
SS 1 2 3 4

DOSH* SL

Adopt entire UBC
chapter without
amendments

X | X X

Adopt entire UBC
chapter as amended
(amended sections
listed below)

Adopt only those
sections that are
listed below

2204.1.2 CA

2204.2.2 CA

Div. IV CA

XX
XX

XX

Div. V CA

X | X

X

*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.

The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

APRIL 3, 2007 ERRATA

2-xvi.37



V

V

CHAPTER 22A—STEEL

LOCAL LOCAL
FIRE HEALTH
ENFORCING AUTHORITY LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL OFFICIAL | OFFICIAL STATE AGENCY
HCD OSHPD
DSA DSA
ADOPTING AGENCY CEC | CA | 1AC | 1 2 | AC SFM DHS DWR | AGR | BOC | BSC | sS 1 2 3 4 | DOSH* | sL
Adopt entire X | X X
California chapter

*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.
The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

CHAPTER 22B—STEEL

LOCAL LOCAL
FIRE HEALTH
ENFORCING AUTHORITY LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL OFFICIAL | OFFICIAL STATE AGENCY
HCD OSHPD
DSA DSA
ADOPTING AGENCY CEC | CA | VAC | 1 2 | AC SFM DHS DWR | AGR | BOC | BSC | SS 1 2 3 4 | DOSH* | SL
Adopt entire CA X | X
chapter without
amendments
Adopt only those X
sections that are
listed below
Div. I -1V CA X
Div. V §2215B CA X
Div. VI - IX CA X
CHAPTER 23—WOOD
LOCAL LOCAL
FIRE HEALTH
ENFORCING AUTHORITY LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL OFFICIAL | OFFICIAL STATE AGENCY
HCD OSHPD
DSA DSA
ADOPTING AGENCY CEC | CA | VAC | 1 2 | AC SFM DHS DWR | AGR | BOC | BSC | SS 1 2 3 4 | DOSH* | SL

Adopt entire UBC
chapter without
amendments
Adopt entire UBC X | X X X
chapter as amended
(amended sections
listed below)
Adopt only those X
sections that are
listed below
2304.2 Except. CA X
2306.3 CA X
2306.5 CA X
2306.7 CA X
2306.14 CA X
2316.1.2 CA X | X X X
2316.2 Note CA X | X X X
2316.3 CA X | X X X
2321.1.1 CA X

*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.
The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

CHAPTER 23A—WOOD

California chapter

LOCAL LOCAL
FIRE HEALTH
ENFORCING AUTHORITY LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL OFFICIAL | OFFICIAL STATE AGENCY
HCD OSHPD
DSA DSA
ADOPTING AGENCY CEC | CA | 1AC | 1 2 | AC SFM DHS DWR | AGR | BOC | BSC | sS 1 2 3 4 | DOSH* | sL
Adopt entire X | X X

*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.
The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

2-Xxvi.38

APRIL 3, 2007 ERRATA




APPENDIX CHAPTER 16—STRUCTURAL FORCES

LOCAL LOCAL
FIRE HEALTH
ENFORCING AUTHORITY LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL OFFICIAL OFFICIAL STATE AGENCY

HCD OSHPD
DSA DSA
ADOPTING AGENCY CEC CA 1/AC 1 2 AC SFM DHS DWR | AGR | BOC | BSC SS 1 2 3 4 DOSH* SL

Adopt entire UBC
chapter without
amendments

Adopt entire UBC X X
chapter as amended
(amended sections
listed below)

Adopt only those
sections that are
listed below

1665.2.3.2 CA X X
1665.4.2 CA X X

*DOSH has not adopted the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. The 1995 edition of the California Building Code remains effective.
The ® designation indicates that the State Fire Marshal’s adoption of this chapter or individual sections is applicable to structures subject to HCD 1 and/or HCD 2.

APPENDIX CHAPTER 16A—DIV. VI, EARTHQUAKE REGULATIONS FOR SEISMIC-ISOLATED STRUCTURES

LOCAL LOCAL
FIRE HEALTH
ENFORCING AUTHORITY LOCAL BUILDING OFFICIAL OFFICIAL | OFFICIAL STATE AGENCY
HCD OSHPD
DSA DSA
ADOPTING AGENCY CEC | CA | 1AC | 1 2 | AC SFM DHS DWR | AGR | BOC | BSC | sS 1 2 3 4 | DOSH* | sL
Adopt entire X | X X
California chapter

APRIL 3, 2007 ERRATA 2-Xxvi.39




(This page intentionally left blank.)

2-Xxvi.40 APRIL 3, 2007 ERRATA



2001 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE

HISTORY NOTE APPENDIX

HISTORY NOTE APPENDIX

CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE
(Title 24, Part 2, California Code of Regulations)

For prior history, see the History Note Appendix to the Califor-
nia Building Code, 1998 Triennial Edition published in December
1998 and effective July 1, 1999.

1. (DSA/SS 2/01) Adoption of necessary structural safety
amendments to the 1998 California Building Code (CCR Title 24,
Part 2) for public schools, community colleges and state-owned or
state-leased essential service buildings. Approved by the Building
Standards Commission on September 25, 2001 and effective on
November 1, 2002.

2. (OSHPD 2/01) Adoption of the material and structural stan-
dards of the 1997 Uniform Building Code with necessary amend-
ments (CCR, Title 24, Part 2) for hospital buildings and
correctional treatment centers. Approved by the Building Stan-
dards Commission on September 25, 2001 and effective on No-
vember 1, 2002.

3. (HCD 1/01) Adoption of amendments to the California
Building Code (CCR, Title 24, Part 2) for hotels, motels, lodging
houses, apartment houses, dwellings, employee housing, factory-
built housing, and permanent building and accessory buildings in
mobile home parks and special occupancy parks. Approved by the
Building Standards Commission on November 28, 2001 and ef-
fective on November 1, 2002.

4. (SFM 1/01) Adoption of various amendments to the fire and
panic safety standards in the California Building Code (CCR,
Title 24, Part 2) for State Fire Marshal regulated occupancies. Ap-
proved by the Building Standards Commission on November 28,
2001 and effective on November 1, 2002.

5. Errata October 1, 2002:

Page 2-1: Delete the words “Note: This chapter has been re-
vised in its entirety” from the heading.

Page 2-18: In the last paragraph of Section 1632.1 revise “[For
OSHPD 1]” to “|For OSHPD 2]”.

Page 2-38.12: In Section 1627A, under APPROVED EXISTING
BUILDING, revise “[For OSHPD 1, 2 and 4] to “[For OSHPD
1 and 4]”.

Page 2-38.23: Revise language in Section 1632A.6.

Page 2-38.29: Revise Section 1637A title to “SITE DATA FOR
HOSPITALS AND STATE OWNED OR STATE-LEASED ES -
SENTIAL SERVICES BUILDINGS”.

Page 2-38.45: Revise description to read “This map delineates the
boundaries of the seismic hazard zones as given in Section
1629A.4.1 for hospitals and public schools in California”.

Page 2-38.52: Revise item 1. in Section 1644A.9.2.3.2 to read as
follows: “Chapter 19A, Section 1921A.4, for concrete, and Chap-
ter 22A, Section 2210A, 2211A, items 4 and 5, for steel in struc-
tures in .....”.

Page 2-38.57: Revise Section 1645A.7.1.3 Item 2. to read “Non-
structural components, as listed in the 1995 California Building
Code, Part 2, Title 24,...” Revise Item 3. to read “Equipment listed
in the 1995 California Building Code, Part 2, Title 24,...”

Page 2-38.66: In Table 16A-R-3, for Site Class E, in the right col-
umn replace the “0” with an “*”. For Site Class F, in the left col-
umn replace the “0” with an “*”. In Table 16AR-4, for Site Class
E, in the right column replace the “0” with an “*”.

APRIL 3, 2007 ERRATA

Page 2-39: Revise title of Section 1701.4 Item 3. to “Spray-ap-
plied fire-resistive materials.” Revise title of Section 1701.5
Item 1.1 to “/For OSHPD 2] Placing record.”

Page 2-41: Revise title of Section 1704.1.2.1 to “/For HCD 1]
Factory- built housing.”

Page 2-42.2: Revise title of Section 1704.6.4 Item 17. to "Glued-
laminated timber.” Revise Title of Item 18 to “Post installed an-
chors.”

Page 2-96.6: In Section 1809A.5.1, replace “... Type S3 or S4
soils, ... ” with “... Type Sp, Sg or Sg soils, ...”

Page 2-184.74: In the last line of Section 1923 A, replace “Section
1916A.4.2.“ with “Section [916A.7.1.”

Page 2-236.11: Revise the title of Section 2106A.1.12.4 Item 2. to
“Shear walls.” Revise the title of Section 2106A.2.3.3 to “Walls
and piers.” and the heading “Thickness of Walls.“ to “Thickness
of walls.”

5. (DSA/SS EF 01/03) Emergency adoption/approval of tech-
nical design and construction building standards for the adaptive
reuse of existing building public school use; CCR, Title 24, Part 2.
Approved by the California Building Standards Commission on
May 14, 2003 and filed with Secretary of State on May 15, 2003.
Effective May 15, 2003.

6. (DSA/SS EF 03/03) Emergency re-adoption/re-approval of
technical design and construction building standards for the adap-
tive reuse of existing building public school use; CCR, Title 24,
Part 2. Approved by the California Building Standards Commis-
sion on July 16, 2003 and filed with Secretary of State on May 15,
2003. Effective September 10, 2003.

7. (BSCEF 1/03) Amend Title 24, Part 2, Vol. 2, Chapters 2, 16,
17, 19, 22B and 23. Various sections. Filed with the Secretary of
State on July 18, 2003. July 18, 2003.

8. (DSA/SS 3/02) Adoption of various amendments to the Cal-
ifornia Building Code (CCR, Title 24, Part 2) for seismic design of
irregular structures. Approved by the Building Standards Com-
mission on May 14, 2003 and effective July 30, 2004.

9. (OSHPD 3/02) Adoption of various amendments to the Cali-
fornia Building Code (CCR, Title 24, Part 2) for seismic design of
irregular structures. Approved by the Building Standards Com-
mission on May 14, 2003 and effective July 30, 2004.

10. (DSA/SS EF 03/03) Emergency re-adoption/re-approval
of technical design and construction building standards for the
adaptive reuse of existing building public school use; CCR, Title
24, Part2, Vol. 2. Approved as permanent by the California Build-
ing Standards Commission on January 7, 2004 and filed with the
Secretary of State on January 8, 2004. Effective January 8§, 2004.

11. (BSC EF 1/03) Amend Title 24, Part 2, Vol. 2, Chapters 2,
16, 17, 19, 22, 22B and 23, various sections; filed as permanent
adoption with the Secretary of State on September 20, 2004; effec-
tive date September 20, 2004.

12. (OSHPD EF 01/05) Amend Title 24, Part 2, Vol. 2, Chapter
16A, Div. VI-R. Approved by the California Building Standards
Commission on December 13, 2005. Filed with the Secretary of
State on December 14, 2005 with an effective date of December
14, 2005.

13. (OSHPD EF 01/05) Amend Title 24, Part 2, Vol. 2, Chapter
16A, Div. VI-R. Re-adopted/approved by the California Building

2-497



HISTORY NOTE APPENDIX

Standards Commission on March 22, 2006. Filed with the Secre-
tary of State on March 30,2006 with an effective date of March 30,
2006.

14. (BSC01/04, HCD 03/04, and OSHPD 02/04) Amend Title
24, Part 2, Vol. 2, Chapters 16, 18, 19, 21,22, 22B, 23 and Appen-
dix Chapter 16 with editorial corrections, updated seismic provi-
sion for allowable stress design for steel buildings, and adoption
of the more recent edition of the national design standard for wood
design and construction. Approved by the California Building
Standards Commission on May 17, 2006. Filed with Secretary
of State on May 23, 2006 with an effective date 180 days after
publication on November 3, 2006.

15. (OSHPD 02/04 and DSA/SS 01/04) Amend Title 24, Part 2,
Vol. 2, Chapters 16, 16A, 18A, 19, 19A, 21A, 22, 22A, 23A and
Appendix Chapter 16A with editorial corrections, updated seis-
mic design procedures for nonstructural building components,
and adoption of the more recent edition of the national design stan-
dard for wood design and construction. Approved by the Califor-
nia Building Standards Commission on May 17, 2006. Filed with
the Secretary of State on May 23, 1006 with an effective date 180
days after publication on November 3, 2006.

16. (OSHPD EF 01/05) Amend Title 24, Part 2, Vol. 2, Chapter
16A, Div. VI-R. The language for the permanent rule will remain
effective and unchanged from the re-adoption/approval of Emer-
gency Finding (OSHPD EF 01/05) by the California Building
Standards Commission. Filed with the Secretary of State on
March 30, 2006 with an effective date of March 30, 2006, ap-
proved as permanent by the California Building Standards Com-
mission on July 27, 2006 and filed with the Secretary of State on
July 28, 2006.

17. Erratum to correct the publication date from October 12,
2006 to November 3, 2006, for the code changes described in
items 14 and 15 above.

18. Erratum to correct the Matrix Adoption Tables to correlate
with the code changes described in items 14 and 15 above.

2-498

2001 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE

APRIL 3, 2007 ERRATA



