REVISION RECORD FOR THE
STATE OF CALIFORNIA

SUPPLEMENT

November 13, 2006
2001 Title 24, Part 2, California Building Code

PLEASE NOTE: The date of this Supplement is for identification purposes only.
See the History Note Appendix for the adoption and effective dates of the provisions.

It is suggested that the section number as well as the page number be checked when inserting this material and removing the superseded
material. In case of doubt, rely on the section numbers rather than the page numbers because the section numbers must run consecutively.

It is further suggested that the superseded material be retained with this revision record sheet so that the prior wording of any section can
be easily ascertained. Please keep the removed pages with this revision page for future reference.

NOTE

Due to the fact that the application date for a building permit estab-
lishes the California Building Standards code provisions that are
effective at the local level, which apply to the plans, specifications, and
construction for that permit, it is strongly recommended that the
removed pages be retained for historical reference.

VOLUME 2
Remove Existing Pages Insert New Pages
2-497 and 2-498 2-497 and 2-498

Item No. 5510A052






2001 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE

HISTORY NOTE APPENDIX

HISTORY NOTE APPENDIX

CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE
(Title 24, Part 2, California Code of Regulations)

For prior history, see the History Note Appendix to the Califor-
nia Building Code, 1998 Triennial Edition published in December
1998 and effective July 1, 1999.

1. (DSA/SS 2/01) Adoption of necessary structural safety
amendments to the 1998 California Building Code (CCR Title 24,
Part 2) for public schools, community colleges and state-owned or
state-leased essential service buildings. Approved by the Building
Standards Commission on September 25, 2001 and effective on
November 1, 2002.

2. (OSHPD 2/01) Adoption of the material and structural stan-
dards of the 1997 Uniform Building Code with necessary amend-
ments (CCR, Title 24, Part 2) for hospital buildings and
correctional treatment centers. Approved by the Building Stan-
dards Commission on September 25, 2001 and effective on No-
vember 1, 2002.

3. (HCD 1/01) Adoption of amendments to the California
Building Code (CCR, Title 24, Part 2) for hotels, motels, lodging
houses, apartment houses, dwellings, employee housing, factory-
built housing, and permanent building and accessory buildings in
mobile home parks and special occupancy parks. Approved by the
Building Standards Commission on November 28, 2001 and ef-
fective on November 1, 2002.

4. (SFM 1/01) Adoption of various amendments to the fire and
panic safety standards in the California Building Code (CCR,
Title 24, Part 2) for State Fire Marshal regulated occupancies. Ap-
proved by the Building Standards Commission on November 28,
2001 and effective on November 1, 2002.

5. Errata October 1, 2002:

Page 2-1: Delete the words “Note: This chapter has been re-
vised in its entirety” from the heading.

Page 2-18: In the last paragraph of Section 1632.1 revise “[For
OSHPD 1]” to “|For OSHPD 2]”.

Page 2-38.12: In Section 1627A, under APPROVED EXISTING
BUILDING, revise “[For OSHPD 1, 2 and 4] to “[For OSHPD
1 and 4]”.

Page 2-38.23: Revise language in Section 1632A.6.

Page 2-38.29: Revise Section 1637A title to “SITE DATA FOR
HOSPITALS AND STATE OWNED OR STATE-LEASED ES -
SENTIAL SERVICES BUILDINGS”.

Page 2-38.45: Revise description to read “This map delineates the
boundaries of the seismic hazard zones as given in Section
1629A.4.1 for hospitals and public schools in California”.

Page 2-38.52: Revise item 1. in Section 1644A.9.2.3.2 to read as
follows: “Chapter 19A, Section 1921A.4, for concrete, and Chap-
ter 22A, Section 2210A, 2211A, items 4 and 5, for steel in struc-
tures in .....”.

Page 2-38.57: Revise Section 1645A.7.1.3 Item 2. to read “Non-
structural components, as listed in the 1995 California Building
Code, Part 2, Title 24,...” Revise Item 3. to read “Equipment listed
in the 1995 California Building Code, Part 2, Title 24,...”

Page 2-38.66: In Table 16A-R-3, for Site Class E, in the right col-
umn replace the “0” with an “*”. For Site Class F, in the left col-
umn replace the “0” with an “*”. In Table 16AR-4, for Site Class
E, in the right column replace the “0” with an “*”.

NOVEMBER 13, 2006 SUPPLEMENT

Page 2-39: Revise title of Section 1701.4 Item 3. to “Spray-ap-
plied fire-resistive materials.” Revise title of Section 1701.5
Item 1.1 to “/For OSHPD 2] Placing record.”

Page 2-41: Revise title of Section 1704.1.2.1 to “/For HCD 1]
Factory- built housing.”

Page 2-42.2: Revise title of Section 1704.6.4 Item 17. to "Glued-
laminated timber.” Revise Title of Item 18 to “Post installed an-
chors.”

Page 2-96.6: In Section 1809A.5.1, replace “... Type S3 or S4
soils, ... ” with “... Type Sp, Sg or Sg soils, ...”

Page 2-184.74: In the last line of Section 1923 A, replace “Section
1916A.4.2.“ with “Section [916A.7.1.”

Page 2-236.11: Revise the title of Section 2106A.1.12.4 Item 2. to
“Shear walls.” Revise the title of Section 2106A.2.3.3 to “Walls
and piers.” and the heading “Thickness of Walls.“ to “Thickness
of walls.”

5. (DSA/SS EF 01/03) Emergency adoption/approval of tech-
nical design and construction building standards for the adaptive
reuse of existing building public school use; CCR, Title 24, Part 2.
Approved by the California Building Standards Commission on
May 14, 2003 and filed with Secretary of State on May 15, 2003.
Effective May 15, 2003.

6. (DSA/SS EF 03/03) Emergency re-adoption/re-approval of
technical design and construction building standards for the adap-
tive reuse of existing building public school use; CCR, Title 24,
Part 2. Approved by the California Building Standards Commis-
sion on July 16, 2003 and filed with Secretary of State on May 15,
2003. Effective September 10, 2003.

7. (BSCEF 1/03) Amend Title 24, Part 2, Vol. 2, Chapters 2, 16,
17, 19, 22B and 23. Various sections. Filed with the Secretary of
State on July 18, 2003. July 18, 2003.

8. (DSA/SS 3/02) Adoption of various amendments to the Cal-
ifornia Building Code (CCR, Title 24, Part 2) for seismic design of
irregular structures. Approved by the Building Standards Com-
mission on May 14, 2003 and effective July 30, 2004.

9. (OSHPD 3/02) Adoption of various amendments to the Cali-
fornia Building Code (CCR, Title 24, Part 2) for seismic design of
irregular structures. Approved by the Building Standards Com-
mission on May 14, 2003 and effective July 30, 2004.

10. (DSA/SS EF 03/03) Emergency re-adoption/re-approval
of technical design and construction building standards for the
adaptive reuse of existing building public school use; CCR, Title
24, Part2, Vol. 2. Approved as permanent by the California Build-
ing Standards Commission on January 7, 2004 and filed with the
Secretary of State on January 8, 2004. Effective January 8§, 2004.

11. (BSC EF 1/03) Amend Title 24, Part 2, Vol. 2, Chapters 2,
16, 17, 19, 22, 22B and 23, various sections; filed as permanent
adoption with the Secretary of State on September 20, 2004; effec-
tive date September 20, 2004.

12. (OSHPD EF 01/05) Amend Title 24, Part 2, Vol. 2, Chapter
16A, Div. VI-R. Approved by the California Building Standards
Commission on December 13, 2005. Filed with the Secretary of
State on December 14, 2005 with an effective date of December
14, 2005.

13. (OSHPD EF 01/05) Amend Title 24, Part 2, Vol. 2, Chapter
16A, Div. VI-R. Re-adopted/approved by the California Building

2-497



HISTORY NOTE APPENDIX

Standards Commission on March 22, 2006. Filed with the Secre-
tary of State on March 30,2006 with an effective date of March 30,
2006.

14. (BSC01/04, HCD 03/04, and OSHPD 02/04) Amend Title
24, Part 2, Vol. 2, Chapters 16, 18, 19, 21,22, 22B, 23 and Appen-
dix Chapter 16 with editorial corrections, updated seismic provi-
sion for allowable stress design for steel buildings, and adoption
of the more recent edition of the national design standard for wood
design and construction. Approved by the California Building
Standards Commission on May 17, 2006. Filed with Secretary
of State on May 23, 2006 with an effective date 180 days after
publication.

15. (OSHPD 02/04 and DSA/SS 01/04) Amend Title 24, Part 2,
Vol. 2, Chapters 16, 16A, 18A, 19, 19A, 21A, 22, 22A, 23A and
Appendix Chapter 16A with editorial corrections, updated seis-
mic design procedures for nonstructural building components,
and adoption of the more recent edition of the national design stan-
dard for wood design and construction. Approved by the Califor-
nia Building Standards Commission on May 17, 2006. Filed with
the Secretary of State on May 23, 1006 with an effective date 180
days after publication.

16. (OSHPD EF 01/05) Amend Title 24, Part 2, Vol. 2, Chapter
16A, Div. VI-R. The language for the permanent rule will remain
effective and unchanged from the re-adoption/approval of Emer-
gency Finding (OSHPD EF 01/05) by the California Building
Standards Commission. Filed with the Secretary of State on
March 30, 2006 with an effective date of March 30, 2006, ap-
proved as permanent by the California Building Standards Com-
mission on July 27, 2006 and filed with the Secretary of State on
July 28, 2006.

2-498

2001 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE

NOVEMBER 13, 2006 SUPPLEMENT



