Color profile: Generic CMYK printer profile
Composite Default screen

REVISION RECORD
FOR THE STATE OF CALIFORNIA

EMERGENCY SUPPLEMENT

January 1, 2011

2010 Title 24, Part 2, Volume 2, California Building Code

PLEASE NOTE: The date of this supplement is for identification purposes only.
See the History Note Appendix for the adoption and effective dates of the provisions.

It is suggested that the section number, as well as the page number be checked when inserting this material and
removing the superseded material. In case of doubt, rely on the section numbers rather than the page numbers be-
cause the section numbers must run consecutively.

It is further suggested that the superseded material be retained with this revision record sheet so that the prior
wording of any section can be easily ascertained.

Please keep the removed pages with this revision page for future reference.

Note

Due to the fact that the application date for a building permit establishes
the California Building Standards Code provisions that are effective at
the local level, which apply to the plans, specifications, and construction
for that permit, it is strongly recommended that the removed pages be
retained for historical reference.

Part 2, Volume 2
Remove Existing Pages Insert Blue Pages
655 through 660 655 through 660.2
769 and 770 769 and 770

Item No. 552051201

1

M:\data\CODES\STATE CODES\California\2010\Part 2_Building\Final VP\EmergencySupp_Jan2011\0a_Instruct_ CA Bldg Supp2010.vp
Thursday, March 31, 2011 1:52:15 PM




Color profile: Generic CMYK printer profile
Composite Default screen

& &

2
33 M:\data\CODES\STATE CODES\California\2010\Part 2_Building\Final VP\EmergencySupp_Jan2011\0a_Instruct_ CA Bldg Supp2010.vp %E£}
Thursday, March 31, 2011 1:52:15 PM



&

Color profile: Generic CMYK printer profile

Composite

Default screen

REFERENCED STANDARDS
U.S. Department of Housing and Urban Development
HUD 451 7th Street, SW
‘Washington, DC 20410
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
HUD 24 CFR Part 3280 (1994) Manufactured Home Construction and Safety Standards. .......... ... .. ... . . . i . G201
International Code Council, Inc.
500 New Jersey Ave, NW
I C C 6th Fl.oor
Washington, DC 20001
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
1CC 300—07 ICC Standard on Bleachers, Folding and Telescopic Seating and Grandstands . ............. 1028.1.1, Table 1607.1, 3401.1
ICC 400—07 Standard on Design and Construction of Log Structures . . . ... ...ttt e 2301.2
ICC 500—08 ICC/NSSA Standard on the Design and Construction of Storm Shelters. .. .......... ... ... ... ... ... .. 423.1,423.2
ICC 600—08 Standard for Residential Construction in High Wind Regions. ........................... 1609.1.1, 1609.1.1.1, 2308.2.1
ICCES AC 331 Acceptance Criteria for Smoke and Heat Vents. . .. ...... ... .. it 910.3.1
ICCES AC77 Acceptance Criteria for Smoke Containment Systems Used with Fire-resistance-rated
Elevator Hoistway Doors and Frames . . ... ........ ... .ottt e e 707.14.1
ICC-ES AC 01—09* Acceptance Criteria for Expansion Anchors in Masonry Elements . . . ..............iiiiiiiiinneeenn.. 1615A.1.14
ICC-ES AC 43—09* Acceptance Criteria for Steel Deck Roof and FIoor SYstems. . . .. ... 2209A.3
ICC-ES AC 58—09* Acceptance Criteria for Adhesive Anchors in Masonry EIEmMents ... ............uuuuuuneunninenneenn. 1615A.1.14
ICC-ES AC 70—09* Acceptance Criteria for Fasteners Power-Driven into Concrete, Steel and Masonry Elements. . ... .............. 1911A.1.1
ICC-ES AC 106—09* Acceptance Criteria for Predrilled Fasteners (Screw Anchors) in Masonry ....................cccuuuooi.. 1615A.1.14
ICC-ES AC 125—09* Acceptance Criteria for Concrete, and Reinforced and Unreinforced Masonry Strengthening Using
Externally Bonded Fiber-Reinforced Polymer (FRP) Composite SyStems . . .............ccouiuiiiiianeeoon.. 1917A.3
ICC-ES AC 178—09* Acceptance Criteria for Inspection and Verification of Concrete, and Reinforced and Unreinforced Masonry
Strengthening Using Fiber-Reinforced Polymer (FRP) Composite Systems . .............c...couiiiianeoon.. 1917A.3
ICC-ES AC 193—09* Acceptance Criteria for Mechanical Anchors in Concrete Elements. . .. ...........couiuuunen.. 1615A.1.14, 1912A.1.1
ICC-ES AC 308—09 Acceptance Criteria for Post-Installed Adhesive Anchors in Concrete Elements .. ................. 1615A.1.14, 1912A.1.1
ICC-ES AC 358-09* Acceptance Criteria for Helical Foundation Systems and Devices. . . ..............c...couuiiieiinenno.. 1810A.3.1.5.1
SBCCI SSTD 11—97 Test Standard for Determining Wind Resistance of Concrete or Clay Roof Tiles ...................... 1716.2.1, 1716.2.2
* Refers to International Building Code, 2009 as a reference standard.
International Organization for Standardization
ISO Central Secretariat
IS () 1 ch, de la Voie-Creuse, Case Postale 56
CH-1211 Geneva 20, Switzerland
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
ISO 8115—86 Cotton Bales—Dimensions and Density . ............ ... e Table 415.8.2.1.1
National Association of Architectural Metal Manufacturers
N A AMM 800 Roosevelt Road, Bldg. C, Suite 312
Glen Ellyn, IL 60137
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
FP 1001—97 Guide Specifications for Design of Metal Flag Poles . . ... ... i i 1609.1.1
National Concrete Masonry Association
N CMA 13750 Sunrise Valley
Herndon, VA 22071-4662
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
TEK 5-84 (1996) Details for Concrete Masonry Fire Walls. . .. ... .o e e Table 720.1(2)
2010 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE JANUARY 1, 2011 SUPPLEMENT 655

17

M:\data\CODES\STATE CODES\California\2010\Part 2_Building\Final VP\Volume 2 of 2\35_CA_Bldg 2010.vp

Thursday,

March 31, 2011 1:57:44 PM



&

Color profile: Generic CMYK printer profile

Composite Default screen

1Y
w
REFERENCED STANDARDS
National Fire Protection Association
NFP A 1 Batterymarch Park
Quincy, MA 02169-7471
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
10—07 Portable Fire Extinguishers . ........... ... ... ... .. ... 906.2, 906.3.2, 906.3.4, Table 906.3(1), Table 906.3(2)
11—05 Low Expansion FOaAm . . ... ..o 904.7
12—05 Carbon Dioxide Extinguishing SyStems . . . ... ...ttt e e e 904.8,904.11
12A—04 Halon 1301 Halon 1301 Fire Extinguishing SYStems. . . . ... ...t e e et e e 904.9
13—10 Installation of Sprinkler Systems, as amended™. .. ........ ... ... ... ... ... ... 708.2,903.3.1.1, 903.3.2, 903.3.5.1.1,
903.3.5.2,904.11, 905.3.4, 907.6.3, 1613.6.3
*NFPA 13, Amended Sections as follows:
Revise Section 7.6.2.2 as follows:
7.6.2.2 Glycerine-water and propylene glycol-water mixtures shown in Table 7.6.2.2 shall be considered suitable for use. Anti-
freeze solutions exceeding 50 percent by volume of glycerine-water or 40 percent by volume of propylene glycol-water mix-
tures shall not be permitted within dwelling unit portions of the sprinkler system.
Revise Section 7.6.2.3 as follows:
7.6.2.3 If potable water is not connected to sprinklers, the commercially available materials indicated in Table 7.6.2.3 shall be
permitted for use in antifreeze solutions. Antifreeze solutions of diethylene glycol-water or ethylene glycol-water mixtures
shall not be permitted within dwelling unit portions of the sprinkler system.
Add new Section 7.6.2.5.1 as follows:
7.6.2.5.1 Antifreeze solutions shall be factory premix solutions within dwelling unit portions of the sprinkler system.
Revise Section 2.2 and add publications as follows:
2.2 NFPA Publications.
NFPA 25, Standard for the Inspection, Testing, and Maintenance of Water-Based Fire Protection Systems, 2006 California edition.
Revise Section 8.15.1.2.15 as follows:
8.15.1.2.15 Exterior columns under 10 ft* (0.93 m’) in total area, formed by studs or wood joist, with no sources of ignition within the
column, supporting exterior canopies that are fully protected with a sprinkler system, shall not require sprinkler protection.
Revise Section 8.15.7.1% as follows:
8.15.7.1%* Unless the requirements of 8.15.7.2 or 8.15.7.3 are met, sprinklers shall be installed under exterior roofs, canopies,
porte- cochere, balconies, decks, or similar projections exceeding 4 ft (1.2 m) in width.
Revise Section 8.15.7.2% as follows:
8.15.7.2* Sprinklers shall be permitted to be omitted where the canopies, roofs, balconies, decks, or similar projections are
constructed with materials that are noncombustible, limited-combustible, or fire retardant treated wood as defined in NFPA
703, Standard for Fire Retardant-Treated Wood and Fire-Retardant Coatings for Building Materials.
Delete Section A.8.15.7.2 of Annex
Revise Section 8.15.7.3
8.15.7.3 Sprinklers shall be permitted to be omitted from below the canopies, roofs, balconies, decks, or similar projections are
combustible construction, provided the exposed finish material on the roof, or canopy, is noncombustible, limited-combustible, or
fire retardant treated wood as defined in NFPA 703, Standard for Fire Retardant-Treated Wood and Fire-Retardant Coatings for
Building Materials, and the roofs, or canopies contain only sprinklered concealed spaces or any of the following unsprinklered
combustible concealed spaces:
(1) Combustible concealed spaces filled entirely with noncombustible insulation
(2) Light or ordinary hazard occupancies where noncombustible or limited-combustible ceilings are directly attached to
the bottom of solid wood joists so as to create enclosed joist spaces 160 ft' (4.5 m’) or less in volume, including space
below insulation that is laid directly on top or within the ceiling joists in an otherwise sprinklered attic
[See 11.2.3.1.4(4)(d)].
(3) Concealed spaces over isolated small roofs, or canopies not exceeding 55 ft (5.1 m’)
Delete language to section 8.15.7.4 and reserve section number.
8.15.7.4
Revise Annex Section A.8.15.7.5 as follows:
A.8.15.7.5 The presence of planters, newspaper machines and similar items should not be considered storage.
Add new Sections 8.16.1.1.1.4 and 8.16.1.1.1.5 as follows:
8.16.1.1.1.4 Where a system includes floor control valves, a hydraulic design information sign containing information for the
Sfloor shall be provided at each floor control valve. A hydraulic design information sign shall be provided for each area calcu-
656 JANUARY 1, 2011 SUPPLEMENT 2010 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE
dan
w

Thursday, March 31, 2011 1:57:44 PM

18
M:\data\CODES\STATE CODES\California\2010\Part 2_Building\Final VP\Volume 2 of 2\35_CA Bldg 2010.vp %



&

Color profile: Generic CMYK printer profile

Composite

Thursday,

Default screen

REFERENCED STANDARDS

lated. The installing contractor shall identify a hydraulically designed sprinkler system with a permanently marked weatherproof
metal or rigid plastic sign secured with corrosion resistant wire, chain or other approved means. Such signs shall be placed at the

alarm valve, dry pipe valve, preaction valve or deluge valve supplying the corresponding hydraulically designed area.

8.16.1.1.1.5 Control valves, check valves, drain valves and antifreeze valves shall be readily accessible for inspection, testing
and maintenance. Valves located more than 7 feet above the finished floor shall be provided with a means of opening and clos-
ing the valve from the floor level.

Revise Section 8.16.1.5.1 as follows:

8.16.1.5.1 Private fire service main systems shall have sectional control valves at appropriate points in order to permit
sectionalizing the system in the event of a break or for the making of repairs or extensions.

Add new Sections 8.16.1.5.1.1, 8.16.1.5.1.2 and 8.16.1.5.1.3 as follows:
8.16.1.5.1.1 Sectional control valves are not required when the fire service main system serves less than six fire appurtenances.
8.16.1.5.1.2 Sectional control valves shall be indicating valves in accordance with Section 6.7.1.3.

8.16.1.5.1.3 Sectional control valves shall be located so that no more than five fire appurtenances are affected by shut-down of
any single portion of the fire service main. Each fire hydrant, fire sprinkler system riser and standpipe riser shall be consid-

ered a separate fire appurtenance. In-rack sprinkler systems shall not be considered as a separate appurtenance.

8.16.1.5.1.4 The number of fire appurtenances between sectional control valves is allowed to be modified by the authority hav-
ing jurisdiction.

Revise Section 8.16.1.5.2 as follows:

8.16.1.5.2 A valve shall be provided on each bank where a main crosses a body of water or outside the building foundation(s)
where the main or section of main runs under a building.

Add new Section 9.1.3.9.1.1 as follows:

9.1.3.9.1.1 Powder-driven studs used for attaching hangers to the building structure are prohibited in Seismic Design Catego-
ries C, D, E and F.

Revise Section 9.3.5.8.3 as follows:

9.3.5.8.3 Where threaded pipe is used for sway bracing, it shall have a wall thickness of not less than Schedule 40.
Replace Section 9.3.5.9.4 as follows:

Lag screws or power-driven fasteners shall not be used to attach braces to the building structure.

Add language to the beginning of Section 9.3.5.9.6 as follows:

9.3.5.9.6 Fastening methods other than those identified in Section 9.3.5.9 shall not apply to other fastening methods, which
shall be acceptable for use if certified by a registered professional engineer to support the loads determined in accordance with
the criteria in 9.3.5.6. Calculations shall be submitted fo the authority having jurisdiction.

Revise Section 9.3.5.9.7.2% as follows:

9.3.5.9.7.2* Concrete anchors other than those shown in Figure 9.3.5.9.1 and identified in Section 9.3.5.8.10 shall be acceptable for
use where designed in accordance with the requirements of the building code and certified by a registered professional engineer.

Revise Section 9.3.6.1(3) as follows:

9.3.6.1%(3) No. 12, 440 Ib (200Kg) wire installed at least 45 degrees from the vertical plane and anchored on both sides of the pipe.
Powder-driven fasteners for attaching restraint is allowed to be used provided that the restraint component does not support the
dead load.

Revise Section 10.6.5 as follows:

10.6.5 Pipe joints shall not be located under foundation footings. The pipe under the building or building foundation shall not
contain mechanical joints.

Exceptions:

1. Where allowed in accordance with Section 10.6.2

2. Alternate designs may be utilized where designed by a registered professional engineer and approved by the enforcing agency.
Revise Section 11.2.3.1.4(4)(i) as follows:

11.2.3.1.4(4)(i) Exterior columns under 10 ft' (0.93 m’) in fotal area, formed by studs or wood joist, with no sources of ignition
within the column, supporting exterior canopies that are fully protected with a sprinkler system.

Revise Section 11.2.3.2.3.1 as follows:

11.2.3.2.3.1 Where listed quick-response sprinklers, excluding extended coverage quick-response sprinklers, are used through-
out a system or portion of a system having the same hydraulic design basis, the system area of operation shall be permitted to

be reduced without revising the density as indicated in Figure 11.2.3.2.3.1 when all of the following conditions are satisfied:

(1) Wet pipe system
(2) Light hazard occupancy

2010 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE JANUARY 1, 2011 SUPPLEMENT 657

March 31, 2011 1:57:44 PM

19
M:\data\CODES\STATE CODES\California\2010\Part 2_Building\Final VP\Volume 2 of 2\35_CA Bldg 2010.vp %



&

Color profile:

Composite

REFERENCED STANDARDS

Default screen

658

Generic CMYK printer profile

. NFPA—continued

g Y-axis

L 40 é.)\

c

k=2

3

< 30 \\k

o

< O]

S

© 20

=

el

e

210

<

[}

o .
X-axis

10 20 30
Ceiling height (ft)

(3) 20 ft (6.1 m) maximum ceiling height
(4) There are no unprotected ceiling pockets as allowed by 8.6.7 and 8.8.7 exceeding 32 ft' (3 m’)

Note: y :_—3x+ 55

2
For ceiling height > 10 ft and <20 ft, y = i2x+ 55
For ceiling height < 10 ft, y = 40
For ceiling height > 20 ft,y =0
For SI units, 1 ft =0.31 m.
FIGURE 11.2.3.2.3.1 Design Area Reduction for Quick-Response Sprinklers.
Revise Section 11.2.3.2.3.2 as follows:
11.2.3.2.3.2 The number of sprinklers in the design area shall never be less than seven.
Add Section 24.1(5)
24.1 Approval of Sprinkler Systems and Private Fire Service Mains.
The installing contractor shall do the following:

(1) Notify the authority having jurisdiction and the property owner or property owner’s authorized representative of the
time and date testing will be performed.

(2) Perform all required testing (see Section 24.2)
(3) Complete and sign the appropriate contractor’s material and test certificate(s) (see Figure 24.1)
(4) Remove all caps and straps prior to placing the sprinkler system in service

(5) Upon system acceptance by the authority having jurisdiction a label prescribed by Title 19 California Code of Regula-
tions, Chapter 5 shall be affixed to each system riser.

Revise Section 24.4(2) and add Section 24.4(3) as follows:
24.4 Instructions.

The installing contractor shall provide the property owner or the property owner’s authorized representative with the follow-
ing:

(1) All literature and instructions provided by the manufacturer describing proper operation and maintenance of any equip-
ment and devices installed

(2) NFPA 25, Standard for the Inspection, testing, and maintenance of Water-Based Fire Protection Systems, 2006 Califor-
nia Edition

(3) Title 19, California Code of Regulations, Chapter 5, “Fire Extinguishing Systems.”
Add sentence at the end of Section 24.5.1 as follows:

24.5.1 “Pipe schedule systems shall be provided with a sign indicating that the system was designed and installed as a pipe
schedule system and the hazard classification(s) included in the design.”

Revise Section 24.5.2(3) and add Sections 24.5.2(7) to (14) as follows:
24.5.2 The sign shall include the following information:
(3) Required flow and pressure of the system at the base of the riser
(7) Required flow and pressure of the system at the water supply source.
(8) Required flow and pressure of the system at the discharge side of the fire pump where a fire pump is installed.
(9) Type or types and number of sprinklers or nozzles installed including the orifice size, temperature rating, orientation,

K-Factor, sprinkler identification number (SIN) for sprinkler heads when applicable, and response type.

JANUARY 1, 2011 SUPPLEMENT 2010 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE

20

M:\data\CODES\STATE CODES\California\2010\Part 2_Building\Final VP\Volume 2 of 2\35_CA_Bldg 2010.vp

Thursday,

March 31,

2011 1:57:44 PM



Color profile: Generic CMYK printer profile
Composite Default screen

&

1Y
w
REFERENCED STANDARDS
NFPA—continued
(10) The minimum discharge flow rate and pressure required from the hydraulically most demanding sprinkler.
(11) The required pressure settings for pressure reducing valves.
(12) For deluge sprinkler systems, the required flow and pressure at the hydraulically most demanding sprinkler or nozzle.
(13) The protection area per sprinkler based on the hydraulic calculations.
(14) The edition of NFPA 13 to which the system was designed and installed.
Revise Section 24.6.1 as follows:
24.6.1 California Edition NFPA 25, Standard for the Inspection, Testing, and Maintenance of Water-Based Fire Protection
Systems.
13D—10 Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems in One- and Two-Family Dwellings
and Manufactured Homes as amended™ . ... ...... ... ... ... . .. . . .. ... R313.1.1, R313.2.1, R313.3.1, R313.3.2,
R313.3.2.3.1, R313.3.2.4.2, R313.3.6
*NFPA 13D, Amended Sections as follows:
Revise Section 8.3.3.2.3 as follows:
8.3.3.2.3 Percent solution by volume of glycerine-water and propylene glycol-water mixtures shall be in accordance with
Table 8.3.3.2.3, Figure 8.3.3.2.3(a), and Figure 8.3.3.2.3(b). Antifreeze solutions exceeding 50 percent by volume of glycer-
ine-water or 40 percent by volume of propylene glycol-water mixtures shall not be permitted within dwelling unit portions of
the sprinkler system.
Revise Section 8.3.3.2.5 as follows:
8.3.3.2.5 Percent solution by volume of diethylene glycol-water and ethylene glycol-water shall be in accordance with Table
8.3.3.2.5. Antifreeze solutions of diethylene glycol-water or ethylene glycol-water mixtures shall not be permitted within
dwelling unit portions of the sprinkler system.
Add new Section 8.3.3.2.7 as follows:
8.3.3.2.7.1 Antifreeze solutions shall be factory premix solutions.
6.2* Water Supply Sources. When the requirements of Section 6.2.2 are met, the following water supply sources shall be
considered to be acceptable by this standard:
(1) A connection to a reliable waterworks system with or without an automatically operated pump
(2) An elevated tank
(3) A pressure tank designed to American Society of Mechanical Engineers (ASME) standards for a pressure wessel with a
reliable pressure source
(4) A stored water source with an automatically operated pump
(5) A well with a pump of sufficient capacity and pressure to meet the sprinkler system demand. The stored water require-
ment of 6.1.2 or 6.1.3 shall be permitted to be a combination of the water in the well (including the refill rate) plus the
water in the holding tank if such tank can supply the sprinkler system.
6.2.2 Where a well, pump, tank or combination thereof is the source of supply for a fire sprinkler system, the water supply
shall serve both domestic and fire sprinkler systems, and the following shall be met:
(1) A test connection shall be provided downstream of the pump that creates a flow of water equal to the smallest sprinkler
on the system. The connection shall return water to the tank.
(2) Any disconnecting means for the pump shall be approved.
(3) A method for refilling the tank shall be piped to the tank.
(4) A method of seeing the water level in the tank shall be provided without having to open the tank.
(5) The pump shall not be permitted to sit directly on the floor.
6.2.2.1 Where a fire sprinkler system is supplied by a stored water source with an automatically operated means of pressuriz-
ing the system other than an electric pump, the water supply may serve the sprinkler system only.
6.2.4 Where a water supply serves both domestic and fire sprinkler systems, 5 gpm (19 L/min) shall be added to the sprinkler
system demand at the point where the systems are connected, to determine the size of common piping and the size of the total
water supply requirements where no provision is made to prevent flow into the domestic water system upon operation of a
sprinkler.
8.6.4* Sprinklers shall not be required in detached garages, open attached porches, carports with no habitable space above,
and similar structures.
2010 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE JANUARY 1, 2011 SUPPLEMENT 659
dh
w

21
% M:\data\CODES\STATE CODES\California\2010\Part 2_Building\Final VP\Volume 2 of 2\35_CA_Bldg 2010.vp
Thursday, March 31, 2011 1:57:44 PM




Color profile: Generic CMYK printer pr
Composite Default screen

&

REFERENCED STANDARDS

13R—10

14—07

15—01
16—07
17—02
17A—02
20—07
22—03
24—10

660

$ M:\data\CODES\STATE CODES\California\
Thursday, March 31, 2011 1:57:44 PM

ofile

NFPA—continued

Installation of Sprinkler Systems in Residential Occupancies Up to and
Including Four Stories in Height as amended™ . . ........................... 903.3.1.2,903.3.5.1.1, 903.3.5.1.2, 903 .4

*NFPA 13R, Amended Sections as follows:
Add new Section 5.4.2.1 as follows:

5.4.2.1 Antifreeze solutions exceeding 50 percent by volume of glycerine-water or 40 percent by volume of propylene gly-
col-water mixtures shall not be permitted within dwelling unit portions of the sprinkler system.

Add new Section 5.4.2.2 as follows:

5.4.2.2 Antifreeze solutions of diethylene glycol-water or ethylene glycol-water mixtures shall not be permitted within dwell-
ing unit portions of the sprinkler system.

Revise Section 2.2 and add publications as follows:
2.2 NFPA Publications.

NFPA 25, Standard for the Inspection, Testing, and Maintenance of Water-Based Fire Protection Systems, 2006 California
edition.

Add Section 6.3.5 as follows:
6.3.5 Instructions.

The installing contractor shall provide the property owner or the property owner’s authorized representative with the following:

(1) All literature and instructions provided by the manufacturer describing proper operation and maintenance of any
equipment and devices installed

(2) NFPA 25, Standard for the Inspection, Testing, and Maintenance of Water-Based Fire Protection Systems 2006 Califor-
nia Edition and Title 19, California Code of Regulations, Chapter 5.

(3) Once the system is accepted by the authority having jurisdiction a label as prescribed by Title 19, California Code of
Regulations, Chapter 5, shall be affixed to each system riser.

Installation of Standpipe and Hose System, as amended*. .. ...................... 905.2,905.3.4,905.4.2, 905.6.2, 905.8
NFPA 14, Amended Sections as follows:
Replace Section 6.3.7.1

6.3.7.1 System water supply valves, isolation control valves, and other valves in fire mains shall be supervised in an approved
manner in the open position by one of the following methods:

(1) Where a building has a fire alarm system or a sprinkler monitoring system installed, the valve shall be supervised by:
(a) a central station, proprietary, or remote supervising station, or
(b) a local signaling service that initiates an audible signal at a constantly attended location.

(2) Where a building does not have a fire alarm system or a sprinkler monitoring system installed, the valve shall be
supervised by:
(a) Locking the valves in the open position, or

(b) Sealing of valves and a approved weekly recorded inspection where valves are located within fenced enclosures
under the control of the owner:

Water Spray Fixed Systems for Fire Protection

Installation of Foam-water Sprinkler and Foam-water Spray Systems . .. .......... ... ..., 904.7,904.11
Dry Chemical Extinguishing SyStems . . . . .. ...ttt e e 904.6,904.11
Wet Chemical Extinguishing SysStems. . .. ... ... ... e 904.5, 904.11
Installation of Stationary Pumps for Fire Protection. . ........ ... ... ... ... .. ... . . 913.1,913.2.1,913.5

Water Tanks for Private Fire Protection
Installation of Private Fire Service Mains and Their Appurtenances, as amended™ ... ....... .. ... .. .. uiiiiiinenann.

NFPA 24, Amended Sections as follows:

Amend Section 4.2.1

Section 4.2.1. Installation work shall be done by fully experienced and responsible contractors. Contractors shall be appro-
priately licensed in the State of California to install private fire service mains and their appurtenances.

JANUARY 1, 2011 SUPPLEMENT 2010 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE

22
2010\Part 2_Building\Final VP\Volume 2 of 2\35_CA Bldg 2010.vp



&

Color profile:

Composite

Generic CMYK printer profile

Default screen

REFERENCED STANDARDS

Revise Section 4.2.2 as follows:

4.2.2 Installation or modification of private fire service mains shall not begin until plans are approved and appropriate per-
mits secured from the authority having jurisdiction.

Add Section 4.2.2.1 as follows:

4.2.2.1 As approved by the authority having jurisdiction, emergency repair of existing system may start immediately, with
plans being submitted to the authority having jurisdiction within 96 hours from the start of the repair work.

Revise Section 5.9.1.2 as follows:
Section 5.9.1.2 Fire department connections shall be properly supported and protected from mechanical damage.
Revise Section 5.9.5.1 as follows:

5.9.5.1 Fire department connections shall be on the street side of buildings and as approved by the authority having jurisdic-
tion.

Revise Section 6..5.1 as follows:

6.5.1 Private fire service main systems shall have sectional control valves at appropriate points in order to permit
sectionalizing the system in the event of a break or for the making of repairs or extensions.

Add Sections 6.5.2.1 - 6.5.2.3
6.5.2.1 Sectional control valves are not required when the fire service main system serves less than six fire appurtenances.
6.5.2.2 Sectional control valves shall be indicating valves in accordance with Section 6.7.1.3.

6.5.2.3 Sectional control valves shall be located so that no more than five fire appurtenances are affected by shut-down of any
single portion of the fire service main. Each fire hydrant, fire sprinkler system riser, and standpipe riser shall be considered a
separate fire appurtenance. In-rack sprinkler systems shall not be considered as a separate appurtenance.

6.5.2.4 The number of fire appurtenances between sectional control valves is allowed to be modified by the authority having
Jurisdiction.

(Text continues on Page 661.)

2010 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE JANUARY 1, 2011 SUPPLEMENT 660.1

23

M:\data\CODES\STATE CODES\California\2010\Part 2_Building\Final VP\Volume 2 of 2\35_CA_Bldg 2010.vp

Thursday,

March 31,

2011 1:57:44 PM



Color profile: Generic CMYK printer profile
Composite Default screen

660.2 JANUARY 1, 2011 SUPPLEMENT 2010 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE

$ 24
M:\data\CODES\STATE CODES\California\2010\Part 2_Building\Final VP\Volume 2 of 2\35_CA Bldg 2010.vp %
Thursday, March 31, 2011 1:57:44 PM



&

Color profile: Generic CMYK printer profile
Composite Default screen

HISTORY NOTE APPENDIX

California Building Code
(Title 24, Part 2, California Code of Regulations)

1. For prior history, see the History Note Appendix to the California Building Code (CBC), 2010 Triennial Edition, effective
January 1, 2011.

2. (BSC02/09, DSA-AC 01/09, DSA-SS 02/09, HCD 01/09, OSHPD 05/09 & 07/09, SFM 03/09, DWR 01/09) Adoption by refer-
ence of the 2009 International Building Code (IBC) with necessary state amendments into the 2010 CBC and repeal of the 2006
edition of the IBC, effective on January 1, 2011.

3. Errata to correct editorial errors in preface and Chapters 1-4, 6-12, 14-19, 21-24, 26, 30, 31, 34 and 35.

4. (SFM EF 01/10) Amend Chapter 35, Referenced Standards Table for NFPA 13, 13D and 13R. Approved as an emergency by the
California Building Standards Commission on October 19, 2010, Filed with the Secretary of State on October 26, 2010.

2010 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE JANUARY 1, 2011 SUPPLEMENT 769

1

M:\data\CODES\STATE CODES\California\2010\Part 2_Building\Final VP\Volume 2 of 2\48 HistoryNote CA Bldg 2010.vp
Thursday, March 31, 2011 2:01:26 PM




Color profile: Generic CMYK printer profile
Composite Default screen

770 JANUARY 1, 2011 SUPPLEMENT 2010 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE

2
33 M:\data\CODES\STATE CODES\California\2010\Part 2_Building\Final VP\Volume 2 of 2\48 HistoryNote CA Bldg 2010.vp %E£}
Thursday, March 31, 2011 2:01:26 PM



INTERNATIONAL

CODE COUNCIL

People Helping People Build a Safer World™

Helpful Code Tools from ICC

150+ COLOR ILLUSTRATIONS!
REAL-WORLD APPLICATIONS!

BUILDING CODE BASICS: 2009 I-CODES®

From the publishing team behind the popular Significant Changes series, Building
Code Basics uses a straightforward, focused approach to introduce code requirements with non-code language. Technically
accurate and easy to understand, this is the perfect resource for builders, architects, plan reviewers, inspectors, permit

technicians, contractors, and students. Each book contains:

= 150+ full-color illustrations that help readers visualize correct code application.
= content that pulls together related information from various code sections into one convenient location.
= a glossary of code and construction terms to clarify key terminology as it applies to the code.

= numerous real-world applications.

A: BUILDING CODE BASICS: FIRE, BASED ON THE 2009 IFC®
Author and ICC code expert Scott Stookey discusses
requirements for controlling ignition sources and fire
hazards, fire department access, building uses and
processes, fire protection and life safety systems, special
processes and uses, hazardous materials, and much more.
(251 pages)

#4481509

B: BUILDING CODE BASICS: BUILDING, BASED ON THE
2009 IBC®
Author Steve Thomas focuses on the basics of the IBC
requirements for building classification, fire protection
features, means of egress systems, accessibility and
structural integrity. It also includes a review of legal aspects
including permitting, right of entry and inspector liability.
(191 pages)

#4081509

Scot Stookey

BUILDING
o)

BUILDING
CODE
BASICS:
BUILDING

BUILDING
CODE
BASICS:
RESIDENTIAL

Basod on the 2009 Ifernafionol Buiding Code”

C: BUILDING CODE BASICS: RESIDENTIAL, BASED ON THE
2009 IRC®
Author and ICC code expert Steve Van Note focuses on
IRC basics for structural design, fire and life safety, weather
protection, interior environment, energy conservation, and
plumbing, mechanical, fuel gas and electrical systems.
(262 pages)
#4181509

CODE AND COMMENTARY TOGETHER!

D: 2009 IRC: CODE AND COMMENTARY,

VOLUME 1 CHAPTERS 1-11

Includes the full text of IRC Chapters 1-11,

including tables and figures, followed by

corresponding commentary at the end of each

section in a single document.

= Read expert Commentary after each section.

= Learn to apply the codes effectively.

= Understand the intent of the 2009 IRC with
help from the code publisher. (840 pages)

SOFT COVER #31105091
PDF DOWNLOAD #871P09
CD-ROM (PDF) #3110CD09

E: 2009 IRC Q&A: BUILDING AND ENERGY
PROVISIONS

Read insightful answers to 731 of the most
frequently asked real-world questions on the
provisions of the 2009 International Residential
Code® Chapters 1-11. The IRC code section

is reprinted for easy reference, followed by
questions and answers pertaining to the
particular section.

Features:

= 300+ questions and answers on building planning.
= 80+ questions and answers discuss foundations.
= 270 detailed photos and illustrations. (250 pages)
SOFT COVER #4114509
PDF DOWNLOAD #8950P014

LT BUILDING AND
ENERGY PROVISIONS

ORDER YOUR CODE TOOLS TODAY! 1-800-786-4452 | www.iccsafe.org/store



INTERNATIONAL

CODE COUNCIL

People Helping People Build a Safer World™

GOING GREEN

Wi e INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE®

A

A: GOING GREEN WITH THE INTERNATIONAL

RESIDENTIAL CODE®

In the first book of its kind on the market, author Scott

Caufield, C.B.O., reviews the IRC, chapter-by-chapter, to

help the reader make green decisions about construction

methods and materials while staying code compliant and
avoiding costly mistakes. Features include:

- A Building Code Primer that offers insight into the
operation of a building department for anyone seeking
building permits.

- Facilitates more accurate, reduced-risk planning and
implementation.

- Uses tried-and-true real-life examples of green
construction techniques throughout. (304 pages)

SOFT COVER #9576S

CD INCLUDED!
B: 2009 IRC®° CHECKLIST": BUILDING AND ENERGY
PROVISIONS, CHAPTERS 1-11

This helpful CheckList takes you step-by-step through the
building and energy provisions of the 2009 IRC® to help
ensure code compliance. The material is organized by subject
to allow the designer or plans examiner to quickly identify
code requirements applicable to a project. It uses an easy-
to-follow checklist format and covers provisions related to
the planning, design and construction of typical residential
buildings including requirements for construction documents,
structural design criteria, fire and life safety, foundations,
framing, weather protection, chimneys and fireplaces, and
energy efficiency. The CheckList comes with a CD containing
the book in PDF and RTF format. The RTF files can be edited
to meet the specific needs of a project. (68 pages)
SOFT COVER W/CD

PDF DOWNLOAD

#4102S09
#8950P005

Residential Building
d

C: DECK CONSTRUCTION: BASED ON THE

2009 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE®

This helpful publication transforms the code sections of
the 2009 IRC® relevant to deck design and installation

into a format customized for all those involved in deck
construction. The book contains explanations as well as full-
color photos and illustrations related specifically to decks.
Deck contractors, designers, homebuilders, plan reviewers,
inspectors, and manufacturers will find this book helpful in
completing their work in accordance with the 2009 IRC".
(270 pages)

SOFT COVER #4140S09 | PDF DOWNLOAD #8950P020

D: A GUIDE TO THE 2009 IRC° WOOD WALL BRACING
PROVISIONS

Bracing can be one of the most common sources of confusion
and misapplication when designing, performing plan review,
or building and inspecting a structure. This new edition

from APA and ICC covers forces on a house, the history of
bracing, physical limits, bracing options, attachment details
for bracing units, pony and cripple walls, and whole house
considerations. It also includes 200 full-color tables, figures,
and photographs. (255 pages)

SOFT COVER #7102509 | PDF DOWNLOAD #8799P091

E: RESIDENTIAL BUILDING CODES ILLUSTRATED:
A GUIDE TO UNDERSTANDING THE 2009 IRC®

An easy-to-use illustrated guide to building codes for
residential structures based on the 2009 IRC.

= user-friendly visual format.

= 900 illustrations. (400 pages)

SOFT COVER #9195509

ORDER YOUR CODE TOOLS TODAY! 1-800-786-4452 | www.iccsafe.org/store



	0a_Instruct_CA_Bldg_Supp2010
	35_CA_Bldg_2010
	48_HistoryNote_CA_Bldg_2010



