
REVISION RECORD
FOR THE STATE OF CALIFORNIA

ERRATA

January 1, 2015

2013 Title 24, Part 2, Vol. 2, California Building Code

PLEASE NOTE: The date of this errata is for identification purposes only.
See the History Note Appendix.

It is suggested that the section number as well as the page number be checked when inserting this material and
removing the superseded material. In case of doubt, rely on the section numbers rather than the page numbers be-
cause the section numbers must run consecutively.

It is further suggested that the superseded material be retained with this revision record sheet so that the prior
wording of any section can be easily ascertained.

Please keep the removed pages with this revision page for future reference.

Part 2, Vol. 2

Remove Existing Pages Insert Buff Pages

631 through 644 631 through 644

Item No. 5520S1323

Note
Due to the fact that the application date for a building permit establishes
the California Building Standards Code provisions that are effective at
the local level, which apply to the plans, specifications, and construction
for that permit, it is strongly recommended that the removed pages be
retained for historical reference.





REFERENCED STANDARDS

2013 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE 631

FM Factory Mutual Global Research
Standards Laboratories Department
1301 Atwood Avenue, P.O. Box 7500
Johnston, RI 02919

Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number 

FM 1950—10 Approval Standard for Seismic Sway Braces for Automatic Sprinkler Systems  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 1705A.12.3
3260—00 Radiant Energy-Sensing Fire Detectors for Automatic Fire Alarm Signaling.
3011—99 Approval Standard for Central Station Service for Fire Alarm and Protective Equipment Supervision
FM 4430—12 Approved Standard for Smoke and Heat Vents . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 910.3.2
4430—80 Acceptance Criteria for Smoke and Heat Vents . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 910.3.1
4450 (1989) Approval Standard for Class 1 Insulated Steel Deck Roofs—

with Supplements through July 1992 . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .1508.1, 2603.3, 2603.4.1.5
4470 (1992) Approval Standard for Class 1 Roof Covers. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 1504.7
4474 (04) Evaluating the Simulated Wind Uplift Resistance of Roof Assemblies

Using Static Positive and/or Negative Differential Pressures  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 1504.3.1
4880 (2005) American National Standard for Evaluating Insulated Wall or Wall and Roof/

Ceiling Assemblies, Plastic Interior Finish Materials, Plastic Exterior Building Panels,
Wall/Ceiling Coating Systems, Interior and Exterior Finish Systems. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 2603.4, 2603.9

GA Gypsum Association
810 First Street N.E. #510
Washington, DC 20002-4268

Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number 

GA 216—07 Application and Finishing of Gypsum Panel Products. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Table 2508.1, 2509.2
GA 600—06 Fire-resistance Design Manual, 18th Edition. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Table 720.1(1), Table 720.1(2), Table 720.1(3)

HPVA Hardwood Plywood Veneer Association
1825 Michael Faraday Drive
Reston, VA 20190

Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number 

HP-1—2004 Standard for Hardwood and Decorative Plywood . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .2303.3, 2304.6.2

HUD U.S. Department of Housing and Urban Development
451 7th Street, SW 
Washington, DC 20410

Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number 

HUD 24 
CFR Part 3280 (1994) Manufactured Home Construction and Safety Standards. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . G201

ICC International Code Council, Inc.
500 New Jersey Ave, NW
6th Floor
Washington, DC 20001

Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number 

ICC 300—12 ICC Standard on Bleachers, Folding and Telescopic Seating and Grandstands . . . 1028.1.1, Table 1607.1, 3401.1
ICC 400—12 Standard on Design and Construction of Log Structures . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 2301.2
ICC 500—08 ICC/NSSA Standard on the Design and Construction of Storm Shelters . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 202, 423.1, 423.2
ICC 600—08 Standard for Residential Construction in High Wind Regions. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .1609.1.1, 1609.1.1.1, 2308.2.1
ICC-ES AC 01—12* Acceptance Criteria for Expansion Anchors in Masonry Elements  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 1616A.1.19
ICC-ES AC 58—12* Acceptance Criteria for Adhesive Anchors in Masonry Elements  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 1616A.1.19
ICC-ES AC 70—12* Acceptance Criteria for Fasteners Power-Driven into Concrete, Steel and Masonry Elements  . . . . . . . . 908A.1.1
ICC ES AC 77 Acceptance Criteria for Smoke Containment Systems Used with Fire-resistance-rated

Elevator Hoistway Doors and Frames . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 707.14.1

JANUARY 1, 2015 ERRATA
BUFF



REFERENCED STANDARDS

632 2013 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE

ICC—continued
ICC-ES AC 106—12* Acceptance Criteria for Predrilled Fasteners (Screw Anchors) in Masonry  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 1616A.1.19
ICC-ES AC 125—12* Acceptance Criteria for Concrete, and Reinforced and Unreinforced Masonry Strengthening 

Using Externally Bonded Fiber-Reinforced Polymer (FRP) Composite Systems  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 1914.3
ICC-ES AC 156—12 Acceptance Criteria for Seismic Certification by Shake-Table Testing of Nonstructural Components . 1705A.12.4
ICC-ES AC 178—12* Acceptance Criteria for Inspection and Verification of Concrete, and Reinforced and Unreinforced Masonry

Strengthening Using Fiber-Reinforced Polymer (FRP) Composite Systems  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 1914A.3
ICC-ES AC 193—12* Acceptance Criteria for Mechanical Anchors in Concrete Elements . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .1616A.1.19, 1909A.11
ICC-ES AC 308—12 Acceptance Criteria for Post-Installed Adhesive Anchors in Concrete Elements. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 1616A.1.19
ICC ES AC 331 Acceptance Criteria for Smoke and Heat Vents . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 910.3.1
ICC-ES AC 358—12 Acceptance Criteria for Helical Foundation Systems and Devices. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 1810A.3.1.5.1
SBCCI SSTD 11—97 Test Standard for Determining Wind Resistance of Concrete or Clay Roof Tiles . . . . . . . . . . . .1716.2.1, 1716.2.2

* Refers to International Building Code, 2012 as a reference standard.

ISO International Organization for Standardization
ISO Central Secretariat
1 ch, de la Voie-Creuse, Case Postale 56
CH-1211 Geneva 20, Switzerland

Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number 

ISO 8115—86 Cotton Bales–Dimensions and Density . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .Table 415.8.2.1.1
ISO 9001—08 Quality Management Systems - Requirements . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 1705A.12.4
ISO 17025—05 General Requirement for Competence of Testing and Calibration Laboratories. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 1705A.12.4

NAAMM National Association of Architectural Metal Manufacturers
800 Roosevelt Road, Bldg. C, Suite 312
Glen Ellyn, IL 60137

Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number 

FP 1001—07 Guide Specifications for Design of Metal Flag Poles . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .1609.1.1

NCMA National Concrete Masonry Association
13750 Sunrise Valley
Herndon, VA 22071-4662

Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number 

TEK 5-84 (1996) Details for Concrete Masonry Fire Walls . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Table 720.1(2)

NFPA National Fire Protection Association
1 Batterymarch Park
Quincy, MA 02169-7471

Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number 

11—10 Low-, Medium- and High-Expansion Foam  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 904.7
12—05 Carbon Dioxide Extinguishing Systems  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .904.8, 904.11
12A—04 Halon 1301 Halon 1301 Fire Extinguishing Systems . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 904.9
13—13 Installation of Sprinkler Systems, as amended*  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 708.2, 903.3.1.1, 903.3.2, 903.3.5.1.1,

903.3.5.2, 904.11, 905.3.4, 907.6.3, 1613.6.3, 1616.9.5, 1616.10.17

*NFPA 13, Amended Sections as follows:

Revise Section 2.2 and add publications as follows:
2.2 NFPA Publications.

NFPA 25, Standard for the Inspection, Testing, and Maintenance of Water-Based Fire Protection Systems, 2013
California edition.

JANUARY 1, 2015 ERRATA
BUFF



REFERENCED STANDARDS

2013 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE 633

NFPA—continued

Revise Section 8.15.1.2.15 as follows:

8.15.1.2.15 Exterior columns under 10 ft2 (0.93m2) in total area, formed by studs or wood joist, with no sources
of ignition within the column, supporting exterior canopies that are fully protected with a sprinkler system, shall
not require sprinkler protection.

Revise Section 8.15.5.7 as follows:

8.15.5.7 The sprinkler required at the top and bottom of the elevator hoistway by 8.15.5.6 shall not be required
where permitted by Chapter 30 of the California Building Code.

Revise Section 8.15.7.1* as follows:

8.15.7.1* Unless the requirements of 8.15.7.2 or 8.15.7.3 are met, sprinklers shall be installed under exterior
roofs, canopies, porte-cochere, balconies, decks, or similar projections exceeding 4 ft (1.2 m) in width.

Revise Section 8.15.7.2* as follows:

8.15.7.2* Sprinklers shall be permitted to be omitted where the canopies, roofs, balconies, decks, or similar
projections are constructed with materials that are noncombustible, limited-combustible, or fire retardant treated
wood as defined in NFPA 703, Standard for Fire Retardant–Treated Wood and Fire-Retardant Coatings for
Building Materials.

Delete Section A.8.15.7.2 of Annex

Revise Section 8.15.7.3

8.15.7.3 Sprinklers shall be permitted to be omitted from below the canopies, roofs, balconies, decks, or similar
projections are combustible construction, provided the exposed finish material on the roof, or canopy is
noncombustible, limited-combustible, or fire retardant treated wood as defined in NFPA 703, Standard for Fire
Retardant–Treated Wood and Fire-Retardant Coatings for Building Materials, and the roofs, or canopies
contains only sprinklered concealed spaces or any of the following unsprinklered combustible concealed spaces: 

(1) Combustible concealed spaces filled entirely with noncombustible insulation.

(2) Light or ordinary hazard occupancies where noncombustible or limited-combustible ceilings are directly
attached to the bottom of solid wood joists so as to create enclosed joist spaces 160 ft3 (4.5 m3) or less in
volume, including space below insulation that is laid directly on top or within the ceiling joists in an
otherwise sprinklered attic [See 11.2.3.1.4(4)(d)]. 

(3) Concealed spaces over isolated small roofs, or canopies not exceeding 55 ft2 (5.1 m2).

Delete language to section 8.15.7.4 and reserve section number.
8.15.7.4.

Revise Annex Section A.8.15.7.5 as follows:

A. 8.15.7.5 The presence of planters, newspaper machines and similar items, should not be considered storage.

Add Section 8.15.7.6 as follows:

8.15.7.6 Sprinklers may be omitted for following structures:

(1) Solar photovoltaic panel structures with no use underneath. Signs may be provided, as determined by the
enforcing agency prohibiting any use underneath including storage.

(2) Solar photovoltaic (PV) panels supported by framing that have sufficient uniformly distributed and
unobstructed openings throughout the top of the array (horizontal plane) to allow heat and gases to escape,
as determined by the enforcing agency.

Add new Sections 8.16.1.1.1.4 and 8.16.1.1.1.5 as follows:

8.16.1.1.1.4 Where a system includes floor control valves, a hydraulic design information sign containing
information for the floor shall be provided at each floor control valve. A hydraulic design information sign shall
be provided for each area calculated. The installing contractor shall identify a hydraulically designed sprinkler
system with a permanently marked weatherproof metal or rigid plastic sign secured with corrosion resistant
wire, chain, or other approved means. Such signs shall be placed at the alarm valve, dry pipe valve, preaction
valve, or deluge valve supplying the corresponding hydraulically designed area.

8.16.1.1.1.5 Control valves, check valves, drain valves, antifreeze valves shall be readily accessible for
inspection, testing, and maintenance. Valves located more than 7 feet above the finished floor shall be provided
with a means of opening and closing the valve from the floor level.

JANUARY 1, 2015 ERRATA
BUFF



REFERENCED STANDARDS

634 2013 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE

NFPA—continued

Add new Sections 8.16.1.7, 8.16.1.7.1, 8.16.1.7.1.1, 8.16.1.7.1.2, 8.16.1.7.1.2, 8.16.1.7.1.3 and 8.16.1.7.2, as follows:

8.16.1.7 Sectional Valves.

8.16.1.7.1 Private fire service main systems shall have sectional control valves at appropriate points in order to
permit sectionalizing the system in the event of a break or for the making of repairs or extensions.  

8.16.1.7.1.1 Sectional control valves are not required when the fire service main system serves less than six fire
appurtenances. 

8.16.1.7.1.2 Sectional control valves shall be indicating valves in accordance with Section 6.7.1.3.

8.16.1.7.1.3 Sectional control valves shall be located so that no more than five fire appurtenances are affected
by shut-down of any single portion of the fire service main. Each fire hydrant, fire sprinkler system riser, and
standpipe riser shall be considered a separate fire appurtenance. In-rack sprinkler systems shall not be
considered as a separate appurtenance. 

8.16.1.7.1.4 The number of fire appurtenances between sectional control valves is allowed to be modified by the
authority having jurisdiction.

8.16.1.7.2 A valve shall be provided on each bank where a main crosses a body of water or outside the building
foundation(s) where the main or section of main runs under a building.

Add new Section 9.1.3.9.1.1 as follows:

9.1.3.9.1.1 Powder-driven studs used for attaching hangers to the building structure are prohibited in Seismic
design Categories C, D, E and F 

Revise Section 9.3.5.11.4 as follows:

9.3.5.11.4 Where threaded pipe is used for sway bracing, it shall have a wall thickness of not less then Schedule 40.

Replace Section 9.3.5.12.4 as follows:

Lag screws or power-driven fasteners shall not be used to attach braces to the building structure. 

Add language to the beginning of Section 9.3.5.12.6 as follows:

9.3.5.12.6 Fastening methods other than those identified in 9.3.5.12 shall not apply to other fastening methods,
which shall be acceptable for use if certified by a registered professional engineer to support the loads determined in
accordance with the criteria in 9.3.5.9. Calculations shall be submitted to the authority having jurisdiction. 

Revise Section 9.3.5.12.7.2 as follows:

9.3.5.12.7.2 Concrete anchors other than those shown in Figure 9.3.5.12.1 and identified in 9.3.5.11.11 shall be
acceptable for use where designed in accordance with the requirements of the building code and certified by a
registered professional engineer. 

Revise Section 9.3.6.1(3) as follows:

9.3.6.1*(3) No. 12, 440 lb (200 Kg) wire installed at least 45 degrees from the vertical plane and anchored on
both sides of the pipe. Powder-driven fasteners for attaching restraint is allowed to be used provided that the
restraint component does not support the dead load.

Revise Section 10.6.4 as follows:

10.6.4 Pipe joints shall not be located under foundation footings. The pipe under the building or building
foundation shall not contain mechanical joints. 

    Exceptions:

1. Where allowed in accordance with 10.6.2.

2. Alternate designs may be utilized where designed by a registered professional engineer and approved by
the enforcing agency. 

Revise Section 11.2.3.1.4(4)(i) as follows:

11.2.3.1.4(4)(i) Exterior columns under 10 ft2 (0.93m2) in total area, formed by studs or wood joist, with no
sources of ignition within the column, supporting exterior canopies that are fully protected with a sprinkler
system.

JANUARY 1, 2015 ERRATA
BUFF



REFERENCED STANDARDS

2013 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE 635

NFPA—continued
Revise Section 11.2.3.2.3.1 as follows:

11.2.3.2.3.1 Where listed quick-response sprinklers, excluding extended coverage quick-response sprinklers, are
used throughout a system or portion of a system having the same hydraulic design basis, the system area of
operation shall be permitted to be reduced without revising the density as indicated in Figure 11.2.3.2.3.1 when
all of the following conditions are satisfied: 

(1) Wet pipe system. 
(2) Light hazard occupancy. 
(3) 20 ft (6.1 m) maximum ceiling height. 
(4) There are no unprotected ceiling pockets as allowed by 8.6.7 and 8.8.7 exceeding 32 ft2 (3 m2). 

Note: 

For ceiling height ≥ 10 ft and ≤ 20 ft, 

For ceiling height < 10 ft, y = 40

For ceiling height > 20 ft, y = 0

For SI units, 1 ft = 0.31 m.

FIGURE 11.2.3.2.3.1 Design Area Reduction for Quick-Response Sprinklers.

Revise Section 11.2.3.2.3.2 as follows:

11.2.3.2.3.2 The number of sprinklers in the design area shall never be less than seven.

Revise Section 12.1.1.2 as follows:

12.1.1.2 Early suppression fast-response (ESFR) sprinklers shall not be used in buildings with automatic heat or
smoke vents unless the vents use a standard-response operating mechanism with a minimum temperature rating
of 360ºF (182ºC) or 100ºF (56ºC) above the operating temperature of the sprinklers, whichever is higher.

Add Section 25.1(5)

25.1 Approval of Sprinkler Systems and Private Fire Service Mains.

The installing contractor shall do the following:

(1) Notify the authority having jurisdiction and the property owner or property owner’s authorized
representative of the time and date testing will be performed.

(2) Perform all required testing (see Section 24.2).

(3) Complete and sign the appropriate contractor’s material and test certificate(s) (see Figure 24.1).

(4) Remove all caps and straps prior to placing the sprinkler system in service. 

(5) Upon system acceptance by the authority having jurisdiction a label prescribed by Title 19 California
Code of Regulations, Chapter 5 shall be affixed to each system riser.

Revise Section 25.4(2) and Add Section 25.4(3) as follows:

25.4 Instructions.  

The installing contractor shall provide the property owner or the property owner’s authorized representative with
the following:

(1) All literature and instructions provided by the manufacturer describing proper operation and maintenance
of any equipment and devices installed.

y
3x–
2
--------- 55+=

y
3x–
2
--------- 55+=

JANUARY 1, 2015 ERRATA
BUFF



REFERENCED STANDARDS

636 2013 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE

NFPA—continued

(2) NFPA 25, Standard for the Inspection, Testing, and Maintenance of Water-Based Fire Protection
Systems, 2013 California Edition.

(3) Title 19, California Code of Regulations, Chapter 5, “Fire Extinguishing Systems.” 

Add sentence at the end of Section 25.5.1 as follows:

25.5.1 “Pipe schedule systems shall be provided with a sign indicating that the system was designed and
installed as a pipe schedule system and the hazard classification(s) included in the design.”

Revise Section 25.5.2(3) and Add Sections 25.5.2(7) to (14) as follows:

25.5.2 The sign shall include the following information:

(3) Required flow and pressure of the system at the base of the riser.

(7) Required flow and pressure of the system at the water supply source.

(8) Required flow and pressure of the system at the discharge side of the fire pump where a fire pump is
installed.

(9) Type or types and number of sprinklers or nozzles installed including the orifice size, temperature rating,
orientation, K-Factor, sprinkler identification number (SIN) for sprinkler heads when applicable, and
response type.

(10) The minimum discharge flow rate and pressure required from the hydraulically most demanding
sprinkler.

(11) The required pressure settings for pressure reducing valves.

(12) For deluge sprinkler systems, the required flow and pressure at the hydraulically most demanding
sprinkler or nozzle.

(13) The protection area per sprinkler based on the hydraulic calculations.

(14) The edition of NFPA 13 to which the system was designed and installed.

Revise Section 25.6.1 as follows:

25.6.1 California Edition NFPA 25, Standard for the Inspection, Testing, and Maintenance of Water-Based Fire
Protection Systems.

13D—13 Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems in One-and Two-Family Dwellings 
and Manufactured Homes as amended* . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 903.3.1.3, 903.3.5.1.1

*NFPA 13D, Amended Sections as follows:

Revise 6.2.2, 6.2.2.1, 6.2.4 to read as follows:

6.2.2 Where a well, pump, tank or combination thereof is the source of supply for a fire sprinkler system, the
water supply shall serve both domestic and fire sprinkler systems, and the following shall be met:

(1) A test connection shall be provided downstream of the pump that creates a flow of water equal to the
smallest sprinkler on the system. The connection shall return water to the tank.

(2) Any disconnecting means for the pump shall be approved.

(3) A method for refilling the tank shall be piped to the tank.

(4) A method of seeing the water level in the tank shall be provided without having to open the tank.

(5) The pump shall not be permitted to sit directly on the floor.

6.2.2.1 Where a fire sprinkler system is supplied by a stored water source with an automatically operated means
of pressurizing the system other than an electric pump, the water supply may serve the sprinkler system only.

6.2.4 Where a water supply serves both domestic and fire sprinkler systems, 5 gpm (19 L/min) shall be added to
the sprinkler system demand at the point where the systems are connected, to determine the size of common
piping and the size of the total water supply requirements where no provision is made to prevent flow into the
domestic water system upon operation of a sprinkler.

8.3.4* Sprinklers shall not be required in detached garages, open attached porches, carports with no habitable
space above, and similar structures.

JANUARY 1, 2015 ERRATA
BUFF



REFERENCED STANDARDS

2013 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE 637

NFPA—continued
Add Section 8.4 as follows:

8.4 Sprinklers shall be permitted to be omitted for following structures:

(1) Solar photovoltaic panel structures with no use underneath. Signs may be provided, as determined by the
enforcing agency prohibiting any use underneath including storage.

(2) Solar photovoltaic (PV) panels supported by framing that have sufficient uniformly distributed and
unobstructed openings throughout the top of the array (horizontal plane) to allow heat and gases to escape,
as determined by the enforcing agency. 

13R—13 Installation of Sprinkler Systems in Residential Occupancies 
up to and Including Four Stories in Height as amended  . . . . . . . . . . 903.3.1.2, 903.3.5.1.1, 903.3.5.1.2, 903.4

*NFPA 13R, Amended Sections as follows:

Revise Section 2.2 and add publications as follows:

2.2 NFPA Publications. 

NFPA 25, Standard for the Inspection, Testing, and Maintenance of Water-Based Fire Protection Systems, 2013
California edition.

Add new Section 6.6.9, as follows:

6.6.9 Sprinklers shall be permitted to be omitted for following structures:

(1) Solar photovoltaic panel structures with no use underneath. Signs may be provided, as determined by the
enforcing agency prohibiting any use underneath including storage.

(2) Solar photovoltaic (PV) panels supported by framing that have sufficient uniformly distributed and
unobstructed openings throughout the top of the array (horizontal plane) to allow heat and gases to escape,
as determined by the enforcing agency. 

Revise Section 11.4:

11.4 Instructions.

The installing contractor shall provide the property owner or the property owner's authorized representative
with the following:

(1) All literature and instructions provided by the manufacturer describing proper operation and
maintenance of any equipment and devices installed.

(2) NFPA 25, Standard for the Inspection, Testing, and Maintenance of Water-Based Fire Protection Systems
2013 California Edition and Title 19, California Code of Regulations, Chapter 5. 

(3) Once the system is accepted by the authority having jurisdiction a label as prescribed by Title 19,
California Code of Regulations, Chapter 5, shall be affixed to each system riser.

14—13 Installation of Standpipe and Hose System, as amended*  . . . . . . . . . . . . . 905.2, 905.3.4, 905.4.2, 905.6.2, 905.8

NFPA 14, Amended Sections as follows: Replace Section 6.3.7.1

6.3.7.1 System water supply valves, isolation control valves, and other valves in fire mains shall be supervised in an approved

manner in the open position by one of the following methods:

(1) Where a building has a fire alarm system or a sprinkler monitoring system installed, the valve shall be supervised by: 
(a) a central station, proprietary, or remote supervising station, or

(b) a local signaling service that initiates an audible signal at a constantly attended location.

(2) Where a building does not have a fire alarm system or a sprinkler monitoring system installed, the valve shall be 
supervised by:

(a) Locking the valves in the open position, or
(b) Sealing of valves and a approved weekly recorded inspection where valves are located within fenced enclosures 
under the control of the owner.

15—12 Water Spray Fixed Systems for Fire Protection
16—07 Installation of Foam-water Sprinkler and Foam-water Spray Systems . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 904.7, 904.11
17—13 Dry Chemical Extinguishing Systems  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 904.6, 904.11
17A—13 Wet Chemical Extinguishing Systems  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 904.5, 904.11
20—13 Installation of Stationary Pumps for Fire Protection . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 913.1, 913.2.1, 913.5
22—13 Water Tanks for Private Fire Protection
24—13 Installation of Private Fire Service Mains and Their Appurtenances, as amended* 

JANUARY 1, 2015 ERRATA
BUFF



REFERENCED STANDARDS

638 2013 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE

NFPA—continued
NFPA 24, Amended Sections as follows: Amend Section 4.2.1

Section 4.2.1. Installation work shall be done by fully experienced and responsible contractors. Contractors shall be 
appropriately licensed in the State of California to install private fire service mains and their appurtenances.

Revise Section 4.2.2 as follows:

4.2.2 Installation or modification of private fire service mains shall not begin until plans are approved and appropriate permits 
secured from the authority having jurisdiction.

Add Section 4.2.2.1 as follows:

4.2.2.1 As approved by the authority having jurisdiction, emergency repair of existing system may start immediately, with plans 
being submitted to the authority having jurisdiction within 96 hours from the start of the repair work.

Revise Section 5.9.1.2 as follows:

Section 5.9.1.2 Fire department connections shall be properly supported and protected from mechanical damage.

Revise Section 5.9.5.1 as follows:

5.9.5.1 Fire department connections shall be on the street side of buildings and as approved by the authority having jurisdiction.

Revise Section 6.5.1 as follows:

6.5.1 Private fire service main systems shall have sectional control valves at appropriate points in order to permit sectionalizing 
the system in the event of a break or for the making of repairs or extensions.

Add Sections 6.5.2.1 – 6.5.2.3

6.5.2.1 Sectional control valves are not required when the fire service main system serves less than six fire appurtenances.

6.5.2.2 Sectional control valves shall be indicating valves in accordance with Section 6.7.1.3.

6.5.2.3 Sectional control valves shall be located so that no more than five fire appurtenances are affected by shut-down of any 
single portion of the fire service main. Each fire hydrant, fire sprinkler system riser, and standpipe riser shall be considered a 
separate fire appurtenance. In-rack sprinkler systems shall not be considered as a separate appurtenance.

6.5.2.4 The number of fire appurtenances between sectional control valves is allowed to be modified by the authority having 
jurisdiction.

Revise Section 6.6.2 as follows:

6.6.2 A sectional valve shall be provided at the following locations: (1) On each bank where a main crosses a body of water

(2) Outside the building foundation(s) where a main or a section of a main runs under a building

Revise Section 10.6.5 as follows:

10.6.5 Pipe joints shall not be located under foundation footings. The pipe under the building or building foundation shall not 
contain mechanical joints.

Exceptions:
1. Where allowed in accordance with Section 10.6.2

2. Alternate designs may be utilized where designed by a registered professional engineer and approved by the 
enforcing agency.

Revise Section 10.9.1 as follows:

10.9.1 Backfill shall be well tamped in layers or puddle under and around pipes to prevent settlement or lateral movement. 
Backfill shall consist of clean fill sand or pea gravel to a minimum 6" below and to a minimum of 12" above the pipe and shall 
contain no ashes, cinders, refuse, organic matter, or other corrosive materials. Other backfill materials and methods are 
permitted where designed by a registered professional engineer and approved by the enforcing agency.

30—08 Flammable and Combustible Liquids Code  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 415.3
31—11 Installation of Oil-burning Equipment . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 2113.15
32—07 Dry Cleaning Plants  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 415.6.4
37—10 Installation and Use of Stationary Combustion Engines and Gas Turbines
40—07 Storage and Handling of Cellulose Nitrate Film  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 409.1
52—13 Compressed Natural Gas (CNG) Vehicular Gaseous Fuel Systems Code
54—12 National Fuel Gas Code
58—08 Liquefied Petroleum Gas Code  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 415.6.3
61—13 Prevention of Fires and Dust Explosions in Agricultural and Food Product Facilities. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 415.6.1
70—08 National Electrical Code  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 108.3, 415.8.2.8.2, 904.3.1, 907.6.1, 909.12.1,

909.16.3, 1205.4.1, 2701.1, 3401.3, H106.1, H106.2, K101, K111.1

JANUARY 1, 2015 ERRATA
BUFF



REFERENCED STANDARDS

2013 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE 639

NFPA—continued

72—13 National Fire Alarm and Signaling Code, as amended* . . . . . . 901.6, 903.4.1, 904.3.5, 907.2, 907.2.5, 907.2.11,
907.2.13.2, 907.3, 907.3.3, 907.3.4, 907.5.2.1.2,

907.5.2.2, 907.6, 907.6.1, 907.6.5, 907.7,
907.7.1, 907.7.2, 911.1.5, 3006.5, 3007.6

*NFPA 72, Amended Sections as follows:

10.3.1 Equipment constructed and installed in conformity with this code shall be listed for the purpose for which it is used. Fire 
alarm systems and components shall be California State Fire Marshal approved and listed in accordance with California Code 
of Regulations, Title 19, Division 1.

10.3.3 All devices and appliances that receive their power from the initiating device circuit or signaling line circuit of a control 
unit shall be California State Fire Marshal listed for use with the control unit.

10.7.1 Where approved by the authority having jurisdiction, ECS priority signals when evaluated by stakeholders through risk 
analysis in accordance with 24.3.1.1 shall be permitted to take precedence over all other signals.

14.4.6.1 Testing. Household fire alarm systems shall be tested in accordance with the manufacturer’s published instructions 
according to the methods of Table 14.4.3.2.

17.15 Fire Extinguisher Electronic Monitoring Device. A fire extinguisher electronic monitoring device shall indicate those 
conditions for a specific fire extinguisher required by California Code of Regulations, Title 19, Division 1, Chapter 1, Section 
574.2(c) and California Fire Code to a fire alarm control unit.

21.3.6 Smoke detectors shall not be installed in unsprinklered elevator hoistways unless they are installed to activate the eleva- 
tor hoistway smoke relief equipment or where required by Chapter 30 of the California Building Code.

12.3.7 (4) Where the vertically run conductors are contained in a 2-hour rated cable assembly, or enclosed (installed) in a

2-hour rated enclosure or a listed circuit integrity (C.I.) cable, which meets or exceeds a 2-hour fire resistive rating.

23.8.5.1.2 Where connected to a supervising station, fire alarm systems employing automatic fire detectors or waterflow 
detection devices shall include a manual fire alarm box to initiate a signal to the supervising station.

Exception: Fire alarm systems dedicated to elevator recall control, supervisory service and fire sprinkler monitoring as 
permitted in section 21.3 of NFPA 72.

23.8.5.4.1 Systems equipped with alarm verification features shall be permitted under the following conditions:

(1) The alarm verification feature is not initially enabled unless conditions or occupant activities that are expected to cause 
nuisance alarms are anticipated in the area that is protected by the smoke detectors. Enabling of the alarm verification 
feature shall be protected by password or limited access.

(2) A smoke detector that is continuously subjected to a smoke concentration above alarm threshold does not delay the 
system functions of Sections 10.7 through 10.16, 23.8.1.1, or 21.2.1 by more than 30 seconds.

(3) Actuation of an alarm-initiating device other than a smoke detector causes the system functions of Sections 10.7 
through 10.16, 23.8.1.1, or 21.2.1 without additional delay.

(4) The current status of the alarm verification feature is shown on the record of completion (see Figure 7.8.2(a), item 4.3).

(5) Operation of a patient room smoke detector in I-2 and R-2.1 Occupancies shall not include an alarm verification feature.

29.3.1 All devices, combinations of devices, and equipment to be installed in conformity with this chapter shall be approved 
and listed by the California State Fire Marshal the for the purposes for which they are intended.

29.5.2.1.1* Smoke and Heat Alarms. Unless exempted by applicable laws, codes, or standards, smoke or heat alarms used to 
provide a fire-warning function, and when two or more alarms are installed within a dwelling unit, suite of rooms, or similar 
area, shall be arranged so that the operation of any smoke or heat alarm causes all alarms within these locations to sound.

Exception to 29.5.2.1.1 not adopted by the SFM.

29.7.2.1 The alarm verification feature shall not be used for household fire warning equipment.

29.7.6.7.1 The alarm verification feature shall not be used for household fire warning equipment.

29.8.3.4 Specific Location Requirements. The installation of smoke alarms and smoke detectors shall comply with the fol- 
lowing requirements:

(1) Smoke alarms and smoke detectors shall not be located where ambient conditions, including humidity and temperature, 
are outside the limits specified by the manufacturer’s published instructions.

(2) Smoke alarms and smoke detectors shall not be located within unfinished attics or garages or in other spaces where 
temperatures can fall below 40ºF (4ºC) or exceed 100ºF (38ºC).

JANUARY 1, 2015 ERRATA
BUFF



REFERENCED STANDARDS

640 2013 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE

NFPA—continued
(3) Where the mounting surface could become considerably warmer or cooler than the room, such as a poorly insulated 
ceiling below an unfinished attic or an exterior wall, smoke alarms and smoke detectors shall be mounted on an inside wall.

(4) Smoke alarms or smoke detectors shall be installed a minimum of 20 feet horizontal distance from a permanently 
installed cooking appliance.

Exception: Ionization smoke alarms with an alarm-silencing switch or photoelectric smoke alarms shall be permitted 
to be installed 10 feet (3 m) or greater from a permanently installed cooking appliance.

Photoelectric smoke alarms shall be permitted to be installed greater than 6 feet (1.8 m) from a permanently installed 
cooking appliance where the kitchen or cooking area and adjacent spaces have no clear interior partitions and the 10 
ft distances would prohibit the placement of a smoke alarm or smoke detector required by other sections of the code.

Smoke alarms listed for use in close proximity to a permanently installed cooking appliance.

(5) Installation near bathrooms. Smoke alarms shall be installed not less than a 3 foot (0.91 m) horizontal distance from the 
door or opening of a bathroom that contains a bathtub or shower unless this would prevent placement of a smoke alarm 
required by other sections of the code.

(6) Smoke alarms and smoke detectors shall not be installed within a 36 in. (910 mm) horizontal path from the supply 
registers of a forced air heating or cooling system and shall be installed outside of the direct airflow from those registers.

(7) Smoke alarms and smoke detectors shall not be installed within a 36 in. (910 mm) horizontal path from the tip of the 
blade of a ceiling-suspended (paddle) fan.

(8) Where stairs lead to other occupied levels, a smoke alarm or smoke detector shall be located so that smoke rising in the 
stairway cannot be prevented from reaching the smoke alarm or smoke detector by an intervening door or obstruction.

(9) For stairways leading up from a basement, smoke alarms or smoke detectors shall be located on the basement ceiling 
near the entry to the stairs.

(10) For tray-shaped ceilings (coffered ceilings), smoke alarms and smoke detectors shall be installed on the highest 
portion of the ceiling or on the sloped portion of the ceiling within 12 in. (300 mm) vertically down from the highest point.

(11) Smoke alarms and detectors installed in rooms with joists or beams shall comply with the requirements of 17.7.3.2.4.

(12) Heat alarms and detectors installed in rooms with joists or beams shall comply with the requirements of 17.6.3.

80—13 Fire Doors and Other Opening Protectives  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 410.3.5, 508.2.5.2, 715.4, 715.4.5,
715.4.6, 715.4.7.1, 715.4.8.2, 715.5, 715.5.5, 1008.1.4.3

85—07 Boiler and Combustion System Hazards Code . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 415.6.1 
   (Note: NFPA 8503 has been incorporated into NFPA 85)

92—12 Standard for Smoke Control Systems . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 909.8
99—12 Health Care Facilities Code . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 407.10
101—12 Life Safety Code . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .807.4.3.2,1028.6.2
105—13 Standard for the Installation of Smoke Door Assemblies and Other Opening Protectives  . . . . . . . . . . . . 405.4.2, 

715.4.3.1, 909.20.4.1
110—13 Emergency and Standby Power Systems  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 2702.1
111—13 Stored Electrical Energy Emergency and Standby Power Systems  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 2702.1
120—10 Fire Prevention and Control in Coal Mines. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 415.6.1
170—09 Standard for Fire Safety and Emergency Symbols. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 907.1.2
211—13 Chimneys, Fireplaces, Vents and Solid Fuel-burning Appliances  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 2112.5
252—03 Standard Methods of Fire Tests of Door Assemblies  . . . . . . . . . . . . . 715.3, 715.4.1, 715.4.2, 715.4.3, 715.4.7.3.1
253—06 Test for Critical Radiant Flux of Floor Covering Systems Using 

a Radiant Heat Energy Source . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 402.12.1, 406.6.4, 804.2, 804.3
257—07 Standard for Fire Test for Window and Glass Block Assemblies . . . . . . 715.3, 715.4.3.2, 715.5, 715.5.1, 715.5.2,

 715.5.9.1
259—13 Test Method for Potential Heat of Building Materials  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 2603.4.1.10, 2603.5.3
265—07 Method of Fire Tests for Evaluating Room Fire Growth Contribution of

Textile Wall Coverings on Full Height Panels and Walls . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 803.1.3, 803.1.3.1
268—07 Standard Test Method for Determining Ignitibility of Exterior

Wall Assemblies Using a Radiant Heat Energy Source . . . 1406.2.1, 1406.2.1.1, 1406.2.1.2, 2603.5.7, D105.1
275—13 Standard Method of Fire Tests for the Evaluation of Thermal Barriers Used Over Foam Plastic Insulation . . . . . . . 
285—06 Standard Method of Test for the Evaluation of Flammability Characteristics of

Exterior Nonload-bearing Wall Assemblies Containing Combustible Components . . . . . . .1407.10.4, 2603.5.5
286—06 Standard Method of Fire Test for Evaluating Contribution of Wall and

Ceiling Interior Finish to Room Fire Growth . . . . . . . . . . . 402.16.4, 803.1.2, 803.1.2.1, 803.9, 2603.4, 2603.9
288—12 Standard Method of Fire Tests of Horizontal Fire Door Assemblies

Installed in Horizontal Fire-resistance-rated Assemblies  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 712.8
289—13 Standard Method of Fire Test for Individual Fuel Packages  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 
409—11 Aircraft Hangars . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 412.4.6, Table 412.4.6, 412.4.6.1, 412.6.5

JANUARY 1, 2015 ERRATA
BUFF



REFERENCED STANDARDS

2013 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE 641

NFPA—continued
418—06 Standard for Heliports . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 412.7.4
484—06 Combustible Metals. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 415.6.1
502—14 Standard for Road Tunnels, Bridges, and Other Limited Access Highways  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 429
654—13 Prevention of Fire & Dust Explosions from the Manufacturing,

Processing and Handling of Combustible Particulate Solids . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 415.6.1
655—07 Prevention of Sulfur Fires and Explosions . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 415.6.1
664—07 Prevention of Fires and Explosions in Wood Processing and Woodworking Facilities . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 415.6.1
701—04 Standard Methods of Fire Tests for Flame-propagation of Textiles and Films . . . . . . . .402.12.1, 410.3.6, 801.1.4,

806.1, 806.1.2, 806.2, 3102.3, 3102.3.1,
3102.6.1.1, 3105.4, D102.2.8, H106.1.1

704—07 Standard System for the Identification of the Hazards of Materials for Emergency Response  . . . . .414.7.2, 415.2
720—12 Standard for the Installation of Carbon Monoxide (CO) Detection and Warning Equipment . . . . . . . . . . . . . 420.6
1124—13 Manufacture, Transportation, Storage, and Retail Sales of Fireworks and Pyrotechnic Articles . . . . . . . . . 415.3.1
2001—12 Clean Agent Fire Extinguishing Systems, as amended*  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .Table 901.6.1, 904.10

*NFPA 2001, Amended Sections as follows:

4.3.5.1.1 Alarms signals from the fire extinguishing system shall not interfere with the building fire alarm signal.

4.3.5.2.1 The lens on visual appliances shall be “red” in color.

Exception: Other lens colors are permitted where approved by the enforcing agency.

PCI Precast Prestressed Concrete Institute
209 W. Jackson Boulevard, Suite 500
Chicago, IL 60606-6938

Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number 

MNL 124—89 Design for Fire Resistance of Precast Prestressed Concrete  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 721.2.3.1
MNL 128—01 Recommended Practice for Glass Fiber Reinforced Concrete Panels. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 1913.2.1
PCI 120—10 PCI Design Handbook 7th Edition . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .1905A.1

PTI Post-Tensioning Institute
8601 North Black Canyon Highway, Suite 103
Phoenix, AZ 85021

Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number 

PTI—2004 Recommendations for Prestressed Rock and Soil 
Anchors (4th Edition)  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .1811A.2, 1810A.3.10.4, J106.2.4, J106.2.5

PTI—2007 Standard Requirements for Analysis of Shallow Concrete Foundations 
on Expansive Soils, Third Edition. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 1808.6.2

PTI—2007 Standard Requirements for Design of Shallow Post-tensioned Concrete 
Foundation on Expansive Soils, Second Edition  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 1808.6.2

JANUARY 1, 2015 ERRATA
BUFF



REFERENCED STANDARDS

642 2013 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE

SFM State of California
Department of Forestry and Fire Protection
Office of the State Fire Marshal
P.O. Box 944246
Sacramento, CA 94246-2460

Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number 

12-3 Releasing Systems for Security Bars in Dwellings  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 1029.4
12-7-3 Fire-testing Furnaces  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . NA
12-7A-1 Exterior Wall Siding and Sheathing . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 703A.7, 707A.2
12-7A-2 Exterior Window . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 703A.7, 708A.2.1
12-7A-3 Under Eave . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 703A.7, 707A.8
12-7A-4 Decking . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 703A.7, 709A.3
SFM 12-7A-4A Decking Alternate Method A  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 703A.7, 709A.3
SFM 12-7A-5 Ignition Resistant Building Material . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 703A.7, 709A.3
12-8-100 Room Fire Tests for Wall and Ceiling Materials  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . NA
12-10-1 Power Operated Exit Doors. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . NA
12-10-2 Single Point Latching or Locking Devices . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . NA
12-10-3 Emergency Exit and Panic Hardware  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . NA

(The Office of the State Fire Marshal standards referred to above are found in the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 12.)

RMI Rack Manufacturers Institute
8720 Red Oak Boulevard, Suite 201
Charlotte, NC 28217

Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number 

ANSI/MH16.1—08 Specification for Design, Testing and Utilization of Industrial Steel Storage Racks. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 2208.1

SDI Steel Deck Institute
P. O. Box 25
Fox River Grove, IL 60021

Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number 

ANSI/NC1.0—06 Standard for Noncomposite Steel Floor Deck  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 2209.2.2, 2209.2.2.1
ANSI/RD1.0—06 Standard for Steel Roof Deck . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .2209.2.3
ANSI/SDI-C-2012 Standard for Composite Steel Floor Deck Slabs. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 2210A.1.1.3

SJI Steel Joist Institute
1173B London Links Drive
Forest, VA 24551

Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number 

CJ-1.0—06 Standard Specification for Composite Steel Joists, CJ-series . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .1604.3.3, 2203.2, 2206.1
JG-1.1—05 Standard Specification for Joist Girders . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .1604.3.3, 2203.2, 2206.1
K-1.1—05 Standard Specification for Open Web Steel Joists, K-series. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .1604.3.3, 2203.2, 2206.1
LH/DLH-1.1—05 Standard Specification for Longspan Steel Joists, LH-series

and Deep Longspan Steel Joists, DLH-series . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .1604.3.3, 2203.2, 2206.1

SPRI Single-Ply Roofing Institute
411 Waverly Oaks Road, Suite 331B 
Waltham, MA 02452

Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number 

SPRI/ANSI/ES-1—03 Wind Design Standard for Edge Systems Used with Low Slope Roofing Systems . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 1504.5
RP-4—02 Wind Design Guide for Ballasted Single-ply Roofing Systems . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 1504.4

JANUARY 1, 2015 ERRATA
BUFF



REFERENCED STANDARDS

2013 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE 643

This page left intentionally blank.

Text continues on page 645.

JANUARY 1, 2015 ERRATA
BUFF



REFERENCED STANDARDS

644 2013 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE

This page left intentionally blank.

Text continues on page 645.

JANUARY 1, 2015 ERRATA
BUFF



INCLUDES BONUS SOLUTIONS MANUAL!
A: STRUCTURAL LOADS: 2012 IBC AND ASCE/SEI 7-10
Presents requirements in a straightforward manner 
with emphasis placed on proper application in everyday 
practice. The structural load provisions are organized in 
comprehensive flowcharts that provide a road map to 
guide the reader through the requirements. A valuable 
training resource for those who need to understand how to 
determine structural loads including dead load, occupancy 
live load, roof live load and environmental loads such as 
rain, snow, ice, flood, wind and seismic loads. This edition 
includes a new chapter on load path, a new section on 
atmospheric ice loads, completely updated discussion of 
the new wind design procedures in ASCE/SEI 7-10, and 
problems at the end of each chapter. A complete Solutions 
Manual is included as an online bonus. (550 pages)

Soft Cover  #4034S12  |  PDF Download  #8950P261

100+ wOrkED-OUT ExAMPLES!
B: SEISMIC AND WIND FORCES: STRUCTURAL 
DESIGN EXAMPLES, 4TH EDITION
This new edition by Alan Williams, Ph.D., S.E., F.I.C.E., 
C. ENG., has been updated to the 2012 IBC, ASCE/SEI 
7-10, ACI 318-11, NDS-2012, AISC 341-10, AISC 358-10, 
AISC 360-10, and the 2011 MSJC Code. In each chapter, 
sections of the code are presented and explained in a 
logical and simple manner and followed by illustrative 
examples. More than 100 completely worked-out design 
examples clearly illustrate proper application of the code 
requirements. Problems are solved in a straight forward 
step-by-step fashion with extensive use of illustrations and 
load diagrams. (580 pages)

Soft Cover  #9185S4  |  PDF Download  #8804P

FrOM SFPE AND ICC!
C: ENGINEERING GUIDE: FIRE SAFETy FOR VERy TALL 
BUILDINGS
A new information tool from ICC and SFPE for designers, 
builders and all engineering professionals to better 
understand fire protection issues in very tall buildings. 
The focus is on fire and related events and the affect of 
these events on life safety and fire fighter safety. Topics 
covered include: risks, unique challenges, egress, smoke 
management, fire fighter needs, structural fire resistance, 
design, site infrastructure, commissioning, inspection, 
maintenance, and change of occupancy/use. (155 pages)

Soft cover  #9627S  |  PDF Download  #8950P300

NOW IN ONE VOLUME! 
2012 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE 
HANDBOOK  
A comprehensive, full-color guide to the 2012 IBC technical provisions
This visual guide makes it easy to understand and apply complex IBC provisions. ICC code 
experts Douglas W. Thornburg, AIA, and John R. Henry, P.E., skillfully interpret all technical 
provisions of the code: structural and nonstructural, as well as fire- and life-safety.

Features:
•  Provides the rationale behind the code provisions to clarify 

the intent and facilitate proper application and enforcement
• Includes more than 600 full-color illustrations 
• Helps you achieve full compliance with every aspect of the code 
(1,008 pages)
Hard Cover  #4000S12

�  Bonus features online
�  Expanded topics
�  600+ color illustrations

VIEW SAMPLE PAGES ONLINE

People Helping People Build a Safer World®

Turn to ICC for the Structural Tools 
you Need

A B C



NEw FrOM NCSEA AND ICC!
D: GUIDE TO THE DESIGN OF BUILDING SySTEMS FOR 
SERVICEABILITy: IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE 2012 
IBC AND ASCE/SEI 7-10
Provides practical information and design examples 
for design professionals to evaluate the serviceability 
performance of buildings in accordance with the 
requirements of the 2012 IBC and referenced standards. 
Author Kurt D. Swensson, Ph.D., P.E., LEED AP, provides 
detailed explanations and examples of proper application 
of code provisions and standards for a broad scope of 
materials, building systems, and building components, 
covering the vast majority of limit states encountered in the 
structural design of buildings. Each chapter contains basic 
information necessary for consideration of serviceability 
performance and several example problems associated with 
an example building type. (220 pages)

Soft Cover  #7071S12  |  PDF Download  #8950P293

E: STRUCTURAL DESIGN OF LOW-RISE BUILDINGS IN 
COLD-FORMED STEEL, REINFORCED MASONRy, AND 
STRUCTURAL TIMBER
Author J.R. Ubejd Mujagic provides a concise, practical 
guide that authoritatively covers the primary aspects of 
structural design of low-rise buildings in the most common 
materials: cold-formed steel, reinforced masonry, and 
structural timber. (448 pages)

Hard Cover  #9252S

F: REINFORCED CONCRETE STRUCTURES: ANALySIS 
AND DESIGN
Author David A. Fanella, Ph.D., S.E., P.E., covers the 
analysis, design, and detailing requirements in ACI 318-08 
and the 2009 IBC. Design procedures and flowcharts guide 
you through code requirements, and worked-out examples 
demonstrate the proper application of the design provisions. 
(652 pages)

Hard cover  #9359S

G: DESIGN OF LOW-RISE REINFORCED CONCRETE 
BUILDINGS: BASED ON THE 2009 IBC®, ASCE/SEI 
7-05, ACI 318-08
This publication by David A. Fanella, Ph.D., S.E., P.E., 
F.ASCE, will help engineers analyze, design and detail 
low-rise cast-in-place conventionally reinforced concrete 
buildings in accordance with the 2009 IBC®. Section 
numbers and equation numbers from the 2009 IBC, ACI 
318-08 and ASCE/SEI 7-05 that pertain to the specific 
requirements are provided throughout the text. The guide’s 
straightforward approach makes it an ideal reference for 
practicing engineers, engineers studying for licensing 
exams, structural plan check engineers and civil engineering 
students. (384 pages)

Soft Cover  #7034S09  |  PDF Download #8950P075

H: STEEL STRUCTURES DESIGN: ASD/LRFD
Author Alan Williams, Ph.D., S.E., C. Eng., introduces 
the theoretical and fundamental basics of steel design 
and covers the detailed design of members and their 
connections. The book provides clear interpretations of the 
2010 AISC Steel Design Manual; ASCE 7-05; and 2009 
IBC. Contains 250+ design examples with step-by-step 
solutions. (624 pages)

Hard Cover  #9363S

FrOM ICC AND NCSEA!
I: INSPECTION, TESTING, AND MONITORING OF 
BUILDINGS AND BRIDGES
Addressing both applications and emerging technologies 
related to the inspection, testing, and monitoring of 
civil engineering structures and structural systems, this 
book covers a variety of topics by recognized experts in 
their respective fields. Written by the National Council 
of Structural Engineers Associations (NCSEA), the 
book considers visual, destructive and nondestructive 
evaluation. The organization of the book proceeds from 
primarily visual inspection and evaluation of structures to 
more in-depth analysis procedures. Many materials are 
addressed, including reinforced concrete, structural steel, 
timber, masonry, and fiber-reinforced polymers. The book 
is intended as a reference for engineers routinely faced with 
complex evaluation requirements. (180 pages)

Soft Cover  #7845S  |  PDF Download  #8950P193

ORDER yOURS TODAy!
1-800-786-4452
www.iccsafe.org/books

D E F G H I

13-08300


	0a_Instruct_CA_BldgVol2_Errat..
	35a_CA_Bldg_2013_pg631-644
	Ads_Cailf_Supp_Pt2-Vol2_Jan15


<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles false
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Gray Gamma 2.2)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Perceptual
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize true
  /OPM 0
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments false
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Remove
  /UCRandBGInfo /Remove
  /UsePrologue false
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
    /ACaslon-Italic
    /ACaslonPro-Bold
    /ACaslonPro-BoldItalic
    /ACaslonPro-Italic
    /ACaslonPro-Regular
    /ACaslonPro-Semibold
    /ACaslonPro-SemiboldItalic
    /ACaslon-Regular
    /ACaslon-Semibold
    /ACaslon-SemiboldItalic
    /AdobeArabic-Bold
    /AdobeArabic-BoldItalic
    /AdobeArabic-Italic
    /AdobeArabic-Regular
    /AdobeHebrew-Bold
    /AdobeHebrew-BoldItalic
    /AdobeHebrew-Italic
    /AdobeHebrew-Regular
    /AdobeMingStd-Light
    /AdobeMyungjoStd-Medium
    /AdobePiStd
    /AdobeSansMM
    /AdobeSerifMM
    /AdobeSongStd-Light
    /AdobeThai-Bold
    /AdobeThai-BoldItalic
    /AdobeThai-Italic
    /AdobeThai-Regular
    /AGaramond-Bold
    /AGaramond-BoldItalic
    /AGaramond-Italic
    /AGaramondPro-Bold
    /AGaramondPro-BoldItalic
    /AGaramondPro-Italic
    /AGaramondPro-Regular
    /AGaramondPro-Semibold
    /AGaramondPro-SemiboldItalic
    /AGaramond-Regular
    /AGOldFace-Bold
    /AGOldFace-BoldOutline
    /AGOldFace-Medium
    /AGOldFace-Outline
    /AGOldFace-Regular
    /AGOldFace-Shaded
    /AJensonPro-Bold
    /AJensonPro-BoldIt
    /AJensonPro-It
    /AJensonPro-Lt
    /AJensonPro-LtIt
    /AJensonPro-Regular
    /AJensonPro-Semibold
    /AJensonPro-SemiboldIt
    /Americana
    /Americana-ExtraBold
    /Anna
    /ArchitecturePlain
    /Arial-Black
    /Arial-BlackItalic
    /Arial-BoldItalicMT
    /Arial-BoldMT
    /Arial-ItalicMT
    /ArialMT
    /ArialNarrow
    /ArialNarrow-Bold
    /ArialNarrow-BoldItalic
    /ArialNarrow-Italic
    /ArialUnicodeMS
    /AvantGarde-Book
    /AvantGarde-BookOblique
    /AvantGarde-Demi
    /AvantGarde-DemiOblique
    /AvantGardeITCbyBT-Book
    /Barmeno-Bold
    /Barmeno-ExtraBold
    /Barmeno-Medium
    /Barmeno-Regular
    /BaskervilleBE-Italic
    /BaskervilleBE-Medium
    /BaskervilleBE-MediumItalic
    /BaskervilleBE-Regular
    /BauhausITCbyBT-Medium
    /Bellevue
    /BelweBT-Light
    /BelweBT-Medium
    /BelweBT-RomanCondensed
    /BenguiatITCbyBT-Bold
    /BenguiatITCbyBT-BoldItalic
    /BenguiatITCbyBT-Book
    /BenguiatITCbyBT-BookItalic
    /BernhardModernStd-Bold
    /BernhardModernStd-BoldIt
    /BernhardModernStd-Italic
    /BernhardModernStd-Roman
    /BertramPlain
    /BickhamScriptPro-Bold
    /BickhamScriptPro-Regular
    /BickhamScriptPro-Semibold
    /BiffoMT
    /Birch
    /BirchStd
    /Blackoak
    /Bodoni-Antiqua-Regular-DTC
    /Bodoni-PosterCompressed
    /BookAntiqua
    /BookAntiqua-Bold
    /BookAntiqua-BoldItalic
    /BookAntiqua-Italic
    /Bookman-Demi
    /Bookman-DemiItalic
    /Bookman-Light
    /Bookman-LightItalic
    /BookmanOldStyle
    /BookmanOldStyle-Bold
    /BookmanOldStyle-BoldItalic
    /BookmanOldStyle-Italic
    /BookshelfSymbolSeven
    /Boton-Italic
    /Boton-Medium
    /Boton-MediumItalic
    /Boton-Regular
    /Boulevard
    /BrushScript
    /BrushScriptStd
    /CaflischScript-Bold
    /CaflischScriptPro-Regular
    /CaflischScript-Regular
    /Carta
    /CastellarMT
    /CenturyGothic
    /CenturyGothic-Bold
    /CenturyGothic-BoldItalic
    /CenturyGothic-Italic
    /CenturyOldStyleStd-Bold
    /CenturyOldStyleStd-Italic
    /CenturyOldStyleStd-Regular
    /ChaparralPro-Bold
    /ChaparralPro-BoldIt
    /ChaparralPro-Italic
    /ChaparralPro-Light
    /ChaparralPro-LightIt
    /ChaparralPro-Regular
    /ChaparralPro-Semibold
    /ChaparralPro-SemiboldIt
    /CharlemagneStd-Bold
    /CharlemagneStd-Regular
    /Cheltenham-Bold
    /Cheltenham-BoldItalic
    /Cheltenham-Book
    /Cheltenham-BookItalic
    /Colossalis-Bold
    /ComicSansMS
    /ComicSansMS-Bold
    /CommercialScriptBT-Regular
    /CopperplateGothicBT-Heavy
    /CopperplateGothicBT-Roman
    /CopperplateGothicBT-RomanCond
    /Copperplate-ThirtyThreeBC
    /Cottonwood
    /Courier
    /Courier-Bold
    /Courier-BoldOblique
    /CourierNewPS-BoldItalicMT
    /CourierNewPS-BoldMT
    /CourierNewPS-ItalicMT
    /CourierNewPSMT
    /Courier-Oblique
    /CourierStd
    /CourierStd-Bold
    /CourierStd-BoldOblique
    /CourierStd-Oblique
    /Critter
    /Cutout
    /DomCasual
    /DomCasualBT-Regular
    /EstrangeloEdessa
    /ExPonto-Regular
    /FarfelICGFeltTip
    /FarfelICGPencil
    /FlamencoD
    /Formata-Italic
    /Formata-Medium
    /Formata-MediumItalic
    /Formata-Regular
    /FranklinGothicITCbyBT-Book
    /FranklinGothicITCbyBT-BookItal
    /FranklinGothicITCbyBT-Demi
    /FranklinGothicITCbyBT-DemiItal
    /FranklinGothicITCbyBT-Heavy
    /FranklinGothicITCbyBT-HeavyItal
    /FranklinGothic-Medium
    /FranklinGothic-MediumItalic
    /FuturaBlackBT-Regular
    /FuturaBT-Bold
    /FuturaBT-BoldCondensed
    /FuturaBT-BoldItalic
    /FuturaBT-ExtraBlack
    /FuturaBT-ExtraBlackCondensed
    /FuturaBT-Heavy
    /FuturaBT-Light
    /FuturaBT-LightCondensed
    /FuturaBT-LightItalic
    /FuturaBT-Medium
    /FuturaBT-MediumCondensed
    /GalliardITCbyBT-Bold
    /GalliardITCbyBT-BoldItalic
    /GalliardITCbyBT-Italic
    /GalliardITCbyBT-Roman
    /Garamond
    /Garamond-Bold
    /Garamond-Italic
    /Gautami
    /Georgia
    /Georgia-Bold
    /Georgia-BoldItalic
    /Georgia-Italic
    /Giddyup
    /GiddyupStd
    /Giddyup-Thangs
    /GillSans-Condensed
    /GillSans-UltraBold
    /GoudyTextMT-LombardicCapitals
    /Haettenschweiler
    /Helvetica
    /Helvetica-Bold
    /Helvetica-BoldOblique
    /Helvetica-Condensed
    /Helvetica-Condensed-Black
    /Helvetica-Condensed-BlackObl
    /Helvetica-Condensed-Bold
    /Helvetica-Condensed-BoldObl
    /Helvetica-Condensed-Light
    /Helvetica-Condensed-LightObl
    /Helvetica-Condensed-Oblique
    /Helvetica-Narrow
    /Helvetica-Narrow-Bold
    /Helvetica-Narrow-BoldOblique
    /Helvetica-Narrow-Oblique
    /Helvetica-Oblique
    /Humanist521BT-Bold
    /Humanist521BT-BoldCondensed
    /Humanist521BT-BoldItalic
    /Humanist521BT-ExtraBold
    /Humanist521BT-Italic
    /Humanist521BT-Light
    /Humanist521BT-LightItalic
    /Humanist521BT-Roman
    /Humanist521BT-RomanCondensed
    /Humanist521BT-UltraBold
    /Imago-ExtraBold
    /Impact
    /Ironwood
    /ItcKabel-Bold
    /ItcKabel-Book
    /ItcKabel-Demi
    /ItcKabel-Medium
    /ItcKabel-Ultra
    /JoannaMT
    /JoannaMT-Italic
    /Juniper
    /Kartika
    /Kaufmann
    /Kaufmann-Bold
    /KozGoPro-Bold
    /KozGoPro-ExtraLight
    /KozGoPro-Heavy
    /KozGoPro-Light
    /KozGoPro-Medium
    /KozGoPro-Regular
    /KozGoStd-Bold
    /KozGoStd-ExtraLight
    /KozGoStd-Heavy
    /KozGoStd-Light
    /KozGoStd-Medium
    /KozGoStd-Regular
    /KozMinPro-Bold
    /KozMinPro-ExtraLight
    /KozMinPro-Heavy
    /KozMinPro-Light
    /KozMinPro-Medium
    /KozMinPro-Regular
    /KozMinStd-Bold
    /KozMinStd-ExtraLight
    /KozMinStd-Heavy
    /KozMinStd-Light
    /KozMinStd-Medium
    /KozMinStd-Regular
    /Latha
    /LetterGothic
    /LetterGothicStd
    /LetterGothicStd-Bold
    /LetterGothicStd-BoldSlanted
    /LetterGothicStd-Slanted
    /Lithograph
    /Lithograph-Bold
    /LithographLight
    /Lithos-Black
    /LithosPro-Black
    /LithosPro-Bold
    /LithosPro-ExtraLight
    /LithosPro-Light
    /LithosPro-Regular
    /Lithos-Regular
    /LucidaConsole
    /LucidaSans
    /LucidaSans-Demi
    /LucidaSans-DemiItalic
    /LucidaSans-Italic
    /LucidaSans-Typewriter
    /LucidaSans-TypewriterBold
    /LucidaSansUnicode
    /Mangal-Regular
    /Mesquite
    /MesquiteStd
    /MetropolisICG
    /MicrosoftSansSerif
    /Minion-BoldCondensed
    /Minion-BoldCondensedItalic
    /Minion-Condensed
    /Minion-CondensedItalic
    /Minion-Ornaments
    /MinionPro-Bold
    /MinionPro-BoldIt
    /MinionPro-It
    /MinionPro-Regular
    /MinionPro-Semibold
    /MinionPro-SemiboldIt
    /MinionStd-Black
    /MonotypeCorsiva
    /MSOutlook
    /MSReferenceSansSerif
    /MSReferenceSpecialty
    /MT-Extra
    /MVBoli
    /Myriad-Bold
    /Myriad-BoldItalic
    /Myriad-Headline
    /Myriad-Italic
    /MyriadPro-Black
    /MyriadPro-BlackCond
    /MyriadPro-BlackCondIt
    /MyriadPro-BlackIt
    /MyriadPro-Bold
    /MyriadPro-BoldCond
    /MyriadPro-BoldCondIt
    /MyriadPro-BoldIt
    /MyriadPro-Cond
    /MyriadPro-CondIt
    /MyriadPro-It
    /MyriadPro-Light
    /MyriadPro-LightCond
    /MyriadPro-LightCondIt
    /MyriadPro-LightIt
    /MyriadPro-Regular
    /MyriadPro-Semibold
    /MyriadPro-SemiboldCond
    /MyriadPro-SemiboldCondIt
    /MyriadPro-SemiboldIt
    /Myriad-Roman
    /Myriad-Sketch
    /MyriadStd-Sketch
    /MyriadStd-Tilt
    /Myriad-Tilt
    /Mythos
    /NewCenturySchlbk-Bold
    /NewCenturySchlbk-BoldItalic
    /NewCenturySchlbk-Italic
    /NewCenturySchlbk-Roman
    /NewsGothicStd
    /NewsGothicStd-Bold
    /NewsGothicStd-BoldOblique
    /NewsGothicStd-Oblique
    /Nueva-BoldExtended
    /Nueva-Roman
    /NuevaStd-Bold
    /NuevaStd-BoldItalic
    /NuevaStd-Italic
    /NuevaStd-Light
    /NuevaStd-LightItalic
    /NuevaStd-Regular
    /NuptialScript
    /OCRAbyBT-Regular
    /OCRAStd
    /OCRB10PitchBT-Regular
    /Optima
    /Optima-Bold
    /Optima-BoldOblique
    /Optima-Oblique
    /Palatino-Bold
    /Palatino-BoldItalic
    /Palatino-Italic
    /PalatinoLinotype-Bold
    /PalatinoLinotype-BoldItalic
    /PalatinoLinotype-Italic
    /PalatinoLinotype-Roman
    /Palatino-Roman
    /Parisian
    /ParkAvenue
    /PepitaMT
    /Poetica-ChanceryI
    /Poetica-SuppOrnaments
    /Ponderosa
    /PoplarStd
    /PopplLaudatio-Italic
    /PopplLaudatio-Medium
    /PopplLaudatio-MediumItalic
    /PopplLaudatio-Regular
    /PrestigeElite
    /PrestigeEliteStd
    /PrestigeEliteStd-Bd
    /PrestigeEliteStd-BdSlanted
    /PrestigeEliteStd-Slanted
    /Quake
    /Raavi
    /Rad
    /Rockwell-ExtraBold
    /RosewoodStd-Fill
    /RosewoodStd-Regular
    /RubinoSansICG
    /RubinoSansICG-Fill
    /RubinoSansICG-Guides
    /RubinoSansICG-Out
    /RubinoSansICG-Solid
    /RunicMT-Condensed
    /RussellSquare
    /RussellSquare-Oblique
    /RyoDispStd-Bold
    /RyoDispStd-ExtraBold
    /RyoDispStd-Heavy
    /RyoDispStd-Medium
    /RyoDispStd-SemiBold
    /RyoTextStd-ExtraLight
    /RyoTextStd-Light
    /RyoTextStd-Medium
    /RyoTextStd-Regular
    /Sanvito-Light
    /Sanvito-Roman
    /Shruti
    /SouvenirITCbyBT-Demi
    /SouvenirITCbyBT-DemiItalic
    /SouvenirITCbyBT-Light
    /SouvenirITCbyBT-LightItalic
    /Stencil
    /StencilStd
    /Studz
    /Sylfaen
    /Symbol
    /SymbolITCbyBT-Bold
    /SymbolITCbyBT-BoldItalic
    /SymbolMT
    /SymbolProportionalBT-Regular
    /Tahoma
    /Tahoma-Bold
    /TechnicalItalic
    /TechnicalPlain
    /Tekton
    /Tekton-Bold
    /TektonMM
    /TektonMM-Oblique
    /Times-Bold
    /Times-BoldItalic
    /Times-Italic
    /TimesNewRomanMT-ExtraBold
    /TimesNewRomanPS-BoldItalicMT
    /TimesNewRomanPS-BoldMT
    /TimesNewRomanPS-ItalicMT
    /TimesNewRomanPSMT
    /Times-Roman
    /Toolbox
    /Trajan-Bold
    /TrajanPro-Bold
    /TrajanPro-Regular
    /Trebuchet-BoldItalic
    /TrebuchetMS
    /TrebuchetMS-Bold
    /TrebuchetMS-Italic
    /Tunga-Regular
    /Umbra
    /Utopia-Headline
    /Utopia-Italic
    /Utopia-Regular
    /Utopia-Semibold
    /Utopia-SemiboldItalic
    /VendomeT-Bold
    /VendomeT-Medi
    /VendomeT-MediItal
    /VendomeT-Regu
    /VendomeT-ReguCond
    /VendomeT-ReguItal
    /Verdana
    /Verdana-Bold
    /Verdana-BoldItalic
    /Verdana-Italic
    /Viva-BoldExtraExtended
    /Viva-Regular
    /VivaStd-Bold
    /VivaStd-Light
    /VivaStd-Regular
    /Vrinda
    /WarnockPro-Bold
    /WarnockPro-BoldCapt
    /WarnockPro-BoldDisp
    /WarnockPro-BoldIt
    /WarnockPro-BoldItCapt
    /WarnockPro-BoldItDisp
    /WarnockPro-BoldItSubh
    /WarnockPro-BoldSubh
    /WarnockPro-Capt
    /WarnockPro-Disp
    /WarnockPro-It
    /WarnockPro-ItCapt
    /WarnockPro-ItDisp
    /WarnockPro-ItSubh
    /WarnockPro-Light
    /WarnockPro-LightCapt
    /WarnockPro-LightDisp
    /WarnockPro-LightIt
    /WarnockPro-LightItCapt
    /WarnockPro-LightItDisp
    /WarnockPro-LightItSubh
    /WarnockPro-LightSubh
    /WarnockPro-Regular
    /WarnockPro-Semibold
    /WarnockPro-SemiboldCapt
    /WarnockPro-SemiboldDisp
    /WarnockPro-SemiboldIt
    /WarnockPro-SemiboldItCapt
    /WarnockPro-SemiboldItDisp
    /WarnockPro-SemiboldItSubh
    /WarnockPro-SemiboldSubh
    /WarnockPro-Subh
    /Webdings
    /Willow
    /Wingdings2
    /Wingdings3
    /Wingdings-Regular
    /WoodtypeOrnaments-One
    /WoodtypeOrnamentsStd
    /WoodtypeOrnaments-Two
    /WP-ArabicScriptSihafa
    /WP-ArabicSihafa
    /WP-BoxDrawing
    /WP-CyrillicA
    /WP-CyrillicB
    /WP-GreekCentury
    /WP-GreekCourier
    /WP-GreekHelve
    /WP-HebrewDavid
    /WP-IconicSymbolsA
    /WP-IconicSymbolsB
    /WP-Japanese
    /WP-MathA
    /WP-MathB
    /WP-MathExtendedA
    /WP-MathExtendedB
    /WP-MultinationalAHelve
    /WP-MultinationalARoman
    /WP-MultinationalBCourier
    /WP-MultinationalBHelve
    /WP-MultinationalBRoman
    /WP-MultinationalCourier
    /WP-Phonetic
    /WPTypographicSymbols
    /ZapfChancery-MediumItalic
    /ZapfDingbats
    /ZapfDingbatsITCbyBT-Regular
    /ZWAdobeF
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 150
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 2400
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.76
    /HSamples [2 1 1 2] /VSamples [2 1 1 2]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.76
    /HSamples [2 1 1 2] /VSamples [2 1 1 2]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 15
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 15
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 150
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 2400
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.76
    /HSamples [2 1 1 2] /VSamples [2 1 1 2]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.76
    /HSamples [2 1 1 2] /VSamples [2 1 1 2]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 15
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 15
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1600
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck false
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly false
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError true
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (None)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier ()
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName ()
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<
    /CHS <FEFF4f7f75288fd94e9b8bbe5b9a521b5efa7684002000410064006f006200650020005000440046002065876863900275284e8e55464e1a65876863768467e5770b548c62535370300260a853ef4ee54f7f75280020004100630072006f0062006100740020548c002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee553ca66f49ad87248672c676562535f00521b5efa768400200050004400460020658768633002>
    /CHT <FEFF4f7f752890194e9b8a2d7f6e5efa7acb7684002000410064006f006200650020005000440046002065874ef69069752865bc666e901a554652d965874ef6768467e5770b548c52175370300260a853ef4ee54f7f75280020004100630072006f0062006100740020548c002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee553ca66f49ad87248672c4f86958b555f5df25efa7acb76840020005000440046002065874ef63002>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /FRA <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF adatti per visualizzare e stampare documenti aziendali in modo affidabile. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 5.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <FEFFc7740020c124c815c7440020c0acc6a9d558c5ec0020be44c988b2c8c2a40020bb38c11cb97c0020c548c815c801c73cb85c0020bcf4ace00020c778c1c4d558b2940020b3700020ac00c7a50020c801d569d55c002000410064006f0062006500200050004400460020bb38c11cb97c0020c791c131d569b2c8b2e4002e0020c774b807ac8c0020c791c131b41c00200050004400460020bb38c11cb2940020004100630072006f0062006100740020bc0f002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e00300020c774c0c1c5d0c11c0020c5f40020c2180020c788c2b5b2c8b2e4002e>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken waarmee zakelijke documenten betrouwbaar kunnen worden weergegeven en afgedrukt. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 5.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /PTB <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents suitable for reliable viewing and printing of business documents.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 5.0 and later.)
  >>
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


